IFB#10-1124JS
Temporary Employment Services
Bid Tabulation

Abie Body Academy | I AdVance § CarearsUSA § Comipass Express ety 1 Spartan Tampa Tri-State S Tach 1
Lakor Design Adecco | TalentSol. | Aerotek | AUE Staffing Inc Medical || Employment | HH Staffing | JuriStaft || Services | KeyStaff,Inc | SkiliStorm | Staffing | Service Co. | Employment | Solutions
l:: Position Hourly Rate | Hourly Rate | Hourly Rate | Hourly Rate | Hourly Rate || Hourly Rate | Hourly Rate | Hourly Rate | Hourly Rate | Hourly Rate | Hourly Rate Hourly Rate | Hourly Rate | Hourly Rate | Hourly Rate || Hourly Rate | Hourly Rate || Hourly Rate
1 JAdministrative Assistant 3 12753 114448 1670 | § 1389 % 16450 5 16100 § 16.46 || § 14700 % 1439 % 1875 (% 20720 % 14851 § 12400 S 17.80 Mo Bid $ 1285( 5% 1358 | & 18.00
2 ||Administrative Specialist $ 18353 M774s 18014 % 1478 % 17.44 | § 17.16 | § 1744 | 8 16011 % 15491 35 19500 $ 218305 1552 || § 1364 | 8 18.79 No Bid $ 1278 || & 1475 5 19.00
3 |Administrative Services Coordinator 3 2327 || % 172218 213103 1891 § 2153 % 2158 || 2202 8% 16590 § 17890 % 24750 % 27751 % 1822 & 124048 23.38 No Bid Mo Bid 3 18440 § 25.00
4 __||Algal Control Specialist/Laboratory Assistant Mo Bid 3 14.48 Mo Bid $ 16.12 Mo Bid No Bid $ 18.48 || & 1790 % 1689 % 21.00 Mo Bid No Bid 3 13.02 No Bid No Bid Neo Bid 3 1697 1 $ 20.00
5 ||Animal Care Specialist | 3 128215 11.93 No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid B 15.18 Mo Bid $ 14.29 8 5 16.50 Mo Bid No Bid s 13.02 No Bid No Bid $ 136818 13580 5 15.00
6 |lAnimal Care Specialist || $ 1412 4 § 12.48 No Bid No Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid 3 16.10 Mo Bid $ 15.08 | § 19.50 Mo Bid No Bid 5 13.60 No Bid Mo Bid B 14761 8 140288 15.00
7 |[Building Trades Worker 3 17571 12.98 No Bid [ ] 154518 16.45 No Bid $ 17.07 No Bid s 1789 § 2250 No Bid No Bid s 14,88 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 17018 15.00
8 jComputer Oparations Su Technician | Mo Bid 5 1458 § 19.17 || § 15.78 Mo Bid 5 19148 18383 18000 8 1699 | § 2250 || § 236818 1890 § 1488 %5 18.77 Mo Bid Mo Bid 5 16.70 ) § 20.00
9 #Censtruction Coordinator 3 2812 | § 18.65 No Bid 5 24.27 Mo Bid $ 2913 % 27.19 Mo Bid $ 26841 5 29.00 No Bid No Bid 5 22941 § 27.56 Mo Bid 5 24754 8 2564 1| § 29.00
10 Construction Inspection Officer || Mo Bid 3 18.47 No Bid 3 2272 No Bid $ 28418 2565 Mo Bid $ 254911 % 31.90 No Bid No Bid 5 22,32 Mo Bid Mo Bid No Bid s 2495 | % 26.00
11_jCook § 11.50( % 11.05 No Bid 3 10.80 No Bid No Bid $ 12.47 Mo Bid 3 124418 13.57 No Bid Mo Bid $ 10.54 Mo Bid Mo Bid 3 1130 ) 5 1134 8 12.00
12 ||Custodian $ 108405 11.66 No Bid 5 115218 13.03]8 1529 | § 135118 1148 (8 127418 15.00 No Bid No Bid 5 10.54 No Bid No Bid 5 11.30( % 1158 || $ 14.00
13 [Data Entry Operator $ 131218 12981 5 1608 | 5 13.02 )| 8 1553 % 15510 § 15531 § 1369 || § 1389 43$ 17250 % 1776 (% 13504 % 1240 8§ 16.87 Mo Bid 5 1310 || § 1367 | 5 17.00
No Bid 5 1574 1 % 2104118 28.11 No Bid ] 1947 [ § 19594 8 1910 | § 1689 | § 24.00 Mo Bid No Bid 3 13684 | 5 20.00 Mo Bid No Bid 5 1725 § 20.00
No Bid ] 16.68 § § 2230( % 19.00 No Bid 3 2038 | § 20760 % 20000 % 17248 27.00 Mo Bid Mo Bid $ 1488 1 % 21.20 No Bid No Bid 5 18450 § 23.00
$ 1753 % 14.37 No Bid $ 174418 18.73 No Bid ] 180908 17101 § 1899(% 24.00 No Bid Mo Bid 3 16.81 Neo Bid No Bid $ 14400 5 1736 0 § 17.00
s 1512 (1§ 121718 19601 % 13.95 No Bid s 18501 1519 § 17534 § 18.08 | $ 16.50 No Bid No Bid § 1085 | § 17.55 No Bid No Bid 5 121901 $ 15.00
b 17.50 | § 1524 | § 252083 17.40 Mo Bid 3 19.14 1 § 18171 8 12100 § 1699 (% 21.00 Mo Bid Mo Bid $ 11.16 ]| % 20.25 Mo Bid Mo Bid 3 1580 % 15.00
$ 10455 987§ § 1281 0% 10.40 Mo Bid No Bid $ 1116 || § 10331 % 10945 12.00 Mo Bid No Bid $ 9.92 Mo Bid Mo Bid 3 10.44 | $ 10030 % 16.00
$ 11268 10481 S 12810 % 10.85 Mo Bid Mo Bid $ 11.80 || § 11108 8 1194 4 5 12.75 Mo Bid No Bid 3 10.23 No Bid Mo Bid $ 108040 % 11.131 % 17.00
21 _|Executive Assistant $ 1847 % 1569 $ 23104 % 1675 § 1886 § 201301 % 19.59 | 5 1801118 17490 5 21000 % 24051 8 182218 1457 || § 20.93 Mo Bid No Bid 3 17.10( § 22.00
22 ||Fiscal Analyst No Bid $ 19.96 0 $ 33604 % 21.08 No Bid $ 2508 (§ 2473 $ 18.01 48 21891 % 28.000% 31.08 4§ 24685 % 1860 | § 26.08 No Bid No Bid $ 219808 26.00
23 |IFiscal Specialist MNe Bid 5 1738 5 280008 17.84 No Bid 5 2033 || § 20761 § 195008 1724 § 252511 % 25800 % 22471 % 13954 % 2211 Mo Bid No Bid ] 18.45 1 § 23.00
24 _|IFiscal Technician Mo Bid $ 13811% 19600 % 13.92 Ne Bid ] 1716 8 1704 § 175008 1589 | § 1885 % 22200 % 1755 % 12400 8% 18.78 Mo Bid No Bid 3 14700 § 17.00
25 |IFleet Maintenance Technician Trainee 5 16971 % 13.09 No Bid 3 15.45 No Bid Mo Bid 3 17.07 Mo Bid $ 178905 21.00 No Bid No Bid 3 14.57 Mo Bid No Bid Mo Bid $ 15841 5 17.00
| 26 |Fleet Maintenance Technician | ] 18121 § 14.38 No Bid 3 17234 % 19.17 No Bid 3 19.17 Mo Bid 3 183903 22,50 Mo Bid Mo Bid $ 15.50 Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid 3 16.70 ) $ 21.00
27 _|Fleet Maintenance Technician Il 5 1984 | $ 15,89 No Bid $ 19.60 | $ 21.53 No Bid s 21.53 No Bid s 120948 25.50 No Bid No Bid s 18.43 No Bid No Bid No Bid 3 1876 | S 21.00
28 _|Fieet Maintenance Technician Il 5 2059 ) § 18.57 No Bid 3 22110 % 24.19 No Bid 3 2419 No Bid $ 210901 % 2550 Mo Bid Neo Bid 3 17.67 No Bid No Bid Mo Bid $ 210818 22.00
29 |Food Server ) 1068 | § 9.87 No Bid 3 10.80 No Bid $ 118048 11581 8 1100 8 179§ 12.00 No Bid Mo Bid $ 8.92 No Bid Mo Bid ] 1044 1 8 8561 % 12.00
30 | Golf Attendant $ 107848 10.97 No Bid 5 11.186 Mo Bid 5 12210 % 1203 % 111001 8 1154 8 13.50 MNe Bid Mo Bid $ 9.30 No Bid Mo Bid ] 1044 | 5 1030 % 12.00
$ 127148 12.97 Mo Bid 3 14.72 No Bid No Bid 3 1610 § 1358 | § 1359 (% 18.00 No Bid Mo Bid 3 11.47 No Bid Mo Bid $ 1044 || $ 1380 12.00
No Bid s 17.54 | 5 2538 || § 18.09 No Bid s 1782 § 21.53 No Bid $ 1789 || $ 24.00 No Bid No Bid s 1612 (18 21.50 No Bid No Bid s 1845(1 8 23.00
$ 13121 8 13.87 No Bid 3 17.038 % 18.73 No Bid 3 18.08 No Bid $ 1699 % 19.50 Mo Bid Mo Bid s 13.64 Mo Bid Mo Bid No Bid $ 1576 | 5 17.00
34 |Landfill Attendant $ 1414 [ 5 13.18 No Bid Mo Bid $ 18.89 No Bid 5 17.07 No Bid $ 163918 21.00 Mo Bid No Bid 3 12.40 No Bid Mo Bid 5 1152 | § 14870 5 '17.,00
35 ||Landfill Operator $ 1696 % 15.22 Mo Bid Mo Bid 3 22.49 No Bid ] 20.31 No Bid 3 1829% 22.50 Mo Bid No Bid 3 14.28 Mo Bid Mao Bid $ 1476 1 § 19.70 ) § 22.00
36 |lLegal Assistant $ 222718 1832 1§ 37500 § 20.16 No Bid 3 240905 2309)s% 165018 20598 26000 % 28120 % 21750 % 1488 § 24,43 Mo Bid No Bid 5 2029 | § 22,00
37 _||Law Office Assistant ] 1412 1% 1432 1 % 2800 % 16.74 Mo Bid $ 1846 | $ 187001 8 170008 1834 5 203008 2257 1S 182218 1364 § 20.04 Mo Bid No Bid $ 1662 3 § 22.00
3 1562 | § 12250 % 182001 % 13024 % 1668 | 151814 % 1553 | 8 1630 || § 14891 5 18000 % 170211 % 13501 & 10540 § 16.87 Mo Bid No Bid § 1368 § 18.00
3 1526 | § 19.96 1 § 266008 210808 25086 || 8 23100 8 23331 % 1459 || § 21198 5 260008 2850011 8 21751 % 12400 8 24 67 Mo Bid No Bid $ 2073 )| § 26.00
$ 1127 (8 1226 0§ 1540 | § 124008 1381(% 141908 1381(8 11100 $ 148915 1595]8 162808 14170 % 12008 15.16 No Bid s 104418 198§ 15.00
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Bid Tabulation _
i AbleBody I Academy AdVance CereersWSA Y Compass’ | Express | Kally Spartan Tampa |  Tri-State TS Tech
Labor Design Adecco Talent Sol. Aerotek AUE Staffin Inc Medical | Employment | HH Staffing JuriStaff Services KeyStaff, Inc |__SkillStorm Staffing Service Co. | Employment | __Solutions |
Ilt:::l Position Hourly Rate | Hourly Rate | Hourly Rate | Hourly Rate | Hourly Rate || Hourly Rate | Hourly Rate | Hourly Rate || Hourly Rate || Hourly Rate | Hourly Rate | Hourly Rate | Hourly Rate Hourly Rate | Hourly Rate || Hourly Rate | Hourly Rate | Hourly Rate
41 [|Office Specialist ] 13.950 % 13.27 1 8 19.80 || § 1389 % 1553 | § 155111 8 1553 || § 1083 & 1589 8 1740 5 170238 14851 8 13684 3 16.87 No Bid No Bid 3 13190 % 18.00
42 (Paralagal No Bid $ 20.95 No Bid ] 20.89 No Bid $ 2706 § 25450 % 1870 || & 22398 28551 § 31088 232088 1738 § 26.79 No Bid No Bid $ 22601 8 32.00
43 ||Parks Maintenance Groundskeeper $ 1285( $ 1227 No Bid $ 14.64 No Bid Mo Bid $ 15.19 Mo Bid $ 1439 8 16.50 Mo Bid No Bid $ 12.71 No Bid No Bid 5 1350 | § 1385 % 16.00
44 ||Plans Examiner No Bid 5 21.96 No Bid $ 2370 No Bid $ 27728 27.18 No Bid $ 238908 28.00 Mo Bid No Bid $ 19.84 No Bid Mo Bid No Bid ] 2330 % 27.00
45 ||Public Works Maintenance Technician Trainee -] 124531 5 12.29 No Bid 5 144901 8 17.83 No Bid 5 16.10 No Bid $ 14281 % 18.50 No Bid No Bid $ 14.88 Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid 3 1664 § 18.00
46 jiPublic Works Maintenance Technician | § 14651 % 13.71 Mo Bid ] 162810 § 20.03 No Bid 3 18.09 No Bid ] 15281 S 21.00 No Bid No Bid k] 16.19 No Bid No Bid Mo Bid E] 18241 § 18.00
47 __jiPublic Works Maintenance Technician Il $ 1758 § 15.22 No Bid 3 1687 1§ 21.22 No Bid $ 18.17 No Bid $ 1629 | $ 2250 Mo Bid No Bid 3 16.12 No Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid k] 2075 § 20.00
48 JPublic Works Maintenance Technician lil 5 2112 || 8 16.25 No Bid $ 17.80 || § 22.49 No Bid g 20.31 No Bid $ 172918 24.00 No Bid No Bid 5 17.36 No Bid Mo Bid No Bid $ 2416 || § 22.00
48 |Radio Technician || No Bid $ 16.86 | § 2800 % 20.49 No Bid 5 2244 | § 22.83 Mo Bid ] 2024 0 § 27.00 No Bid No Bid 3 18.60 22.50 Mo Bid No Bid $ 2022 || % 22.00
50 |Radio Technician Supervisor No Bid $ 219788 338208 25.30 Mo Bid 3 273918 28.81 Mo Bid $ 24891 % 31.50 Mo Bid No Bid $ 22328 28.40 Mo Bid Mo Bid 3 2604 | § 31.00
$ 219708 % 15.94 Mo Bid $ 191811 & 22,49 No Bid -] 20.31 Mo Bid $ 1929 5 24.00 No Bid No Bid 3 14.88 No Bid Mo Bid No Bid $ 1843 || § 21.00
3 24.86 | § 19.14 Mo Bid $ 23.06 | § 28.40 Mo Bid 3 25.65 Mo Bid 3 21431 8 28.50 Mo Bid Mo Bid 5 19.84 Mo Bid Mo Bid No Bid $ 25190 % 28.00
Small Engine Repair Technician 3 17150 8 14.98 Mo Bid k3 16.58 | § 20.03 No Bid $ 18.08 No Bid 3 1689 § 19.50 No Bid No Bid 3 15.50 Mo Bid Mo Bid No Bid Mo Bid $ 17.00
Stores/Warehouse Technician 3 14441 5% 132118 1885 % 1446 (| § 1668 1% 17038 16.10 No Bid $ 1499 § 18.00 Mo Bid No Bid $ 13.02 No Bid No Bid ] 13750 8 14371 8 18.00
55 ||Systemns Analyst | No Bid ] 22471 % kNG K 22.94 No Bid $ 26731 % 2627 |8 271008 268401 8 3000 || § 310808 27551 % 1860 & 28.98 No Bid No Bid $ 233008 31.00
56 Isislems Anal:st 1] No Bid 3 24931 § 34088 25.82 Mo Bid 5 2904 | § 2946 (| S 28108 8 27840 5 3300 8 35788 30451 1984 | 8 30.36 Mo Bid No Bid 5 2618 § 33.00
57 |Systemns Analyst Ill No Bid $ 2684 8 5 4970 || $ 28.06 Mo Bid $ 3333 || 8 3310 % 301005 2884 | 5 3750 || 42600 % 34801 % 2108 (| % 31.74 Mo Bid Mo Bid ) 29420 8 a7.00
|58 |Telecommunications Technician No Bid ] 17.84 No Bid $ 21.39 Ne Bid 3 24098 241911 % 230003 2189 % 27000 8 3050 8 24651 § 18.91 No Bid Mo Bid No Bid 3 207308 26.00
59 | Ticket Seller $ 109418 987 | § 1387 )| 8 10.80 No Bid No Bid $ 1203418 11004 % 1244 0 5 13.50 No Bid No Bid $ 89208 13.50 Mo Bid 3 1100 || § 10950 § 14.00
60 {Ticket Taker ] 1045 ¢ § 975§ 13058 8 10.40 No Bid Mo Bid $ 1076 | § 11.00 | § 1064 § § 12.00 No Bid No Bid ] 86113 13.50 Mo Bid $ 10301 8 1005035 12.00
61 JUtilities Maintenance Technician Trainee 3 12830 % 12.57 Mo Bid $ 14118 17.25 No Bid $ 16.10 Mo Bid 3 1539 % 17.25 No Bid Mo Bid $ 12.40 No Bid Mo Bid No Bid ] 1500 5 17.00
B2 flutilities Maintenance Technician | $ 14371 % 13.34 Mo Bid 3 15904 20.03 No Bid $ 18.08 No Bid ] 16298 19.50 Mo Bid No Bid $ 12.71 No Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid 3 1625 % 17.00
63 ||\Utilities Maintenance Technician i $ 172518 14.52 No Bid 3 1687 1§ 20.54 No Bid ) 19.17 No Bid $ 17391 % 21.00 No Bid No Bid $ 13.64 No Bid Mo Bid No Bid $ 17500 § 20.00
64 || Utilities Maintenance Technician Il $ ‘I}_E_B 3 15.83 w 3 17804 § 21.77 No Ed $ 20.31 No Bid 3 1829 | § 22.50 Mo Bid w 5 15.19 No Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid ] 1875 $ w
Acknowledge Addendum Yes Yes Yes No Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No Mo No Yes Yes Mo Bid Yes Yes Yes
Attachments Included Yes Yes Yes _Yes No Yes Yes Yes Yas ___Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No Bid Yes Yes Yes
Note: Adecco
pending review
of Special Terms
& Conditions



