
MANATEE COUNTY GOVERNMENT 
INTENT TO AWARD ., 

No Lead Brass Water, MC .A.%". IS \~ l 110 
SUBJECT Sewer, and Backflow DATE POSTED DS vCS£ g 1'1 II., 

Products CC N loA-

PURCHASING Bonnie Sietman, DATE CONTRACT 
Contingent upon the 

REPRESENTATIVE 
Sr. Buyer SHALL BE AWARDED 

acceptance of Purchasing 
x3046 Official (7 days) 

DEPARTMENT Utilities, Warehouse 
CONSEQUENCES IF N/A 

DEFERRED 
"~ / 

SOLICITATION IFB #16-1733BLS AUTHORIZEgA~~ '~W ~~/J'Y{\' 
NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD M.'47iaotl,o err ~I 

Notice of Intent to Award, Invitation for Bid #16-1733BLS, No Lead Brass Water, Sewer, and Backflow Products to 
the bidders (primary and secondary) with the lowest, responsive, responsible bidders (by group, subtotal) Ferguson 
Waterworks , Fortiline Inc. and Municipal Water Works, LLC. 

ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITY I 
Federal/State law(s), administrative ruling(s), Manatee County Comp Plan/Land Development Code, 

ordinances, resolutions, policy. 
!- - - -- _ .. ,._- .-' --:~-.'--~ ..... --

Manatee County Code of Laws 

1-
BACKGROUND/DISCUSSION 

> This procurement is for no-lead brass water, sewer, and backflow products for the Utilities Maintenance 
Warehouse Department. . 

> The intent of this Invitation for Bid (IFB) is to establish a primary and secondary award to the two lowest, 
responsive, responsible bidders meeting specifications by group, subtotal. 

> The annual estimated expenditure is $285,000.00 

> The County solicited Invitation for Bid #16-1733BLS from July 15, 2016 through August 2,2016, appropriate 
bid procedures were followed. 

> Notice of IFB #16-1733BLS was solicited on Demand Star (ten planholders), MyManatee.org, and the 
Manatee County Chamber. 

> Five bids were received from Ferguson Waterworks, Fortiline Inc., and HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd., 
Municipal Water Works, LLC, and Southern Supply Company. 

ATTACHMENTS FUNDING SOURCE 
x Funds Verified 

B (List in order of attached) • (Acct Number & Name) Insufficient Funds 
AMT/FREQ OF RECURRING 

Annual Estimate COSTS (Attach Fiscal Impact 
COST $285,000.00 Statement) 5010003698-595000 



INTENT TO AWARD (continued) _______________ ~Page 2 

~ August 16, 2016 received a memorandum from C. Mike Gore, Utilities Director to award by group as 
follows: 

GROUP 

A (Mise brass) 
B (Brass line fittings) 
C (Brass backflow devices) 

PRIMARY 

Fortiline ($9,830.70) 
Ferguson ($76,631.00) 
Ferguson ($144,172.00) 

SECONDARY 

Ferguson ($10,034.20) 
Municipal WaterWorks ($81,698.25) 
Municipal WaterWorks($146,7l0.00) 

*each group has a fixed percentage discount off published manufacturer's price list for like items not 
specifically identified. 

GROUP 
A (Misc brass) 
B (Brass line fittings) 
C (Brass backflow devices) 

PRIMARY 
F ortiline - 60% 
Ferguson - 55% 
Ferguson - 55% 

SECONDARY 
Ferguson - 61 % 
Municipal Water Works - 53% 
Municipal Water Works - 48% 



IFB #16-1733BLS No-Lead Brass Water, Sewer, and Backflow Products Ferguson Waterworks Fortiline, Inc . HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd. Municipal Water Works, LLC Southern Supply Company 

I Note; This excel 
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I is ,. • ,. Insart unit price in ,Hand 1 and orand total 
will automatically extend and pppulate; Bidder to verify accuracyl 

Sarasota, FL Tampa, FL Sarasota, FL Sanford, FL Sarasota, FL 

PRODUCT DESCRIPTION 

GROUP A 

MISCELLANEOUS BRASS *no-Iead brass* 

IRAS ELL 
i ELL 

11_. 'and ",.f" 

i ELL I Street 
i ELL 90 Street 
i ELL 90 Street 
i ELL 45 
i ELL 45 
TEE 
TEE 
TEE 
TEE 

i ( 
IINr. 

IIPIINr. 
; r.OIJPI INr. 

RFnlJr.INC' 

RFnlJC 

MFG/PART# 

% 50 EA Brass 
1 20 EA Brass 

1-1/4" 15 EA Brass 
2 15 EA Brass 
% 20 EA Brass 

i~ dBrass 
dBrass 
dBrass 

,rass 
,rass 
,rass 
,rass 

I Brass 
I Brass 
I Brass 

1-1/4" I Brass 
I Brass 

• x I Brass 

UNIT PRICE 

2.79 
4.31 
6.83 

13.90 

2 

1 

1 

1 

EXTENDED 

139.50 
86.20 

102.45 
208.50 

72.6( 
300. 
5 

3 

288. 

1 

UNIT 

2.99 
4.47 
6.91 

14.04 
377 
6.24 

21 ;2 

1 

1 

1 

EXTENDED 
PRICE 

149.50 
89.40 

103.65 
210.60 

75.40 
312.00 
513.00 

29.90 
3 ,80 

o 

2 

UNIT 

2.89 
4.46 
7.10 

14.42 
3.77 
6.23 

21 .07 
2.89 

15.87 

1 

1 

EXTENDED 
PRICE 

144.50 
89.20 

106.50 
216.30 

75.40 
311.50 
526.75 

28.90 
317.40 

UNIT PRICE 

2.75 
4.25 
6.75 

13.75 
3.60 
6.00 

20.00 
2.75 

11 15 

1 

EXTENDED 
PRICE 

137.50 
85.00 

UNIT 

4.19 
6.41 

10.22 
20.: 

1 

'x I Brass 1. 
'x I Brass 1. 1.71 

EXTENDED 

209.5( 
128.2( 
153. 

3 

1 

1 

• x I Brass 1 27, 2.84 12. 
• x I Brass 1.49 12. 22. 2.37 35. 
1 x I Brass 2.26 169.: 1: l' 168.75 3.57 267.75 
4 x 1 A I Brass 3.85 77.1 3.7 75.00 6.08 121,60 
'" x 1 2 EA IBrass 4.91 98.20 5. 11 11 4.85 97.00 7.77 155.40 
x% 1 IEAIBrass 8.76 B7.60 B.B6 '.6 1.0 ID. B.75 87.50 11.25 112.50 

2 x 1 45 lEA IBrass 8.76 394.20 B.B6 31 '.7 9.09 41)9.05 B.75 393.75 13.B5 623.25 
2 x lY> 20 I EA IBrass 7.28 145.60 B.B6 177.21 7.55 151.00 7.25 145.00 11.49 229.80 

Y> 10 lEA IBrass 1.43 14.30 1.53 15.30 1.77 17.70 1.50 15.00 2.31 23.10 
% 20 I EA IBrass 1.63 32.60 1.74 34.BO 2.31 46.20 2.25 45.00 2.45 49.00 
1 15 lEA IBrass 2.16 32.40 2.31 34.65 3.94 59.10 3.BO 57.00 3.21 48.15 
2 50 lEA IBrass 321.50 6.69 334.50 14.64 73200 14.00 700.00 9.60 480.00 

Y> x 2 25 I EA IBrass 1.40 35.00 1.23 30.75 15 • 

~ x 2 25 I EA IBrass 2U.5U 098 24.50 0.85 21.25 0.80 20.00 1 36.75 

~ ______________________ ~~~"X*-3~2~51~EAFcIBra==ss ______ -1Hr __ ~~~ __ ~2~6.00~r.~~1~.24Hr __ ~3~'11'~001~ __ ~1~09Hr ___ ~2!~~7r .. ~25~ __ ~1.1.~00Hr __ ~~i.~01~ __ ~Hr.~ __ ~477 .. 0~01 
% x 2 25 I EA IBrass 21.00 1.11 27.75 0.97 24.25 0.90 !.OO 

,NIPPI 

,NIPPI 

,NIPPIF 

~E LL VALVE 

% x CL 50 I EA I Brass 1.48 74.00 1.30 65.0 
% x 2 30 lEA IBrass 17 56.10 2. 8: 
%x· 30 '.80 

'x 
xC 
x: 
X· 

x' 
2 xC 

!X· 
!XI 

xl 
'A ,Valve Co~ 

1.9 
5.7B 
5.45 
B.B6 

1295 
25.50 

3.46 il 

F;\IFB\IFB 16-1733BLS No Lead Brass Water, Sewer, and Backflow Products.xlsx 

1 
2! 

1 
2 
390. 
3B2.50 

67.50 

1 

l' 0 
23.77 
37.3B 

6.39 

1 

1 
1 

1 
1 

~ 
71 
561.71 

95.BI 
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IFB #16-1733BLS No-Lead Brass Water, Sewer, and Backflow Products Ferguson Waterworks Fortiline, Inc. HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd. Water Works, Southern Supply Company 

will automal!calll£ exteD!! iD!! 1!21!ulatej Bidder to veri!i! accuracl!! 
Sarasota, FL Tampa, FL Sarasota, FL Sanford, FL Sarasota, FL 

~I PRODUCT DESCRIPTION ~ lH. EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTlit!l~litl MEG/PART# 
~ fBS fBS ~ PRICE 

SWING THREADED - 125#WSP 

SWING THREADED - 125#WSP 

GRAND TOTAL, GROUP A 

F:\IFB\IFB 16-1733BL5 No lead Brass Water, Sewer, and Backflow Products.xlsx Page 15 



IFB #16-1733BLS No-Lead Brass Water, Sewer, and Backflow Products Ferguson Waterworks Fortiline, Inc. HD Supply Waterworks, MUnicipal Water Works, Southern Supply Company 

will automatically extend and pODulat.: Bidder to verify accuraCY! 
Sarasota, FL Tampa, FL Sarasota, FL Sanford, FL Sarasota, FL 

PRODUCT DESCRIPTION 

GROUPB 

BRASS SERVICE LINE FITTINGS & ACCESSORIES 

NO BID 

1" 370.00 NO BID NO 
NLor 

P15428N 
NO BID NO BID 971.25 NOBID NO BID 

, .. p-r"" _ MIP x NO BID NO BID 32850 NOBID NOBID 

I"n,,,p'r,,,, - MIP x CTS 299.30 NOBID NO BID 300.00 NOBID NOBID 

,,,,,.n::,, _ MIP x CTS 1744.40 NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID 

IAn,Ao-n:D BRASS MIP X PVC COMP 2" 179.20 NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID 

,,,c'n:c _ FIP x CTS COMPRESSION NOBID NOBID NO BID 

'AP'r"c _ FIP x CTS COMPRESSION 

lAP'r"c _ FIP x CTS COMPRESSION 

IAn,AP'r"c _ FIP x CTS COMPRESSION: 

FIP X PVC COMP 2" 

CTS COMPRESSION 271.90 NO BID NO BID 272.50 NOBID NOBID 

CTS COMPRESSION 289.70 NO BID NO BID 290.00 NOBID NO BID 

F:\IFB\IFB 16-1733BLS No Lead Brass Water, Sewer, and Backflow Products.xlsx Page 16 



IFB #16-1733BLS No-Lead Brass Water, Sewer, and Backflow Products Ferguson Waterworks Fortiline, Inc. HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd. Municipal Water Works, LLC Southem Supply Company 

Note: This excel Is Inter-active. Insert unit Drlce In column H and extended Drlclna and arand tDlal Dricina 

will automaticalll£ !!xtend and DODul!l!!!; ~!!der to veri~ accu[l!!Ol!I 
Sarasota, FL Tampa, FL Sarasota, FL Sanford, FL Sarasota, FL 

~ PRQD!,!CT DE§'BleDQI!I ~ III MESill!ARTI UNrr 
EXTENDED 

UNrrl 
EXTENDED 

UNrrPRICE 
EXTENDED 

UNrrPRICE 
EXTENDED 

UNrrPRICE 
EXTENDED 

tJL.lMIlEB .M fBJg ~ PRICE ~ fB!g, 

Ford #T 444 444 NL 
or Mueller P15381 N 

B19 3C1090 TEE CTS COMPRESSION 1 40 EA 1" $ 29.10 $ 1164.00 NO BID NO BID $ 36.27 $ 1,450.80 $ 29.00 $ 1,160.00 NOBID NOBID 
Ford #C-44-33 NL or 
Mueller P15403N 

B20 3C1115 COUPLING - CTS COMPo x CTS COMPo % 80 EA 3/4" $ 11.25 $ 900.00 NO BID NOBID $ 11.37 $ 909.60 $ 1125 $ 900.00 NO BID NO BID 

Ford #C-44-44 NL or 
B21 3C1120 COUPLING - CTS COMPo x CTS COMPo 1 80 EA Mueller P15403N 1" $ 12.87 $ 1029.80 NO BID NO BID $ 12.41 $ 992.80 $ 12.90 $ 1,032.00 NO BID NO BID 

Ford #Y-44-243 NL 
B22 3C1135 WYE CTS COMPRESSION 1x% 100 EA or Mueller P15343N $ 23.26 $ 2,326.00 NO BID NO BID $ 22.38 $ 2,238.00 $ 23.30 $ 2,330.00 NO BID NO BID 

Ford #C-44-34 NL or 
B23 3C1117 COUPLING, %" x 1" CTS 75 EA Mueller P15403N $ 13.07 $ 980.25 NO BID NO BID $ 12.55 $ 941.25 $ 13.00 $ 975.00 NO BID NO BID 

Ford #C-77-77 NL or 
B24 3C1132 UNION CMPS. BRASS 2" PVC X PVC X COMP 10 EA Mueller V15401 N $ 82.20 $ 822.00 NOBID NOBID $ 84.74 $ 847.40 $ 82.50 $ 825.00 NOBID NOBID 

Ford #Y-44-274 NL 
B25 3C1138 WYE 2x1 COMP 30 EA or Mueller P15343N $ 65.00 $ 1,950.00 NO BID NOBID $ 66.50 $ 1,995.00 $ 65.30 $ 1,959.00 NO BID NO BID 
B26 3C1221 BELL NUT, FNG D4 %" CRB/CRP 100 EA Ford #FNG-D4 NL $ 2.99 $ 299.00 NO BID NOBID $ 3.05 $ 305.00 $ 3.40 $ 340.00 NO BID NOBID 
B27 3C1222 BELL NUT, 1" NG-FF4 FOR CORPS 125 EA Ford #NG-FF4 NL $ 4.58 $ 572.50 NO BID NO BID 1$ 4.66 $ 585.00 $ 5.25 $ 656.25 NO BID NO BID 
B28 3C1223 BELL NUT, 1" NG-F4 FOR CURBSTOPS 80 EA Ford #NG-F4 NL $ 3.40 $ 272.00 NO BID NO BID $ 3.47 $ 277.80 $ 5.25 $ 420.00 NO BID NO BID 

Ford #FB1000-3 NL 
B29 3C1215 CORP - CC x CTS COMPRESSION- FULL PORT 300 PSI, % 15 EA or Mueller P2500 314" $ 29.03 $ 435.45 NO BID NO BID $ 29.71 $ 44565 $ 30.00 $ 450.00 NOBID NO BID 

Ford #FB1000-4 NL 
or Mueller P25008N 

B30 3C1220 CORP - CC x CTS COMPRESSION- FULL PORT 300 PSI, 1 20 EA 1" $ 38.18 $ 763.60 NO BID NO BID $ 39.10 $ 782.00 $ 3950 $ 790.00 NO BID NO BID 
Ford #FB1700-6 NL 
or Mueller B20046N 

B31 3C1225 CORP - BALL - MIPT x FIPT 114 20 EA 1.5" $ 82.77 $ 1,655.40 NOBID NOBID $ 85.31 $ 1,706.20 $ 85.25 $ 1,705.00 NOBID NOBID 
Ford #FB1600-6 NL 
or Mueller B20045N 

B32 3C1226 CORP - BALL - CC x FIPT 1~ 10 EA 1.5" $ 82.77 $ 827.70 NOBID NOBID $ 85.31 $ 853.10 $ 85.25 $ 852.50 NOBID NO BID 
Ford #FB1600-7 NL 
or Mueller B20045N 

B33 3C1228 CORP - BALL - CC x FIPT 2 10 EA 2" $ 133.91 $ 1,339.10 NO BID NOBID $ 138.01 $ 1,380.10 $ 138.00 $ 1,380.00 NO BID NO BID 
Ford #FB1700-7 NL 
or Mueller B20046N 

B34 3C123O CORP - BALL - MIP x FIP, 2 35 EA 2" $ 13728 $ 4,804.80 NO BID NO BID $ 138.01 $ 4,830.35 $ 138.00 $ 4,830.00 NO BID NO BID 
Ford #FB 11 00-3 NL 
or Mueller P25028N 

B35 3C1235 CORP - MIPT x CTS COMPRESSION, FULL PORT 300 PSI % 50 EA 314" $ 29.03 $ 1,451 .50 NO BID NO BID $ 29.71 $ 1,485.50 $ 30.00 $ 1,500.00 NO BID NO BID 
Ford #FB1100-4Nl 
or Mueller P25028N 

B36 3C1243 CORP. STOP 1", FULL PORT 300 PSI, 80 EA 1" $ 39.15 $ 3,132.00 NO BID NO BID $ 39.10 $ 3,128.00 $ 39.00 $ 3,120.00 NOBID NOBID 
Ford #FB41-333W 
NL or Mueller 

B37 3C1250 CURB BALL FULL PORT CTS COMPo x FIP W/LOCK WINGS % 80 EA P25170N 3/4" $ 37.08 $ 2,968.40 NO BID NO BID $ 37.25 $ 2,980.00 $ 37.25 $ 2980.00 NOBID NO BID 
Ford #FB41-444W 
NL or Mueller 

B38 3C1255 CURB BALL FULL PORT CTS COMPo x FIP W/LOCK WINGS 1 75 EA P25170N 1" $ 56.24 $ 4,218.00 NO BID NO BID $ 56.46 $ 4,234.50 $ 56.50 $ 4,237.50 NO BID NO BID 

F:\IFB\IFB 16-1733BLS No Lead Brass Water, Sewer, and Backflow Products.xlsx Page 17 



IFB #16-1733BLS No-Lead Brass Water, Sewer, and Backflow Products Ferguson Waterworks Foriiline, Inc. HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd. Municipal Water Works, LLC Southern Supply Company 

Note: This excel spreadsheet Is Inter-active. Insert unit Drice in column H and extended Drlcino and orand total pricino 
Sarasota, FL Tampa, FL Sarasota, FL Sanford, FL I Sarasota, FL I will automaticaill/ extend and 1l0llulate; Bld!!er to verifl! accuracl/I 

~I PRODUCT 
PRQD!,!CT DESCRIP!lQt! ~ 

U/ 
MFGIPARTII UNIT PRICE 

EXTENDED 
UNIT PRICE 

EXTENDED 
UNIT PRICE 

EXTENDED 
UNIT PRICE 

EXTENDED 
UNIT PRICE 

EXTENDED 
NUMBER M PRICE PRICE PRICE ~ PRICE 

Ford IIFB 11-333W 
NL or Mueller 

B39 3C1260 CURB BALL FIPT x FIPT FULL PORT WILOCK WINGS % 40 EA B20200N 314" $ 32.97 $ 1,318.80 NOBID NOBID $ 33.11 $ 1,324.40 $ 33.00 $ 1,320.00 NO BID NOBID 
Ford #FB 11-444W 
NL or Mueller 

B40 3C1265 CURB BALL FIPT x FIPT FULL PORT WILOCK WINGS 1 15 EA B20300N 1" $ 50.51 $ 757.65 NOBID NO BID $ 50.70 $ 760.50 $ 50.75 $ 761.25 NOBID NO BID 
Ford #FB11-666W 
NL or Mueller 

B41 3C1270 CURB BALL FIPT x FIPT FULL PORT WILOCK WINGS 1% 15 EA B20300N 1.5" $ 102.05 $ 1,530.75 NO BID NO BID $ 103.33 $ 1,549.95 $ 102.50 $ 1,537.50 NOBID NOBID 
Ford #FB11-777W 
NL or Mueller 

B42 3C1275 CURB BALL FIPT x FIPT FULL PORT WILOCK WINGS 2 25 EA B20300N 2" $ 148.65 $ 3,716.25 NO BID NOBID $ 150.44 $ 3,761.00 $ 149.50 $ 3,737.50 NO BID NO BID 
Ford #FB71-333W 
NL or Mueller 

B43 3C1248 PVC CURBSTOPS, w lock rings, 314" 40 EA E25196N 314" $ 43.32 $ 1,732.80 NO BID NO BID $ 43.44 $ 1,737.60 $ 43.50 $ 1,740.00 NOBID NOBID 
Ford #FB71-444W 
NL or Mueller 

B44 3C1253 Valve Curb 1" wI lock wing PVC 1" 40 EA V25108N 1" $ 60.95 $ 2,438.00 NO BID NO BID $ 49.18 $ 1,967.20 $ 61.25 $ 2,450.00 NOBID NO BID 

Ford #L44-44 NL or 

B45 3C1105 ELLS CTS COMPRESSION 1 35 EA Mueller P15526N 1" $ 18.66 $ 653.10 NO BID NOBID $ 17.95 $ 628.25 $ 18.75 $ 656.25 NO BID NO BID 
Ford #C47 -33 NL or 
Mueller E15443N 

B46 3C1256 COUPLING, 314 CTS. X 314" PVC 10 EA 314" $ 15.20 $ 152.00 NOBID NOBID $ 14.68 $ 146.80 $ 15.25 $ 152.50 NO BID NOBID 

Ford #C47-44 NL or 

B47 3C1257 COUPLING, 1" CTS x 1" PVC 20 EA Mueller V15441 N 1" $ 21.96 $ 439.20 NO BID NO BID $ 20.82 $ 416.40 $ 22.00 $ 440.00 NOBID NO BID 

B48 3C1280 "Y" BRANCH, 2" x (FOUR11" 10 EA Ford #Y11-474 NL $ 45.35 $ 453.50 NOBID NO BID $ 46.49 $ 464.90 $ 45.50 $ 455.00 NOBID NOBID 
Mueller B2434F or 

B49 3W1155 Meter VB42-7W Reset 150 EA Ford VB42 7W NL $ 63.68 $ 9,552.00 NO BID NOBID $ 83.06 $ 12,459.00 $ 78.75 $ 11,812.50 NOBID NO BID 
Mueller B2434F or 

B50 3W1160 Meter VB42-9W Reset 40 EA Ford VB42 9W NL $ 64.42 $ 2,576.80 NO BID NO BID $ 84.95 $ 3,398.00 $ 79.50 $ 3,180.00 NO BID NO BID 
Mueller B2434F or 

B51 3W1165 Meter FVB4212W 314" x 12" Reset 10 EA Ford VB42 12W NL $ 66.53 $ 665.30 NOBID NOBID $ 8788 $ 878.80 $ 8150 $ 815.00 NO BID NOBID 
Mueller B2434F or 

B52 3W1225 Meter FVB4215W 314" x 15" Reset 5 EA Ford VB42 15W NL $ 67.00 $ 335.00 NOBID NO BID $ 9086 $ 454.30 $ 84.00 $ 420.00 NOBID NO BID 
Mueller B2434F or 

B53 3W1170 Meter FVB4218W 314" x 18" Reset 10 EA Ford VB42 18W NL $ 75.80 $ 758.00 NO BID NO BID $ 97.87 $ 978.70 $ 92.50 $ 925.00 NOBID NO BID 
Mueller or 

B54 3W1180 Meter VB44 1" x 10" W Reset 5 EA Ford VB44 10W NL $ 131.75 $ 658.75 NO BID NO BID $ 149.91 $ 749.55 $ 140.50 $ 702.50 NOBID NOBID 

F:\IFB\IFB 16-1733BLS No Lead Brass Water, Sewer, and Backflow Products.xlsx Page 18 



IFB #16-1733BLS No-Lead Brass Water, Sewer, and Backflow Products Ferguson Waterworks Fortiline, Inc. HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.IIMIJnic:ipal Water Works, Southern Supply Company 

will automatically extend and oopulate; Bidder to verify accuracyl 
Sarasota, FL Tampa, FL Sarasota, FL Sanford, FL Sarasota, FL 

PRODUCT DESCRIPTION EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED 

SUB TOTAL. GROUP B 

detailed attachment is applicable. 

GRAND TOTAL. GROUP B 

GROUPC 

BRASS BACKFLOW PREVENTION DEVICES 

SUB TOTAL. GROUP C 

GRAND TOTAL. GROUP C 

F:\IFB\IFB 16-1733BLS No Lead Brass Water, Sewer, and Backflow Products.xlsx Page 19 


