

MEMORANDUM



Financial Management Dept
Purchasing Division
1112 Manatee Ave W, Ste 803
Bradenton, FL 34205

MANATEE COUNTY
FLORIDA

Phone: 941.749-3055
Fax: 941.749-3034
www.olga.valcich@mymanatee.org

To: All Bidders
Date: April 28, 2011
From: Olga Valcich, Construction Buyer
Subject: IFB #11-0576-OV / Manatee County Utilities Maintenance and Administration Building.

A handwritten signature in cursive script, appearing to read "Olga Valcich".

All Bidders:

Attached are the tabulation results for Bid "A" and Bid "B" for the above referenced project.

Should you have any questions or comments, please contact the undersigned.

Thank you for your continued interest in the Manatee County Bidding Process.

Olga Valcich, Construction Buyer
941-749-3055

LARRY BUSTLE * MICHAEL GALLEN * JOHN R. CHAPPIE * ROBIN DISABATINO * DONNA G. HAYES * CAROL WHITMORE * JOE McCLASH
District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7

Bid Tabulation
IFB#11-0576-OV
Manatee County Utilities Maintenance and Administration Building

Bid "A" - 270 Days Completion				Cardinal Contractors, Inc Lakewood Ranch, FL 941.377.8555		Construction Technology Group, Inc. Plant City, FL 813.752.2959		Delesline Construction, Inc. Palmetto, FL 941.723.6112	
Item	Description	U/M	QTY.	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	Mobilization / Demobilization	LS	1	\$ 109,031.00	\$ 109,031.00	\$ 220,000.00	\$ 220,000.00	\$ 84,415.00	\$ 84,415.00
2	Temporary Erosion Control	LS	1	\$ 3,155.00	\$ 3,155.00	\$ 3,500.00	\$ 3,500.00	\$ 3,439.00	\$ 3,439.00
3	Sitework - Complete	LS	1	\$ 149,185.00	\$ 149,185.00	\$ 200,000.00	\$ 200,000.00	\$ 174,948.00	\$ 174,948.00
4	Landscape and Irrigation	LS	1	\$ 15,400.00	\$ 15,400.00	\$ 15,000.00	\$ 15,000.00	\$ 15,777.00	\$ 15,777.00
5	Building - Complete	LS	1	\$ 1,951,259.00	\$ 1,951,259.00	\$ 1,825,000.00	\$ 1,825,000.00	\$ 1,764,992.00	\$ 1,764,992.00
6	Rain Harvest Cistern	LS	1	\$ 39,743.00	\$ 39,743.00	\$ 45,000.00	\$ 45,000.00	\$ 41,906.00	\$ 41,906.00
7	Discretionary Work				\$ 75,000.00		\$ 75,000.00		\$ 75,000.00
BID "A" TOTAL BID PRICE					\$ 2,342,773.00		\$ 2,383,500.00		\$ 2,160,477.00
8	Removal/Replacement of Hazardous Material	CY	6	\$ 226.00	\$ 1,356.00	\$ 51.00	\$ 306.00	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 30,000.00
	Acknowledged Addendum # 1 Acknowledged Addendum # 2 Acknowledged Addendum # 3 Provided Price for Removal/Replacement of Haz Mat. Site Visit Florida Trench Safety Act Contractor's Questionnaire License Requirement: General Contractor Drug Free Work Place Certification Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certification Bid Bond			Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes		Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes		Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes	see below
									Extended total corrected in accordance with Article A.29, Mathematical Errors of the IFB

Bid Tabulation
IFB#11-0576-OV
Manatee County Utilities Maintenance and Administration Building

Bid "A" - 270 Days Completion				D.L. Porter Constructors, Inc. Sarasota, FL 941.929.9400		E.O. Koch Construction, Inc. Seabring, FL 863.385.8649		DeAngelis Diamond Construction Inc. Port Charlotte, FL 941.255.3324	
Item	Description	U/M	QTY.	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	Mobilization / Demobilization	LS	1	\$ 98,261.00	\$ 98,261.00	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 50,000.00	\$ 50,000.00
2	Temporary Erosion Control	LS	1	\$ 1,545.00	\$ 1,545.00	\$ 3,500.00	\$ 3,500.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00
3	Sitework - Complete	LS	1	\$ 200,921.00	\$ 200,921.00	\$ 163,148.00	\$ 163,148.00	\$ 160,000.00	\$ 160,000.00
4	Landscape and Irrigation	LS	1	\$ 12,125.00	\$ 12,125.00	\$ 18,535.00	\$ 18,535.00	\$ 12,000.00	\$ 12,000.00
5	Building - Complete	LS	1	\$ 1,702,125.00	\$ 1,702,125.00	\$ 1,711,855.00	\$ 1,711,855.00	\$ 1,767,000.00	\$ 1,767,000.00
6	Rain Harvest Cistern	LS	1	\$ 39,743.00	\$ 39,743.00	\$ 58,810.00	\$ 58,810.00	\$ 30,000.00	\$ 30,000.00
7	Discretionary Work				\$ 75,000.00		\$ 75,000.00		\$ 75,000.00
BID "A" TOTAL BID PRICE					\$ 2,129,720.00		\$ 2,055,848.00		\$ 2,095,000.00
8	Removal/Replacement of Hazardous Material	CY	6	\$ 125.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 6,000.00	\$ 470.00	\$ 2,820.00
	Acknowledged Addendum # 1			Yes		Yes		Yes	
	Acknowledged Addendum # 2			Yes		Yes		Yes	
	Acknowledged Addendum # 3			Yes		Yes		Yes	
	Provided Price for Removal/Replacement of Haz Mat.			Yes		Yes		Yes	
	Site Visit			Yes		Yes		Yes	
	Florida Trench Safety Act			Yes		Yes		Yes	
	Contractor's Questionnaire			Yes		Yes		Yes	
	License Requirement: General Contractor			Yes		Yes		Yes	
	Drug Free Work Place Certification			Yes		Yes		Yes	
	Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certification			Yes		Yes		Yes	
	Bid Bond			Yes		Yes		Yes	

Bid Tabulation
IFB#11-0576-OV

Manatee County Utilities Maintenance and Administration Building

Bid "A" - 270 Days Completion				Halfacre Construction Company Sarasota, FL 941.907.9099		Holland Construction Corporation Sarasota, FL 941.953.4500		J.L. Wallace, Inc. Fort Myers, FL 239.437.1111	
Item	Description	U/M	QTY.	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	Mobilization / Demobilization	LS	1	\$ 147,566.00	\$ 147,566.00	\$ 7,500.00	\$ 7,500.00	\$ 16,000.00	\$ 16,000.00
2	Temporary Erosion Control	LS	1	\$ 2,310.00	\$ 2,310.00	\$ 1,075.00	\$ 1,075.00	\$ 3,500.00	\$ 3,500.00
3	Sitework - Complete	LS	1	\$ 177,930.00	\$ 177,930.00	\$ 197,098.00	\$ 197,098.00	\$ 220,000.00	\$ 220,000.00
4	Landscape and Irrigation	LS	1	\$ 16,850.00	\$ 16,850.00	\$ 14,745.00	\$ 14,745.00	\$ 12,000.00	\$ 12,000.00
5	Building - Complete	LS	1	\$ 1,807,307.00	\$ 1,807,307.00	\$ 1,748,304.00	\$ 1,748,304.00	\$ 1,929,700.00	\$ 1,929,700.00
6	Rain Harvest Cistern	LS	1	\$ 29,583.00	\$ 29,583.00	\$ 43,410.00	\$ 43,410.00	\$ 58,500.00	\$ 58,500.00
7	Discretionary Work			\$ 75,000.00	\$ 75,000.00	\$ 75,000.00	\$ 75,000.00	\$ 75,000.00	\$ 75,000.00
BID "A" TOTAL BID PRICE					\$ 2,256,546.00		\$ 2,087,132.00		\$ 2,314,700.00
8	Removal/Replacement of Hazardous Material	CY	6	\$ 385.00	\$ 2,310.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 6,000.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 3,000.00
	Acknowledged Addendum # 1 Acknowledged Addendum # 2 Acknowledged Addendum # 3 Provided Price for Removal/Replacement of Haz Mat. Site Visit Florida Trench Safety Act Contractor's Questionnaire License Requirement: General Contractor Drug Free Work Place Certification Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certification Bid Bond			Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes		Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes		Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes	

**Bid Tabulation
IFB#11-0576-OV**

Manatee County Utilities Maintenance and Administration Building

Bid "A" - 270 Days Completion				John F. Swift, Inc. Sarasota, FL 941.951.6100		Magnum Builders of Sarasota, Inc. Sarasota, FL 941.351.5560		Manasota Commercial Construction Company, Inc. Bradenton, FL 941.795.3732	
Item	Description	U/M	QTY.	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	Mobilization / Demobilization	LS	1	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 113,881.00	\$ 113,881.00	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 5,000.00
2	Temporary Erosion Control	LS	1	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 1,617.00	\$ 1,617.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00
3	Sitework - Complete	LS	1	\$ 212,000.00	\$ 212,000.00	\$ 201,735.00	\$ 201,735.00	\$ 240,000.00	\$ 240,000.00
4	Landscape and Irrigation	LS	1	\$ 13,200.00	\$ 13,200.00	\$ 13,360.00	\$ 13,360.00	\$ 14,000.00	\$ 14,000.00
5	Building - Complete	LS	1	\$ 1,824,300.00	\$ 1,824,300.00	\$ 1,894,226.00	\$ 1,894,226.00	\$ 2,057,000.00	\$ 2,057,000.00
6	Rain Harvest Cistern	LS	1	\$ 42,000.00	\$ 42,000.00	\$ 52,815.00	\$ 52,815.00	\$ 46,000.00	\$ 46,000.00
7	Discretionary Work				\$ 75,000.00		\$ 75,000.00		\$ 75,000.00
BID "A" TOTAL BID PRICE					\$ 2,178,000.00		\$ 2,352,634.00		\$ 2,438,000.00
8	Removal/Replacement of Hazardous Material	CY	6	\$ 500.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 6,000.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 240.00
	Acknowledged Addendum # 1 Acknowledged Addendum # 2 Acknowledged Addendum # 3 Provided Price for Removal/Replacement of Haz Mat. Site Visit Florida Trench Safety Act Contractor's Questionnaire License Requirement: General Contractor Drug Free Work Place Certification Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certification Bid Bond			Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes		Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No Yes Yes Yes		CBC License Provided	Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Bid Tabulation
IFB#11-0576-OV
Manatee County Utilities Maintenance and Administration Building

Bid "A" - 270 Days Completion						NDC Construction Bradenton, FL 941.747.1062		Pat Cook Construction, Inc. Bradenton, FL 941.749.1959		R.E. Crawford Construction, LLC Sarasota, FL 941.907.0010	
Item	Description	U/M	QTY.	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price		
1	Mobilization / Demobilization	LS	1	\$ 115,000.00	\$ 115,000.00	\$ 35,000.00	\$ 35,000.00	\$ 30,000.00	\$ 30,000.00		
2	Temporary Erosion Control	LS	1	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 2,300.00		
3	Sitework - Complete	LS	1	\$ 200,000.00	\$ 200,000.00	\$ 188,538.00	\$ 188,538.00	\$ 191,687.00	\$ 191,687.00		
4	Landscape and Irrigation	LS	1	\$ 14,500.00	\$ 14,500.00	\$ 15,000.00	\$ 15,000.00	\$ 11,365.00	\$ 11,365.00		
5	Building - Complete	LS	1	\$ 1,858,000.00	\$ 1,858,000.00	\$ 1,750,000.00	\$ 1,750,000.00	\$ 1,745,648.00	\$ 1,745,648.00		
6	Rain Harvest Cistern	LS	1	\$ 62,000.00	\$ 62,000.00	\$ 40,000.00	\$ 40,000.00	\$ 35,000.00	\$ 35,000.00		
7	Discretionary Work				\$ 75,000.00		\$ 75,000.00		\$ 75,000.00		
BID "A" TOTAL BID PRICE					\$ 2,327,000.00	\$ 2,108,538.00	\$ 2,091,000.00				
8	Removal/Replacement of Hazardous Material	CY	6	\$ 300.00	\$ 1,800.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 418.00	\$ 2,508.00		
	Acknowledged Addendum # 1			Yes		Yes					
	Acknowledged Addendum # 2			Yes		Yes					
	Acknowledged Addendum # 3			Yes		Yes					
	Provided Price for Removal/Replacement of Haz Mat.			Yes		Yes					
	Site Visit			Yes		Yes			see below		
	Florida Trench Safety Act			Yes		Yes					
	Contractor's Questionnaire			Yes		Yes					
	License Requirement: General Contractor			Yes		Yes					
	Drug Free Work Place Certification			Yes		Yes					
	Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certification			Yes		Yes					
	Bid Bond			Yes		Yes					
									Extended total corrected in accordance with Article A.29, Mathematical Errors of the IFB		

**Bid Tabulation
IFB#11-0576-OV**

Manatee County Utilities Maintenance and Administration Building

Bid "A" - 270 Days Completion

		Paul J. Sierra Construction Inc. Tampa, FL 813.228.6661		Stellar Development, Inc. Bradenton, FL 941.907.8788		Zirkelbach Construction Palmetto, FL 941.729.0000				
Item	Description	U/M	QTY.	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	
1	Mobilization / Demobilization	LS	1	\$ 40,000.00	\$ 40,000.00	\$ 30,000.00	\$ 30,000.00	\$ 5,997.00	\$ 5,997.00	
2	Temporary Erosion Control	LS	1	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	
3	Sitework - Complete	LS	1	\$ 230,965.42	\$ 230,965.42	\$ 185,000.00	\$ 185,000.00	\$ 178,675.00	\$ 178,675.00	
4	Landscape and Irrigation	LS	1	\$ 16,050.54	\$ 16,050.54	\$ 12,500.00	\$ 12,500.00	\$ 13,150.00	\$ 13,150.00	
5	Building - Complete	LS	1	\$ 2,016,926.01	\$ 2,016,926.01	\$ 1,829,000.00	\$ 1,829,000.00	\$ 2,107,937.00	\$ 2,107,937.00	
6	Rain Harvest Cistern	LS	1	\$ 75,008.95	\$ 75,008.95	\$ 40,000.00	\$ 40,000.00	\$ 39,743.00	\$ 39,743.00	
7	Discretionary Work			\$ 75,000.00	\$ 75,000.00	\$ 75,000.00	\$ 75,000.00	\$ 75,000.00	\$ 75,000.00	
BID "A" TOTAL BID PRICE					\$ 2,455,450.92		\$ 2,174,000.00		\$ 2,421,502.00	
8	Removal/Replacement of Hazardous Material	CY	6	\$ 410.76	\$ 2,464.56	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 6,000.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 570.00	
Acknowledged Addendum # 1 Acknowledged Addendum # 2 Acknowledged Addendum # 3 Provided Price for Removal /Replacement of Haz Mat. Site Visit Florida Trench Safety Act Contractor's Questionaire License Requirement: General Contractor Drug Free Work Place Certification Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certification Bid Bond				Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes			Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes			Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes NO
				Total Bid Price corrected in accordance with Article A.29, Mathematical Errors of the IFB. Total Price on bid stated as \$2,455,552.88						

PREPARED BY ARCHITECT:

[Signature]

APPROVED BY PROJECT MANAGER:

[Signature] 4-19-11

APPROVED BY PURCHASING:

[Signature] 4/18/2011

**Bid Tabulation
IFB#11-0576-OV**

Manatee County Utilities Maintenance and Administration Building

Bid "B" - 180 Days Completion				Cardinal Contractors, Inc Lakewood Ranch, FL 941.377.8555		Construction Technology Group, Inc. Plant City, FL 813.752.2959		Delesline Construction, Inc. Palmetto, FL 941.723.6112	
Item	Description	U/M	QTY.	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	Mobilization / Demobilization	LS	1	\$ 108,691.00	\$ 108,691.00	\$ 220,000.00	\$ 220,000.00	\$ 84,415.00	\$ 84,415.00
2	Temporary Erosion Control	LS	1	\$ 3,155.00	\$ 3,155.00	\$ 3,500.00	\$ 3,500.00	\$ 3,439.00	\$ 3,439.00
3	Sitework - Complete	LS	1	\$ 149,185.00	\$ 149,185.00	\$ 210,000.00	\$ 210,000.00	\$ 174,948.00	\$ 174,948.00
4	Landscape and Irrigation	LS	1	\$ 15,400.00	\$ 15,400.00	\$ 15,000.00	\$ 15,000.00	\$ 15,777.00	\$ 15,777.00
5	Building - Complete	LS	1	\$ 2,053,299.00	\$ 2,053,299.00	\$ 1,875,000.00	\$ 1,875,000.00	\$ 1,850,372.00	\$ 1,850,372.00
6	Rain Harvest Cistern	LS	1	\$ 39,743.00	\$ 39,743.00	\$ 45,000.00	\$ 45,000.00	\$ 41,906.00	\$ 41,906.00
7	Discretionary Work				\$ 75,000.00		\$ 75,000.00		\$ 75,000.00
BID "A" TOTAL BID PRICE					\$ 2,444,473.00		\$ 2,443,500.00		\$ 2,245,857.00
8	Removal/Replacement of Hazardous Material	CY	6	\$ 226.00	\$ 1,356.00	\$ 51.00	\$ 306.00	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 30,000.00
	Acknowledged Addendum # 1 Acknolgedged Addendum # 2 Acknolgedged Addendum # 3 Provided Price for Removal /Replacement of Haz Mat. Site Visit Florida Trench Safety Act Contractor's Questionnaire License Requirement: General Contractor Drug Free Work Place Certification Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certification Bid Bond			Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes		Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes		Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes	see below
	Extended total corrected in accordance with Article A.29, Mathematical Errors of the IFB								

Bid Tabulation
IFB#11-0576-OV
Manatee County Utilities Maintenance and Administration Building

Bid "B" - 180 Days Completion				D.L. Porter Constructors, Inc. Sarasota, FL 941.929.9400		E.O. Koch Construction, Inc. Seabring, FL 863.385.8649		DeAngelis Diamond Construction Inc. Port Charlotte, FL 941.255.3324	
Item	Description	U/M	QTY.	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	Mobilization / Demobilization	LS	1	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 50,000.00	\$ 50,000.00
2	Temporary Erosion Control	LS	1	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 3,500.00	\$ 3,500.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00
3	Sitework - Complete	LS	1	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 163,148.00	\$ 163,148.00	\$ 160,000.00	\$ 160,000.00
4	Landscape and Irrigation	LS	1	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 18,535.00	\$ 18,535.00	\$ 12,000.00	\$ 12,000.00
5	Building - Complete	LS	1	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 1,841,425.00	\$ 1,841,425.00	\$ 1,767,000.00	\$ 1,767,000.00
6	Rain Harvest Cistern	LS	1	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 58,810.00	\$ 58,810.00	\$ 30,000.00	\$ 30,000.00
7	Discretionary Work				\$ 75,000.00		\$ 75,000.00		\$ 75,000.00
BID "A" TOTAL BID PRICE					NO BID		\$ 2,185,418.00		\$ 2,095,000.00
8	Removal/Replacement of Hazardous Material	CY	6	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 6,000.00	\$ 470.00	\$ 2,820.00
Acknowledged Addendum # 1 Acknowledged Addendum # 2 Acknowledged Addendum # 3 Provided Price for Removal /Replacement of Haz Mat. Site Visit Florida Trench Safety Act Contractor's Questionnaire License Requirement: General Contractor Drug Free Work Place Certification Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certification Bid Bond				Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes	NO BID	Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes		Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes	

Bid Tabulation
IFB#11-0576-OV
Manatee County Utilities Maintenance and Administration Building

Bid "B" - 180 Days Completion				Halfacre Construction Company Sarasota, FL 941.907.9099		Holland Construction Corporation Sarasota, FL 941.953.4500		J.L. Wallace, Inc. Fort Myers, FL 239.437.1111	
Item	Description	U/M	QTY.	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	Mobilization / Demobilization	LS	1	\$ 107,706.00	\$ 107,706.00	\$ 7,500.00	\$ 7,500.00	\$ 16,000.00	\$ 16,000.00
2	Temporary Erosion Control	LS	1	\$ 2,310.00	\$ 2,310.00	\$ 1,075.00	\$ 1,075.00	\$ 3,500.00	\$ 3,500.00
3	Stework - Complete	LS	1	\$ 177,930.00	\$ 177,930.00	\$ 197,098.00	\$ 197,098.00	\$ 220,000.00	\$ 220,000.00
4	Landscape and Irrigation	LS	1	\$ 16,850.00	\$ 16,850.00	\$ 14,745.00	\$ 14,745.00	\$ 12,000.00	\$ 12,000.00
5	Building - Complete	LS	1	\$ 1,806,707.00	\$ 1,806,707.00	\$ 1,748,304.00	\$ 1,748,304.00	\$ 1,929,700.00	\$ 1,929,700.00
6	Rain Harvest Cistern	LS	1	\$ 29,583.00	\$ 29,583.00	\$ 43,410.00	\$ 43,410.00	\$ -	\$ -
7	Discretionary Work			\$ -	\$ 75,000.00	\$ -	\$ 75,000.00	\$ -	\$ 75,000.00
BID "A" TOTAL BID PRICE					\$ 2,216,086.00		\$ 2,087,132.00		\$ 2,256,200.00
8	Removal/Replacement of Hazardous Material	CY	6	\$ 385.00	\$ 2,310.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 6,000.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 3,000.00
Acknowledged Addendum # 1 Acknowledged Addendum # 2 Acknowledged Addendum # 3 Provided Price for Removal /Replacement of Haz Mat. Site Visit Florida Trench Safety Act Contractor's Questionaire License Requirement: General Contractor Drug Free Work Place Certification Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certification Bid Bond				Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes		Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes		price for bid item #6 is missing Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes	
Total Bid Price corrected in accordance with Article A.29, Mathematical Errors of the IFB. Total Price on bid stated as \$2,216,087.00								Total Bid Price corrected in accordance with Article A.29, Mathematical Errors of the IFB. Total Price on bid stated as \$2,314,700.00	

Bid Tabulation
IFB#11-0576-OV

Manatee County Utilities Maintenance and Administration Building

Bid "B" - 180 Days Completion				John F. Swift, Inc. Sarasota, FL 941.951.6100		Magnum Builders of Sarasota, Inc. Sarasota, FL 941.351.5560		Manasota Commercial Construction Company, Inc. Bradenton, FL 941.795.3732	
Item	Description	U/M	QTY.	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	Mobilization / Demobilization	LS	1	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 113,881.00	\$ 113,881.00	NO BID	NO BID
2	Temporary Erosion Control	LS	1	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 1,617.00	\$ 1,617.00	NO BID	NO BID
3	Sitework - Complete	LS	1	\$ 212,000.00	\$ 212,000.00	\$ 201,735.00	\$ 201,735.00	NO BID	NO BID
4	Landscape and Irrigation	LS	1	\$ 13,200.00	\$ 13,200.00	\$ 13,360.00	\$ 13,360.00	NO BID	NO BID
5	Building - Complete	LS	1	\$ 1,866,300.00	\$ 1,866,300.00	\$ 1,894,226.00	\$ 1,894,226.00	NO BID	NO BID
6	Rain Harvest Cistern	LS	1	\$ 42,000.00	\$ 42,000.00	\$ 52,815.00	\$ 52,815.00	NO BID	NO BID
7	Discretionary Work				\$ 75,000.00		\$ 75,000.00		\$ 75,000.00
BID "A" TOTAL BID PRICE					\$ 2,220,000.00		\$ 2,352,634.00		NO BID
8	Removal/Replacement of Hazardous Material	CY	6	\$ 500.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 6,000.00	NO BID	NO BID
Acknowledged Addendum # 1 Acknowledged Addendum # 2 Acknowledged Addendum # 3 Provided Price for Removal /Replacement of Haz Mat. Site Visit Florida Trench Safety Act Contractor's Questionnaire License Requirement: General Contractor Drug Free Work Place Certification Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certification Bid Bond				Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes		Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes		CBC License Provided	Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Bid Tabulation
IFB#11-0576-OV
Manatee County Utilities Maintenance and Administration Building

Bid "B" - 180 Days Completion				NDC Construction Bradenton, FL 941.747.1062		Pat Cook Construction, Inc. Bradenton, FL 941.749.1959		R.E. Crawford Construction, LLC Sarasota, FL 941.907.0010	
Item	Description	U/M	QTY.	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	Mobilization / Demobilization	LS	1	\$ 115,000.00	\$ 115,000.00	\$ 35,000.00	\$ 35,000.00	\$ 30,000.00	\$ 30,000.00
2	Temporary Erosion Control	LS	1	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 2,300.00
3	Sitework - Complete	LS	1	\$ 200,000.00	\$ 200,000.00	\$ 188,538.00	\$ 188,538.00	\$ 191,687.00	\$ 191,687.00
4	Landscape and Irrigation	LS	1	\$ 14,500.00	\$ 14,500.00	\$ 15,000.00	\$ 15,000.00	\$ 11,365.00	\$ 11,365.00
5	Building - Complete	LS	1	\$ 1,858,000.00	\$ 1,858,000.00	\$ 1,750,000.00	\$ 1,750,000.00	\$ 1,773,648.00	\$ 1,773,648.00
6	Rain Harvest Cistern	LS	1	\$ 62,000.00	\$ 62,000.00	\$ 40,000.00	\$ 40,000.00	\$ 35,000.00	\$ 35,000.00
7	Discretionary Work				\$ 75,000.00		\$ 75,000.00		\$ 75,000.00
BID "A" TOTAL BID PRICE					\$ 2,327,000.00		\$ 2,108,538.00		\$ 2,119,000.00
8	Removal/Replacement of Hazardous Material	CY	6	\$ 300.00	\$ 1,800.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 418.00	\$ 2,508.00
	Acknowledged Addendum # 1			Yes		Yes		Yes	
	Acknowledged Addendum # 2			Yes		Yes		Yes	
	Acknowledged Addendum # 3			Yes		Yes		Yes	
	Provided Price for Removal /Replacement of Haz Mat.			Yes		Yes		Yes	
	Site Visit			Yes		Yes		Yes	
	Florida Trench Safety Act			Yes		Yes		Yes	
	Contractor's Questionnaire			Yes		Yes		Yes	
	License Requirement: General Contractor			Yes		Yes		Yes	
	Drug Free Work Place Certification			Yes		Yes		Yes	
	Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certification			Yes		Yes		Yes	
	Bid Bond			Yes		Yes		Yes	
									unit price qty. is wrong in bid item #8
									see below
									Extended total corrected in accordance with Article A.29, Mathematical Errors of the IFB

Bid Tabulation
IFB#11-0576-OV
Manatee County Utilities Maintenance and Administration Building

Bid "B" - 180 Days Completion				Paul J. Sierra Construction Inc. Tampa, FL 813.228.6661		Stellar Development, Inc. Bradenton, FL 941.907.8788		Zirkelbach Construction Palmetto, FL 941.729.0000	
Item	Description	U/M	QTY.	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	Mobilization / Demobilization	LS	1	\$ 40,000.00	\$ 40,000.00	\$ 30,000.00	\$ 30,000.00	\$ 5,997.00	\$ 5,997.00
2	Temporary Erosion Control	LS	1	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00
3	Sitework - Complete	LS	1	\$ 208,015.74	\$ 208,015.74	\$ 185,000.00	\$ 185,000.00	\$ 178,675.00	\$ 178,675.00
4	Landscape and Irrigation	LS	1	\$ 1,723.23	\$ 1,723.23	\$ 12,500.00	\$ 12,500.00	\$ 13,150.00	\$ 13,150.00
5	Building - Complete	LS	1	\$ 1,993,482.01	\$ 1,993,482.01	\$ 1,871,000.00	\$ 1,871,000.00	\$ 2,207,937.00	\$ 2,207,937.00
6	Rain Harvest Cistern	LS	1	\$ 75,008.95	\$ 75,008.95	\$ 40,000.00	\$ 40,000.00	\$ 39,743.00	\$ 39,743.00
7	Discretionary Work			\$ 75,000.00	\$ 75,000.00	\$ 75,000.00	\$ 75,000.00	\$ 75,000.00	\$ 75,000.00
BID "A" TOTAL BID PRICE				\$	2,394,729.93	\$	2,216,000.00	\$	2,521,502.00
8	Removal/Replacement of Hazardous Material	CY	6	\$ 410.76	\$ 2,464.56	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 6,000.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 570.00
Acknowledged Addendum # 1 Acknowledged Addendum # 2 Acknowledged Addendum # 3 Provided Price for Removal/Replacement of Haz Mat. Site Visit Florida Trench Safety Act Contractor's Questionnaire License Requirement: General Contractor Drug Free Work Place Certification Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certification Bid Bond				Yes		Yes		Yes	
Total Bid Price corrected in accordance with Article A.29, Mathematical Errors of the IFB. Total Price on bid stated as \$2,432,108.88				Yes		Yes		No	

PREPARED BY ARCHITECT:

APPROVED BY PROJECT MANAGER:

APPROVED BY PURCHASING:

Armedic
W. J. David 4/18/2011
D.S. 4-19-11