IFB # 10-0040-DS
Project Title:Whitfield Ave @ Prospect Road
Project # 341-6068360

Aja P:.;iniiln;lusnﬁes of Apac-Southeast, Ine, C&M Road Builders, Inc. D.R. Swaanson Co. EHC, Inc. Gator Grading & Paving, LLC Kuxhausen Construction, Inc. Meleod Land Services, Inc.
s10, G‘:';" :‘r;'; 4. 1451 Myrede St 728, 33rd Street East 1720 £ Jobean Rd, # 208 136¢ Raihead Bivd. 4220, 15th Street E. P.0. Box 21087 7405, 28th Street Court East
Nokomis, FL 34275 Sarasota, FL 34234 Sarasota, FL 34243 % Port Charloite, FL 33948 Naples, FL 34110 Bradenton, FL 34208 Sarasota, FL 34276 Sarasota, FL 34243
9412486-3600 (941)358-7178 (941) 758-1933 (941)629-8822 (541) 254-6050 (941) 751-3900 (941) 379-6603 (941)922-1861
IN m UNITPRICE | EXTENDED UNIT EX'ENDED UNIT PRICE m UNIT PRICE EmeD UNIT PRICE EXTENDED UNIT PRICE] EXTENDED [QyuNIT PRICE EXTENDED
ITEMNO. DESCRIPTION (BID A) 160 DAYS QUANTITY | UNITS M'T(;R gl PRICE(S) T | PRICE®) PRICE PRICE(S) s PRICE(S) ) PRICE(S) e PRICE(S) © PRICE(S) ) PRICE(S)
1 101-1 Mobilization [ Ls $5.200.00 4520000 62.600.60 6260000 1805000 18.030.00 16.390.00 16,390.00 455647 455647 11.790.00 11.790.00 45,000.00 45,000.00 13.863.14 13.863.14
2 102-1 MOT [ LS 3550000 35,500.00 22.105.00 22.105.00 18,0000 18.000.00 31.760.00 31,760.00 3461453 3461453 23,400.00 23.400.00 10.000.00 10,000.00 13.733.17 13.733.17
3 33123 1" Type S-HHi Asphalt 38743 TON 76.40 29.599.65 69.00 2673267 36.00 3331898 11680 4525182 83.98 3253637 $4.75 32.834.69 $1.00 3138183 7335 28.495 48
4 3312 1-1.4" Type S-1 Asphalt 484.30 TON 7230 3501489 69.50 3365885 83.00 40.196.90 11740 56.856.82 83.52 40,448.74 §7.25 4225548 ° §1.50 3947045 7397 3582367
5 285-709 10" Base Group (9) 2,130 SY 20.25 43,132.50 1235 2630550 11.00 23.430.00 2210 47.073.00 19.09 10.661.70 1110 23,643.00 2650 56.445.00 1589 33.845.70
6 160-6 10" Stabilized Subbase (LBR60) 2130 SY 6.15 13.099.50 715 15.229.50 6.10 12.993.00 9.60 20.448.00 7.36 15,676 .80 9.15 19,489.50 7.00 14.910.00 7.02 14.952.60
7 3277013 {Pavement Milling 4,780 SY 1.50 7.170.00 1.90 9,082.00 275 13,145.00 3.40 16,252.00 2.65 12.667.00 1.25 597500 2.50 11.950.00 211 10,085 80
8 110-1-1 Clearing & Grubbing (SWALES) 035 AC 13,550.00 4,742.50 40,500.00 14,175 00 12,000.00 4,200 00 6,140 00 2,149.00 558167 1,953.58 2532846 8.864.96 10,000.00 3,500.00 23,888 46 8,360 96
9 120-1 Regular Excavation 1419 Y 9.10 1291290 9.05 1284195 9.00 12.771.00 1150 16.318.50 149 637131 17.70 25.116.30 15.00 21,285.00 632 8,968 08
10 120-6 Embankment (Regular) 282 CcY 21.20 5978.40 4420 12,464.40 2285 6.443.70 250 705.00 3.19 899.58 5.45 1.536.90 10.00 2.820.00 1272 3.587.04
1 5222 Concrete Driveways 6" 208 SY 29.65 6.167.20 2846 5.919.68 28.00 5,824.00 3220 6,697.60 40.75 3,476.00 28.20 5.865.60 45.00 9,360.00 30.87 6.420.96
12 570-1-2 {Sodding-Bahia 1,681 SY 1.55 2,605.55 163 2.740,03 1.65 2,773.65 2,60 4,37060 4.59 7.715.79 1.40 235340 2.00 336200 1.90 3.19390
13 520-1-10 7(‘“:!1& Gutter Cone, (Type F) 274 LF 1605 4,397.70 1540 421960 1500 4,11000 .}7 1790 490460 1167 3,197.58 16.60 454840 16.25 4,,4250 'l— 12.00 3.288.00
14 104-13-1 IStaked Silt Fence, Type Iit 2366 LE 105 248430 145 3.430.70 1.35 3,194.10 1.10 2,602.60 194 4.590.04 0.90 2,12940 2.00 4.73200 1.03 243698
15 536-1-1 Guardrail Roadway 38 LF 18.10 687.5 T'T.'§4 65892 95.00 361000 l 19.60 74430 79.80 3.03240 17.80 676.40 20.00 760.00 66.15 251370
16 425-3-41 Jumion%ox 3 EA 212500 637500 2.745.00 823500 1,67500 502500 2‘430.()0 744000 1,162.00 3,486.00 163500 4.905.00 2.700.00 8,100.00 187177 5.&;3.3!
17 435-12.01  |CurbInket Top (type 9) i EA 1915.00 191500 310000 310000 1.650.00 1.650.00 { 349000 3.49000 151820 151820 221000 221060 | SR 2.960,00 2.093.05 2.093.05
18 430-171-201 IZ")HSWw ERCP and IS"?(CP 1.024 LF SEJS 30.4645‘0 2335 24,32000 27.00 21.64&00 l 4_3‘:60 44,646.40 3233 33,105.92 !‘ 2290 23.449.60 40‘(70 4096000 2601 2&3‘4.24
19 430-171-101 24" R(;l:" . 195 LF 35.10 6.844& 2256 5,76420 3850 750750 l 5340 12.413.00 46.34 903630 38.00 E 10.00 5200 10,140.00 3399 &.228.05 1
20 430-984—3&3 ‘Mttﬂmd E:l_d Section {2"x18" ERCP 8 EA 74400 5,‘35?_,00 730,00 5.840.00 1.150.00 9.200.00 992;00 7.92000 44949 3,59592 44500 3.560.00 I B 700.00 5,600.00 634.14 507312
21 430-982-129 Mitered End Section 24" RCP 2 EA 800.00 1,600.00 84500 1.690.00 2.200.00 4.400.00 1.600.00 3.20000 53450 1.069.00 1,125.00 2.250.00 775.00 1.550.00 955.26 191052
22 425 -1-571 Ditch Bottom Inlet 5 EA 1.800.00 9.,000.00 2.450.00 1225000 1.595.00 797500 221000 1105000 92654 463270 1.385.00 6.925.00 202500 10,125.00 1.506.01 7.53005
23 522-1 4" Concrete Sidewalk (Handicap Ramps) 90 SY 55.00 4.950.00 51.20 4.608.00 4225 380250 5800 5.22000 70.90 6,381.00 4375 393750 3750 3,375.00 87.60 7.884.00
24 630-1-12 Condut (underground) - F&I 55 LF 3.70 203.50 357 196,35 4.15 22825 4.20 231.00 8.05 44275 3.65 200.75 365 200.75 4.98 27390
25 630-1-14 Conduit (underground - Jack and Bore) - F&I 700 LF 13.00 9,100.00 12,50 8.750.00 1235 8,645.00 14.60 10,220.00 9.78 6.846,00 12.80 8.960.00 12.85 8.995.00 6.94 4.858.00
26 632-6-1 Signal Cable- F&I 600 LF 5.95 3,570.00 571 3.426.00 5.75 3,450.00 6.70 4,02000 467 2,.802.00 5.85 3.510.00 5.85 3,510.00 3.06 1.836.00
27 634-6-1 Messenger Cable (38") 800 LF 1.60 1.280.00 1.53 1.224.00 2.65 2,120.00 1.80 1,440.00 4.64 3,712.00 1.60 1.280.00 1.55 1,240.00 301 2,408.00
28 635-1-11 Pull Box - F&I 12 EA 290 00 3,480.00 280 50 3,366.00 280.00 3,360.00 328.00 3,936.00 290.36 3,484.32 290.00 3,480.00 288.75 3,465.00 28223 3,386.76
29 639-1-13 Service (Overhead) 1 AS 3.400.00 3.400.00 3.264.00 3.264.00 1,290.00 1.290.00 3.821.00 3,82100 1.206.13 1.206.13 3.345.00 3.345.00 3.360.00 3.360.00 1,728.95 1.728.95
30 641-14-140  [Concrete Strain Pole - F&I 3 EA 5.100.00 15.300.00 4.896.00 14.688.00 4,685.00 14,055.00 5.731.00 17,193.00 571793 17.153.79 5,015.00 15,045.00 5,040.00 15,120.00 5.904.10 17.712.30
31 650-51-311  |Traffic Signal (3 Section - One Way - Led) - F&I 8 AS 1.015.00 8,120.00 973.10 7,79280 775.00 6.200.00 1.140.00 9.120.00 976.63 7,813.04 99500 7.960.00 1,002.75 8.022.00 898.62 7,188.96
32 653-181 Pedestrian Signal ( Led- One Way) - F&I 8 AS 700.00 5.600.00 660.96 5.287.68 695.00 5.560.00 77400 6.19200 691385 5.534.80 675.00 5.400.00 680.00 5.440.00 631380 5.054.40
33 659-101 [Signal Head Auxiliaries(Backplates Heads 3 & *) - F&I 4 EA 100,00 40000 99.45 39780 2.05 8.20 116.00 464.00 13066 522.64 102.00 408.00 102.00 408.00 87.72 35088
34 660-1-104  |Loop Detector 3 EA 130.00 1,040.00 12240 979.20 57.00 456.00 143.00 1.144.00 17924 143392 125.00 1,000.00 126.00 1.008.00 218.64 1.749.12
35 660-2-101 Loop Assembly (Type A) - F&I 2 AS 745.00 1.490.00 71400 1.428.00 780.00 1.560.00 836.00 167200 603.06 1.206.12 73000 1.460.00 735.00 1.470.00 77437 1.548.74
36 660-2-106  {Loop Assembly (Type F - Modified 6"X40") - F&I 6 AS 850.00 5,100.00 816,00 4.896.00 1.005.00 6.030.00 955.00 5.730.00 751.60 4.509.60 835.00 5,010.00 840.00 5,040.00 88471 5.308.26
37 665-11 Pedestrian Detector (Pole Or Controller Mount) (Type A) - F&I 8 EA 13500 1,080.00 129.54 1.036.32 182.00 1,456.00 15000 1.20000 202.02 1,616.16 13000 1,040.00 13330 1.066.40 17633 1.410.64
670-5-110 Controlier Assembly { NEMA TS-2, 8 Phase) (Type A) - F&I 1 AS__- __z'o.ﬁoo.oo 26‘600‘23—0 2550000 25.50000 23,02000 __23—.020.00 2985000 :’.7),85000 2114064 2114064 24.500.00 24.5'(-}0.00 26.250.00 26,250.00 22.156.87 22,156 87
7HE-11-121 6" Solid Traffic Stripe (White) 3.350 LF 0.65 2.1 77?5 (Té'i 204350 0.65 42_.17750 1 0.70 2.34500 112 375200 0.60 201000 0.65 2,17750 T 0.79 264650
7H1-11-123 12 Solid Traffic Stripe (White) 5-0-5 LF 1.60 952.56 1.53 91035 1.06 ;?5.00 1.70 101150 261 1.55-595 160 952.00 1.55 92225 137 815.15
7T1-(1-125 24" Solid Traffic_Stripe (White) s _ iF 3.20 36800 306 35190 303 e 350 30250 763 87745 310 356,50 315 36225 369 42433
42 T1i-11-22 6" Solid Traffic Stripe (Yellow) 5.250 LE 0.65 341250 061 3.202.50 0.60 3,15000 0.70 367500 LIt 5.82750 0.60 3.15000 0.65 341250 0.78 4,085.00
3 7T !£24—'!1Wrmfﬁc Stripe (Vellow) 820 LF 710 1 172200 204 167280 312 337840 730 1.836.00 3.99 327180 195 1599.00 7.10 KA 224680
44 7I-11-170 Traffic Arrow (White 20 EA 5850 1.170.00 56.10 1,12200 11584 3:“6.80 63-.‘55 1.280.00 78.93 ;373.60 55.00 1.160.00 57.75 1.155.00 5487 1,097 40
35 TUI11-17  [Remove Thermoplastic Marking T SF 240 55200 230 52900 0.90 30700 760 5980 9.34 214820 | 230 529,00 235 54050 1032 237360
i 641-17-160  fConcrete Strain Pole = i EA_ | 893000 §93000 3.568.00 836800 | 718500 | 718500 1063000 10.03000 9.179.94 317994 * 8.70000 8.700.00 §82000 582000 7.160.78 AT |
Engiwﬂ'ingferviws For Joint Use Pole 1 18 640.00 640.9&)_ 61200 1.31500 1.315.00 690.00 690,00 29483 29483 650,00 65000 63000 630.00 3,409.18 3,409.18 l
Discretionary Work 70.000.00 7000000 7000000 76.000.00 70.000.00 7000000 70.000 .00
Acknowledged Addendum # | ; yes yes yes
cknowledged Addendum # 2 yes yes. yes yes yes yes yes yes
Florida Trench Safety Act yes yes yes yes yes yes yes yes
Contractor’s Questionnaire yes yes yes yes yes yes yes yes
Drug Free Work Place yes yes yes yes yes yes yes yes
Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certification yes yes yes yes yes yes yes yes
Bid Bond Enclosed yes yes yes yes yes yes yes yes
Site Visit Confirmed yes yes yes yes yes yes yes yes
A ffidavit submitted if applicable yes yes yes yes yes yes yes yes

NOTES: * unsigned o,




IFB # 10-0040-DS
Project Title:Whitfield Ave @ Prospect Road

Project # 341-6068360
Russel Engineering, Inc. Superior Asphalt, Inc. Woofruff & Sons, Inc.
Portal Crossing P.0. Box 2489 P. 0. Box 10127
Bradenton, FL 34211 Oneco, FL 34264 % Bradenton, FL 34282
{941) 757-6080 (941) 755-2850 (941) 756-1871
i R B
UNIT PRICE|  EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION (BID A) 160 DAYS QUANTITY | UNITS © PRICE(S) PRICE PRICE(S} PRICE PRICES)
1 101-1 Mobilization 1 iLs 55,031.00 55,031.00 31.000.00 3100000 43.156.13 43.156.13
2 102-1 MOT i LS 25.900.00 25.960.00 30,300.00 30,300.00 1655981 1655981
3 331-2-3 1" Type S-IiI Asphalt 38743 TON 73.34 2841412 8445 3271846 81.36 3152130
4 331-2-1 i-1:4" Type S-1 Asphalt 48430 TON 73.76 35,721.97 8115 39,300.95 77.16 3736859
5 285-709 10" Base Group (9) 2,130 SY 2400 5112000 1840 39.,192.00 11.66 2483580
6 160-6 10" Stabilized Subbase (LBR60) 2,130 SY 467 9.947.10 7.60 16.188.00 5.47 1165110
7 327-70-13 Pavement Milling 4,780 SY 201 10.085.80 2,65 12,667.00 2.04 9,751.20
8 110-1-1 Clearing & Grubbing (SWALES) 0.35 AC 48.800.00 17.080.00 45350.00 15.87250 4056825 14.198 89
9 120-% lReguhr Excavation 1419 CcY 11.00 15.609.00 27.35 38,809.65 15.85 2249115
10 120-6 F‘Imbankmem (Regular) 282 Yy 6.15 1.73430 22555 6,359.10 5.20 1,466.40
&1 522-2 l(‘oncrete Driveways 6" 208 SY 3461 7.198.88 5345 11,117.60 29.72 6,181.76
12 570-1-2 !Sodding-Bahia 1,681 sY 3.08 5,17748 1.50 252150 1.84 3,093.04
13 520-i-10 Curb & Gutter Conc. (Type F) 274 LF 2000 548000 2370 6,493.80 1782 4,882.68
14 104-13-1 Staked Silt Fence, Type Il 2,366 LF 087 205842 1.50 354900 110 2,602.60
i5 536-1-1 Guardrail Roadway 38 LF 18.00 684.00 17.55 666.90 1764 670.32
16 425-3-41 Junction Box 3 EA 244500 7,335.00 1.805.00 541500 1,79823 539469
17 425-12-01 Curb Inlet Top (type 9) 1 EA 253400 253400 1.755.00 1,755.00 1,796 .67 1.796.67
18 430-171-201 T2'x18" ERCP and 15"RCP 1,024 LF 2646 2709504 30.00 30,720.00 30.89 3163136
9 330-171-101 124" RCP 195 LF 3825 745875 4110 801450 45.76 892320
20 430-984-623  [Mitered End Section 12"x18" ERCP 8 EA 1,260.00 10580.00 1,12000 8,960.00 91246 7.299.68
21 430-982-129  IMitered End Section 24" RCP 2 EA 2.313.00 4,626.00 2,220.00 444000 1,011.02 202204
22 425 -1-571 Ditch Bottom Inet 5 EA 1,870.00 9.350.00 1,650.00 8,250.00 1,537.88 7.689.40
23 522-1 4" Concrete Sidewalk (Handicap Ramps) 90 SY 56.40 5,076.00 5230 4,707.00 45.32 4,078.80
24 630-1-12 Conduit (underground) - F&I 55 LF 368 20240 3.60 198.00 359 19745
25 630-1-14 Conduit (underground - Jack and Bore) - F&I 700 LF 12.89 9.023.00 1265 8.855.00 12.56 8.792.00
26 632-6-1 Signal Cable- F&I 600 LF 5.89 3.534.00 5.80 3.480.00 574 344400
27 634-6-1 Messenger Cable (3:8") 800 LF 1.57 1.256.00 1.55 1,24000 1.54 1,232.00
28 635-1-11 1Pull Box - F&I 12 EA 289.00 3,468.00 285.00 3.420.00 28189 338268
29 639-1-13 Service (Overhead) ! AS 3.367.00 3.367.00 3,300.00 3.300.00 3.280.17 3,280.17
30 641-14-140 Concrete Strain Pole - F&I 3 EA 5.050.00 15,150.00 4,950.00 14.850.00 492025 14.760.75
31 650-51-311 Traffic Signal (3 Section - One Way - Led) - F&I 8 AS 1,005.00 8.040.00 985.00 7.880.00 97893 7.83144
32 653-181 Pedestrian Signal { Led- One Way) - F&I 8 AS 68100 544800 670.00 5.360.00 664.23 531384
33 659-10t {Signal Head Auxiliaries(Backplates Heads 3 & *) - F&I 4 EA 102.00 408.00 100.00 400.00 99.95 399.80
34 660-1-104 Loop Detector 8 EA 126.00 1.008.00 12400 992,00 123.01 984.08
35 660-2-101 Loop Assembly (Type A) - F&I 2 AS 736.00 1,472.00 720.00 1,440.00 717354 1.435.08
36 660-2-106 Loop Assembly (Type F - Modified 6"X40") - F&I 6 AS 84100 5.046.00 825.00 4,950.00 820.04 492024
37 665-11 Pedestrian Detector (Pole Or Controller Mount) (Type A) - F&I 8 EA 13400 107200 131.00 1,048.00 130.19 1,04152
38 670-5-110 Controller Assembly { NEMA T5-2, 8 Phase) (Type A) - F&I 1 26,307.00 26,307.00 25.775.00 25,775.00 2562629 2562629
39 7H-11-121 6 Solid Traffic Stripe (White) 3350 LF 0.63 2,11050 0.62 207700 0.61 204350
40 7H-11-123 12" Solid Traffic Stripe (White) 595 LF 1.58 940.10 1.55 92225 1.54 916,30 |
41 711-11-125 24" Solid ’l'rafﬁ.c-s-;ipe {White) 115 LF 316 36340 3.10 356,50 3.08 354.20
42 711-11-221 5.250 LF 063 3.307.50 0.62 3.255.00 0.6t 3,202.50
43 711-11-224 §20 v 2.10 1.72200 205 1.681.00 2.05 168100
44 TTI-11-170 2 EA 58.00 1.160.00 56.70 1.134.00 56.38 112760
7H-11-17 230 SF 237 545.10 235 540.50 2.31 53130
641-17-160 i EA 8.840.00 8.840.00 8.660.00 8.660.00 861043 861043
1 LS 63100 631.00 62000 62000 615.03 615.03
70,000.00 00
TOTAL PRICE: 5§19.217.86 470989.81
Acknowledged Addendum # | yes
Acknowledged Addendum # 2 yes yes yes
Florida Trench Safety Act yes yes yes
Contractor’s Questionnaire yes yes yes
Drug Free Work Place yes yes yes
Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Centification yes yes yes
Bid Bond Enclosed yes yes yes
Site Visit Confirmed yes yes yes
flidavit submitted if applicable €s yes yes

NOTES: * unsigned of]
PREPARED BY (ENGINEER):
REVIEWED BY (PROJECT MANAGE!
APPROVED BY (PURCHASER):
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IFB # 10-0040-DS
Project Title:Whitfield Ave @ Prospect Road

Project # 341-6068360
Ajax P:;:_;z ln:!us!ries of Apac-Southeast, Inc. C&M Road Builders, Inc. D.R. Swaanson Co. EHC, Inc. Gator Grading & Paving, LLC Kuxhausen Construction, inc. McLeod Land Services, Ine.
516, Gone :’;n":'; Ra. 1451 Myrtle St. 6728, 33rd Street East 1720 E1 Jobean Rd, # 208 1360 Raihead Bivd. 4220, 15th Street E. P.0. Box 21087 7405, 28th Street Court East
Nokosis, FL 34275 Sarasota, FL 34234 Sarasota, FL 34243% Port Charlotte, FL 33948 Naples, FL. 34110 Bradenton, FL. 34208 Sarasota, FL 34276 Sarasota, FL 34243
(941)486-3600 (941)355-7178 (841) 758-1933 (941)629-8822 (941} 254-6050 (941) 751-3908 (941) 379-6603 (941)922-1861
R RS0 DR R SR S R L2212 e SRR
UNITPRICE| EXTENDED | ynyTpricr | EXTENDED [yusiTemiceE] EXTENDED [uwiTPRICE] EXTENDED [JuniTpriCE, EXTENDED | yniT PRICE EXTENDED UNITPRICE] EXTENDED [uwyTpriCcE, EXTENDED
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION (BID B) 220 DAYS QUANTITY | UNITS ) PRICE(S) ® PRICE(S) & PRICE(S) P PRICE(S) © PRICE(S) s PRICE(S) ) PRICE(S) ® PRICE(S)
! 101-1 Mobi.l.izaﬁon 1 LS 85,200.00 85,200.00 62,600.00 6260000 18.050.00 18,050.00 NO f-i.l?) NO BKTDL 4.633.85 4,63385 NO BEJ NO BIT) 45.000.00 4500000 13.863.14 13.863.14
2 102-1 MOT i LS 3550000 3550000 22,105.00 22,105.00 15,000.00 18,000.00 NO BID NOBID 4840332 4840332 NO BID NO BID 10,000.00 10.000 00 13,733.17 13,733.17
3 331-233 1" Type S-III Asphalt 38743 TON 76.40 29.599.65 69.00 2673267 £6.00 3331898 NO BID NO BID 8541 3309040 NO BID NO BID 81.00 3138183 7355 2849548
4 331-2-t i-1:4" Type S-1 Asphalt 484.30 TON 72.30 3501489 69.50 3365885 $3.00 40.196.90 NO BID NO BID 84.94 41.136.44 NO BID NO BID 81.50 3947045 7397 3582367
5 285-709 10" Base Group (9) 2,130 SY 2025 43,13250 12.35 26,305.50 11.00 23.430.00 NO BID NO BID 1941 4134330 NO BID NO BID 26.50 56.445.00 15.89 33.845.70
6 160-6 16" Stabilized Subbase (LBR60) 2,130 SY 6.13 13.09950 7.45 15,229.50 6.10 12.993.06 NO BID NO BID 748 1593240 NO BID NO BID 7.00 1491000 7.02 14.952.60
7 327-70-13 {Pavement Milling 4.780 SY 150 7.170.00 1.90 2.082.00 275 13,145.00 NO BID NO BID 2.70 12,906.00 NO BID NO BID 250 11.950.00 2.1 10,085.80
8 110-1-1 Clearing & Grubbing (SWALES) 0.35 AC 13,550.00 4,742.50 40,500.00 14.175.00 12,000.00 4.200.00 NO BID NO BID 5,676.46 1.986.76 NO BID NO BID 10,000.00 3.500.00 23.888.46 8,360.96
9 120-1 Regular Excavation 1419 Yy 9.10 1291290 9.05 12.84195 9.00 12,771.00 NO BID NO BID 457 648483 NO BID NO BID 15.00 21.285.00 6.32 8.968.08
10 120-6 fEmbankment (Reguiar) 282 cY 21.20 597840 4420 12.464.40 2285 6.443.70 NO BID NO BID 3.24 91368 NO BID NO BID 10.00 2.820.00 12.72 358704
11 5222 Concrete Driveways 6" 208 SY 29.65 6.167.20 28.46 591968 28.00 5.824.00 NO BID NO BID 4144 8,61952 NO BID NO BID 45.00 9.360.00 30.87 6,42096
12 570-1-2 Sodding-Bahia 1.681 SY 1.55 2,605.55 1.63 2.740.03 1.65 277365 NO BID NOBID 4.67 7.850.27 NO BID NO BID 2.00 3.362.00 1.90 3.193.90
i3 520-1-10 Curb & Gutter Conc. (Type F) 274 LF 16.05 439770 1540 421960 15.00 4.110.00 NO BID NO BID 11.87 325238 NO BID NO BID 16.25 4452350 12.00 3.288.00
14 104-13-1 Staked Silt Fence. Type HI 2,366 LF 1.05 2,484 30 145 3.430.70 1.35 3.194.10 NO BID NO BID 197 4.661.02 NO BID NO BID 2.00 473200 1.03 243698
15 536-1-1 Guardrail Roadway 38 LF 18.10 63730 17.34 658.92 95.00 3.61000 NO BID NO BID 81.15 3.083.70 NO BID NO BID 20.90 760.00 66.15 2.513.70
16 425-3-41 Junction Box 3 EA 2,125.00 6,375.00 2,745.00 8.235.00 167500 5,02500 NO BID NO BID 1,181.73 3,545.19 NO BID NO BiD 2,760.00 8.100.00 1,877.77 563331
17 425-12-01 Curb Inlet Top (type 9) 1 EA 1.915.00 191500 ‘ 3,100.00 3,100.00 1.650.00 1,650.00 NO BID NOBID 1.54398 1,543.98 NOBID NO BID 2,900.00 2.900.00 2,093.05 209305
18 430-171-201 12"x18" ERCP and 15"RCP 1,024 LF 29.75 30464.00 23.75 2432000 27.00 27,648.00 NO BID NO BID 32388 33,669.12 NO BID NO BID 40.00 40.960.00 [_ 26.01 26.634.24
19 430-171-10t [24“ RCP 195 LF 35.10 6,844 50 29.56 576420 38.50 750750 t NO BID NO BID 47.13 9,190.35 NO BID NOBID 52.00 10.140.00 3399 6.628.05
F 20 430-984-623  [Mitered End Section 12"x18" ERCP 8 EA 744.00 5.952.00 T 73000 5.840?0 1.150.00 9,200.00 NO BID NOBID 457.13 3,657.04 NO BID NO BID 700.00 5,600.00 634.14 5.073.12
21 430-982-129  [Mitered End Section 24" RCP 2 EA $00.00 1.600.00 845.00 1,69-6.00 220000 4.400.00 NO BID NO BID 54358 1,087.16 NO BID NO BID 77500 1.550.00 955.26 1.910.52
22 425 -1-571 {Ditch Bottom Inlet 5 EA 1,800.00 9.000.00 2.450.00 1225000 1.595.00 7.975.00 NO BID NO BID 942238 471140 NO BID NO BID 2,025.00 10.125.00 1,506.01 7,530.05
23 522-1 4" Concrete Sidewalk (Handicap Ramps) 90 SY 55.00 495000 51.20 4,608.00 4225 3.802.50 NO BID NO BID 72.10 6,489.00 NO BID NO BID 37.50 337500 87.60 7.884.00
24 630-1-12 Conduit (underground) - F&I 55 LF 370 20350 357 196.35 4.15 22825 NO BID NO BID 8.19 45045 NO BID NO BID 3.65 200.75 4.98 273.90
25 630-1-14 Conduit (underground - Jack and Bore) - F&I 700 LF 13.00 9,100.00 1250 8,750.00 1235 8.,64500 NO BID NO BID 994 6.958.00 NO BID NO BID 1285 8.995.00 6.94 4.858.00
26 632-6-1 Signal Cable- F&I 600 LF 5.95 3,570.00 5.71 3,426.00 5.75 3.450.00 NO BID NO BID 4.75 2.850.00 NO BID NO BID 585 3.510.00 3.06 1,836.00
27 634-6-1 FMessenger Cable (3:8") 800 LF 1.60 1.280.00 153 1.224.00 265 2.120.00 NO BID NO BID 4.72 377600 NO BiD NO BID 1.55 1.240.00 3.01 2.408.00
28 635-1-11 Pull Box - F&i 12 EA 290.00 3,480.00 280.50 3,366.00 280.00 3,360.00 NO BID NO BID 295.30 3,543.60 NO BID NO BID 288.75 3,465.00 28323 3,398.76
29 639-1-13 Service (Overhead) 1 AS 3.400.00 3.400.00 3.264.00 3.264.00 1.290.00 1,290.00 NO BID NO BID 1,226 61 122661 NO BID NO BID 3.360.00 3.360.00 1,728.95 1,72895
30 641-14-140 Concrete Strain Pole - F&I 3 EA 5,100.00 15.,300.00 4.896.00 14.688.00 4.685.00 14,055.00 NO BID NO BID 581503 17.445.09 NO BID NO BID 5.040.00 15.120.00 5.904.10 17.712.30
31 650-51-311 Traffic Signal (3 Section - One Way ~ Led) - F&I 8 AS 1,015.00 8.120.00 974.10 7.792.80 77500 .200.00 NO BID NO BID 99321 7.94568 NO BID NO BID 1.002.75 8,022.00 898.62 7.18896
32 653-181 Pedestrian Signal ( Led- One Way) - F&I 8 700.00 5.,600.00 66096 5,287.68 695.00 5.560.00 NO BID NO BID 70359 562872 NO BID NO BID 680.00 5.440.00 631.80 5.054.40
33 659-101 Signal Head Auxiliaries(Backplates Heads 3 & *) - F&I 4 EA 100.00 400.00 9945 397.80 205 8.20 NO BID NO BID 132.88 53152 NO BID NO BID 102.00 408.00 87.72 35088
34 660-1-104 Loop Detector 8 EA 130.00 1,040.00 12240 979.20 57.00 456.00 NO BID NO BID 182.29 145832 NO BID NO BID 126.00 1.008.00 218.64 1,749.12
35 660-2-101 Loop Assembly (Type A) - F&I 2 AS 745.00 1.490.00 714.00 1,428.00 780.00 1,560.00 NO BID NO BID 61331 1.226.62 NO BID NO BID 735.00 147000 77437 1,548.74
36 660-2-106 Loop Assembly (Type F - Modified 6"X40™) - F&I 6 AS 850.00 5.100.00 816.00 4.896.00 1,005.00 6,030.00 NO BID NO BID 764.36 4.586.16 NO BID NO BID 840.00 5.040.00 884.71 5,308.26
37 665-11 Pedestrian Detector (Pole Or Controller Mount) (Type A) - F&I 8 EA 135.00 1.080.00 129.54 1.036.32 182.00 1.456.00 NO BID NO BID 20545 1,643.60 NO BID NO BID 13330 1,066 .40 17633 141064
38 670-5-110 Controlier Assembly ( NEMA TS-2. 8 Phase) (Type A) - F&I 1 AS 26.600.00 26.600.00 25.500.00 25.500.00 2302000 2302000 NO BID NO BID 2149969 2149969 NO BID NO BID 2625000 26.250.00 2215687 22,156 87
39 THE-11-121 6" Solid ‘Fr;-fﬁc Stripe (V;;hiie) 3,350 LF l' 0.65 2.177.50 061 204350 0.65 2.177.50 NO BID NO BiD .14 3.819.00 NO BID NO BID 065 217750 0.79 2.646.50
40 7i1-11-123 12 Solidm Stripe (W_‘_hite} 595 LE I' 1.60 952,00 1.53 91035 1.00 595.00 NE BID NO BID 2.66 1.582.70 NO BID NO BID 1.55 92225 1.37 815.15
41 711-11-125 24" Solid Traffic Stripe (White) 115 LF 320 368.00 3.06 351.90 2.05 23575 NOBID NO BID 7.76 89240 NO BID NOBID 3.15 36225 3.69 42435
42 TH1-11-221 6" Solid Tﬁc Stripe (Yeﬁ&w) 5.250 LE 0.65 341250 061 320250 0.60 3.150.00 NO BID NO BID 1.13 593250 NO BID NO BID 0.65 341250 0.78 4,095 00
43 71i-11-224 18" Sulid_T-;fﬁc Stripe (Yellow) 820 LE i | 216 1,72200 2.04 1,672.80 4.12 3.3';3.40 NO BID NO BID 4.06 332920 NO BID NO BID 210 172200 2.74 2.246 80
44 THI-11-170 “Traffic Arrow (White) 20 EA 5850 1,170.00 56.10 1,122.00 11584 231680 NO BID NO BID 80.26 1.605.20 NO BiD NO BID 57.75 1.155.00 5487 109740
45 THE-1E-17 Remove —:"fhenmplastic Marking 230 SF 2.40 55200 230 52900 0.90 207.00 NO BID NOBID l 9.50 2,18500 NO BID NO BID 238 54050 10.32 257{6T_—
46 641-17-160  IConerete Strain Pole 1 EA §.930.00 8.930.00 $,568.00 8.568.00 7.185.00 7.185.00 NO BID NO BID 9,33585 9.33585 NO BID NO BID 8,820.00 8,820.00 7.169.78 7.169.78
Engineering Services For Joint Use Pole I LS 640,00 64060 612,00 612.00 131500 1,315.00 NO BID NO BID ‘I 29984 20984 NO BID NO BID 63000 630.00 3409.18 3,409.18
Discretionary Work 70,000.00 70,000.00 70.000.00 NO BID NO BID 70.000.00 NOBID NO BID 70.000.00 70.000.00
TOTAL PRICE: 531,480.89 48921520 43726723% NO BID NO BID 477,942.86 NO BID NO BID 424217.06
cknowledged Addendum # | yes yes yes yes yes yes
cknowledged Addendum # 2 yes yes yes yes yes yes
Florida Trench Safety Act yes yes yes yes yes yes
ontractor’s Questionnaire ' yes yes yes yes yes yes
Drug Free Work Place yes yes yes yes yes yes
Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certification yes yes yes yes yes yes
Bid Bond Enclosed yes yes yes yes yes yes
Site Visit Confirmed yes yes yes yes yes yes
Affidavit submitted if applicable yes yes yes yes yes yes
NOTES: * unsigned offer, non responsive. -
PREPARED BY (ENGINEER); /] ) 2/7 / /0
REVIEWED BY (PROJECT MANAGER 2/ £
APPROVED BY (PURCHASER):




IFB # 10-0040-DS

Project Title:Whitfield Ave @ Prospect Road

Project # 341-6068360
Russel Engineering, Inc. Superior Asphalt, Inc. Woofraff & Sons, Inc.
Portal Crossing P.O. Box 2489 P. 0. Box 10127
Bradenton, FL 34211 Oneco, FL 34264 % Bradenton, FL 34282
(941) 757-0080 (941)755-2850 941-756-1871
UNITPRICE| EXTENDED fyniTpricE] EXTENDED RuNIT PRICE EXTENDED
FTEM NO. DESCRIPTION (BID B) 220 DAYS QUANTITY | uNITS © PRICES) © PRICE(S) o PRICE(S)
1 to1-1 Mobilization 1 LS NO BID NO BID 44.000.00 44.000.00 43.156.13 43,156.13
B T02-1 MOT 1 s NO BID NO BID 40.300.00 40.300.00 1655981 1655081
3 33123 1" Type S-THl Asphalt 38743 TON NO BID NO BID 84,45 32.71846 $1.36 3152130
7] 33121 14" Type S-1 Asphalt 18430 TON NO BID NO BID 3115 39.30095 77.16 37.368.59
3 285-700 10" Base Group (9) 2130 SY NO BID NO BID 1840 39.192.00 11.66 3383580
% 160-6 10" Stabilized Subbase {LBR60) 2.130 SY NG BID NO BID 760 16.188 00 547 11.651.10
7 337-70-13  |Pavement Milling 3.780 SY NO BiD NO BID 265 12.667.00 304 9.751.20
3 11011 Clearing & Grubbing (SWALES) 035 AC NO BID NO BID 45.350.00 15.872.50 10.568.25 13.198.89
5 1201 Regukar Excavation 1419 Y NO BID NO BID 2735 3880965 15.85 2349115
1 120-6 Embankment (Regular) 282 Y NO BID NO BID 2255 5.359.10 520 146630
T 5222 Concrete Driveways 6 208 SY NO BID NO BID 5345 111760 29.72 6.181.76
12 570-1-2  [Soddig-Bahia 1681 SY NO BID NO BID 150 752150 1.84 309304
13 520-1-10 [Cn__r_g_sf_ Gutter Conc. (Type F) T 274 LF NO BID NO BID 23.70 6,493.80 17.82 488268
14 104-13-1  |Staked Silt Fence, Type 1T 3366 LF NO BID NO BID 1.50 3.549.00 110 2.602.60
15 536-1-1 Guardrail Roadway 38 LF NO BID NO BID 17.55 666,90 1764 67032
16 425341 |Junction Box 3 EA NO BID NO BID 1.805.00 5AL500 1.79823 5.39469
7 325-12:01 _ |Curb Inlet Top (type 9) 1 EA NO BID NO BID 1.755.00 175500 1.796.67 1.79667
18 330-171:201 _ |12°%18" ERCP and 15"RCP 1024 LF NO BID NO BID 30.00 30.720.00 3089 3163136
9 330-171-101 _ |24" RCP 195 LF NO BID NO BID 41.10 8.01450 45.76 $.923.20
20 330-984-623  |Mitered End Section 12°x18" ERCP 8 EA NOBID. NO BID 1.120.00 $.960,00 01246 29568
21 430-982-120 | Mitered End Section 24" RCP 2 EA NO BID NO BID 3.220.00 3,440,00 101102 2.022.04
2 425-1.571 | Ditch Bottom Inlet 5 EA NO BID NO BID 165000 8.250.00 153788 7,689.46
73 522-1 4" Concrete Sidewalk (Handicap Ramps) 30 SY NO BID NO BID 5230 1.707.00 4532 307880
4 630-1-12_|Conduit (underground) - F&I 55 LF NO BID NG BID 360 198.00 3.59 19745
25 630-1-14 | Condut (underground - Jack and Bore) - F&I 700 LF NO BID NO BID 1265 8.855.00 12.56 $.792.00
2% 632-6-1 Signal Cable- F&I 00 LF NO BID NO BID 580 3.480.00 5.74 3,444.00
27 634-6-1 Messenger Cable (3:8) 300 IF NO BID NO BID 155 124000 154 123200
2% 635-1-11  |Pull Box - F&I 12 EA NO BID NO BID 285.00 3.42000 28189 3.38268
29 §39-1-13  |Service (Overhead) I AS NO BID NO BID 330000 3.300.00 3.280.17 3.280.17
30 631-14-130  |Concrete Strain Pole - F&l 3 EA NO BID NO BID 1.95000 14.850.00 4.920.25 14.760.75
3t 650-51-311 Traffic Signal (3 Section — One Way - Led) - F&l1 8 AS NO BID NO BID 985.00 7.880.00 97893 783144
32 653181 Pedestrian Signal ( Led- One Way) - F&I 3 AS NO BID NO BID 670,00 5.360.00 66423 531384
EE) 659-101 Signal Head Auxiliaries(Backplates Heads 3 & *) - F&I 3 EA NO BID NO BID 100.00 300,00 99.95 399.80
34 660-1-104  |Loop Detector 3 EA NO BID NO BID 124.00 592,00 12301 984.08
35 660-2-101  |Loop Assembly (Type A) - F&I 2 AS NO BID NO BID 720,00 144000 71754 143508
3% 660-2-106 | Loop Assembly (Type F - Modified 6 X40™) - F&I 6 AS NO BID NO BID 825,00 3.950.00 82004 192024
37 665-11 [Pedestrian D {Pole O Controller Mount) (Type A) - F&I 8 EA NO BID NO BID 131.00 1,048.00 130.19 104152
8 670-5-110 _ |Controller Assembly { NEMA TS-2, 8 Phase) (Type A) - F&l 1 AS NO BID NO BID 25.775.00 25.775.00 2562629 7562629 |
= 7T1-11-121 16" Solid Traffic Stripe (White) 30 | IF NO BID NO BID 062 707700 061 704350
30 T11-11-123 112" Sohd Traffic Stripe (White) 595 TF NO BID NO BID 155 92325 154 51630
T TTI-11-125  |24" Solid Traffic Stripe (White) T1s LF NO BID NO BID 3.10 35650 308 35420
& TT1-11-231 J6° Solid Traffic Stripe (Yellow) 5250 F NO BID NO BID 062 325500 061 330250
5 T11-11-224 |18 Solid Traffic Stripe (Yellow) 820 iF NO BID NO BID 205 168100 205 1681.00
a TT1211.170  |Traffic Arrow (White) 20 EA NOBID NO BID 56,70 1.134.00 3638 1.12760
15 TTI-11-17  |Remove Thermoplastic Marking 730 SF NO BID NO BID 335 54050 231 53130
36 641-17-160 _|Concrete Strain Pole 1 EA NO BID NO BID 3.660.00 8.660.00 861043 861043
Fogineering Services For Jomt Use Pole 1 IS NO BID NO BID 630,00 620 00 615.03 61503
NO BID NO BID 70.000.00 70,000.00
TOTAL PRICE: NO BID NO BID 55445221 % 47098981
Acknowledged Addendum # | yes yes yes
IAcknowledged Addendum # 2 yes yes yes
Florida Trench Safety Act yes yes yes
iContractor's Questionnaire yes yes yes
Drug Free Work Place yes yes yes
Public Contracting & Environmental Crimes Certification yes yes yes
Bid Bond Enclosed yes yes yes
ite Visit Confirmed yes yes yes
Affidavit submitted if applicable yes yes yes

NOTES: * unsigned offer, non responsive,
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PREPARED BY (ENGINEER): W
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