
Suburban System Water Line Replacement Project, Phase 1
Project No. 60747.70
Bid No.   09‐3281‐OV
Bid Price "A"
Bid Opening November 12, 2010
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1 Mobilization-Demobilization LS 1 55,000.00 55,000.00 12,000.00 12,000.00 89,900.50 89,900.50 100,000.00 100,000.00 110,830.00 110,830.00 45,740.00 45,740.00 46,000.00 46,000.00 45,971.00 45,971.00 15,000.00 15,000.00 19,950.00 19,950.00 62,124.05 62,124.05 131,761.71 131,761.71 130,000.00 130,000.00 No Bid
2 Furnish and Install Pipe 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

2A 4 Inch PVC Pipe-Open Cut LF 502 9.60 4,819.20 5.54 2,781.08 15.00 7,530.00 20.00 10,040.00 11.35 5,697.70 10.30 5,170.60 12.75 6,400.50 13.00 6,526.00 8.41 4,221.82 9.80 4,919.60 8.15 4,091.30 17.68 8,875.36 19.00 9,538.00 No Bid
2B 4 Inch HDPE Pipe-HDD LF 529 10.50 5,554.50 10.71 5,665.59 11.00 5,819.00 15.00 7,935.00 15.95 8,437.55 18.20 9,627.80 17.85 9,442.65 13.00 6,877.00 13.26 7,014.54 17.50 9,257.50 25.80 13,648.20 20.26 10,717.54 27.00 14,283.00 No Bid
2C 6 Inch PVC Pipe-Open Cut LF 1,903 12.25 23,311.75 9.77 18,592.31 18.00 34,254.00 24.00 45,672.00 12.85 24,453.55 11.80 22,455.40 16.35 31,114.05 15.00 28,545.00 10.91 20,761.73 13.10 24,929.30 9.95 18,934.85 19.97 38,002.91 16.00 30,448.00 No Bid
2D 6 Inch HDPE Pipe-HDD LF 10,145 14.40 146,088.00 17.65 179,059.25 16.00 162,320.00 18.50 187,682.50 19.50 197,827.50 22.20 225,219.00 22.50 228,262.50 16.90 171,450.50 21.31 216,189.95 20.80 211,016.00 32.95 334,277.75 22.09 224,103.05 30.55 309,929.75 No Bid
2E 8 Inch PVC Pipe-Open Cut LF 387 17.00 6,579.00 11.74 4,543.38 21.00 8,127.00 26.00 10,062.00 16.00 6,192.00 15.30 5,921.10 21.42 8,289.54 24.15 9,346.05 15.38 5,952.06 18.60 7,198.20 14.00 5,418.00 24.34 9,419.58 25.00 9,675.00 No Bid
2F 8 Inch HDPE Pipe-HDD LF 2,885 18.05 52,074.25 25.22 72,759.70 22.00 63,470.00 22.00 63,470.00 28.30 81,645.50 29.70 85,684.50 29.50 85,107.50 20.50 59,142.50 28.85 83,232.25 28.40 81,934.00 41.45 119,583.25 30.14 86,953.90 42.45 122,468.25 No Bid
3 Furnish and Install Ductile Iron Fittings TON 3.45 5,600.00 19,320.00 9,850.15 33,983.02 7,360.00 25,392.00 2,770.00 9,556.50 9,920.00 34,224.00 9,500.00 32,775.00 10,100.00 34,845.00 2,751.00 9,490.95 6,549.38 22,595.36 6,517.00 22,483.65 6,981.35 24,085.66 12,575.42 43,385.20 8,200.00 28,290.00 No Bid
4 Furnish and Install Valves 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 No Bid

4A 4 Inch Gate Valve EA 2 710.00 1,420.00 823.68 1,647.36 540.00 1,080.00 853.00 1,706.00 645.00 1,290.00 710.00 1,420.00 965.00 1,930.00 796.00 1,592.00 629.54 1,259.08 730.00 1,460.00 702.20 1,404.40 930.07 1,860.14 1,059.00 2,118.00 No Bid
4B 6 Inch Gate Valve EA 23 935.00 21,505.00 1,404.46 32,302.58 660.00 15,180.00 1,028.00 23,644.00 760.00 17,480.00 880.00 20,240.00 1,173.00 26,979.00 1,011.50 23,264.50 844.47 19,422.81 969.00 22,287.00 906.25 20,843.75 1,088.42 25,033.66 1,175.00 27,025.00 No Bid
4C 8 inch Gate Valve EA 17 1,260.00 21,420.00 2,077.36 35,315.12 940.00 15,980.00 1,318.00 22,406.00 1,055.00 17,935.00 1,170.00 19,890.00 1,581.00 26,877.00 1,393.00 23,681.00 1,180.87 20,074.79 1,301.00 22,117.00 1,244.35 21,153.95 1,468.97 24,972.49 1,484.00 25,228.00 No Bid
4D 20 inch Butterfly Valve EA 1 16,000.00 16,000.00 8,339.49 8,339.49 16,410.00 16,410.00 7,075.00 7,075.00 6,305.00 6,305.00 6,070.00 6,070.00 7,679.00 7,679.00 8,100.00 8,100.00 6,627.87 6,627.87 6,440.00 6,440.00 6,801.85 6,801.85 7,867.10 7,867.10 7,280.00 7,280.00 No Bid

5
Furnish and Install Tapping Sleeves and
Valves 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 No Bid

5A 18"x6" Tapping Sleeve and Valve EA 5 4,500.00 22,500.00 2,855.30 14,276.50 4,480.00 22,400.00 2,613.00 13,065.00 3,295.00 16,475.00 1,692.00 8,460.00 3,675.00 18,375.00 6,980.00 34,900.00 2,390.29 11,951.45 4,784.00 23,920.00 1,977.75 9,888.75 4,426.63 22,133.15 6,193.00 30,965.00 No Bid
5B 20"x6" Tapping Sleeve and Valve EA 3 4,600.00 13,800.00 2,564.36 7,693.08 6,980.00 20,940.00 2,705.00 8,115.00 3,385.00 10,155.00 1,785.00 5,355.00 3,784.50 11,353.50 7,080.00 21,240.00 9,118.36 27,355.08 5,445.00 16,335.00 2,082.55 6,247.65 4,517.18 13,551.54 6,321.00 18,963.00 No Bid

6
Furnish and Install Small and Medium
Diameter Distribution Connections 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 No Bid

6A 1 1/2 Inch Connection EA 2 290.00 580.00 188.24 376.48 770.00 1,540.00 400.00 800.00 795.00 1,590.00 600.00 1,200.00 342.75 685.50 498.00 996.00 171.04 342.08 430.00 860.00 303.75 607.50 865.40 1,730.80 570.00 1,140.00 No Bid
6B 2 Inch Connection EA 2 632.00 1,264.00 745.01 1,490.02 1,010.00 2,020.00 804.00 1,608.00 840.00 1,680.00 997.00 1,994.00 960.85 1,921.70 820.00 1,640.00 969.80 1,939.60 842.00 1,684.00 759.90 1,519.80 947.15 1,894.30 1,429.00 2,858.00 No Bid

6C 6 Inch Connection Near 5506 16th St. West EA 1 3,165.00 3,165.00 386.04 386.04 1,120.00 1,120.00 1,426.00 1,426.00 2,155.00 2,155.00 850.00 850.00 1,530.00 1,530.00 1,411.00 1,411.00 375.98 375.98 722.00 722.00 944.90 944.90 2,476.05 2,476.05 3,099.00 3,099.00 No Bid

6D 6 Inch Connection Near 5612 16th St. West EA 1 3,665.00 3,665.00 386.04 386.04 1,120.00 1,120.00 1,426.00 1,426.00 2,155.00 2,155.00 850.00 850.00 665.00 665.00 1,411.00 1,411.00 375.98 375.98 722.00 722.00 944.90 944.90 3,201.44 3,201.44 2,465.00 2,465.00 No Bid

6E 6 Inch Connection Near 5412 16th St. West EA 1 3,665.00 3,665.00 386.04 386.04 1,120.00 1,120.00 1,426.00 1,426.00 2,770.00 2,770.00 850.00 850.00 459.00 459.00 1,411.00 1,411.00 375.98 375.98 722.00 722.00 944.90 944.90 6,420.52 6,420.52 3,615.00 3,615.00 No Bid

6F
8 Inch Connection 55th. Ave. West & 18th.
St. West. EA 1 3,912.00 3,912.00 440.37 440.37 1,160.00 1,160.00 1,466.00 1,466.00 2,260.00 2,260.00 897.00 897.00 969.00 969.00 1,501.00 1,501.00 417.79 417.79 982.00 982.00 1,065.75 1,065.75 3,351.81 3,351.81 3,375.00 3,375.00 No Bid

7
Funish and Install DIP Conflict Piping 55th
Ave. West LS 1 30,700.00 30,700.00 3,878.74 3,878.74 4,730.00 4,730.00 4,800.00 4,800.00 8,480.00 8,480.00 3,640.00 3,640.00 13,821.00 13,821.00 3,868.00 3,868.00 3,610.89 3,610.89 3,273.00 3,273.00 3,992.50 3,992.50 5,246.83 5,246.83 7,265.00 7,265.00 No Bid

8 Furnish and Install Fire Hydrant Assembly EA 22 3,565.00 78,430.00 8,122.69 178,699.18 3,290.00 72,380.00 3,835.00 84,370.00 3,435.00 75,570.00 3,715.00 81,730.00 5,190.50 114,191.00 4,160.00 91,520.00 4,998.22 109,960.84 4,573.00 100,606.00 4,000.00 88,000.00 4,247.55 93,446.10 4,120.00 90,640.00 No Bid

9
Furnish and Install Long Side Water
Service 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 No Bid

9A Long Side Single Water Service EA 69 815.00 56,235.00 413.34 28,520.46 600.00 41,400.00 404.16 27,887.04 670.00 46,230.00 1,060.00 73,140.00 739.50 51,025.50 880.00 60,720.00 1,405.22 96,960.18 1,095.00 75,555.00 647.70 44,691.30 1,007.79 69,537.51 1,000.00 69,000.00 No Bid
9B Long Side Multiple Water Service EA 62 1,278.00 79,236.00 1,374.53 85,220.86 1,030.00 63,860.00 942.61 58,441.82 1,085.00 67,270.00 1,492.00 92,504.00 1,530.00 94,860.00 1,692.00 104,904.00 2,163.40 134,130.80 1,671.00 103,602.00 1,175.95 72,908.90 1,598.68 99,118.16 1,893.00 117,366.00 No Bid

10
Furnish and Install Short Side Water
Service 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 No Bid

10A Short Side Single Water Service EA 97 525.00 50,925.00 406.59 39,439.23 470.00 45,590.00 229.00 22,213.00 380.00 36,860.00 490.00 47,530.00 321.50 31,185.50 680.00 65,960.00 559.14 54,236.58 596.00 57,812.00 251.65 24,410.05 535.91 51,983.27 450.00 43,650.00 No Bid
10B Short Side Multiple Water Servce EA 51 770.00 39,270.00 960.37 48,978.87 860.00 43,860.00 707.00 36,057.00 765.00 39,015.00 889.00 45,339.00 933.50 47,608.50 1,223.00 62,373.00 1,081.04 55,133.04 1,180.00 60,180.00 740.65 37,773.15 1,086.35 55,403.85 920.00 46,920.00 No Bid
11 Furnish and Install Meter Box Assembly EA 418 86.00 35,948.00 212.87 88,979.66 130.00 54,340.00 139.00 58,102.00 250.00 104,500.00 309.00 129,162.00 219.00 91,542.00 334.00 139,612.00 207.04 86,542.72 364.00 152,152.00 171.85 71,833.30 220.74 92,269.32 280.00 117,040.00 No Bid

12 Furnish and Install Right-of-Entry Services 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 No Bid
12A Type I ROE Service EA 12 865.00 10,380.00 1,500.68 18,008.16 420.00 5,040.00 2,950.00 35,400.00 775.00 9,300.00 830.00 9,960.00 229.50 2,754.00 685.00 8,220.00 919.68 11,036.16 1,444.00 17,328.00 1,999.00 23,988.00 851.12 10,213.44 1,400.00 16,800.00 No Bid
12B Type II ROE Service EA 3 900.00 2,700.00 412.78 1,238.34 490.00 1,470.00 1,059.00 3,177.00 695.00 2,085.00 950.00 2,850.00 250.00 750.00 823.00 2,469.00 586.76 1,760.28 1,444.00 4,332.00 1,848.05 5,544.15 1,047.19 3,141.57 2,614.00 7,842.00 No Bid
12C Type III ROE Service EA 12 984.40 11,812.80 1,628.07 19,536.84 750.00 9,000.00 1,617.00 19,404.00 770.00 9,240.00 1,281.00 15,372.00 331.50 3,978.00 2,743.00 32,916.00 1,000.19 12,002.28 3,182.00 38,184.00 2,510.20 30,122.40 1,790.95 21,491.40 2,485.00 29,820.00 No Bid
13 Funrnish and Install Blow-Off Assembly EA 4 300.00 1,200.00 1,018.19 4,072.76 840.00 3,360.00 1,686.00 6,744.00 895.00 3,580.00 891.00 3,564.00 994.50 3,978.00 810.00 3,240.00 2,173.05 8,692.20 1,312.00 5,248.00 772.10 3,088.40 1,267.26 5,069.04 800.00 3,200.00 No Bid
14 Furnish and Install Air Release Assembly EA 4 2,247.00 8,988.00 1,971.71 7,886.84 3,260.00 13,040.00 2,570.00 10,280.00 1,565.00 6,260.00 1,650.00 6,600.00 1,986.00 7,944.00 1,812.00 7,248.00 1,885.95 7,543.80 1,926.00 7,704.00 1,546.85 6,187.40 1,999.53 7,998.12 2,025.00 8,100.00 No Bid
15 Grout Abandoned Pipelines 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 No Bid

15A 2 Inch Water Line LF 370 3.40 1,258.00 0.33 122.10 1.70 629.00 4.00 1,480.00 1.60 592.00 5.60 2,072.00 1.53 566.10 1.05 388.50 2.00 740.00 2.70 999.00 1.00 370.00 6.88 2,545.60 2.15 795.50 No Bid
15B 3 Inch Water Line LF 11,607 3.65 42,365.55 0.37 4,294.59 2.00 23,214.00 4.50 52,231.50 1.60 18,571.20 1.10 12,767.70 2.30 26,696.10 1.05 12,187.35 3.00 34,821.00 3.80 44,106.60 1.20 13,928.40 3.10 35,981.70 1.80 20,892.60 No Bid
15C 6 Inch Water Line LF 3,965 4.10 16,256.50 0.12 475.80 5.90 23,393.50 6.00 23,790.00 3.90 15,463.50 1.50 5,947.50 3.57 14,155.05 1.60 6,344.00 4.00 15,860.00 4.90 19,428.50 25.70 101,900.50 3.73 14,789.45 2.60 10,309.00 No Bid
16 Pavement Restoration SY 206.5 29.00 5,988.50 4.84 999.46 110.00 22,715.00 50.00 10,325.00 84.15 17,376.98 25.40 5,245.10 26.50 5,472.25 62.00 12,803.00 27.00 5,575.50 92.90 19,183.85 63.05 13,019.83 117.37 24,236.91 35.50 7,330.75 No Bid

17 Pavement Restoration-Milling and Overlay SY 3,311 14.04 46,486.44 1.80 5,959.80 16.00 52,976.00 13.00 43,043.00 12.90 42,711.90 14.00 46,354.00 22.44 74,298.84 25.00 82,775.00 22.00 72,842.00 12.80 42,380.80 14.90 49,333.90 13.39 44,334.29 9.15 30,295.65 No Bid
18 Curb Restoration LF 177 20.50 3,628.50 8.91 1,577.07 24.00 4,248.00 25.00 4,425.00 35.00 6,195.00 19.80 3,504.60 35.70 6,318.90 45.00 7,965.00 11.00 1,947.00 24.10 4,265.70 24.85 4,398.45 27.52 4,871.04 48.50 8,584.50 No Bid
19 Driveway Restoration 80 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 No Bid

19A Concrete Driveway SY 219 46.25 10,128.75 10.17 2,227.23 75.00 16,425.00 40.00 8,760.00 32.60 7,139.40 56.50 12,373.50 49.00 10,731.00 50.00 10,950.00 75.00 16,425.00 40.00 8,760.00 31.05 6,799.95 37.92 8,304.48 45.45 9,953.55 No Bid
19B Asphalt Driveway SY 158 29.00 4,582.00 3.23 510.34 70.00 11,060.00 45.00 7,110.00 45.20 7,141.60 49.50 7,821.00 24.00 3,792.00 40.00 6,320.00 45.00 7,110.00 44.80 7,078.40 56.40 8,911.20 61.40 9,701.20 31.25 4,937.50 No Bid
19C Shell Driveway SY 33 25.50 841.50 17.19 567.27 61.00 2,013.00 10.00 330.00 19.75 651.75 26.20 864.60 18.00 594.00 10.00 330.00 21.00 693.00 10.90 359.70 15.10 498.30 26.11 861.63 10.75 354.75 No Bid
19D Stone Driveway SY 9 25.50 229.50 14.33 128.97 68.00 612.00 40.00 360.00 80.00 720.00 69.50 625.50 12.00 108.00 18.00 162.00 18.00 162.00 16.40 147.60 13.45 121.05 46.31 416.79 11.90 107.10 No Bid
20 Sidewalk Restoration SY 17 46.50 790.50 28.27 480.59 55.00 935.00 40.00 680.00 25.25 429.25 67.30 1,144.10 38.00 646.00 50.00 850.00 72.00 1,224.00 31.60 537.20 26.75 454.75 74.34 1,263.78 43.25 735.25 No Bid

21 Discretionary Work 160,000.00 160,000.00 160,000.00 160,000.00 160,000.00 160,000.00 160,000.00 160,000.00 160,000.00 160,000.00 160,000.00 160,000.00 160,000.00 160,000.00
1,124,023.24 1,134,226.61 1,173,173.00 1,197,991.36 1,236,940.38 1,270,780.00 1,315,901.18 1,342,621.35 1,364,495.47 1,413,162.60 1,426,807.03 1,489,937.72 1,594,702.15 No Bid
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