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NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD 

Notice of Intent to Award, Invitation for Bid 16-27140V, Force Main 17A Replacement, 63111 Avenue West, 
Bradenton, FL to the lowest, responsive, responsible bidder Harris-McBurney Company, 2120 North US Highway 
301, Tampa, FL 33619 for a total base bid of $448,870.40, (Bid "B") based on a completion time of 210 calendar 
days. 

ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITY 

FoderallState !awls), aclmlniltratlve rullngll), Man_ County Cornp PlanILand Dewtlopmenl Code, ordlnanc .. , resolutions, polley. 

Manatee County Code of Laws 

BACKGROUND/DISCUSSION - -- _. 
This project is a rebid of IFB16-0699DC which was cancelled on March 29, 2016 due to the sole bid received was 
materially higher than the County's engineer's estimate for construction cost. 

The revised 17A project located at 63111 Avenue West, Bradenton, FL was redesigned to include smaller pulls on the 
pipe vs one large pull, the installation of ARV valves, shallower connection points on the discharge, changed alignment 
of the Force Main. 

The Work consists of the Successful Contractor furnishing and installing approximately 1,500 LF of 6" HDPE/PVC 
force main by directional drilling and direct bury, one below-ground Air Release Valve (ARV), and connecting to a 
manhole. The existing 2,300 LF 6" CI (Cast Iron force main will be abandoned in place via grout filling. The original 
manhole receiving the force main flow, the new manhole receiving the force main flow, and the next two (2) manholes 
downstream of the new receiving manhole shall be repaired I rehabilitated and lined per approval of the County. 

All work to be performed on this project shall be in accordance with the Revised Technical SpeCifications and Plans 
dated June 2016. 

See page 2 for further discussion and tabulation. 

ATTACHMENTS: • Department 
FUNDING SOURCE (List In order as Recommendation 

4046028385/534000/6028385/0004 attached) • Tabulation (Acct Number & Name) 
Funding Source: Utility Rates 

AMTIFREQOF 
RECURRING COSTS 

(Attach Fiscal Impact N/A 
COST $448,870.40 Statement) 

I 
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Force Main 17 A Replacement 
IFB 16-27140V 
(Rebid of IFB16-0699DC) 
63rd Avenue West, Bradenton, FL 
(Project No. 404-6028385) 

Appropriate Bid procedures were followed. Notice of Bid availability was advertised from August 25, 2016 
through October 5, 2016 on mymanatee.org, DemandStar and the Manatee Chamber of Commerce. 

Bid "A" 
Bid Offers (120 Calendar Days) 

Hillsborough County 
Harris-McBumey Company 
Tampa, FL 

(LeVY County) 
General Underground 
Chiefland, FL 

(Duval County) 

No Bid 

$664,130.36 

***TB Landmark Construction, Inc. 
Jacksonville, FL $363,197.91 

Manatee County 
Woodruff & Sons 
Bradenton, FL $578,594.39 

Bid "B" 
(210 Calendar Days)' 

$448,870.40 

$592,973.54 

$363,197.91 

$505,035.34 

Although TB Landmark Construction, Inc., Jacksonville, FL was the apparent low bidder, they did not 
acknowledge the correct Addendum #1, did not utilize the Addendum #1 bid forms (Bid A & B) which 
revised the description of two (2) items and added one (1) bid item; therefore, TB Landmark 
Construction, Inc. were deemed non-responsive. 

Memorandum dated October 13, 2016 from Project Management Division recommended award to 
Harris-McBurney Company located in Tampa, FL, the lowest responsive, responsible bidder for a total 
base bid of $448,870.40 (Bid "B") based on a completion time of 210 calendar days. 

Award of project is contingent on the approval of Budget Amendment, B-17-011/1 which will be 
presented to the Board of County Commissioners on November 15, 2016 to fully fund the project. 

F:\OVAlCICH FY16 AND 17\PUBLIC WORKS.PROJ.MGMT\IFB.FY2016.All\IFB#16-27140V.FM17A Replacement\lntent to Award 
October 2016.docx 



MEMORANDUM 
To: 

From: 

Date: 

Subject: 

Melissa M. Wendel, CPPO, Purchasing Official 

Jeff Streitmatter III, P. E., Project Management 
.vision Manager 

October13,2016 

Force Main 17A Replacement/83rd Avenue East 
Harris-McBurney Company 
Recommendation for Award -IFB 16-27140V 

~":I~.!/.; "'" i:'M ..". anatee 
County 

....,=~j) rLORIDA 

The bids for the above referenced project have been reviewed by staff. The bid tabulation form 
is attached for your review. It is recommended that the contract Bid "B" with a construction time 
of 210 days be awarded to the lowest responsive, responsible bidder, Harris-McBurney 
Company in the amount of $448,870.40 and in accordance with the terms and conditions of the 
bid package. Upon completion of project award, please provide a copy of the purchase order 
assigned to the contractor. The funding source for this contract is Utility Rates. 

The amount currently encumbered is less than the proposed contract amount, and a budget 
amendment will be prepared to fully fund the project prior to the contract award. 

Please contact William G. Lorenzo, P.E., Project Engineer II if you have any questions 
regarding the attached documents. 

Thank you for your continued assistance. 

JSlw9lJ 

cc: Mike Gore, Director, Utilities 
Ron Schulhofer, Director, Public Works 
Sia Mollanazar, P.E., Deputy Director, Engineering Services 
Carmen Mosley, MA, Senior Fiscal Services Division Manager 
William G. Lorenzo, P.E., Project Engineer II 
Prony Bonnaire Fils, Engineering Specialist II, w/attachments 
Project File: 6028385 9.2 

Public Works Department 
Project Management Oivlsfon 

1022 261h Avenuc Enst. Bradenton, FL 34208·3926 
Phone "umber: (941) 708-7450 --

LARRY DU''TLE' CHARLES B. SMITII' ,OlIN R, CHAPPlE' RODIN DISABATINO' VANESSA BAUGH' CAROL WHITMORE' BETSY BENAC 

DIstrict I Olsln~t 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 Dislrict 7 

S:\PWD_P,t.CSh.uc\Projects\ Wastcwi.ltcr\Forcc M.(Iin-17 A I{eplc 60283 85\PM\3Pul'chasing\Ujdding\ncconlln~ndatjon for Award IFB Funding 
ReqUired Memo doc>.: 



BID "A" 
120 CALENDAR DAYS 

110m 
No. Un.ltem , Curb ReplaC*ment 

2 Trd'lc Sep81"1tor Replacement Concrate 

• Pawment Rap.lr & Road Restoration (Base. Mill & Resurfac:el 

• Pawment RepaIr & Road RestonItIon (Mill & Reeurfllce) 

• Sodding. Bahie 

• Grout Fill Ab.ndoned.· Fore. Main 

7 Rehabilitate ~t Manhole, 4' diameter (3 MH Tabl), Including Liner 

Addendum " 

• 8" PVC {ClOD' M ·ta 

• 18" HOPE -(pEe7 •• DR-", (Ad_.,) 

10 !connect to.xletingManholi. NIde drop 

~Pntent, 5' diMMtlr, trMd 
12 Itting, 01 .. ro...V.tv., MJ ,. AIr R.I .... V.lve, a.low Ground - 2" ,. M.lnte .... nc. ofTr8ffIc ,. Erosion Control 

'7 
R.hablllQte ~~attng Manhol. 4" diameter (1 MH total, wlo Lin ... 
Add.ndum" ,. Mobillutton ,. MllC:enaneou, Wortc & Cl.anup 

2. Record Drewtng. 

BAS! IIJD (ITEMS 1 .20) 

ContlngenC)' ti~'' 01 ttlm. i 

IAPp-ll 
20) (Uud only with County 

OTAL OFFER BID -A- - Baud on Complttlon nnw of 120 

- lcj.1endar O.ya (Add.ndum 11) 

D Did not bid Addendum #1 

Pas-1 

U/M QIy 

LF .. S 
LF ". I 

SY 234 I 

SV 1,078 S 
SV •• S 
CV 17 I 

VF 3. S 

LF ... • 
l' 1,44' • 
EA • S 
VF • S 
lB '82 S 
EA • S 
EA 1 S 
LS 1 I 
La 1 S 

VF • 
La 1 S 
La 1 I 
LS 1 S 

10%OF &lse 
Bid 

-

BID TABULATION 

FOR 
IFB tll6-2714-0V 

FORCE MAIN 17 A REPLACEMENT 

(REBID OF IFB I1&-06V9-DC) 

f 2 
TB Undma1< ConolnIctI .... Inc. Woodruff & Sona, Inc.. 

11220 New Berlin Rood P.O. Box 10127 
Jacksonville. FL 32226 BrMfenlDn. FL 34282 

(Duval County) (M.n .... County) 
Unit Extended Un" Extended 
Price P~ce p~co Price .. ... S 890.00 S 110.11 S 2,215.40 

85,00 I 10,200.00 I 58.10 S 1,038.80 

125.00 S 21,250.00 I 140.Sl8 S 32.980.32 

34.00 I 38,m.00 S 3.2.41 I 35,024.22 

10.00 S 380.00 S 3$.31 S 1,272.96 

800.00 S 10,200AO S 837.35 S 15,OU.S1 

415.00 S 12,450-00 S 337.41 S 10,122.30 

333.00 S ......... S 724.72 S 72,472.00 

75.12 S 108,247.12 S 07.tlS S 13 . ...... 05 

7 ....... S 7 ....... S 21.075..48 S 21.015 ..... 

1.800.00 I ' ,100.00 S 187.54 S 5.'25.24 ..... S 4,418.00 S 13.57 S 2,&05.44 

2,308.00 S 2,301.00 S 1,.5'1.55 S 1,557.55 

8,725.00 S 8,725.00 S 3,442.17 S 3,412.17 

10,&10.00 S 10,810.00 S 10,433.41 S 18,433.41 

3,523.00 S 3,523.00 S 1.811." S 1 ••. M 
Did not bid DId not bid 

S US.OO S 2.070.00 ....... urn., Addendum " 
30,050.00 S 30,050.00 I 48.144.15 S 4B,144.55 

7 ....... S 7,481.00 S 103,022.02 S 103,122.02 

8,427.00 S 8,427.00 S 2,213.78 S 2,213.78 

S 330.178.92 S 525.1194.80 , 33.017.88 I 52.601.48 

S 383.187.81 1571._.30 

3 • 
Go ...... Underground H.ms Mellin., Company 
7650 NW 50th Street 2120 North US HIghway 301 
Chlaftand, FL 32e26 Temp., FL 33810 

(Lavy County) (Hillsborough County) 
Unit Extended Unit I Extended 
Price Price P~ce P~ce 

S 112.00 S 2,240.00 No Bid 

$ 155.80 S 1.,,11.00 No Bid 

S 156.80 S 38,"1.20 No Bid 

S ...... S 10,552.00 No BId 

S 58.00 I 2,01'.00 No Bid 

S MO.OO I 14,210.00 No Bid 

S 1,008.00 S 30,240.00 No Bid 

S 280 ... S 2',000.00 No BId 

S 13',04 S 1ae.m.14 No Bid 

S ......... S .......... No BId 

S 5,800JlO S :13.110.00 _0 BId 

S 22.40 I ......... •• BId 

S 2,100.00 S 2,100.00 No Bid 

S 15,120.00 S 15,120.00 No BId 

S 39,200.00 S 31,200.00 No Bid 

S 5.&00.00 I 5,fOO.00 No Bid 

S 1,120.00 S &.720.00 No Bid 

S 28,750.23 S 28,750.23 HoBid 

S 22,400 .. 0 S 22,400.00 No Bid 

$ 11,200.00 $ 11,200.00 No Bid 

S 803.75U7 No Bid 

S 10.375,48 No Bid 

$ seC.I30.3S No BId 

1011312011 



BID TABULATION 

FOR 

IFB #16-2714-0V 

FORCE MAIN 17A REPLACEMENT 
(REBID OF IFB #16-0699-DC) 

BID "An 
BASED ON A COMPLETION TIME OF 120 CALENDAR DAYS 

PREPARED BY: 
(Project Management) 

REVIEWED BY: 
(Project Management) 

REVIEWED BY: 
(Project Engineer) 

APPROVED BY: 
(Purchasing) 

Page 2 

~\mlni 'R_Qb\m.~cY'\ 
Sherri Robinson, Assessment Coordinator 

10/1)lIb 
Date 

/~ 
Date 

~ 
Date 

/~ •. otjA '& 
~ 

10/1312016 



810"8" 
210 CALENDAR DAYS 

ltom 
ND. Une Item , curtt RIIpfecement 

2 nlffie S..,....r:or Replacement Concrete 

3 Plv.ment Repair & Road Restoration (B .... Mill & R •• urface) 

• P_R_&Rood_CIIII&_1 

5 SoddIng. Bah~ 

• Grout Fill Abandoned r Force Main 

7 
Reh.blllblte ex. Manhole.",,' dlamete' (3 MH TotIIl). Including Line, 

Addendum "J 

• ~ PVC ceODOI DR-1, 

• .. "DPE· CPE.7'. DI""1 C-"J 
1. Conn.ct to exls6ng Manhole, lnald. drop 

11 Manhole, Precalt, , ' diameter. lined 

12 ~DI 
13 ~GataV ..... ,MJ 

14 Air ReI .... Valve, Below Ground· 2-

1. Maln-.nance of Traffic ,. Erosion Control 

'1 exknlng .... nhollJ 4" ~(1 MH total) wIo Uner 
Addendum 11) 

18 Mobnlzetlon ,. MI.cellan.ous Wortt & CI.anup 

20 _D_ 

BASE B10 CJI1!MS , . 21) 

Contlngllncy (to" of Hema 1 - 20) {UHCI only wllh COU~ 

OTAL OFFER BID -a- • SaNdi on Completion TlrM Of 120 
Celendar Days (Addendum '1) 

D Old not bid Addendum .1 

Page 1 

UJU Qty 

LF 20 S 
LF '20 S 

SY 234 S 

SY 1,071 S 
sy 38 I 
CY 17 • 
VF ,. • 
LF 100 S 
LF ',441 S 
EA , S 
VF • • 
LB '82 • 
EA , • 
EA , I 
LS 1 S 
LS , I 

\If • 
LS , S 
LS 1 $ 

LS 1 $ 

10%OFBa .. 
BId 

-

BID TABULATION 
FOR 

IFB #16-2714-0V 
FORCE MAIN 17A REPLACEMENT 

(REBID OF IFB .1 ~699-DC' 

1 2 . . 
T8 Landmark ConoInJotIon, Inc. Woodruff & Sonl.lnc. 

11220 __ R .... P.O. 80111: 10127 
JKkaonvl ... FL 32221 Bradenton. FL 34282 

(Ouvol County) (Man ... County) 
Unit Emnded UnR Extended 
PrIc:o PrIc:o Price Price 

44 ... S ...... S 87." s ',158.20 
85.00 I 10,200.00 I 58.51 S '.711,40 

125.00 $ 21,2 ••••• S 128.62 S 30,017.08 

)Uo $ .......... I :12." $ "''''.22 
10.00 I ...... S 31.7. I 1,142." 

GOO.OO $ 10,200.00 I 824.03 I 14,008.51 

416.00 S 12.450.00 S 319.31 I 9,581.40 _ .. 
s :13,3110 ... S 514.11 I 580411.00 

71.12 $ 108.247.12 $ ".72 I 1ZC,H3.D2 

70484.00 $ 7,484.00 • 17.180.22 I 17,180.22 

1,100.00 • ',100.00 • 804.18 $ 5,427.14 

23.00 S ",A1LOC1 I 12.12 I ...... 84 ........ • ........ • " ...... • 1,4$8 •• 

',725.00 • 8,725.00 I 3,018.13 I 3,01'." 

10,810.00 $ 10.810.00 $ 14,830.1' $ ",.,1130.11 

3.523.00 • 3,523.00 I 1,469.51 $ ' ..... 5' 
DId ....... Dldnol"'" • 345." • 2,m.oo _ ... 11 -" 30,010.00 • 30,050.00 • 3',781.14 I 39,711.14 

7,4U .•• I 7,.418.00 I 87AG7.11 • 87,..07.11 

".27.00 I 1,427 ... $ 2.213.71 I 2,213.78 , 330,179.92 $ 4511,123,04 

$ 33,017.89 $ 45,912.30 

$ ~e3,187.81 S !05,D3S.~ 
- -- -

3 4 
Gene .. Undorground H.rrfo-McBumoy Compony 
7850 NW 5Oth_ 2120 _ US HIghway 301 

Chlotland, FL 3_ T.mpa. FL 33811 
(L~County) tHllleborou h County) 

UnK Exhlnded Unit II!xtended 
PrIco Prico PrIco Price 

I 100.00 S ........ S 75.00 I 1,510.00 

S 140.00 I 16,100.00 I 115 ... I 11.401.00 

$ 140.00 S 32.180.00 I 98.00 I 22,932.00 

I 7 .... I ",I5CI.00 I 43." S ......... 
I ..... I , ....... I .... S .... .. 
I 750.00 S 12,710.00 S 525.00 • 8,125.00 

S ...... S 27,000.00 I 460.00 S 13,100.00 

$ ... ... $ 25,000'" S 874.041 S 87 ....... 

S 117.00 $ 111,S17.DO • ..... S 72,051.00 

S 20.000.00 $ 20,000.00 $ 8,524.00 $ 8,524.00 

I 5,000.00 $ 30,000.00 I 1,350.00 S 8,100.00 

I 21." $ ........ S 17.00 S 3,284'" 

S 2,500.10 I ...... 00 S ' ....... S " ...... 
S 13,500.00 • 13.500.00 S 1,113.00 • 1,813.00 

I 35,000.00 $ 35.000.00 I 51,000.00 $ 55,000.00 

$ 5,000.00 • 5,000.10 • 2,510.00 • 2,5fO.oo 

s 1,000.00 • ........ $ 2OS.00 • t,721.01 

S 25,689.85 $ 25 ..... 85 • 32,000.00 I 32,000.00 

I 20,000.00 • 20,000.00 I 21,000.00 • 25.000.00 

I 10,000.01 $ 10,018.00 I ......... S . ....... 
$ $39,088.85 $ 401,0_ 

S 53,808.89 f 010,806.010 

S 5112,173.54 ~ ..... ,870.40 
- -- -- - -- --

10113J2011 



BID TABULATION 

FOR 

IFB #16-2714-0V 

FORCE MAIN 17A REPLACEMENT 
(REBID OF IFB #16-0699-DC) 

BID "B" 
BASED ON A COMPLETION TIME OF 210 CALENDAR DAYS 

PREPARED BY: 
(Project Management) 

REVIEWED BY: 
(Project Management) 

REVIEWED BY: 
(Project Engineer) 

APPROVED BY: 
(Purchasing) 

Page 2 

~h.truu KOblrn~on 
Sherri Robinson, Assessment Coordinator 

Czo, P.E., Project Manager 

.4?~~ 

·vJ.-
clch, 'Contract Specialist 

\O/J3/1 b 
Date 

/~~ 
~ 

A>hA 
? (jate 

;'&~e'/6 
Q te 

10/1312016 


