MANATEE COUNTY

January 22, 2009

TO: All Interested Bidders
RE: IFB 09-01920V
Bid Tabulation

Improvements at the Master Lift Station 41-A.

We thank you for your participation in the Manatee County Government Bidding
process. We look forward to your future participation.

Should you have any questions regarding the attached, please contact the under-
signed.

Regards, - .
6% (-1 %M((AA/L/
-

“"0Olga Valcich

Construction Buyer

941-749-3055

Email: olga.valcich@mymanatee.org.

Financial Management Department — Purchasing Division
1112 Manatee Avenue Waest, Suite 803, Bradenton, FL 34205
Phone: 941-749-3014 - Fax: 941-749-3034
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09-01920V TABULATION

IMPROVEMENTS AT MASTER LIFT STATION 41-A

_Wmmo_,_ Construction Company Inc.” [[DeJonge Excavating Contractors, inc.  ||[H.A. Contracting Corp KBHS (Ken's Bush Hog)
P.O. Box 141860 P.O. Box 743 9500 NW 12th St. Bay 1 13825 Hwy 19
Gainesville, FL 32614 Venice, FL 34284 Miami, FL 33172 Hudson, FL 34667
352-335-5556 941-485-7799 305-591-9212 727-863-0205
EST.
ITEM DESCRIPTION umMi aTY | UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED PRICE || UNIT PRICE || EXTENDED PRICE || UNIT PRICE || EXTENDED PRICE || UNIT PRICE || EXTENDED PRICE
Bid "A" - Based on Completion
Time of 270 Days
1 |MOBILIZATION LS| 1 $45,000.00 $45,000.00 $12,484.00 $12,484.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00
Mechanical / Structural / Electrical
2 |Work LS| 1 | $809,700.00 $809,700.00 $346,860.00 $346,860.00 $760,000.00 $760,000.00 $328,766.61 $328,766.61
MISCELLANEOUS WORK AND $5.000.00
CLEAN UP T $5,000.00 $6,083.00 $6,083.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $13,000.00 13,000.00
DISCRETIONARY WORK $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00
TOTAL BID "A" PRICE $909,700.00 $415,427.00 $855,000.00 $392,766.61
Bid "B" - Based on Completion
Time of 365 Days
1 |MOBILIZATION LS| 1 $45,000.00 $45,000.00 $12,484.00 $12,484.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00
Mechanical / Structural / Civit /
2 |Electrical Work LS| 1 | $809,700.00 $809,700.00 $346,860.00 $346,860.00 $750,000.00 $750,000.00 $328,766.61 $328,766.61
MISCELLANEQUS WORK AND sl 1 $5.,000.00
5 |CLEANUP e $5,000.00 $6,083.00 $6,083.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $13,000.00 513,000.00
DISCRETIONARY WORK $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00
TOTAL BID "B" PRICE $909,700.00 $415,427.00 $845,000.00 $392,766.61
Site Visit Acknowledged Yes Yes Yes Yes
Acknowledge Addendums 1 thru 2 Yes Yes Yes Yes
Subcontractor Percentage Yes Yes Yes Yes
The Florida Trench Safety Act Yes Yes Yes Yes
Contractor's Questionnaire Yes Yes Yes Yes
Drug Free Work Place Certification Yes Yes Yes Yes
Public Contracting and
Environmental Crimes Certification Yes Yes Yes Yes
Bid Bonds Included Yes Yes Yes Yes
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09-01920V TABULATION
IMPROVEMENTS AT MASTER LIFT STATION 41-A

Kuxhausen Construction TLC Diversified, Inc. U.S. Water Services Westra Construction Corp. Wright Construction Group
P.0. Box 21087 2719 17th St. E. 4925 Cross Bayou Blvd P.O. Box 1149 5811 Youngquist Rd.
Sarasota, FL 34276 ___um_amzo_ FL 34221 New Port Richey, FL 34652 Paimetto, FL 34221 Fort Myers, FL 33912
941-379-6603 941-722-0621 727-848-8292 941-723-1611 239-481-5000
EST.
ITEM DESCRIPTION umll a1y | UNIT PRICE || EXTENDED PRICE || UNIT PRICE || EXTENDED PRICE | UNIT PRICE || EXTENDED PRICE || UNIT PRICE || EXTENDED PRICE §j UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED PRICE
Bid "A" - Based on Completion
Time of 270 Days
1 |MOBILIZATION LS| 1 $48,000.00 $48,000.00 $21,000.00 $21,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $30,500.00 $30,500.00 $27,555.00 $27,555.00
Mechanical / Structural / Electrical
2 [|Work LS| 1 [$379,240.00 $379,240.00 $412,000.00 $412,000.00 $548,760.00 $548,760.00 $318,500.00 $318,500.00 $395,955.00 $395,955.00
MISCELLANEOUS WORK AND
5 |CLEANUP $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $11,500.00 $11,500.00 25,000.00 25,000.00 38,500.00 $38,500.00 $96,150.00 596,150.00
DISCRETIONARY WORK $50,000.00 50,000.00 50,000.00 50,000.00 $50,000.00
ITOTAL BID "A" PRICE $489,240.00 $494,500.00 $688,760.00 $437,500.00 $569,660.00
Bid "B" - Based on Completion
Time of 365 Days
1 |MOBILIZATION LS| 1 $48,000.00 $48,000.00 $21,000.00 $21,000.00 NO BID NO BID $30,500.00 $30,500.00 $27,555.00 $27,555.00
Mechanical / Structural / Civil /
2 |Electrical Work LS| 1 | $379,240.00 $379,240.00 $412,000.00 $412,000.00 NO BID NQ BID $318,500.00 $318,500.00 $395,955.00 $395,955.00
MISCELLANEOUS WORK AND sl 1
5 |CLEAN UP 12,000.00 $12,000.00 $11,500.00 $11,500.00 NO BID NO BID 38,500.00 538,500.00 $96,150.00 $96,150.00
DISCRETIONARY WORK $50,000.00 ¢ $50,000.00 NO BiD L $50,000.00 $50,000.00
TOTAL BID "B” PRICE $489,240.00 ; $494,500.00 NO BID L $437,500.00 [t $569,660.00
Site Visit Acknowledged Yes Yes Yes Yes ] Yes
Acknowledge Addendums 1 thru 2 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Subcontractor Percentage Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
The Florida Trench Safety Act Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Contractor's Questionnaire Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Drug Free Work Place Certification Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Public Contracting and
Environmental Crimes Certification Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Bid Bonds Included Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
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