
SUBJECT 

MANATEE COUNTY GOVERNMENT 
INTENT TO A WARD 

Garden Heights Subdivision 
Waterline Replacement Project DATE POSTED 

Project # 404-6085170 

5 ,,'1'+ 
5 11 44: 86 

r." 1* 

PURCHASING 
Donna M. Stevens ext. 3045 

DATE CONTRACT 
Seven days from date posted 

REPRESENTATIVE SHALL BE AWARDED 

DEPARTMENT Public Works Department 
CONSEQUENCES IF 

Delay in project 

J! DEFERRED 

SOLICITATION IFB #14-0841-DS 
AUTHORIZED BY Meliss1endel ~ 

DATE May , 

NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD 

Notice of Intent to Award, Invitation for Bid # 14-0841-DS, Garden Heights Subdivision Waterline Replacement Project, to the lowest, 
responsive and responsible bidder, Secord Contracting Corporation of 4821 Coolidge Avenue, Tampa Florida 33622 for a total base bid of 

F27 l 116.50 for a com(!letion time of 250 calendar da~s. 

ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITY 

Federal/State law(s), administrative ruling(s), Manatee County Comp Plan/Land Development Code, ordinances, resolutions, policy. 

Manatee County Code of Law 

BACKGROUND/DISCUSSION 

(' 

~/r~ 

The work included in this contract consists of the construction of various sizes of waterlines and water services by directional drilling and other 
methods to replace existing waterlines, including all appurtenances, water meters, traffic control, pavement repair, valves, hydrants, permits, 
and coordination with county staff and residents. The work shall be performed in accordance with the related standards and specifications 
noted in the Invitation for Bid. 

Appropriate bid procedures were followed. Notice of Bid availability advertised on DemandStar, mymanatee.org and the Manatee 
Chamber of Commerce. 

Seven (7) bids were received. 

Manatee Count~ Firm Bid Offering Bid" A" 31 0 da~s Bid Offering Bid "B" 250 da~s 
Westra Construction Corp $1,109,975.35 No Bid 

Hillsborough Count~ Firm Bid Offering Bid "A" 310 da~s Bid Offering Bid "B" 250 da~s 
Secord Contracting Corp. $ 727,116.50 $ 727,116.50 
Harris Mc-Burney Company $ 765,202.13 $ 765,202.13 
Carl Hankins, Inc. $ 906,910.95 $ 952,510.95 

Charlotte Count~ Firm Bid Offering Bid "A" 310 da~s Bid Offering Bid "B" 250 da~s 
D. R. Swanson Company No Bid $1,192.335.10 

Brevard Count~ Firm Bid Offering Bid" A" 31 0 da~s Bid Offering Bid "B" 250 da~s 
Young's Communication $ 951,079.80 $ 951,079.80 

(Out of State) Bid Offering Bid" A" 31 0 da~s Bid Offering Bid "B" 250 da~s 
Gregory Electric Company $ 897,044.50 $ 897,044.50 

Utility Rates 
ATTACHMENTS FUNDING SOURCE 0 Funds Verified 

(List In order of attached) Department Recommendation (Acct Number & Name) 
Bid Tabulation X Insufficient Funds 

AMT/FREQ OF RECURRING 
COSTS (Attach Fiscal Impact 

COST $727,116.50 Statement) 
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• On April 24, 2014 received from Public Works Department the recommendation to award to Secord Contracting Corporation the 
lowest, responsive and responsible bidder for a total base bid of $727,116.50 with a 250 calendar day completion. 

• Funding will become available via the budget amendment Resolution No. B-14-053 which is on the Board of County Commissioners 
Agenda for May 6,2014. 

• This funding source for this Agreement will be WTR - Garden Heights Subdivision (404-6085170-534000/6085170-0004) 

F:\Donna Stevens\IFB's for FY 2014\14-0841-05 Garden Heights Subdivision Waterline\INTENT TO AWARD.docx 



MEMORANDUM 
To: 

From: 

Date: 

Subject: 

Melissa M. Wendel, CPPO, Purchasing Official 

Jeff Streitmatter III. P. E .• Project Managemen~. 
Division Manager /',:::7 . 
April 24, 2014 

Garden Heights Subdivision Waterline Replacement Project 
Secord Contracting Corp. 
Recommendation for Award - IFB# 14-0841-DS 

·1vl a 11. a tee 
-'---- County 

f t 0 If I [) ,~ 

The bids for the above referenced project have been reviewed by staff. The bid tabulation form 
is attached for your review. It is recommended that the contract Bid "B", with a construction 
time of 250 Calendar Days be awarded to the lowest responsive, responsible bidder, Secord 
Contracting Corp. in the amount of $727,116.50 and in accordance with the terms and 
conditions of the bid package. Upon completion of project award, please provide a copy of the 
purchase order assigned to the contractor. The funding source for this contract is Utility Rates. 

The amount currently encumbered is less than the proposed contract amount, and a budget 
amendment will be prepared to fully fund the project prior to the contract award. 

Please contact Kent Bontrager, Project Engineer II if you have any questions regarding the 
attached documents. 

Thank you for your continued assistance. 

JSlkdb 

cc: Mike Gore, Director, Utilities 
Ron Schulhofer, Director, Public Works 
Sia Mollanazar, P.E., Deputy Director, Engineering Services 
Kent Bontrager, Project Engineer II 

Project File: 60851709.2 
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BID uA" Secord ContrKttng corp. 
P.o . Box 26072 

310 CALENDAR DAYS Timpe. FL 33622 
(HHI~h County) 

Rim Unit Extended 
No. Uneltem Un" Qty Prlca Price 

1 6' HOPE1C<II06JLOlrectlonll Drill) LF 5,330 528.50 S 151 ,905.00 
2 8' HOPE (C-II06) (Dlrectlonll Drill) LF 605 533.00 SI9965.00 
3 8' 01 (CL-350) (Olrect Bury) LF 85 55500 $4.675.00 
4 6" 01 (CL-360) (Olrect Bury) LF 270 $4500 $12.150 00 
5 4' HOPE (C·II06HDltKUonll Drill) LF 230 $1800 54. 14().00 
6 2 ' HOPE (C0906) (Olrectlonll 01110 LF 205 $1400 52.87000 
7 6 ' GlleV.lve EA 22 sns.oo $17.050.00 
8 4 ' Glte Vllve EA 1 $55000 $550.00 
II Ouellle Iron FItting., Wlter LB 5~ $310 516,120.00 
10 Fl.I'I Hydnlnt Auembly EA 8 55.800.00 546,400.00 
11 Wlter Servtce (Long) (Single) EA 6 $95000 S5,7oooo 
12 Wiler ServIce (Short) (Single) EA 24 $625.00 515,000.00 
13 Wlter Service (Long) (Double) EA 45 $1 ,000.00 545.000.00 
14 Wiler Servtce IShort) (Double) EA 23 $950.00 521 .850.00 
15 Prlvlte WIt.er Servtce ReloutJon. Complete EA 140 $900.00 $126.000.00 
16 SF Preventere wiExp. T.nk " VIC. BI'IIII.rw EA 25 SSOO.OO 512,500.00 
17 Remow &IaI1ng V.lvelSaddle. lnatllI SIee"",lug EA 3 S550.oo $1 .650.00 
18 Connect to Exletlng Wlterllnel EA 3 $1 ,500.00 $4,500.00 
111 Orlveway RHtorw,lon Sy 100 55510 S551000 
20 Grout Flil Abandoned Pipe CF 600 $12.50 57.500.00 
21 Sodding SY 3000 $10.10 $30.300.00 
22 Erollon Control LS 1 $1 200.00 $1 ,200.00 
23 Conere'e Curb Repllcement LF 60 53500 $2,100.00 
24 Alphllt Rold Ru'orwtlon (B ... " Relurflcel Sy 200 55555 $11 , 110.00 
25 Alphlll Rold Reetor.lIon (Mill" Relumce) SY 700 $IB.l0 $12,670.00 
211 Pipe Adapter EA 45 $75.00 53.375.00 
'Z1 Pipe Joint R.UI:rIlnll EA 75 $75.00 55,625.00 
28 Blowolf Auembly, 2" EA 2 S350.00 $700 00 
211 Skfw1Ilk R.stOl'ltlon SY 50 $50.00 52.500.00 
30 AIr R,lel" AsMmbly EA 2 $500.00 $1 .00000 
31 Trwlflc Control LS 1 55.500.00 55.500.00 
32 16' II e' Tip S"'~" V.I~ EA 1 $2.10000 $2,100.00 
33 14' II 8" TIp S"'~" V.lve EA 1 $2.000.00 $2.000.00 
34 14' II S' TIp Sleew " V.1Ye EA 1 $1 .800.00 $1 .800.00 

~oIaI C~netructlon Coet $e03 015.00 
36 Moblllutlon LS 1 S40 000.00 $40.00000 
36 all_lllneoue Woril " Clean Up LS 1 518.00000 518.000 00 

To1I1B_81d 5661015.00 
37 C~ntrlCl Contingency % 10 566.101.50 

Toll.' ConlBct AWlrd • Gwden Helghb 
$727 .116.50 

SuOdMeIon Watertlne Protect 
Aclmowled!Jft1 Addendum 11 Yu 

ContntCtor'l QuestionnaIre Ye. 

ContntCtor's UcenN CUC057194 

Flor/dJI Trench S.fery Act Yu 

Public ContrlJCtlng & Environmental Crimes Yo 

Affidavit for LOCltl Bua/M .. (If appl/ub/e) No 

9ld90nd Yes 
_.-
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IFB #14-0841-05 
POTABLE WATER PROJECT NO. 6085170 

GARDEN HEIGHTS WATERLINES 

2 3 4 
HI "","McBurney Compeny Gr.goIy EIeettIc Compeny Carl Hlnklm, Inc. 

2120 u.s. Hlghwrf 301 P.O. Orew.r 14111 14512 N. Nebrllkl AVlenue 
TIII1pI, FL 33619 Columbia, SC 2i2O'2 Tampe. FL 33613 

(Hillsborough County) (HIlIabOrc lIQh County) 
Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Exhnded 
Prlca PrlCI Prloe Prlca Plica .Prlce. 
523.60 SI25 788.00 52725 $145,242..50 $26.50 5135,915.00 
$30.70 $18,573.50 538.50 $23,292.50 $32.00 $19.36000 
$58.40 $4.964.00 555.00 $4.675 .00 $195.00 $ 16.S75.oo 
$33.50 59,045.00 537.00 $9.990.00 $125.00 $33,75000 
$1610 $3.703.00 $17.00 53.910.00 52300 $5,290.00 
$9.80 $2.009.00 513.00 $2,665.00 512.00 $2,460.00 

$1.26040 S27,728.80 $1 ,220.00 $26.840.00 $1 ,369.00 $30.118.00 
$1 ,021 .00 $1 ,021.00 $1 .000 00 $1.000.00 $1 .150.00 $1.15000 

5550 $28,600.00 55.00 $26,000.00 $6.50 533.600.00 
$4,957.00 $39,656.00 $5 600.00 $46.400.00 55.600.00 544.800.00 
51 .090.00 $6,540.00 $1 ,700 00 510,200.00 $1 ,900.00 $11.400.00 

586100 $20.864 00 $1 ,050.00 $25,200.00 $1 .143.00 $27432.00 
$1 .S34.OO 569.030.00 52 200.00 $99,000.00 $2,285.00 $102.825.00 
$1 ,362..00 $31326.00 51 .550.00 535.650.00 51 ,480.00 534.040.00 

552500 $73,500.00 $1 , 160.00 $162.400.00 $265.00 537,100.00 
$690.00 $17.250.00 $1 ,072.00 $26,600.00 $670.00 $1675000 

$1 ,630.00 $4.890.00 5530.00 $1 .590.00 $450.00 $1 .350.00 
$2,685.00 $8.055.00 $1 ,500.00 $4 500.00 $650.00 $1 ,950.00 

56500 56,500.00 566.00 56 600.00 57500 57,50000 
$12.00 57.200.00 55.50 $3300.00 $1500 $9,000.00 

53.60 $10,800.00 $4.50 513.500.00 5650 $19.500.00 
$2,90000 $2.900.00 56.500.00 56.50000 52.20000 $2.200.00 

$54.00 $3,240.00 534.00 $2.040.00 545.00 $2,70000 
$8000 $16.000.00 562.00 $12.400.00 532.00 56,400.00 
$46.75 532.725.00 S:J8.oo $26,600.00 535.00 $24500.00 

5380.00 $17.10000 S350.oo $15,750.00 $17460 $7.852.50 
$216.00 $16.200.00 $125.00 $9.375.00 $125.00 $9,375.00 
$667.50 $1 .335.00 51 .500.00 53 000.00 $510.00 $1020.00 

554.00 $2,700.00 $55.00 $2,750.00 $65.00 53,25000 
$2,225.50 $4,451 .00 $2.300.00 $4,600.00 $2,425 .. 00 $4.850.00 
55.500.00 55,500.00 $8,500.00 58.500.00 514.000.00 $14,000.00 
$3,271 .00 53,271 .00 57,300.00 57 300.00 511 ,781 .00 $11.781 .00 
53.253.00 53,.253.00 $7,025.00 57.025.00 511,795 00 $11 .79500 
52.6noo $2.Snoo 55.900.00 55.900.00 512.176.00 $12,17600 

5828195.30 $790495.00 $703,984.50 
546.913.00 546,91300 $24.00000 524.000.00 $114.000.00 $114.000.00 
520.53000 $20,530.00 $1.000.00 $1 ,000.00 56.50000 56.500.00 

5895638.30 S815495.oo $824464.50 
$69.563 83 S81 .S4950 $82,446 45 

$765,202. 13 S8i7.0«.50 SiOS.lll0.H 

Ye. YIPS Yea 
Y.s Yell Yea 

CGCfS14783 
__ U _1'II 

CUC0574$3 
Yell Yu Yel 
Yo Yea Ye. 
Yes No No 
Yes Yes Y .. 

- - --

5 8 7 I 
Young'l Communlc:ltlon W...,. CoMltUCllon Corp. O.R. SWlnlOn COmp.lny 

424 WutOrlw 1263 12th Avenue Eut 13144 Long lIIIllIne 

I "'Iboume, FL 32904 Pllmlno, FL 342221 PM Chlliotte. FL 33953 
(8l'1wrd Cou~ (MInatee County) (C hll1Gn. County) 

Unlt Extended Unit Extended ~;! 1 ~~:s I Price Price Prlee Price 
535.25 $187.882.50 533.00 $175.890.00 No Bid 
$49.00 S29.645.00 553.00 $32.065.00 No Bid 
$4050 $3.442.50 $5350 54.54750 No Bid 
$2900 $7,830.00 541 .90 $11 .313.00 No Bid 
$2450 55.635.00 53590 $8.25700 No Bid 
$13.00 $2,665.00 $ 1920 $3.936.00 No Bid 

$945.00 $20.790.00 $1 .260.00 SZ7.720.oo No Bid 
5784 00 $784.00 $ 1.134.00 $1.134.00 No Bid 

5500 526000.00 $350 $18,200.00 No Bid i 

54.636.00 537,068 00 $4,720.00 $31.760.00 No Bid I 

$1 ,718.00 $10.308 00 $1.300.00 $7.800.00 No BId 
, 

$906.00 $21.744 00 $1 ,01000 $24,24000 No Bid i 

5216600 597.470.00 $1.685.00 575.825.00 No BId I 

$1 ,554.00 535.742.00 $1,515.00 $34,845.00 No BId I 

$1,161 .00 $162,540.00 $1 ,810.00 5253.400.00 No Bid ! 

574600 $18.650 00 $790.00 $19750.00 No Bid 
510,185.00 $30.55500 $ 1 10000 $3.300.00 No BId 

5226.00 S87800 $1 ,990.00 $5.97000 No Bid 
$50.00 55.000 00 S6.60 S660.oo No Bid 
$800 $3,600.00 56.95 $4.170.00 No Bid 
$3.50 $10500.00 52.35 $7.050.00 No Bid 

$1 .362.00 $1.362.00 $4 475.00 54,475.00 No Bid 
532.00 51 .920.00 $22. 10 $1 .326.00 No81d 
543.00 58.600.00 $7525 $15.050.00 No Bid 
$3000 $21 .000.00 553.00 537.100.00 No Bid 

$165.00 $7.425.00 $380.00 $17.100.00 No Bid 
$78.00 55.700 00 $320.00 $24.000.00 No Bid 

51 .235.00 $2,470.00 $290.00 S580.oo No Bid 
$4100 $2050.00 $4000 52,000.00 No Bid 

$1.90200 $3.804.00 51.960 00 53 920.00 No Bid 
54.000.00 $4,000.00 525.500.00 525.50000 No BId 
S2.~.00 52.485.00 $8.850.00 $8.85000 No Bid 
$2.395.00 $20395.00 $8,835.00 $8.835.00 No Bid 
$1 .858.00 $1 .858.00 53,500.00 $3.500.00 No Bid 

$783,618.00 $910,068.50 No Bid 
$54,00000 554.000.00 $37.00000 537.000,00 No Bid 
$27.00000 $27.000.00 $62,00000 $62.00000 No BId 

5864618.00 51 009 068.50 No Bid 
$86.46180 $100.90685 No Bid 

5951 ,079.80 51 ,109 •. 975.35 No81d 

Yo Yo No91d 
YeJl Ye. No91d 

CUC057425 CGC062888 No91d 
Ye. Yes No91d 
Yea Yes No Bid 
No No No9Jd 
Yes Yell No9rd 

----

5/5/2014 
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BID II B II Sec:ol'd ConlnlctJng Corp. 
P.O. BoJlH072 

250 CALENDAR DAYS T.mpa. F1.. 33&22 
(HIII~h County) 

Item Unit Extended 
No. Unelt.m Unft Oty Prlc. Prlc. 

1 6" HOPE (C-906) (DlrectlOMI Drill) IF 5.330 528.50 $151 ,905.00 
2 8" HOPE (C'9CMI) (DIrection" Drill) LF 605 $33.00 $19,965 00 
3 8' 01 (CL-3SO) (Direct Butyl LF 85 $55.00 $4 .675.00 
4 6' 01 (CL-350) (Direct Butyl LF 270 545.00 $12.15000 
5 4' HOPE (C-9CMI1 (DlrecUon.1 Drill) LF 230 516.00 54.140.00 
8 2' HOPE (C-9CMI) (Dlrectlon.l Drill) LF 205 $14.00 $2,870.00 
7 6" G.te V.t... EA 22 sn5.00 $17,05000 

• 4' am V •. lve EA 1 $550.00 5550.00 
!! DuctIle Iron F1ttJng •• Wltar LB 5200 $310 $16, 12O.DO 
10 Fire HYdren' Anembly EA 8 155,800.00 S48,400.DO 
11 W.ter Servle. (Long) (SIngle) EA 6 595000 55.700.00 
12 Wat.r Sel\l~ (Short) (SIngle) EA 24 $625.00 $15.000.00 
"3 Wmr Service (LongHOoublaJ EA 45 $1 .000.00 545,000.00 
14 tw.leI' Servlc. (Short) (Couble) EA 23 $950 00 521 .850.00 
15 PriVIIte Wmr Service R.'ocatlon. Complete EA 140 5900.00 $126000.00 
16 BF Preventere wiExp. Tank & VIC. Bmkare EA 25 SSOO.OO 512.500.00 
17 Remow &1.11l1li V.rv.lS.tddle. Ina .. 11 SIMYeII'Iug EA 3 5550.00 51.650.00 
18 Connect to ElIlltln!! W.terllne. EA 3 $1 .50000 $4.500.00 
19 Driveway Re.,oraUon Sy 100 $55.10 55.510.00 
20 Grout Fill Abandoned lit". CF 600 $12.50 $7.500.00 
21 Sodding SY 3,000 $10.10 $30.30000 
22 Ero.1on Control LS 1 $1 .200.00 $1200.00 
23 Cone,." Curb R.pl.eement LF 60 $3500 $2 lOO.DO 
24 Aaphaft Aoad RutoretJon (B ... & Ruurface) Sy 200 555.65 $11 , 110.00 
25 Asphalt Aoad R .. torallon (MIt1 & Re.urt.c.l Sy 700 $18. 10 $12.670.00 
26 Plpe~pter EA 45 $75.00 $3.37500 
Z7 Pipe Joint Autr.lnta EA 75 $75.00 55,625.00 
28 Blowol1 Anembly. 2" EA 2 5350.00 $700.00 
2!! Sldw.lk Aeatoratlon Sy 60 $50.00 $2500.00 
30 AIr R.I ..... AaRmbly EA 2 S5OO.00 $1 .000.00 
31 [Treme Control LS 1 55.500.00 55.500.00 
32 IS" 11 S' Tap S .... ve & V.1ve EA 1 $2.100.00 $2.100.00 
33 14' 118" T.p S ... ve & V.lve EA 1 52,000.00 $2,000.00 
34 U · • S" T8p SIMve & V.1ve EA 1 51 .800.00 $1 .800.00 

Subtolal Construc:tlon Coat $603015.00 
35 Moblliulion LS 1 $40.000 DO $40.000.00 
38 Mlacell.neous Wol1t & CIe.n Up LS I 516.00000 $1800000 

[fotll 8ue Bid S661015.00 
37 ,r.onlract Contingency "JI. 10 $66,10150 

1T0tal Contract A_1'd • Garden Helghb $727,118.50 
Subdivision Walltt11ne Pro)ec:t 

AcJmowled9M1.. Addendum" Yes 

eonlrtlClor.t OtHf.tllonnlJl,. Yltll 

CO(1/r/ICIOr'1I UcenH CUC057194 

Floridll Trench Silfety Act Yall 
Public ContrllClfng .. EnvlronmtmltJ./ Cri",.11 Yu 

lAffldlJIIlt for L0C6/ BUlllne .. (If lIPPI/cable) No 

Bid Bond y,. 
-
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IFB #14-0841-05 
POTABLE WATER PROJECT NO. 6085170 

GARDEN HEIGHTS WATERLINES 

2 3 4 
H.n1.uc:SUmey co~ Gregoty Electrlc: COmpMY c.n H.nkl,,*> Inc. 

2120 U.s. Highway 301 P.O. D~1411 14512 ... ,..,,.111. Avenue 
T.mpa. Fl 334111 Columbia, SC 21202 T.mpa. F1.. 33813 

(Hmllbotough County) (Hillsborough County) 
Unit Enended Unit Extended Unit extended 
Prlc. Prlc. Prlc. Prlc. Prfc. Prfc. 

$23.60 5125 ,78800 15272S $145 242 50 $2fln $142.684.10 
$30.70 $18.57350 538.50 $23.292.50 533.60 $20.328.00 
$58.40 $4 .964 00 SS500 $4.67500 S204.75 $17.403.75 
53350 $9.04500 $3700 $9.990.00 $131.25 $35,437 50 
$16. 10 $3,70300 $1700 $3.910.00 $24.15 155.554.50 
$9.80 $2.009.00 $1300 $2.66500 $12.60 $2.58300 

$1 .260.40 $27,72880 $1 ,220 00 1528,840.00 $1 .437.45 531,623.90 
$1 .02100 $1 .02100 $1 ,000.00 51 .000.DO $1,207.50 $1 .20750 

155.50 $28,60000 55.00 S28.000.DO $6.82 $35,46400 
$4.95700 $39.656.00 155.800.00 $46.4OO.DO $5.880.00 547.040.00 
$1 .090.00 56.540.00 $1 .700.00 $10.20000 $1 .995.00 $11 .970.00 

$861.00 $20.664.00 $1 ,050.00 $25.200.00 51 ,200.15 528.800.60 
51 .53400 569.030.00 52.200 00 $99.000.00 52.399 .. 25 $107.966.25 
$1 ,362.00 $31 .326.00 $1 .550 00 535,650 DO 51 ,554.00 535.742.00 

5525.00 573.500.00 $1 ,160.00 $ 162, 400. DO 5278.25 $38.955.00 
5690.00 $17.250.00 $1 .072.00 526.800.00 $70350 $17.687.60 

$1 ,630.00 54.89000 5530.00 51 .590 00 $472.60 51 .417.50 
52,685.00 58.055.00 $1 .500.00 54.500 DO $682.50 $2.047.60 

565.00 $6,500.00 56600 56.800.00 $78.75 $7.875.00 
$12.00 !f7.200.00 $550 $3.300.DO $15.75 $9,450.00 
53.60 $10,800.00 5450 513,5OO.DO 5682 $20.480.00 

$2,900.00 $2.900.00 $6.50000 56.500.00 $2310.00 $2310.00 
554.00 $3.240.00 534.00 52.040.00 $47.25 $2.835 00 
$80.00 $16.000.00 562.00 512.400.00 533.60 56.72000 
546.75 $32.725.00 $38.00 $26.600.00 536.75 $25.725.00 

S38000 $17100.00 S350 00 $15.750.00 $183.22 56.244.90 
$216.00 516,20000 $125.00 59.375.00 $13125 $9.843 75 
$667..50 $1 .335.00 51 .500.00 $3.000 00 $535 50 $1 .071 .00 

554.00 $2,700.00 555.00 $2.750.00 568.25 $3.412.50 
$2.225.50 $4.45100 $2,300.00 $4,600 00 152.548 25 155.092.50 
55.500.00 155.500.00 sa,5OO.00 58 5OO.DO 514.700.00 514.70000 
53.271 .00 $3.271 .00 $7.30000 57300.00 $12.370.05 $12.370.05 
$3 253.00 $3.253.00 $7.025.00 $7,025.00 $12,384.75 $12.384.75 
52.677.00 52.mOO 155,900.00 $5.900.00 512.784.00 512,784.00 

5628195.30 S7904V5.00 5739004.05 
546.91300 546.91300 $24.000.00 $24.000.00 $120.000.00 $120.000.00 
$20.530.00 $20,53000 $1 .00000 $1 .000.00 58.82500 56.82500 

5695,638.30 $8"15495.00 $865 g'I1.05 
569,563.83 581 .549.50 $86,59190 

S785,202.13 $897,044.50 S952,510.gS 

Yu Yltll Yu 
Yell Yes Yes 

CGCISI4783 _~lua:.. .. CUC057433 
Yltll Yell Yell 
Yell Yell Y"~ 
Ye, No No 
Yell Yu Yu -

5 6 7 
Young'. CommunlQtlon WHITe Construction Corp. D.R. 5_ company 

424 W ... DrlWI 1263 12th Avenue E .... 13744 Long Lab Lane 
u.Iboume, Fl :12904 Palmetto, F1.. 342221 Port ChaloUll. F1.. 33M3 

(Brevard County) (Manatee County) (ChatIotlit COU/IIy) 
Unit Extended ~:! I Extended Unit Extended 
Prle. Price Prlca Prle. Prlca 

$35.25 5187.882.50 No Bid $25.20 $134.316.00 
$4900 $29.645.00 No Bid $3300 519.965 00 
$40.50 53.44250 No Bid $103.00 58.75500 
529.00 $7.830 00 No BId $58.00 $15.660 00 
$24.50 55.635.00 No BId $19.50 $4.485.00 
$13.00 $2.885.00 No BId $10.40 $2 132.00 

5945.00 $20.790.00 No Bid $1 .31600 $28,952.00 
$784.00 $784.00 No Bid $1 .02400 $1 .024.00 

155.00 528,00000 No Bid 5380 $19,760.00 
54,636.00 537.088.00 No BId $7.704.00 $61632.00 
51 ,71800 $10.308.00 No Bid $1 ,640.00 59.840.00 

$906.00 $21744.00 No Bid 51 .091 .00 $26.184.00 
$2.166.00 597.470.00 No BId $2.179.00 $96,055.00 
$1 .554.00 535 742.00 No BId 51 .64700 $37881 .00 
$1 . 161 00 $ 1 62,540.00 No Bid 52.545.DO $356,300 00 

$746.00 $18.650.00 No BId $1 ,014.00 525.350.00 
$10,185.00 $30.555.00 No BId SI .n8.00 55,334.00 

522600 5678.00 No BId 599400 $2.982.00 
550.00 55,000.00 No Bid $7700 $7.700.00 
56.00 $3.600.00 No Bid $9.30 55.580.00 
$3.50 $10.500.00 No Bid $3.00 59,000.00 

$1 .362.00 $1 .362.00 No Bid 59.199.00 59.199.00 
532.00 $1 .920.00 No Bid 546.30 52.778.00 
54300 58.600.00 No BId 5n.2O 515.440 00 
$30.00 $21 ,000.00 No BId 546.90 $32,830.00 

5165.00 $7,425.00 No Bid $189.00 56.505.00 
$7600 $5,700.00 No BId $262.00 $19,650.00 

$1 .235.00 52.470.00 No BId $56600 51 ,132..00 
$4100 $2,050.00 No Bid $46.30 $2,315.00 

$1 .902.00 53,804.00 No Bid $2,147.00 54 294.00 
$4.000.DO 54.00000 No BId $27 91300 $27,913.00 
52.485.00 $2,485.00 No Bid 55.466.00 155466.00 
52,395.00 $2395.00 No Bid 55.022.00 55.022.00 
51 .858.00 $1 .858.00 No Bid 54.041 .00 $4.041.00 

S783618.00 No Bid SI ,OI9,472.00 
$54.000.00 $54.000 00 No Bid $61 .713.00 $61,713.00 
527.00000 527.00000 No BId 52,758.00 52.756.00 

$884,818.00 No BId $1 OSS,941 .00 
566.46180 No Bid $108.394 10 

$951 .079.80 No Bid $1.192,335.10 

Yes No Bid Yall 
y,. No Bid Yell 

CUC05742S No Bid CUC056691 

Yell No Bid Yell 

Yell No Bid Yill" 
No No Bid No 

Y .. No Bid Yell -
5/5/2014 
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BASED ON A COMPLETION TIME OF 250 CALENDAR DAYS 

Sherri Robinson, Assessment Coordinator 

Jim 

Kent Bontrager, P.E~ Project Engineer II 

Date 

Date 
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