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SOLICITATION IFB #16-2289BLS AUTHORIZ~A~~~Y 075, ~(. b'j;Yt~ 
• 

NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD 
_. 

1111/1(" 7'" 

Notice of Intent to Award, Invitation for Bid #16-2289BLS, Water and Sewer Materials and Accessories to the 
bidders (primary and secondary) with the lowest, responsive, responsible bids (by group, subtotal) Ferguson 
Waterworks, Fortiline Inc. and HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd. 

ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITY 
I 

Federal/State law(s). administrative ruling(s). Manatee County Comp Plan/Land Development Code. 
ordinances. resolutions. policy. 

~~-- >. > -

Manatee County Code of Laws 

BACKGROUND/DISCUSSION 

> This procurement is for water and sewer materials and accessories for the Utilities Maintenance Warehouse 
Department. 

> The intent of this Invitation for Bid (lFB) is to establish a primary and secondary award to the two lowest, 
responsive, responsible bidders meeting specifications by group, subtotal. 

> The annual estimated expenditure is $500,000.00 

> The County solicited Invitation for Bid #16-2289BLS from July 20,2016 through August 8,2016, appropriate 
bid procedures were followed. 

> Notice of IFB #16-2289BLS was solicited on Demand Star (thirteen planholders), MyManatee.org, and the 
Manatee County Chamber. 

> Three bids were received from Ferguson Waterwor1<s, Fortiline Inc., and HD Supply Waterwor1<s, Ltd. 

ATTACHMENTS FUNDING SOURCE 
x 

Funds Verified 0 (List in order of attached) • (Acct Number & Name) 0 Insufficient Funds 
AMT/FREQ OF RECURRING 

Annual Estimate COSTS (Attach Fiscal Impact 
COST $500,000.00 Statement) 5010003698-595000 
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~ August 16, 2016 received a memorandum from C. Mike Gore, Utilities Director to award by group as 
follows: 

GROUP 

A (PVC fillings/pipe) 
B (C900 PVC pipe) 
C (SDR26 fittings/pipe) 
D (HOPE fillings/pipe) 
E (Misc valves/stems) 
F (Ductile Iron fittings/pipe) 
G (Misc repair clamps) 
H (MeterNalve boxes) 
I (Fire hydrants/repair kits) 

PRIMARY 

Ferguson ($7,860.92) 
Ferguson ($12,056.00 
Fortiline ($16,187.46) 
Ferguson ($26,537.95) 
Ferguson ($38,476.89) 
Ferguson ($33,128.87) 
Ferguson ($41,155.61) 
Ferguson ($54,381.29) 
Ferguson ($94,275.53) 

SECONDARY 

Fortiline ($11,339.26) 
Fortiline ($12,474.40) 
Ferguson ($16,922.53) 
nla 
Fortiline ($39,634.65) 
HD Supply ($37,701.88) 
nla 
HD Supply (55,521.93) 
nla 

*each group has a fixed percentage discount off published manufacturer's price list for like items not 
specifically identified. 

GROUP 
A (PVC fittings/pipe) 
B (C900 PVC pipe) 
C (SDR25 fittings/pipe) 
D (HDPE fittings/pipe) 
E (Misc valves/stems) 
F (Ductile Iron fittings/pipe) 
G (Misc repair clamps) 
H (MeterNalve boxes) 
I (Fire hydrants/repair kits) 

PRIMARY 
Ferguson - 81 % 
Ferguson - 0% 
Fortiline - 50% 
Ferguson - 0% 
Ferguson - 64% 
Ferguson - 64% 
Ferguson - 52% 
Ferguson - 0% 
Ferguson - 37% 

SECONDARY 
Fortiline - 50% 
Fortiline - 50% 
Ferguson - 80% 
nla 
Fortiline - 48% 
HD Supply-O% 
nla 
HD Supply - 0% 
nla 



1 - Water and Sewer Materials and Accessories 
Ferguson Waterworks Fortiline Inc. HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd. 

H ,.,'V"" 
UCT DESCRIPTION 

IWFG fPAH.T 
"eMU NUMBER QTY UIM NUMBERS 

GROUP A 

A1 ;'L1Zlo 

PVC FITTINGS AND ~CHEDULE 40 AND SCHEDULE 80 
IMAII: Au", lUI'< - SLIP X CH.40 % 125 EA IN-I4I'LOTTE $0.1' !l:iA 7' $0.1/ c?nnc $0.21 C?" ?, 

A2 % 115 EA I~UADLOTTE $0.1 ' $17.2f $0.1' ~.n c, $0.2, ~~a " 

A3 < 3/4" X 1/T 25 EA I~U'DLOTTE $0.21 $7.0C So:2i $7.2! $0.4, ~~ 

A4 :1;l;'O 1 60 EA I~UADLOTTE SO.3( C.A nn $0.31 ~.o a, 50.42 $25.2C 

A5 ;$L1240 -114 25 EA I ... U.DLOTTE SO.33 $8.251 $O.3l $8.7! $O.SI S12.7'! 

A6 .)L1;lOU 1% 25 EA I'''''''LOTTE $0.4' c.? n, $0.4f $11.5( $0.6~ $17.0( 

A7 2 125 EA ~U'DLOTTE SO.59 $73.71 SO.58 $72.5C $0.89 S1112~ 
AS 3L1;loO MAl F: ADAF I uK SLIP X MIPT SCH.40 3 100 EA """"LOTTE S2.S0 !l:7!i1l nr $2.27 $227.0( $3.85 C~A" rV' 

A9 4 10 EA "'UA DLOTTE S3.20 c:~? no $2.87 ~?O 7r $4.91 $49.1 4 

A10 ;'L 12HU 1010"'" F "n , UI'< - SLIP X FIPT SCH. 40 % 50 EA "U'''LOTTE SO.18 $9.DC $020 C1n nr $0.26 $13.00 
A11 3Z1295 % 110 EA ~UAD'_OTTE SO.2~ .. ?" AI $0.21 e~n 0' SO.33 !i:AA ~, 

A12 3zi305 1 60 EA I"'''''LOTTE SO.21 !l:iR ?, ToTs $17.4( $0.38 ~t 

A13 3Z1310 1% 25 EA I~UADLOTTE S04C C1n n' $0.41 ~.n·" $0.5~ $14. 7~ 

A14 3Zi3-i5 1% 25 EA I"""'LOTTE $O.4l $11.2! $0.41 $11.7! $0.68 S17.6ii 
A15 3Z1320 2 25 EA ~UADLOTTE $0.61 '''" ? $0.62 ~ •• • r $0.91 $22.7 

A16 3Z1330 IFEMAI 1= "u" ... , UK SLIP xFlPT SCH. 40 3 12 EA "".DLOTTE $2.08 !I:?,. a. $1.99 C?~ A' $3.1~ $372ii 

A17 3Z1335 4 10 EA "'''''''LOTTE $3.45 !l::l4 !ir $3.07 $30.7C $S.14 $51.40 

A18 3Z1345 1 RFnllr.IN(' RI i SUP X SLIP SCH. 40 %x% 200 EA "'".DLOTTE $0.17 'I:~Ann $0.19 C~Ann $0.24 ~AO M 

A19 3Z1350 1 X % 120 EA "'''''''LOTTE $0.30 !1::lR nn '$oj3 'I:~a "n $0 .44 C"?An 

A20 3Z1355 1x% 50 EA ... "AD'_OTTE $0.3: $15.50 $0.33 $16.50 $O.~ ~~~ M 

A21 3Z1385 1% X 1 5 EA rJ·""'_OTTE SO.42 $2.11 $oA3 $2.11 $0.59 $2.91 

A22 3Z1375 1% X 1 10 EA I ... "AD'_OTTE SO.43 S4.3C SO.41 $4.se $0.63 $6.3C 

A23 3zi300 2x1 15 EA I ......... "LOTTE SO.71 $10.6f $D.7i $10.6f SI.O' milo 
A24 3Z1395 2x 1% 5 EA I ... " A DLOTTE SO.7: $3.se SO.7( sa.5C SI.O' S5.2( 

A25 3Z14oO 2 X 1J.~ 5 EA I""'''LOTTE SO.7' $3.65 $o:7c S3.50 $1.~ w e 
A26 3Z1415 4x2 10 EA l~uADLOTTE S3.6! c.,,, cn S3.3' ~? ?n SS .S( ~.c or 

A27 3zi420 4 x'3 15 EA I"""'LOTTE S3.8! $57.75 $3.3, .... a An S5.S( ~r 

A28 3Z1425 6x4 _5 EA I~UAD'_OTTE S9.6C CAA nl $7,94 $39.70 $13.6 ~aa " ' 

A29 3Z1440 IREnllr.INr.: RII~J.lING SUP xFIPT SCH.40 1x% 25 EA Iru'DI_OTTE $0.42 <tin "n $O.4f $11.50 $O.5C ~;: 

A30 3Z1450 1% X 1 12 EA I"'''''''LOTTE $0.64 $7.68 $0.61 $8.04 $O.n $9.1:, 

A31 3Z1455 1%x% 12 EA "''''DI.OTTE $0.74 $888 $0,7? $9.24 $0.81 '" n A , 

A32 3Z1460 1% X 1 12 EA CHARLOTTE $0.74 $8.88 $0 ,7? $9.24 $0.8? ... n A , 

A33 3Z1480 2x% 125 EA "'''ADLOTTE $0.9! 'l:1?? "" $1.0( 4:1?" nn $1.1 S146.2! 

A34 3Z1520 ICAP - SLIP SCH.40 % 55 EA ICHARLOTTE SO.I' $7.7C $D.l/ $8.80 $0 1~ $9.3! 

A35 3Z1525 % 75 EA I ... UADLOTTE $0.1 <t1? 7< $0.11 C1A ?" $0.2( e .. nr 

A36 3zi530 1 15 EA I" .... ·"LOTTE $0.2f $390 So:2i $4.35 $0.31 $4.S! 

A37 3Z1540 1% 12 EA I~UADLOTTE $0.3' $4.561 $O.4i $4.92 $O .~ s5.2e11 

A38 3Zi545 1Y., 15 EA I" .... ·"LOTTE $O.4C $6.0< S044 $6.60 $0.41 S7.05l1 

A39 3Z1550 2 15 EA '~UADLOTTE $049 $7.3f SO.51 $7.651 SO.57 s8.5511 

A40 3Z1565 CAP SLIP SCH. 40 3 15 EA " .... ·"LOTTE $16? 'i:?!i n. SIM C?A "r $1.99 ~. 

A41 3Z1570 4 _5 EA ~"ADLOTTE $4.00 "?nnn S3.41 S17.0f $4.53 .. ~?O< 

A42 3Z1575 6 20 EA " .... ·"LOTTE S9.48 $189.60 $791 $158.2C ~ln R4 ~n 

A43 .)L1U;$O CAP - FIPT SCH. 40 % 10 EA ~UAD'.OTTE $0.35 $3.5C $0.39 $3.9C $0.40 $4.0C 
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IF~16-2289BLS - Water and Sewer Materials and Accessories 
Ferguson Waterworks I Fortiline Inc. I HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd. 

,'" U,,'" MI''' I t'AKI 

I I I ITEM NUMBER PRODUCT DESCRIPTION QTY UlM NUMBERS 

A44 3Z1535 1 10 EA CHARLOTTE $0.51 $5.10 $0.53 $5.30 $0,61 $6.10 

A45 3Z1040 1% 10 EA CHARLOTTE $0 6~ $6.40 $0.64 $6.40 $0.73 $7.30 

A46 3Z1045 1'12 10 EA CHARLOTTE $0.6<1 $6.40 $0.64 $6.40 SO.76 $7.60 

A47 3Z1555 2 12 EA CHARLOTTE $1.19 $14.2S $113 $13.56 $136 $16.31 

A48 3Z1050 3 5 EA CHARLOTTE $2.40 $12.00 $2.09 $10.45 $2.60 $13,OC 

A50 3Z1585 COUPLING SLIP x SLIP SCH. 40 '12 100 EA CHARLOTTE $0.11 $11.00 $0,12 $12.00 $0.11 $11,OC 

A51 3Z1590 % 150 EA CHARLOTTE $015 $22.50 $0.16 $24,00 SO.17 $25.5C 

A52 3Z1595 1 65 EA CHARLOTTE $0.26 $16.90 $0.27 $17.55 SO.30 $19.5C 

A53 3Z1600 1% 75 EA CHARLOTTE $0.36 $27.00 $0.38 $28.50 $0.40 $30.0C 

A54 3Z1605 1'12 100 EA CHARLOTTE $0.39 $39.00 $0.4( $40.00 $0.44 $44.0C 

A55 3Z1610 2 450 EA CHARLOTTE $0.59 $265.50 $0.56 $252.00 $066 $297,OC 

A56 3Z1620 COUPLING SLIP x SLIP SCH. 40 3 25 EA CHARLOTTE $1.99 $49.75 $184 $46.00 $2.30 $57.5C 

A57 3Z1625 4 50 EA CHARLOTTE $2.94 $147.00 $2.56 $128.00 $3.33 $166.5C 

A58 3Z1055 COUPLING FIPT x FIPT SCH. 40 % 100 EA CHARLOTTE $0.39 $39.00 $0.39 $39.00 $0.44 $44,OC 

A60 3Z1635 BEND 45 DEGREE SLIP x SLIP SCH. 40 '12 50 EA CHARLOTTE $0.26 $13.00 $0.28 $14.00 $0.31 $15,5C 

A61 3Z1640 % 60 EA CHARLOTTE $0.42 $25.20 $0.40 $24.00 $0.4, $28.2C 

A62 3Z1645 1 60 EA CHARLOTTE $049 $29.40 $0.47 $28.20 SO 57 $34.2C 

A63 3Z1650 1% 5 EA CHARLOTTE $0.69 $3.45 $0.66 $3.30 SO,8( $4.0C 

A64 3Z1655 1'12 5 EA CHARLOTTE $0,86 $4,30 $0.83 $4.1f $1.00 $5.0C 

A65 3Z1660 2 25 EA CHARLOTTE $1.16 $29.00 $1.06 $26.50 $130 $32.5C 

A66 3Z1675 4 5 EA CHARLOTTE $8.32 $41.6C $6.73 $33.61 $9.44 $47.2C 

A67 3Z1690 BEND 90 SLIP x SLIP SCH 40 '12 210 EA CHARLOTTE $0.16 $33.60 $0.17 $357C $0.19 $39.9C 

A68 3Z1695 % 210 EA CHARLOTTE $0.19 $3990 $0.20 $42.00 $0.21 $44.1C 

A69 3Z1702 BEND 90 DEGREE STREET SCH. 40 3/4" 25 EA CHARLOTTE $0.56 $14.00 $0.56 $14,00 $0.64 $16.00 

A70 3Z1705 BEND 90 SLIP x SLIP SCH 40 1 105 EA CHARLOTTE $0.34 $35.70 $0.35 $36n $0.3 $38.85 

A71 3Z171 0 1% 20 EA CHARLOTTE $0.57 $11.40 $0.57 $11.40 $0.66 $13.20 

A72 3Z1715 1'12 35 EA CHARLOTTE $0.62 $21.70 $0.63 $22.01 $0 ,7\ $24.85 

A73 3Z1720 2 25 EA CHARLOTTE $0.99 $24,75 $0.94 $23.50 $1.11 $27.75 

A74 3Z1730 BEND 90 SLIP x SLIP SCH. 40 3 25 EA CHARLOTTE $362 $90.50 $3.02 $75.5C $4,0€ $10150 

A75 3Z1735 4 5 EA CHARLOTTE $6.50 $32.50 $528 $26.40 $7.24 $36,20 

A76 3Z1070 BEND 90 DEGREE THREAD x THREAD SCH. 80 '12 12 EA CHARLOTTE $1.50 $18.0C $1.47 $17.64 $1.86 $22,32 

A77 3Z1065 % 25 EA CHARLOTTE $1.90 $47.50 $1.83 $45.71 $2.33 $58,25 

A78 3Z1090 2 5 EA CHARLOTTE $4.15 $20.71 $3.87 $19.31 $5.03 $25,15 

A79 3Z2640 90 DEGREE ELBOWS-SXS SCHED 80 4" 40 EA CHARLOTTE $9.28 $371.20 $8.63 $345.20 $11.50 $460.00 

A80 3Z1750 TEE SLIP x SLIP SCH. 40 '12 50 EA CHARLOTTE $0.19 $9.5C $0.21 $10,50 $0.23 $11.5C 

A81 3Z1755 % 100 EA CHARLOTTE $023 $23.00 $0.26 $26,00 $0.27 $27.0( 

A82 3Z1760 1 60 EA CHARLOTTE $0.42 $2520 $0.45 $27.00 $0.50 $30.0( 

A83 3Z1770 1'12 10 EA CHARLOTTE $079 $7,90 $0.81 $8.10 $0.94 $940 

A84 3Z1775 2 15 EA CHARLOTTE $1.15 $17.25 $1.14 $17.10 $1.37 $20,51 

A85 3Z1785 TEE SLIP x SLIP x SLIP SCH. 40 3 5 EA CHARLOTTE $5.25 $26.25 $4.43 $22.15 $5.94 $29.7C 

A86 3Z1790 4 20 EA CHARLOTTE $9.50 $190.00 $7.67 $153.40 $1076 $215.2C 

A87 3Z1170 TEE FIPT x FIPT x FIPT SCH, 80 2 5 EA CHARLOTTE $6.82 $34.10 $6.77 $33.85 $3.49 $17.41 

A88 3Z1120 PLUG THREAD SCH. 40 % 65 EA CHARLOTTE $0.46 $29.90 $0.51 $33.15 $0.54 $35.1C 

A89 3Z1125 1 75 EA CHARLOTTE $0,78 $58.50 $0.77 $57.75 $0.87 $65.21 

A90 3Z1130 1% 5 EA CHARLOTTE $0,78 $3.90 $0.81 $4.05 $0.93 $4.61 

A91 3Z1135 1'12 5 EA CHARLOTTE $0,84 $4.20 $0.84 $4.20 $1.00 $5.0C 
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IFB #'U0l:lBLS - Water and Sewer Materials and Accessories 
Ferguson Waterworks Fortiline Inc. HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd. 

I MI# 51 MFG I PART 

ITEM NUMBER PRODUCT DESCRIPTION QTY UIM NUMBERS 

A92 3Z1140 2 10 EA "..,ARLOTIE $1.09 $10.9C $1.0f '1:10 ." $1.29 <;:17 !In 

A93 3Z1145 3 5 EA "'''A''LOTIE $2.50 ~17 ." $2.0S <t1n Ar $2.70 "'~"n 

A94 3Z1810 NIPPI FlO: SCH. 80 %x2 10 EA $0.25 $2.5C $0.61 $6.1C $0.34 $340 

A95 3Z1815 %x4 100 EA ~P~'''~ $0.35 <t~" nr $0.90 'I:!ln nr $0.47 $4700 

A96 3Z1860 1%x4 4 EA 'D~AD~ $1.37 $54€ $1.93 $7.72 $1.09 $4.38 

A97 3Z1115 1% x 12 ~ EA ~P~'P~ $3,30 "'~ ~n $3.62 $14.4€ $2.23 $8.92 

A98 3Z1880 2x8 4 EA $3.25 $13.00 $3.45 $13.80 $2.19 $8.76 

A99 3Z1885 2 x 12 4 EA $5.05 $20.20 $5.34 $21 .36 S2.96 $11.84 

Aloo 3Z1185 I INIf'lN C:I I II IC 80 FIPT X FIPT 1 4 EA "''''''LOnE $5.25 $21.00 $4.96 $19.84 $6.46 <"" IL 

Al0l 3Z1200 114 4 EA " ... ARLOnE $9.85 $39.40 $9.08 lI:,'Ul ." $12.31 ~Q7, 

Al02 3Z1190 2 5 EA "''''''LOnE SI8.45 SQ225 S17.22 $86.10 $23 .46 $117.3( 

Al03 3Z1975 =1 ANC':F; - VAN;:, I UNt - III F: 80 SLIP 3 5 EA rJ-tAI>LOTIE $9.22 $46.10 S9.31 'tMl "" $12.53 'l:R7 R' 

Al04 3Z1980 4 10 EA {,,""'LOTIE $11.52 $115.20 $1 )'78 $117.80 ~1~ R~ $l58.Rn 

Al05 3Z1965 AnAPTOR PVC SCH. 80 F.I .P . x 1'1 ANC':J: 4 10 EA ""A"LOnE U? « ~?".AA .. ~? Q~ 'I:~7Q.~1 $44.79 $447.9C 

Al06 3Z1970 6 6 EA $71.7, lI:~:ln :l? $51.80 $310.80 $7143 ~?R !iF 

Al07 3V1395 ~~~~N. EPD:~t; t-It":~ t-~~~I,;~~~ I KUI: % 2 EA "''''''LOTIE $7.8, $15.74 $19.1 "'~" ?A $26.9 "',,~ '" 
Al08 3V1255 1% 2 EA "..,ARLOTIE $30 O~ $60.10 $44.4, !l:RR "A ~~?4, $104.RF 

t"VI,; f'I_RIN~.' ::~L I ~I:AI, 

% 4 EA SO.8 $3.2' $9.6! .. ~" 7~ $1I .8! ""7 '" Al09 3V1410 I"'"A"LOTIE 

All0 3V1415 % 5 EA I" ... ARLOTIE $1.1 $5.7f "1~ n~ li:R" ," $16.2 $81.0f 

Alll 3V1420 1 5 EA 1"' ... ·"WnE ~1.6~ SS.2f "142~ $71.4( $17.71 .. ,," '" 
Al12 3V1430 1% 4 EA 1""'A"LOnE $3.1~ (1? ." $25.51 $102.21 $31.72 $126.8€ 

Al13 3V1435 2 5 EA I{""''''_OTIE $4.5~ S??7f $33 .7S $168.9f u," $211.7: 

Al14 PVC CIC" I 40, 20 FT LENG"i M~ 1/2" 25 EA Ir",cLOTIE s.llQI "0" tv S8.8C !i;??n Ilf $9.6C .~.n nr 

Al15 3/4" 50 EA Ir .... A"LOTIE S4.6C 'I:?:ln tv $1I2C 'l:AAn tv $11.52 $576.0C 

Al16 ," 3,5 EA 1" ... ARLOnE $6.OC $210.0( $168C SAAR Ilf ~lR4r SR44 nr 

Al17 1 1/4" 35 EA 1"''''A''LOnE $7.8C $273.0( .. " nr $770.0( "?4., '1:""" " • 
Al18 ;>t-'lUfO 1 1/2" 20 EA 1" ... ARLOnE S9.4C $188 .0C ~'4M !l:4!1? nr $27.73 $554.60 

Al19 2" 10 EA I"'''A'>I_OTIE SI2,7C $127 .0C .. >4 nr ~~"n nr $38.1 $381.30 

A120 3Pl083 21/2" 5 EA ICHARLOTIE tlQ nc 'l:QIi nr $54.4C $272.0C $64.2? $321.35 

A121 3Pl085 3" 10 EA I "'''''''_OTIE $260C "?An nr .. "" nr ... ."n nr $74.93 <1:7"0 ~n 

A122 3Pl090 4" 10 EA ICHARLOTIE $3500 li::lM nr tRIO R~ tRRR nr $105.D7 $1,050.70 

A123 3L1200 IPINT - PVC " II IC 80 wfnAIIR"R. 700 50 EA $5.15 $257.5C $8.00 tAnn nr $9.41 tA7n."n 

A124 3L1260 IPINT - PVC PRII..4FR, - PIIRPI F W/nAIIRI=R 100 EA $4.60 ~Rnnr S7.00 $700.0C $6.39 lI:A"!I.nn 

A125 3L1205 IPINT - PVC II, WET DRY W/nAIIR~ R 100 EA IORTEG $6.30 c= $7.00 _$7OO.OC $9.27 

$1~ SUB I U I AL, GROUP A $1 1 ~~a,. 

FOR ALL OTHER ITEMS NOT LISTED ABOVE IN GROUP A, LIKE ITEMS MAY BE PURCHASED AT 
A FIXED PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT OFF A PUBLISHED MANUFACTUER'S PRICE LIST. Submit a $5,000.00 81% 50'% 0% ~O.O(j 

detailed attachment is applicable. (estimate only) 

GRAND I U II\L, IIPA .. ~ R1n 00 Una, • $13.'"' RI 
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IFV16-2289BLS - Water and Sewer Materials and Accessories 
Ferguson Waterworks Fortlline Inc. HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd. 

, ." """ MFIO I PAlO 

ITEM NUMBER PRODUCT DESCRIPTION QTY UIM NUMBERS 

GROUPB 

C900 PVC PIPE (4" and above) 

B1 3P1100 PVC PIPE, C900, BLUE FOR POTABLE WATER 4" 5 EA DIAMOND NAPeo $41.40 $207.0C $40.4C $202.00 $60.53 $302.6E 

B2 3P1115 6" 10 EA DIAMOND NAPCO $77.60 $776.00 $79.80 $798.00 $120.80 $1,208.0C 

B3 3P1125 8" 3 EA DIAMOND NAPeo $134.40 $403.20 $138.40 $415.20 $208.80 $626.4C 

B4 3P1140 10" 4 EA DIAMOND NAPeo $206.40 $825.60 $207.80 $831.20 $313.60 $1,254.4C 

B5 3P1150 12" 4 EA DIAMOND NAPeO $279 .40 $1,117.60 $293,20 $1,172.8( $442.75 $1,771.00 

B6 3P1155 16" 3 EA DIAMOND NAPeo $518.00 $1,554.OC $542.2C $1,626.6C $733.33 $2,199.00 
PVC PIPE, C900, GREEN FOR NON-POTABLE 

B7 3P1105 WATER 4" a EA DIAMOND NAPeO $40.60 $324.8C $40.40 $323.2C S63.73 $509.84 

B8 3P1120 6" 5 EA DIAMOND NAPCO $77.40 $387.00 $79.80 $399.OC $126.61 $633.35 

B9 3P113O 8" 4 EA DIAMOND NAPCO $13500 $540,00 $138.40 $553.6C $21920 $876.8C 

B10 3P1145 10· 4 EA DIAMOND NAPCO $198.40 $7936C $207.8C $831.2C $329.33 $1,317.32 

B11 3P1146 12" 4 EA DIAMOND NAPCO $28780 $1,151 .2C $293.20 $1,172.8C $464.88 $1,859.5~ 

B12 3P1147 16" 4 EA DIAMOND NAPCO $518.00 $2,072.00 $542.20 $2,168.8C $733.33 $2,933.32 
PVC PIPE, C900, PURPLE FOR NON-POTABLE 

B13 3P1217 RECLAIMED WATER 6" 4 EA DIAMOND NAPeo $77.60 $310.40 $7980 $319.20 $12907 $516.28 

B14 3P1124 a" 12 EA DIAMOND NAPCO $13280 $1,593.60 $138.40 $1,660.80 $223.47 $2,681.64 

SUB TOTAL, GROUP B $12,056.00 $12,474.40 $18,690.51 

FOR ALL OTHER ITEMS NOT LISTED ABOVE IN GROUP B, LIKE ITEMS MAY BE PURCHASED 
AT A FIXED PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT OFF A PUBLISHED MANUFACTUER'S PRICE LIST. Submit $5,000.00 0% $000 50% ($2,500.00 0% $0.01 

a detailed attachment is applicable. (estimate only) 

GRAND TOTAL, GROUP B $12,056.00 $9,974.40 $18,690.51 

GROUPC 

PVC PIPE & FITTINGS (SDR 26) 

C1 3P1160 PIPE, SEWER, SDR26, GREEN, 14 FT LENGTHS 4" 25 EA DIAMOND NAPeo $15.6! $392.00 $15.54 $368.50 $23.33 $583.2! 

C2 3P1165 6" 25 EA DIAMOND NAPeo $32.48 $812.00 $33.32 $833.00 $50.67 $1,266.7! 

C3 3P1170 8" 5 EA DIAMOND NAPCO $58.94 $294.70 $60.06 $300.30 $91.33 $456.6! 

C4 3P115a PIPE, SEWER, SDR, GREEN, 14 FT LENGTHS 1011 5 EA DIAMOND NAPCO $92.12 $460.60 $94.22 $471.10 $142.67 $713.3! 

C5 3P1173 12" 5 EA DIAMOND NAPeo $126.56 $632.8( $134.26 $671.30 $20347 $1,0173! 

C6 3P1174 15" 5 EA DIAMOND NAPeo $20692 $1,034.60 $203.98 $1,019.90 $308.56 $1,542.8C 

C7 351020 SDR 26 CLEANOUT FEMALE ADAPTOR 4 50 EA DIAMOND NAPeo $2.2t $113.0( $2.24 $112.00 $2.2t $113.OC 

C8 351025 6 100 EA DIAMOND NAPeO $1055 $1,055.0( SI0.3( $1,030.00 $\0.68 $1,068.OC 

C9 351030 SDR 26 ELLS GASKETED 4 BxB45 10 EA DIAMOND NAPeO $9.01 $90.7C $6.85 $68.50 $9.07 $90.7C 

C10 351035 4 S/45 60 EA DIAMOND NAPeO $83t $501.6C $6.5 $391.8C S8.3! $502.8C 

C11 3S4040 6 BxB45 10 EA DIAMOND NAPCO $16.60 $166.OC $\5.21 $152.20 $16.6t $166.6C 

C12 351045 6 5/45 100 EA DIAMOND NAPeO $12.1 $1,213.OC $1I ,7~ $1,174.00 $\2.31 $1,231.OC 

C13 351050 4 BxB 22Y2 10 EA DIAMOND NAPeO Sll ,7t $117.6C $6.61 $66.90 $12.05 $120.5C 

C14 351055 4 S/22Y2 25 EA DIAMOND NAPeO $11.5C $287.5( $6.35 $158.75 $11.53 $288.2E 

C15 351060 6 BxB 22Y2 10 EA DIAMOND NAPeO $2262 $226.2C $167( $167.00 $22.72 $2272C 

C16 351065 6 S/22Y2 50 EA DIAMOND NAPeo $21.42 $1,071.00 $15.8/ $793.00 $21.75 $1,087.5C 

C17 3S10a5 SDR 26 WYE GASKETED 4x4 50 EA DIAMOND NAPeo $20,24 $1,01200 $19.4( $970.00 $20.5~ $1,027.0C 
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16· W. -Water and <' Materials and Accessories 
Ferguson Waterworks Fortiline Inc. HD Supply Waterworks, ltd. 

. ."v.." MFG/PAIU 

III~M NUMBER PRODUCT DESCRIPTION QTY U/M NUMBERS 

C18 381090 6x6 100 EA 'NAPCO ~12 Q: S3?Q?~0Ii $29.14 $2,a1' nr ~111Q "~,~~a nn 

C19 351095 iWYE :rED 8x6 10 EA ITRED ~.n ,. !tA~? <;(1 un "-, !tAM..., ~"-111 !tA~~~ 

C20 351096 6x6x6x6 25 EA ITRED ~"1 4< $1,fiAA nn ~'4 1. $1,3fi3 fin ~'Q'. $1,481.00 

C21 351097 14" PUSH PLUG 4 25 EA ITRED $2.2S $57.25 $6.3 $157.75 $7.34 ~1R"5n 

C22 351098 16" PUSH PLUG 6 50 EA ITREO S3.5' $176.00 $14.21 $714.00 $14.80 ~7"-n.nn 

C23 351105 16x4 6X4 25 EA ITREO $16.71 .... ,a,. $18.4S .... ," ? $172e ...... nnn 

C24 351107 ISANITARY TEE, 6X4 12 EA ITREO $29.14 ~3"-Q R~ $27.63 ~~~1 ". ~'Q 'I ~3'" 1? 

C25 351109 ISANITARY TEE, 8X6 5 EA ITREO $41 21 4"rv: n. ~1Q4' $197.15 u,,· $211.2~ 

C26 3Z195O ISDR 26 INVt:K I ioU Pl,UG 4 50 EA ITREO $3 l~ $158.50 $2.2S $114.50 $1.64 ~?Il( 

C27 3Z1955 16" lIO::U • PLUG 6 100 EA ITREO $8 U $815.0< S7.7e $770.00 $6!! $618.0C 

SUB TOTAL, GROUP C t1R Q"'" t1R 1"7 .... $19,371.81 

FOR ALL OTHER ITEMS NOT LISTED ABOVE IN GROUP C, LIKE ITEMS MAY BE PURCHASED 
AT A FIXED PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT OFF A PUBLISHED MANUFACTUER'S PRICE LIST. Submit $5,000.00 80% ($4 nnn nnl 50% (~ finO.nn' 0% $OOC 

a detailed attachment is applicable. , only) 

G~4t.1n IVIAL, liP C $12,Q?? ~, "" .. ,."7 .... $19,371.81 

GROUPO 
1iiliiE PIPE AND 1"11 I ILJK-H) 

PIPE, HDPE SDR11, BLUE STRIPE, 40 FOOT 
!NATI J·M 
'POLYPIPE 

D1 3P1326 LENGTHS 6" 50 EA $217.20 $11'."Rn nr NO BID NO BID ~,~~ .. , $13.3?30C 

'~~;~F 
D2 3P1345 8" 12 EA $36560 $4,387.2C NO BID NOBID $478.71 ~'i 7"-"?, 

D3 3A1075 
l~~-~~~~S HDPE MJ ADAPTER VV(I\II ~ IseQ 

4" 5 EA ,~PIPE t",OIi $310.00 NO BID NO BID ~oa ?, $448.75 

D4 3A1080 6" 10 EA I~PIPE <:RA.M "RA.n nr NO BID NO BID $67.43 "R7 .. "" 

CTR I I 
D5 3A1085 8" 5 EA INO PIPE ~lnl nn $515.0C NO BID NOBID $J 2R21 $64115 

D6 3A1325 
1~~:~~r=~~:~1~1~~ 1-1, ~()1161 AUAI-I 0::1"< 1:)l;U 
1\';:>lYlr .,., OR 4" 5 EA ~T;PIPE I $173S $86.75 NO BID NOBID ''In ~< $153.25 

D7 3A1330 6" 5 EA ~T;PIPE ~~~n< $130.25 NO BID NO BID <Ary" $211.65 

D8 3A1335 8" 5 EA ~T;PIPE ~4J.55 $207.75 NO BID NO BID t~"- '1 $321.15 

3A1340 I~~I i ~; ~~L ~OIlAI 
ISeQ 

~T;PIPE $74.85 $374.25 NO BID $175.Q1 $875.05 D9 4" 5 EA NO BID 

D10 3A1345 6" 5 EA ~-r;PIPE coo 0' $499.75 _NO_BID NO BID $167 ~68 ~R'>R.A.n 

D11 36131;{1 8" 5 EA :;J; PIPE $147.0< !l:7~!; nn NO BID NO BID $175.00 $879.45 
IDR-11 DIPS HDf>t: r I I I II''' ... ;:> 1:)l;U 

~PIPE D12 3A1300 OR EQUAL· go : ~I 4" 5 EA $19.20 ~"" nn NO BID NOBID NO BID NO RID 

D13 "1M "In!; 6" 5 EA ~-r;PIPE $41 .20 !I:?nAM NO BID NOBID ~~~.m S??4.6~ 

D14 3A1310 JI" 5 EA ~T;PIPE ~Q~30 .... R' 'in NO BID NO BID $116.32 $581.60 
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IFB #16-2289BLS - Water and Sewer Materials and Accessories 
Ferguson Waterworks Fortiline Inc. HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd. 

MCSTOCK I QTY I MFu/PART 

ITEM NUMBER PRODUCT DESCRIPTION UlM NUMBERS 

POLY PIPE BLUE, CTS-SDR-ASTM D2737 - 100' 
ROLLS - CHARTER, EN DO PURE OR VANGUARD 

D15 3P1285 PROCORE '* 15 RL CHARTER $21.75 $326.25 NO BID NO BID $21.11 $316.6E 

D16 3P1290 1 50 RL CHARTER $36.00 $1,800.00 NO BID NOBID $3589 $1,794.5C 

D17 3P1295 1Y:i 5 RL CHARTER $75.15 $3757E NO BID NOBID $75.16 $375.8C 

POLY PIPE BLUE, CTS·SDR-ASTM D2737 - 100' 
ROLLS - CHARTER, EN DO PURE OR VANGUARD 

D18 3P1300 PROCORE 2 25 RL CHARTER $129.00 $3,225.00 NO BID NO BID $128.51 $3,214.2E 

D19 3P1315 POLY PIPE, PURPLE 1 5 RL CHARTER $36.00 $180.00 NO BID NO BID $35.89 $179.4E 

D20 3P1325 2 5 RL CHARTER $129,00 $645.00 NO BID NO BID $128.57 $642.8E 

D21 3C1010 INSERT CTS-SS·PE SDR 9 FLAIRED ENDS 1" 150 EA FORD $1.01 $151.50 NO BID NO BID $1 16 $174.00 

D22 3C1015 2" 75 EA FORD $1.40 $105.00 NO BID NOBID $1.61 $120.7E 

1 SUB TOTAL, GROUP D 1 $26,537.9! $0.00 $31,735.8& 

FOR ALL OTHER ITEMS NOT LISTED ABOVE IN GROUP D, LIKE ITEMS MAY BE PURCHASED 
AT A FIXED PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT OFF A PUBLISHED MANUFACTUER'S PRICE LIST, Submit $5,000,00 0% 

I $o.oj % NO BID 0% $O,OC 

a detailed attachment is applicable. (estimate only) 

1 GRAND TOTAL, GROUP D 1 1 $26,537.951 NO BID NON RESPONSIVE 

GROUPE 

MISCELLANEOUS WATER AND SEWER VALVES 

I MJ (;AI t: VALVt: WII H ~r ~'V'," II~\:> NU I ~ 
E1 3V1080 FULL BODY 4 8 EA $301.00 $2,408.00 $308,08 $2,464.64 $304.88 $2,439.04 

E2 3V1085 6 25 EA $384.00 $9,600.00 $390.90 $9,772.50 $388.86 $9,721,50 

E3 3V1090 8 4 EA $612.00 $2,448.00 $619.34 $2,477.3E $619.14 $2,476,5a 

E4 3V1100 12 2 EA $1,206.94 $2,413.88 $1,215.60 $2,431.20 $1,221.93 $2,443,86 
FLANGED GATE VALVElWHEEL HANDLE NRS 

E5 3V1065 (Non Rising Stem) 4 4 EA $298,39 $1,193.56 $305.26 $1,221,04 $302,08 $1,208.32 

E6 3V1060 6 6 EA $398,85 $2,393.10 $405.94 $2,435,64 $403,82 $2,422,97 

E7 3V1135 TAP VALVE WITH CENTERING RING 6 4 EA $537.00 $2,148.00 $543.04 $2,172.1E $543,04 $2,172.16 

E8 3V1140 8 2 EA $79125 $1,582.50 $806.04 $1,612.0S $806,04 $1,612.08 
OS & Y VALVE WITH PET COCK, WHEEL, FLG, 

E9 3V1042 XFLG, 3" 2 EA $336.50 $673.00 $468,72 $937.44 $458.96 $91797 

E10 3V1045 4" 2 EA $392.70 $785.40 $529,01 $1,058.02 $523.50 $1,047.00 

E11 3V1050 6" 3 EA $500.85 $1,502.55 $766.58 $2,299.74 $762.58 $2,287.7 

E12 3V1052 8" 2 EA $764.95 $1,529.90 $1,249.58 $2,499.16 $1,249,58 $2,499.H 

E13 3V1160 CHECK VALVE WITH WEIGHTED ARM 4" 4 EA $739.75 $2,959.00 $526.32 $2,105.28 $644.78 $2,579,1; 

E14 3V1155 6" 2 EA $996.70 $1,993.40 $696.34 $1,392.68 $857.26 $1,714,5~ 

E15 3V1165 8" 2 EA $1,509.60 $3,019.20 $960.42 $1,920.84 $1,297.40 $2,594.8( 

SUB GROUP E-A; ECCENTRIC PLUG VALVES 
ECCENTRIC PLUG VALVE - FLANGED ENDS, 

EA-1 3V1110 MILLIKEN OR EQUIVALENT 3" 1 EA $ 213.00 $213.00 $ 210.64 $210.64 $ 206.25 $206.2E 

EA-2 3V1120 4" 1 EA $ 275.25 $275.25 $ 269.47 $269.47 $ 266.67 $266.6 

EA-3 3V1115 6" 1 EA $ 703.20 $703.20 $ 561.26 $561.26 $ 558.33 $558.3' 

Page 7 



#16-2289BLS - Water and~' Materials and Accessories 
Ferguson Waterworks Fortiline Inc. HD Supply Waterworks, ltd. 

ITEMI ,.,'u ..... MFG/PART 

NUMBER PRODUCT DESCRIPTION QTY UIM NUMBERS 

SUB lID E-~ t:A lEi VAl V~ STEMs 
I!:AI VAl \IF' <>I!:M<> " 

3' 5 EA $ 36.30 $181.5C $ 114.13 ~~7n Ro;I $ ?4d. ~7 C01 "'.R" EB-1 3Vl175 RINGS & STAINLESS STEEL PIN. 

EB-2 3Vl180 4' 5 EA $ 42.74 $213.70 $ 119.57 $597.8511 $ 26087 '1:1 ,:tnd.~~ 

EB-3 3Vl185 5' 5 EA $ 48.15 

C~~ 
$ 1?<; nn 

UQR~A."'~ $ 
277.17 

~:= SUB IVIAL, IIP~ E, E-A, AND E-B 

FOR ALL OTHER ITEMS NOT LISTED ABOVE IN GROUPS E, LIKE ITEMS MAY BE PURCHASED 
AT A FIXED PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT OFF A PUBLISHED MANUFACTUER'S PRICE LIST. $5,000.00 84% t'l: .. ,nn nm 48% t!t? dnn nn' 0% $000 

Submit a detailed attachment is applicable. i I only) 

"''''A''ID IVIAL, IIP~ E, E-A, AND E-B u~ '>"7" DQ U"7'U'" CA~ nD. n. 

GROUP F 

DUCTILE IRON PIPE & FITTINGS 

F1 3F1041 11:1 , 1"1 ,,,-.,,<>; BEND 90. 3 5 EA ,STES $ 40.85 C?M ,.JI $ 41.68 C?nR.A.n '$ 41.32 "'?OR '" 

F2 3F1048 4 5 EA ~'''''''I STES $ 65.20 !t"?A nn $ 65.08 $325.40 $ 64.52 l:~?? II( 

F3 3F1013 6 4 EA ,STES $ 101 .50 .... AAIV $ 100.90 .... mAn $ 100.04 .... nn" 
F4 3Fl016 8 5 EA ~'''''''I STES $ 16575 !:R?R 7' $ 165.61 !:R?R n~ $ 164.20 $821.0C 

F5 3Fl018 10 2 EA "''''''ISTES $ 282.40 !l:fi?4 Rr $ ?<:o <I ... $518.68 $ ?<:o RO C~10 7c 

F6 3Fl051 12 2 EA "'''''''ISTES $ ,:t4n ,:tn !tRRn Rr $ ,:t,:tA,:tR $672,76 $ 337.10 $674.2C 

F7 3Fll16 TEE 3 5 EA "'''''''I STES 1$ 59.65 !I;?AA ?f 1$ 59.59 $297.95 $ 59.08 !I:?llfi 4e 

F8 ~121 4 5 EA "I""'" STES 1$ 11300 "'''''<;IV 1$ 112.97 !tAAd R' $ 112.00 'I:""n nr 

F9 3Fl128 8 5 EA "I"''''ISTES 1$ 247.70 $1 ,?AA!it' 1$ 244.87 $1, ??4 ~f $ ?"'''. <1O $1, ??fl ll' 

FlO 3Fl076 IFLANGE T 0 .1. 4x2 5 EA "I""'" STES 1$ 38.75 $193.7E 1$ 3875 $193.7E $ 38.42 $192.1C 

Fl1 3F1081 6x2 5 EA ~I""'I STES 1$ 53.72 $268.OC 1$ 53.74 'i:?AA 7r $ 53.28 'i:?AA 4C 

F12 3F1084 8x2 5 EA "'r ..... '" STES 1$ 83.35 $416,n 1$ 83.35 .... ,R7' $ 82.86 .... , .. <If 

F13 3Fl021 16- BLIND 1:1 AIIlGI=. 0.1 . 6" 5 EA '(,-&.I'ISTES 1$ 43.13 'i:?1" fl.' 1$ 42.68 'I:?1~ df $ 42.77 $213.~ 

F14 3Fl023 18- BLIND 1:1 AIIlGI= 6- 4 EA "I""'" STES 1$ 72.75 $291 .0( 1$ 71.96 $287.9< $ 72.13 "'RR '" 
.fJ5 3Fl031 r.1 ; 0.1. 1:1 n 6" 2 EA I"""ISTES 1$ ?n?oo !:dn"R( 1$ 200.74 $401.41: $ 20U7 !:dn?~ 

EPDM SAFETY ORANGE, FULL FACE RUBBER 
F16 3Fl135 In :1 ~ %" 3 12 EA 1$ 6.31 $75.72 1$ 6.91 $82.9J 1$ . 11.91 CR? O? 

EPDM SAFETY ORANGE, FULL FACE RUBBER 
1$ 1$ 1$ F17 3Fl140 Ie:: :1 ~ Yo" 4 60 EA I Rubber 7.37 'tAd? ?n 6.06 UR<l'" 8.06 !:dR<l An 

EPDM SAFETY ORANGE, FULL FACE RUBBER 
F18 3Fl145 n :I <> Yo" 6 25 EA I Rubber I 1$ 8.81 $220.25 1 $ 9.41 'l:nfi ? 1$ 9.64 $241 .00 

EPDM SAFETY ORANGE, FULL FACE RUBBER 
1$ F19 3F1150 e:: : 1 ~ Yo" 8 10 EA .D •• ~. 13.70 $137.00 , $ 14.48 'l:u .. An 1$ 14.99 !:1A.O an 

IEPDI-A SAFETY ORANGE, FULL FACE RUBBER 
F20 3Fl155 IGA~ ,<> Yo" 10 50 EA I Rubber 1$ 2348 $1,174.00 1$ 24.82 $1,241 .0C 1$ 25.69 $1 ,?Ad <;n 

F21 3Kl005 IMJ KIT LESS GI ANn 3 5 EA I~~R~~~~ 1$ 9.55 $47.75 $ 13.41 $67.0E 1$ 1196 l;fiQ Rr 

F22 3Kl0l0 IMJ KIT LESS GI ANn 4 45 EA I~~R~~~~N 1$ 10.25 UAi,. $ 16.10 $724.5C 1$ 1470 $661.50 

F23 3Kl015 IMJ KIT LESS GI ANn 6 210 EA I~~~R~~~~;N $ 12.70 l:? A .. 7 nn $ 18.45 'I:~ R7d "n 1$ 17.04 $3,578.40 
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IF~16-2289BLS - Water and Sewer Materials and Accessories 
Ferguson Waterworks I Fortiline Inc. I HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd. 

;::;IUt;K MFG/PART I I I ITEM NUMBER PRODUCT DESCRIPTION QTY UIM NUMBERS 

STZR, SIGMA, 
F24 3Kl020 MJ KIT LESS GLAND 8 20 EA TYLER, UNION $ 14,55 $291,00 $ 23.63 $472.60 $ 22.35 $447.0C 

STZR, SIGMA, 
F25 3Kl025 MJ KIT LESS GLAND 10 5 EA TYLER, UNION $ 17.20 $86.00 $ 29.07 $145.35 $ 27.80 $139.0C 

STZR, SIGMA, 
F26 3Kl030 MJ KIT LESS GLAND 12 8 EA TYLER, UNION $ 21.50 $172.00 $ 36.55 $292.40 $ 3496 $279.6f 

STZR, SIGMA, 
F27 3Kl056 MJ KIT WITH GLAND 14 5 EA TYLER, UNION $ 31 .18 $155.90 $ 46.62 $233.10 $ 4687 $234.3f 

STZR, SIGMA, 
F28 3Kl057 MJ KIT WITH GLAND 16 8 EA TYLER, UNION $ 34.40 $275.20 $ 51.31 $410.48 $ 51.59 $412.7~ 

STZR, SIGMA, 
F29 3M1535 MJ GASKET 4 5 EA TYLER, UNION $ 5.00 $25.00 $ 7.41 $37.m $ 8.04 $40.2C 

STZR, SIGMA, 
F30 3M1540 MJ GASKET 6 5 EA TYLER, UNION $ 785 $39.21 $ 8.55 $42.7f $ 8.91 $44.5f 

STZR, SIGMA, 
F31 3M1545 MJ GASKET 8 5 EA TYLER, UNION $ 9.75 $48.7f $ 10.62 $53.10 $ 13.48 $67.4C 

STZR, SIGMA, 
F32 3M1550 MJGASKET 10 5 EA TYLER, UNION $ 13.05 $65.2f $ 13.92 $69.60 $ 1598 $79.9C 

STZR, SIGMA, 
F33 3M1555 MJGASKET 12 5 EA TYLER, UNION $ 16.50 $82.50 $ 17.39 $86.9f $ 22.39 $111.9E 

STZR, SIGMA, 
F34 3M1560 TRANSITION GASKET 3 5 EA TYLER, UNION $ 9.95 $49.7f $ 10.73 $53.65 $ 957 $47.8E 

STZR, SIGMA, 
F35 3M1565 TRANSITION GASKET 4 15 EA TYLER, UNION $ 10.50 $157.50 $ 15.00 $225.00 $ 1370 $205.5C 
F36 3M1570 TRANSITION GASKET 6 10 EA STRZlSIGMA $ 12.45 $12450 $ 18.35 $183.50 $ 16.96 $169.6C 
F37 3M1575 TRANSITION GASKET 8 5 EA STRZlSIGMA $ 16.60 $83.00 $ 24.02 $120.10 $ 22.72 $113.6C 
F38 3M1580 TRANSITION GASKET 10 5 EA STRZlSIGMA $ 19.55 $97.75 $ 28.07 $140.3! $ 26.85 $134.2E 
F39 3M1585 TRANSITION GASKET 12 5 EA STRZlSIGMA $ 34.90 $174.5C $ 33.44 $167.20 $ 33.26 $166.3C 
F40 3Kl035 MJ GRIP RING KITS; STAR PIPE #PVGPK4 4 5 EA STRZlSIGMA $ 17.00 $85.00 $ 32.75 $16375 $ 32.29 $161.4E 
F41 3Kl040 MJ GRIP RING KITS; STAR PIPE #PVGPK6 6 5 EA STRZlSIGMA $ 20.00 $100.00 $ 39.85 $199.25 $ 3930 $196.5C 
F42 3Kl045 MJ GRIP RING KITS; STAR PIPE #PVGPK8 8 5 EA STRZlSIGMA $ 28.00 $140.00 $ 54.90 $274.50 $ 54.43 $2721! 
F43 3Kl050 MJ GRIP RING KITS; STAR PIPE #PVGPK10 10 5 EA STRZlSIGMA $ 38.00 $190.00 $ 87.72 $438.60 $ 87.44 $437.2( 
F44 3Kl055 MJ GRIP RING KITS; STAR PIPE #PVGPK12 12 5 EA STRZlSIGMA $ 42.00 $210.00 $ 96.57 $482.8E $ 97.29 $486.4! 
F45 3Ml167 MECHANICAL JOINT FITTINGS: MJ 90 3 2 EA STRZlSIGMA $ 32.25 $64.5c $ 32.17 $64.3<1 $ 31.90 $63.8( 
F46 3Mll72 4 2 EA STRZlSIGMA $ 35.15 $7030 $ 35.10 $70.20 $ 34.80 $69.6( 
F47 3M1177 6 2 EA STRZlSIGMA $ 57.45 $114.90 $ 57.40 $114.80 $ 56.91 $113.8: 
F48 3M1182 8 2 EA STRZlSIGMA $ 8380 $167.60 $ 82.83 $165.66 $ 8301 $166.0: 
F49 3M1187 10 5 EA STRZlSIGMA $ 132.55 $662.75 $ 129.56 $647.80 $ 131.22 $656.1< 
F50 3Ml127 MJ 45 4 2 EA STRZlSIGMA $ 28.95 $57.90 $ 28.88 $57.7( $ 28.64 $57.21 
F51 3M1133 6 5 EA STRZlSIGMA $ 46.85 $234.2! $ 46.80 $234.00 $ 46.40 $232.01 
F52 3M1137 8 5 EA STRZlSIGMA $ 5855 $292.7i $ 66.91 $334.5! $ 67.06 $335.3( 
F53 3M1372 MJ TEE 4 5 EA STRZISIGMA $ 47.25 $236.21 $ 46.66 $233.30 $ 46.76 $233.8( 
F54 3M1387 6 5 EA STRZlSIGMA $ 8305 $415.2i $ 81.24 $406.20 $ 82.28 $411.4( 
F55 3M1422 MJ REDUCING TEES 8x6 2 EA STRZlSIGMA $ 103.60 $207.20 $ 101.28 $202.51 $ 102.58 $205.11 
F56 3M1487 MJ LIP SLEEVE 01 4" LONG 5 EA STRZlSIGMA $ 3045 $152.25 $ 30.34 $15170 $ 30.09 $150.4! 
F57 3M1473 6" LONG 30 EA STRZlSIGMA $ 53.90 $1,617.00 $ 53.74 $1,612.2( $ 53.28 $1,598.4( 
F58 3M1507 16" LONG 5 EA STRZlSIGMA $ 258.20 $1,291.01 $ 248.87 $1,244.3f $ 257.36 $1,286.8( 
F59 3M1277 MJ REDUCER 01 6x3 2 EA STRZlSIGMA $ 38.85 $77.70 $ 38.75 $7750 $ 3842 $76.8' 
F60 3M1282 6x4 5 EA STRZlSIGMA $ 33.35 $166.7! $ 33.27 $166.3! $ 32.99 $164.9f 
F61 3M1297 8x6 2 EA STRZlSIGMA $ 48.75 $97.50 $ 48.62 $97.2' $ 48.21 $96.42 
F62 3M1322 12 x 10 2 EA STRZlSIGMA $ 92.30 $184.60 $ 91.15 $182.30 $ 91.34 $182.61 

Page 9 



~ . #16-~,.,on~LS - ••• . and Sewer Materials and Accessories 
Ferguson Waterworks Fortiline Inc • HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd. 

. ~''''''' MFG I PART 

IIT~M NUMBER PRODUCT DESCRIPTION QTY IUIM NUMBERS 

F63 3M1072 MJ CAP 6 5 EA I $ 23.90 $119.50 1$ 23.76 $118.8(1 1$ 2356 $117.& 

F64 3M1097 MJ TAP x 2" FIPT CAPS 4 4 EA I $ 24.60 'l:OR dn 1$ 24.49 $97.96 1$ 24.29 '1:07 " 

F65 3M1102 6 2 EA I" " I $ 34.85 $69.70 $ 34.73 "'RQ dR $ 34.43 !l:RR RF 

F66 3M1242 MJ TAP PLUG x 2" FIPT 3 2 EA I $ 27.55 11:"" 11 $ 27.42 ~"d.'" $ 27.19 ~"d ~. 

F6J_ 3M1247 4 2 EA I $ 26.05 $52.10 $ 25.96 11:<;1 Q? $ 25.74 $51 ,4E 

F68 3M1252 6 2 EA $ 39.25 <l:7R "n $ 39.12 $78.24 $ 38,7!! $77.5E 

F69 3M1262 10 2 EA $ 84.30 1I:1AA AO $ 82.32 ""M "d $ 83.37 $166.74 

F70 3M1263 12 1 EA $ 86.35 ~A" ~I $ 84.46 !l:R44A $ 85.54 !i:R<; <;.4 

F71 3M1214 PIIIr:::C::DI MJ 3 4 EA $ 16.90 $67.6C $ 16.82 $67.21 $ 16.67 11:"" ..... 

F72 3M1222 6 4 EA 1$ 2J1.65 $1146C $ 28.52 $114.01 $ 28.27 $113.0~ 
F73 3M1022 MJ 6 3 EA Is 121 .00 <I:~~(V" $ 118.11 <I:~"" ~< 1$ 119.62 II:~«R"" 

F74 3M1OO8 M.J. 11-1/4 6 3 EA 1$ 44.35 $133.Of 1$ 43.77 $131.31 1$ 43.86 $131.5S 

F75 M.J. 22-1/2 6 4 EA $ 42.90 $171 .6C $ 42.32 "'= ?, $ 42.41 "'= '" 
£7~ 3H1110 MJ x SWIVEL TEE 6x6 10 EA $ 46.00 !I:4M nr $ 94.26 Ci:Qd?Rr $ 94.97 $949.70 

F77 3H1115 8xll 4 EA $ 12060 ""'-R?Ar $ 117.75 $471.0C $ 119.25 $477.00 

F78 3H1120 10x6 4 EA $ 146.70 "'<;0.. Rr 1$ 144.54 'I:<;7R 1, 1$ 147.16 "'<;ARM 

3K1080 PIPE; E~~A"~~~TAR ' FOR DUCTILE IRON 
3 #1103 1$ 12.00 II:dA or 1$ 13.73 lI:"d 0< Is 12.88 $51.52 F79 4 EA 

F80 3K1085 4 #1104 5 EA 1$ 1295 $647E 1$ 14.55 $72.7E 1$ 13.65 !liAR ?<; 

F81 6 #1106 60 EA 1$ 15.20 <l:01? or 1$ 17.10 $1.0?" nr 1$ 16.04 1I:0"?dn 

F82 3K1095 8 #1108 10 EA 
" I 

1$ 22.80 !I:??Rnr 1$ 25.70 $257.0C 1$ 24.12 $241.20 

F83 3K1100 10 #1110 15 EA 1$ 33.70 'I:"n" '" 1$ 37.67 "',,"" n"'l $ 35.75 'I:"~R ? 

F84 3K1105 12 #1112 2 EA 1$ 49.40 !1:0AM 1$ 54.28 $108.5E 1$ 52.08 $104.16 

F85 3K1107 16 #1116 5 EA 1$ 89.90 OUdO "" 1$ 96.36 $481 .8(1 1$ 95.02 $475.1C 

F86 3K1109 FORC900 3 2 EA 1$ 14.50 !I:?Q nn 1$ 16.39 $32.7S 1$ 15.37 $307. 

F87 3K1110 4 30 EA 1$ 15.60 URAM ~$ 17.61 ""?A ~n ! $ 16.52 K% fl( 

F88 3K1115 6 100 EA 1$ 18.95 $1 ,RQ<; nr 1$ 21 .41 $2,141.00 1$ 20.09 !t? onQ nr 

F89 3K1120 8 10 EA 1$ 28.15 $281.5C 1$ 31.65 "'~1" '" 1$ 29.69 "?OR or 

F90 3K1125 10 IF''UlUI"'V 5 EA 1$ 53.20 "'?"" M 1$ 59.13 II:?O<; ". 1$ 56.11 "'?Rn '" 

F91 3K1130 12 ""UI"'-V 7 EA 1$ ~ 
$392.70 1$ 61.59 $431.1~ 1$ 59.09 $413.6, 

F92 3K1135 14 2 EA 1$ $178.00 1$ 95.19 '1:1 on ~. 1$ 93.87 $187.74 

F93 3K1140 16 #2u101"'v 5 EA 1$ 119.00 !l:1i!!Ii.no $ 124.66 "'R?~ ~n $ 126.26 $631 .3C 

F94 3A1030 FOR ~.~~jCM OR o::nl "" 
' MJx -, 

EBCC LOSS 1$ $157.85 $ "'?lin.!!" $ !i:R!l44F 4" 7 EA 2255 35.85 127.78 

F95 3J1035 BELL RESTRAINT FOR C9OO, EBBA OR EQUAL 6" 5 EA ISTRZ PRICELESS $ 28.47 $1 4? ~" $ 30.53 $152.R" $ 30.27 $151 .3E 

F96 3J1040 8" 5 IsTRZ 1>1>1"'" ~"" $ 49.19 lI:?d" QG $ 48.99 "'?il QG $ 49.09 "'? .. " ... 

F97 3A1053 Ar 'I u" IINII=I ANC::F; CI - .400-C 3" 2 EA IEBCCLOSS $ 17.65 !I:.~<;~ $ 32.41 'I:M R? $ 32.13 !l:R4 ?F 

F98 4" 2 EA IEBCCLOSS $ 23.85 $47.70 $ 35.48 $70.96 $ 35.18 1I:7n ..... 

F99 3A<""f\ 6" 5 EA IEBCCLOSS ,$ 25.70 !l:1?AM $ 44.05 !I:?7n 7<; $ 43.14 $215.70 

I F100 3X1105 POL IYY,""," BLUE 3"- 8" FO~ 0.1. 2 RL ITRuuA6I $ 120.00 "'?An no $ 126.00 "'?,,? no $ 117.36 ..?~ 77 

I F101 3X1110 POLyvv,"",i"': BLUE 10"-12" FOR D.1. 2 RL ITRuMRAI I $ 156.00 $312.00 $ 162.00 !I:"?4 nn $ 158.90 $317.& 

I F102 3X1115 POL IVV""," BLUE 14"-16" I'Q8D.1. 2 RL ITRuuA6I $ ?MM "AnA nn $ ?MM unAnn $ 201.10 $40??C 

I F103 3X1120 POL rVVKAI"' PIIRPI : 3"-8" FOR D.1. 2 RL ITRu"RAII $ 126.00 "'?,,? nn $ 147.00 !:?Qd nn $ 129.23 !:?<;R ". 

I F104 3X1125 POL IVV,""," PIIRPI F: 10"-12" FOR D.1. 2 RL ITRUU'>A" -.! 171 .00 !I;""7 nn $ 186.00 $372.00 $ 176.04 ~~"? n. 

F105 3X1130 POL'rvv,""," PURPI F; 14"-16" FOR D.1. 2 RL ITRu"RAI I -.! 219.()() "'''''R nn $ ???nn $44400 $ ??n All $441.7€ 
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IF~89BLS - Water and Sewer Materials and Accessories 
Ferguson Waterworks Fortiline Inc. HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd. 

M .... 'I"A1 .. 

ITEM NUMBER PRODUCT DESCRIPTION QTY UIM NUMBERS 

SUB TOTAL, GROUP F $33,128.8' $37,806.71 $37,701.8B 

FOR ALL OTHER ITEMS NOT LISTED ABOVE IN GROUP F. LIKE ITEMS MAY BE PURCHASED AT 
A FIXED PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT OFF A PUBLISHED MANUFACTUER'S PRICE LIST. Submit a $5.000.00 64% ($3,200.00 62% ($3.100.00 0% $0 DC 

detailed attachment is applicable. (estimate only) 

GRAND TOTAL, GROUP F $29,928.87 $34,706.71 $37,701.8.11 

GROUPG 

MISCELLANEIOUS WATER AND SEWER REPAIR CLAMPS 

G1 3R1005 CLAMP - PATCH ~x3 1.05 20 EA FORDFSC $4.3 $87.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

G2 3R1010 ~x6 1.05 10 EA FOROFSC $8.11 $81 .10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

G3 3R1015 1x3 1.32 10 EA FORDFSC $473 $47.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

G4 3R1020 1x6 1.32 7 EA FORDFSC $8.64 $6O.4lI NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

G5 3R1040 1%x6 1.90 4 EA FORDFSC $9.88 $39.52 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

G6 3R1045 2x3 2.38 4 EA FORD FSC $5.74 $22.!HI NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID 

G7 3R1050 2x6 2.38 4 EA FORD FSC SI0.3! $41.57 NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID 

G8 3R1055 REPAIR CLAMPS: 2x7% 235-263 PVC 7 EA FORD F1 526.65 $186.8 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

G9 3R1060 2 x 12% 235-263 PVC 10 EA FORD F1 $38.02 $380.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID 

G10 3R1065 3 x 7% 395-425 AC 4 EA FORD F1 $32.65 $130.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

G11 3R1070 3 x 15 395-425 AC 5 EA FORD F1 $56.9( $284.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

G12 3R1075 CL 200 4 x 7% 495-535 AC 4 EA FORD F1 $34.5t $138.24 NO BID NOBID NO BID NOBID 

G13 3R1080 CL 150 4 x 15 474-514 AC 5 EA FORD F1 560 .17 $30085 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID 

G14 3R1090 CL 150 6 x 15 684-724 AC 5 EA FORD F1 $73.5t $367.80 NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID 

G15 3R1095 CL150 8 x 15 899-939 AC 4 EA FORD F1 $89.31 $357.4f NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

G16 3R1100 CL200 10X 15 1175-1215AC 4 EA FORD F1 $1153l $461.4< NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

G17 3R1140 CL 150 4 x 7'h 474-514 AC 5 EA FORD F1 S34.5t $1nac NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

G18 3R1145 CL 200 4 x 15 495-535 AC 5 EA FORD F1 $60.11 $3Oo.at NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

G19 3R1155 CL 200 6 x 15 745-785 AC 4 EA FORD F1 $7355 $294.20 NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID 

G20 3R1160 CL 200 8 x 15 927-967 AC 4 EA FORD F1 $91.5( $366.00 NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID 

G21 3R1165 C900 10X 151104-1144 4 EA FORD F1 $11535 $461.4C NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID 

G22 3R1170 C 900 12 X 15 1310-1350 4 EA FORD F1 S131.2C $524.ac NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

G23 3R1210 2% x 12 270-300 PVC 4 EA FORD F1 $40.24 $160,96 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

G24 3R1215 3 x 7% 346-370 PVC 4 EA FORD F1 $31.53 $126.1~ NO BID NOBID NO BID NOBID 

G25 3R1220 3 x 15 346-370 PVC 4 EA FORD F1 $55.5C $222.OC NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID 

G26 3R1225 4 x 7% 445-473 PVC 4 EA FORD F1 $32.64 $130.lK NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID 

G27 3R1230 4 x 15 445-473 PVC 8 EA FORD F1 $5690 $455.2C NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID 

G28 3R1235 6 x 7% 656-696 PVC 4 EA FORD F1 $40.69 $1B2.7f NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

G29 3R1240 6 x 15 656-696 PVC 5 EA FORDF1 S71.7l $358.7f NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

G30 3R1245 8 x 15 854-894 PVC 4 EA FORDF1 $8935 $357.4< NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

HYDRAULIC REPAIR COUPLINGS- 2.10 - 2.60 TOTAL PIPING 
G31 3R1290 MINIMUM O.D. RANGE. #2000-0303 - 260 2" 8 EA SOLUTIONS 5828C $662.4< NO BID NOBID NO BID NOBID 

13.46 - 4.33 MINIMUM O.D. RANGE, #2000-0433 - TOTAL PIPING 
G32 3R1295 260 3" 8 EA SOLUTIONS $10845 $867.6C NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

4.25 - 5.63 MINIMUM O.D. , #2000-0563 - TOTAL PIPING 
G33 3R1300 260 4" 10 EA SOLUTIONS $139.6l $1,396.5C NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 
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] #16-2289BLS - Water and Sewer Materials and Accessories 
Ferguson Waterworks Fortiline Inc. HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd. 

I' .... """ 
QTY 

MFG I PAKT 

II emu NUMBER PRODUCT DESCRIPTION UIM NUMBERS 

6.42 7.66 10.0. R! ~ - I~~~ AL ,~p'~NG 
G34 3R1305 1260 6" 15 EA 5lIWlr $2.7R4.!in NOBIO NO BID NO BID NO BID 

18.54 - 9.84 10.0. - I~~~,~~~NG G35 3R1310 1260 8" 5 EA $20R.7r <1:1 nA .. "" NO BID NO BID NOBIO NOBID 

I~~; -1;1.U 
IU.U. ·"vv -

10" I~~~~I~~~G t?"O 0< $1.07980 NOBIO NO BID NOBIO NO BID G36 3R1350 4 EA 

3R1315 
1~~04 -13.66 10.0. -. ·1366 - I~~~~~I~~~NG 53177C $1,270.B< NO BID NO BID NOBIO NOBID G37 12" 4 EA 

G38 3R1265 10.96-12.263R1265 10" OVERSIZE, #2000-1226-260 3 EA I~~~~I:~NG ~?. ~< ~'''' '" NOBIO NO BID NOBIO NO BID 

G39 3C1175 ,CDlg GALV, % nnAMl 4 EA ITELsco 59.62 !:"A A< NO BID NO BID NOBIO NO BID 

G40 3C118O % 1.050 5 EA ITELSCO $10.55 c~? 7' ~OBID NO BID NOBIO NO BID 

G41 3C1185 1 1.315 4 EA iTELSCO t1? 44 UQ7F NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

G42 3C1190 114 1.660 4 EA ITELSCO tHO? ~ ........ NV I:IJU NO BID NOBIO NO BID 

G43 3C1195 1% 1.900 5 EA ITELsco ~36 $91.B< NOBIO NO BID NOBIO NO BID 

G44 3C1200 2 2.375 20 EA ITELsco 523.ot $461.4C NO BID NO BID NOBIO NO BID 
: L;LAY X I~:S ~VL; 

G45 =!S1125 1~I=RI\lr.n 4x4 50 EA 53.51 $175.5C NO BID NO BID NOBIO NO BID 

G46 3S1145 6x4 5 EA $8.82 $44.1C NO BID NOBID ]110 BIO NOBID 

G47 3S1150 6x6 100 EA 57.52 $752.0C NO BID NO BID NOBIO NO BID 

G48 3S1175 8x6 30 EA $14.06 $421.BC NO BID NO BID NORlD NO BID 

G49 3S1170 8xB 10 EA $11.56 $115.60 NO BID NO BID NOBIO NOBID 

G50 3S1130 IPS PVC X IPS PVC 4x4 75 EA $3.51 li:?,. .. ? NOBIO NOBID NOBIO NOBID 

G51 3S1133 4x3 8 EA 53 .81 "''''' AI NO BID NOBID NOBIO NOBID 

G52 3S1140 6x4 100 EA 58.82 !All? nn NO BID NO BID NOBIO NO BID 

G53 3S1155 6x6 40 EA 5752 "''OM All NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

G54 351185 Bx6 5 EA $H91 CAo Al1 NO BID NO BID !'IV DJU NO BID 

G55 351180 BxB 10 EA 511 5( $115.00 NOBIO NO BID NOBIO NO BID 

G56 351135 I CLAY x CLAY 4x4 4 EA 53.71 $15.1~ NO BID NO BID NOBIO NO BID 

G57 3S1165 8xB ~ EA 512.41 14Q.QA NO BID NO BID NOBIO NO BID 

G58 3T1025 
1;.~~;lvc I 

~ x I ... Vl; (;1.;j!j -

IS70 6 EA FORD 514.41 CARA. @BIO NO BID NO BID NOBID 
G59 3T1140 14 X 2 PVC (4.25 - 4.50) 325 4 EA SMITH BLAIR $90.·n <I: ..... 'n NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID 
,60 3T1150 16 X 1 PVC 6.50 - 6.6~ _325 SERIES 20 EA SMITH BLAIR $QO.l! '" AMnn :r- DBID NO BID 'BID NOBID 
,61 3T1155 16x2 PVC 6.50 - 6.6~ 325 SERIES 5 EA SMITH BLAIR $103.1 $515.75 l' DBID NO BID 'BID NO BID 
,62 3T1160 18x 1 PVC 8.50 - 8.6~ 325 10 EA SMITH BLAIR $1,117.00 :r-OBID NO BID 'BIO NO BID 

G63 3T1165 18x2 PVC 8.50 - 8.63 325 3 EA ISMITH BLAIR ll!i?6!i NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 
G64 3T1170 110x2 PVC 10.60 - 10.75) 325 SERIES 3 EA SMITH BLAIR i45180 NOBIO NO BID NO BID NOBID 
G65 3T1175 112x2 PVC 12.75 -13.50) 325 I 3 EA SMITH BLAIR 17: i521.2f NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

GOO 3T1035 14 X 1 AC,DI (4.BO - 5.57) FORD 10 EA FORD $74.54 lt7A<; df NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID 

G67 3T1045 14 X 2 AC,DI (4.80 - 5.57) FORD 5 EA FORD S899C CAAo~r 

~ 
NO BID NO BID NO BID 

G68 3T1050 16 X 1 AC.DI (6.90 - 7.56) FORD ?n?FL" 40 EA FORD c • ., .,< $3.511 .B< NO BID NOBIO NO BID 

G69 3T1055 16 X 2 AC.DI (6.90 - 7.56) FORD 30 EA FORD 5104.75 "'" 1 A? '" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

G70 3T1060 18 x 1 AC,DI (9.05 - 9.74) FORD 5 EA FORD ~10R .II< C~ .. ?' NO BID NO BID NOBJD NO BID 

G71 3T1065 18 x 2 AC,DI (9.05 - 9.74) FORD 5 EA FORD $117.05 li:AA.<;" NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID 

G72 3T1070 110 x 2 AC,DI (11.10 -12.12) FORD 5 EA FORD $'AO ?< <l:7AO ?«II .NQBID NOBID NO BID NO BID 

G73 3T1075 112 x 2 AC,DI (13.20 -14.38) FORD ~ EA FORD 5171.85 lI:6.<;!I ?1iI NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

..QI4 3T1085 116 x 2 AC,DI (17.40 -19.19) FORD ?n?R~ 5 EA FORD 5447.7C It? ? .. A finl NOBIO NO BID NOBIO NO BID 
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1 #16-L:~ ~ - Water and Sewer Materials and Accessories 
Ferguson Waterworks Fortiline Inc. HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd. 

, .. 'V"',, I MFGI PART 

ITEM NUMBER PRODUCT DESCRIPTION QTY UIM NUMBERS 

G75 3T1033 IG !=:Annl F!=:_ 3 X 1 DI,r.1 r.!lnn (3.80- 4.29) 10 EA FORD $4455 lI:44fi fin NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 
G76 3T1040 I '" !=:Annl F!=:_ 3 X 2 DI,r.1 r.!lnn (3.80- 4.29) 5 EA FORD $47.89 lI:n!l4~ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

G77 3T1047 14 X 2 DI,CI,C900 (4.80 - 5.00) I 5 EA IFORD $4780 .. ?~O nn NO BID NOBID NO BID NOBID 

G78 3T1101 124 X 2 DI,CI.r~!lnfi (25.80 - 26.32) 2 EA IFORD ~1 ,4 0' l:~OR 11 NO BID NOBID NO BID NOBID 

G79 3T1148 Ipvr. Ar. (4.36 -" ,'> 2 EA IFORD ~8.7( $157.40 NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID 
G80 3T1027 .(2.13~Tube~ 20 EA $35.31 $707.00 NO BID 

~::~ 
NO BID ~BID 

SUB TOTAL, GROUP G ".< <cc R< NO BID 

FOR ALL OTHER ITEMS NOT LISTED ABOVE IN GROUP G, LIKE ITEMS MAY BE PURCHASED 
AT A FIXED PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT OFF A PUBLISHED MANUFACTUER'S PRICE LIST. $5,000.00 52% , .. ? "nn nm % $O.OC % $0.00 

Submit a detailed attachment is applicable. , only) 

r-CAun IUIA~.GpnIlC G l:~R ~~~ R1 NOBID NO BID 

GROUPH 

METER AND VALVE BOXES & RELATED ACCESSORIES 

H1 ;'VV1UUO 1~9~~ ";:~~u~~~~~~t: (~~';,,~~ ~:~ 'B~~~' VVII H-~I~ATERJ. 200 EA I",,, ... ~~~ Q~ l:R 7!10 or NO BID NOBID $34.5 l:" ao? or 

H2 ;'VVlUOU 
ILiU ~ .. ~ ~A~~T;~~(u~: ~.~L:K~~~~~~~~ VVAI 10K Mt: I 10K 100 EA I",,, ... $11.44 $1,144.0C NO BID NOBID $11.63 $1,163.0C 

H3 ;'VVlUO I~~l(';~~ ~A~~i-~~~~~~,~~;~~:~ :.v':~,=NR 7';;1~~K ;'~';L~) 25 EA I",,, ... $11.38 l:?R4 !'ir NO BID NO BID $11 ,63 l:?ao 7' 

H4 I~~~HN~~C~~OL 
11·J<.lf II ioU, 

I",,, ... $9.84 l:aR _or NO BID NO BID $9. IE $91.8C ;'VVlUU 10 EA 

H5 I~~~HN~,: H~'~" 
11·J<.lf II ioU, 

""". $900 l:ao or NO BID NOBID $9.18 $91.8C ;'VVlUU:l 10 EA 

H6 10 1~9~~ ";:~~UIVAL _IDVVAI 10K, ~~~,~::~N~.VVlI ~~~u, 
',.."'N I :U 4 EA "" ... ~~~ Rn $135.2C NO BID NOBID ~~4 ,1 $13804 

H7 
ILiU UN~~A~~TED PIIRPI F M, 'l;A~~~~~~,:AI 10K Mt: I 10K 4 EA "" ... t10 Rn l:~'> ?r NO BID NOBID $11.03 $44.1' 

H8 1 LlU UN~ ~A~~T;~~IIRPI F M, ' l;A~ ~~~~~,: ~~~;H M2: ~~LE) 4 EA ,,, ... ~10 Rn l:d~ ?r NO BID NO BID $11.03 $44.12 

H9 3W1100 I vv""nc 1'\, IVI'" "....: RIIRRFR 3/4" x 1/8" 7,000 EA I ~"AI ~ $0.08 """n nn NO BID NO BID $0.07 ""on nn 

H10 3W1101 ,Me' e"": RIIRRFR 3/4" x 1/16" 3,500 EA ' ~,,., ~ $007 lI:?4fi on NO BID NO BID $0.06 !i:?10 on 

H11 ;,vvlU15 IMe I or( BOX it()KnK-15 ONLY, 17" x 30" BOX FOR 2" Me I :1'\ 3 EA IDFW $79.50 !i:nR fin NO BID NO BID $146.74 !i:d40 ?? 
lEAST 

H12 3W1016 I LID FOR ARnVF BOX, OKDK-5 ONLY 17" x 30" LID 3 EA $93.70 $281.10 NO BID NOBID $97.83 l:?!1~ 4~ 

H13 .:Jvv I u-'" IVALVE BOX CL IRE LID J 17 EA • STRZ $41.73 $709.41 NO BID NOBID $69.5~ $1 . 

I n<=1 " . BUX ~~~".;~-~~' ~~o" ~ .. ~~ TES 
t:!UJ<. I U 

100 EA $20.37 $2,037.00 NOBID ~%?n ~? ,,?n nn H14 3W1021 ' ~'f'T NO BID 

H15 ~c<nnQ ILiD ONLY FOR 2 n'~N: VALVE BOX .. ~n'/"n 7 EA , FIr.T $6.32 l:44.?4 NO BID NO BID $6.52 !i:4!'i R4 

H16 ;'VVlU:lO ILiD ONLY FOR 2 PIECE VALVE BOX MARKED WATER 100 EA 
STRZ,~I~,~ 

$6.32 l:R~? on NO BID NO BID $6.52 !i:R!'i? on 

H17 Extra Deep Covers for high traffic areas, series 6800 I 13 EA EJ Water Solutions t~? QR $42874 NO BID NO BID $27.17 l:~!'i~ ?1 

H18 ;'VVlUOO I LID ONLY FOR !=:()IIARF VAl VF BOX ,RFr.1 AIM 5 EA SIGMA t~l Qr !i:1!'ia !'in NO BID NOBID $13.04 l:R!'i ?r 

H19 3W1030 VALVE BOX RISER 1" FOR 461-S, 3-PIECE 30 EA 
STRZ,~I~~~ 

$4.21 $127.Rn NO BID NOBID $4.26 $127.Rr 

H2O .:Jvv I U.:J" 1/111 \f<= BOX : 1%", FOR 461-S, ~ 25 EA ST~S~~I~~ $5.91 ~1dO on NO BID NOBID $5.97 !i:1dO ?' 

H21 ;,VV1 U4U IVAI VI'; BOX 2", FOR 461-S, 3-PIECE 40 EA 
STRZ, ~I~I~~ 

$7.5( l:~oo on NO BID NOBID $7.46 !i:?aR dr 
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#~ - Water and Sewer Materials and Accessories 
Ferguson Waterworks Fortiline Inc. HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd. 

''''V''''I MFGfPART 

ITEMI NUMBER PRODUCT DESCRIPTION QTY UlM NUMBERS 

H22 "VV"IV"" VALVE BOX RISER 3" FOR 461-5, 3-PIECE 50 EA 
STRZ,S~~I~ 

$9,65 !:.4R7 "r NO BID NOBID $959 CA7C "0 

H23 IVALVEBOX 2"l':OIIARF. 9X9 RFr.1 15 EA IRell Corp ~Ii~ R, $9577e NO BID NO BID $69.30 $1 ,n~c "0 

H24 VALVE BOX RISER 3" SQUARE 9X9 ~1=r.1 AIUl=n 15 EA IRell Corp ~/iQ I' $1,037.25 NO BID NO BID ~7Q.Q~ $1,199.40 
H25 351005 1r.1 UTS#7621 100 EA ,USF $27.6~ !I:?7RIi.Ofi NO BID NOBID $31.98 'I:",'''R nn 
H26 351015 I F. RING I r<Ar-r-I'; #170 100 EA USF $77.401 '1:7 7A" nn NO BID NOBID $87.44 $8.7 .... ne 

MANHOLE COVER TRAFFIC #170E, LIDS MUST BE MARKED 
H27 351010 1" .. 1\, OAT":E COUNTY SANITARY SEWER" AND YEAR 100 EA USF !i:RAA, 'l:R AAA nn NO BID NO BID ~'R? An $1R.?Ro.no 

7WB -SS 
01\' i I UI"'I"'t: 

MANHOLE INFLOW PROTECTORS STAINLESS RS or Inflow 

H28 3S1018 STEEL 23-3/4 <'. Equal 200 EA I, .. ,,, 4W SHIELD ca? nc ~'A "'1.00 NO BID NO BID $34,401 !t" RAR fl{ 

SUB TOTAL, GROUP H CCA .a'.2! NO BID ~ .... "7' Q' 

FOR ALL OTHER ITEMS NOT LISTED ABOVE IN GROUP H, LIKE ITEMS MAY BE PURCHASED 
AT A FIXED PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT OFF A PUBLISHED MANUFACTUER'S PRICE LIST. $5,000.00 0% $O.OC % $0.00 0% $O.ot 

Submit a detailed attachment is applicable. i ~ only) 

G~41t.1n IVIAL, liP H ~ .. " "R1.2S NO BID c:.:~ ~?1 Q. 

GROUP I 

FIRE HYDRANTS 

11 15'A \/AI \/1= BURY 24" 5 EA $1,685.00 !i:R A7<; nr ~I lilil IR 'l:R "n" ar $1,691.39 'l:R .. ,," cc 

12 3H1027 BURY 30" 5 EA $1,701.50 $8,507.50 $1,70586 ~" "ryC ~r $1,728.01 !i:R R"n n~ 

13 BURY 36" 8 EA $I,R?? ,0 Ji:'A "Rn nn $1,751.01 $14 nnR n. $1,764.65 $14,11720 
14 BURY 42" 10 EA $1.88650 ",,, A"" ne ~I RO, ?R $1R Oli7 Rr ~I ROQ.97 $18,099.70 
15 "n'lu"'1 BURY 48" 10 EA $1,939.00 !i:'" ""n no $1,846.97 $1" ""a 7r $1,851.77 $18,517.70 
16 BURY 54" 4 EA $1,0.'; nn $7,R74.0fi $1,882.77 $7,531.0E $1,887.66 $7,<;<;n R.d 

SUB GROUP I-A ;RELATED HYDRANT PARTS 

I-A1 3H1010 IFIRE HYUr<AN . G~Anl=l nr.K W/(>'I Al\lnl': 6x 12 5 EA ~?'7" on $1,37400 NO BID NOBID ~?R? 44 $1,412.20 
I-A2 3H1015 6x24 4 EA ~~,n nn $1 .. nn no NO BID NO BID $35989 '" A~C.". 

I-A3 ,,\:1 '''''0 I' :WIRE VAl t'n 10 EA $18.95 $189.50 NO BID NO BID $19.89 !t,cR.an 
2W'TO%" 

I-A4 3H1130 HYDRANT ADAPTOR NOZZLE MALE 10 EA $14.56 $145.60 NO BID NOBID $12.07 $120.70 
I-A5 3L1245 H wRANT OIL A-51 10 GA $29.75 $297.50 NO BID NOBID $39.63 ~~a" ~r 

I-A6 3H1125 H TUIV\I~ I VVI 1- An II rABLE IF 10 EA $1695 $169.50 NO BID NOBID $17.33 $173.3C 
I-A7 3H1127 HTuRANT VVI RECLAIM 5 EA $89.00 CAA" nr NO BID NO BID $51.93 !i:7<;" Rf 

SUB GROUP I-B ;TRJ'I=I=It' REPAIR KITS 340~ ~AN nA~1 I .. '" DNL Y.- OEM 

I-B1 I 5'A VO EXI 6" 4 EA AFC ~?Rll0 $1,133.2( NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 
I-B2 12" 4 EA AFC $311.50 $1,7"" nr NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID 

I~~'I~~~~~' _. ~".~ 
5% HTUr<AN I 

$73.80 '1:7"" 7r NO BID NOBID NO BID NOBID I-B3 4 EA AFC 84-41 
I-B4 3H1140 nA~1 11\1(>. 5'A I r<Ar-"'I~ .KIT 5 EA AFC $178 .95 ""aA 7C NO BID NOBID NO BID NOBID 
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16· n'_s -Water and Sewer Materials and Accessories 
Ferguson Waterworks Fortiline Inc. HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd. 

,,>IV,"," M~1j II'AKI 

ITEMI NUMBER PRODUCT DESCRIPTION QTY UIM NUMBERS 

I-B5 "nl~"O IAMERICAN nARI INC:: t<At .,\.. REPAIR KIT 4 EA AFC $187.05 $748.?n NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID 

SUB GROUP I-C; TRAFFIC REPAIR KITS 340, . no" v -OEM 
ITRAFflC URKITS 340. IT 5% VO 

I-Cl 3H1045 EXTENSION 6" 3 EA "., !I;:l:ln fifi !l:QQ1 R~ NO BID NOBID "'">R7 ?? $1.101.6f 
I-C2 3Hl065 12" 4 EA "'">AR nn _$1 """ nn NO BID NOBID 'l:4?A A7 $1.715.4E 
I-C3 K8151 IT K-81 MAIN \/AI\/I= KIT 5 1/4 4 EA l' $301.00 $1 ?n4 nn NO BID NO BID ",?.,A nn "'a,,? nt 

1-C4 3H1145 IT K-81·A TRAFFIC RI=PAIR. KIT 5 EA $149.55 $747.75 NO BID NO BID $166.12 'l:A">n R~ 

SUB GROUP 1·0; TRAFFIC REPAIR KITS 34O,~ I FR A·423 O~ LY.· OEM 

I~~tt-I'-' '~';.'.;;~" KITS 340. t A-423 : 
$281.96 "'1M" A' NO BID NO BID ~"O 00 $1.016.67 1-01 3H1070 ~ ~ 3 EA Mueller 340 

1-02 3H1055 12" 3 EA U .... II .. r340 $332.70 $998.1C NO BID NO BID ~lOO oQ $1.166.67 
1-03 IMllFl1 FR. CENTURIA,,! 51/4 Repair Kit 3 $32.10 "'aR .,r NO BID NO BID $5538 $166.14 

1-04 MUELLER CENTURIAN 5 1/4 Main Valve Repair Kit 3 $ 345.70 $1.n.,7 1r j'iOBID NOBID 362.41 $1,nR7 ?, 

1-05 ~All~ I I I=R '-'t:N I IIRIA,,! 5 1/4 Shoe Repair Kit 3 ..:ou"", $ 148.60 !l:44fi Ar NO BID NOBID 228.38 $685.14 

1-06 3H1150 IMllFl1 FR CENTURIAN 5% TRAFFIC REPAIR KIT 3 EA Mueller 340 $ 145.00 NO BID NO BID 133.33 ".,aa ao 

SUB TOTAL, GROUPS I, I-A, I-B, I-C, AND I-D !t!l4 ?7fi fi~ '1:74 RIIK RO !tRR "n..t.oR 

FOR ALL OTHER ITEMS NOT LISTED ABOVE IN GROUPS I. LIKE ITEMS MAY BE PURCHASED 
AT A FIXED PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT OFF A PUBLISHED MANUFACTUER'S PRICE LIST. $5.000.00 37% ($1 ,,,,,n nn' % $OOC 0% $0.00 

Submit a detailed attachment is applicable. I (e~t;m"t" only) 

r.~4Nn TOTAL, IJP~ I, I-A, I-B, I-C, AND I-D CO? A?" ". NON NON 

No Bid: Bert Lowe Supply 
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