MANATEE COUNTY GOVERNMENT

INTENT TO AWARD
Whitfield Avenue, 16-Inch
Water Main, Manatee MC .l
SUBJECT County, FL DATE POSTED DS :
Project No. 6040970 cC
PURCHASING . DATE CONTRACT
REPRESENTATIVE ©l9a Valcich, Ext 3055 SHALL BE AWARDED
. CONSEQUENCES IF
DEPARTMENT Public Works Department e W
AUTHORIZED BY Melissa W ge( "
ells en
SOLICITATION IFB#15-0660-OV DATE \Ma@ i © 2015

NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD v
Notice of Intent to Award, Invitation for Bid #15-0660-OV, Whitfield Avenue, 16-Inch Water Main, Manatee
County, FL (Project No. 6040970) to the lowest, responsive, responsible bidder, Killebrew, Inc., PC Box
6258 Lakeland, FL 33807-6258 for a total base bid of $714,620.50, based on a completion time of 210
calendar days.

ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITY
Federal/State law(s), administrative ruling(s), Manatee County Comp Plan/Land Development Code, ordinances, resolutions, policy.

Manatee County Code of Laws
BACKGROUND/DISCUSSION

The Work consists of furnishing all labor, equipment, materials and performing all operations in connection
with the construction of approximately 2,200 linear feet of 16-Inch ductile iron main and associated
appurtenances along Whitfield Avenue in compliance with the Specifications, Drawings, Contract Documents
and all of the information contained in the bid solicitation. Pipe shall be installed by open cut and horizontal
directional drilling.

Appropriate Bid procedures were foliowed. Notice of Bid availability was a advertised on mymanatee.org,
DemandStar and the Manatee Chamber of Commerce.

Background discussion continued on Page 2.

Funds Verified, Utility
ATTACHMENTS: * Department FUNDING SOURCE Rates: Account No.
(List in order as attached) é $e§°.’“ tm S (Acct Number & Name) $046040970-6040070-
er as atiacne apulation 534000-0004
AMT/FREQ OF RECURRING
COSTS (Attach Fiscal Impact N/A
COST $714,620.I150 Statement)
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INTENT TO AWARD (continued) Page 2
IFB#15-0660-OV, Whitfield Avenue, 16-Inch Water Main, Manatee County, FL
(Project No. 6040870)

Bid “A" Bid “B!!
Bid Offers {210 Calendar Days) {270 Calendar Days)

Polk County
Killebrew, Inc.

Lakeland, FL $714,620.50 $716,899.70

Sarasota County
Spectrum Underground

Sarasota, FL $729,714.15 $729,714.15

Hillsborough County
Harris-McBurney Company

Tampa, FL No Bid $897,927.80

Lake County
Pospiech Contracting, Inc.

Inverness, FL $1,030,818.80 $1,085,818.80

Lee County
Andrew Sitework, LLC

Fort Myers, FL $926,379.30 $926,379.30

Manatee County
E. T. Mackenzie of Florida,Inc.

Bradenton, FL $860,002.00 $860,002.00

Westra Construction
Palmetto, FL No Bid $1,083,225.00

Woodruff & Sons
Bradenton, FL $1,179,105.29 $1,008.956.17

Miami-Dade County
Danella Utility Construction, Inc.

Boynton Beach, FL $909,510.80 $909,510.80

On June 3, 2015, a memorandum from Project Management Division was received recommending award to
Killebrew, Inc., Lakeland, FL the lowest responsive, responsible bidder for a total base bid of $714,620.50

based on a completion time of 210 calendar days.

S:\PERSONNEL FOLDERS\Olga Valcich\PuincWorks.Proj.Mgmt\IFB.FY.2015.ALL\IFB#15-0660-0V.WHITFIELD AVE.16.INCH
WATERMAIN\Intent to Award. June 2015.docx



To: Melissa M. Wendel, CPPO, Purchasing Official

From: Jeff Streitmatter lll, P. E., Project Management
Division Manager

Date: June 3, 2015
Subject: Whitfield Avenue 18-Inch Water Main
Killebrew, Inc.

Recommendation for Award - I_FB_#1 4-0684-0V

The bids for the above referenced project have been reviewed by staff. The bid tabulation form
is attached for your review. It is recommended that the contract Bid “A”, with a construction time
of 210 days be awarded to the lowest responsive, responsible bidder, Killebrew, Inc. in the
amount of $714,620.50 and in accordance with the terms and conditions of the bid package.
Upon completion of project award, please provide a copy of the purchase order assigned to the
contractor. The funding source for this contract is Utility Rates.

Please contact Brian P. Bates, P.E., Project Manager if you have any questions regarding the
attached documents.

Thank you for your continued assistance.

JSlbb(s“

cc: Mike Gore, Director, Utilities
Ron Schulhofer, Director, Public Works
Sia Mollanazar, P.E., Deputy Director, Engineering Services
Brian P. Bates, P.E., Project Manager
Prony Bonnaire Fils, Engineering Specialist Il, w/attachments
Project File: 6040970 9.2



IFB #15-0660-OV/BASE BID "A"
Whitfletd Avenue 16-inch Water Maln
Manatee County, Bradenton, FL - Project No.: 6040970

—

— ¥ x
Spectrum E.T. Mackenzle
mn "
BID "A Killehrew, inc. Underground, Inc. of Florida, Inc.
210 CALENDAR DAYS
Unit Extended [ Unit Extonded Unit Extended

fom Ne. } Line item Lokt | oty Prige_.{  Price Peico | Price 1 Price | Price
1 |mobltization & Demobilization LS 1 $40,24000| $q02e000] s400sc00| senoscoo| ssrasoo0]|  sev.3g0.00
2 |mainte of Trafflc Ls 1 satazeon]  sa4zecof  sas2anco|  siszencof  siszesoo| 1578500
5 H"ﬁn__“.nm....u,_._n_u__ 16-inch Flex-Ring Ductile Iron Pipe and Fittings | o | 4 ey s140.75|  s$247.087.50 $17075 | sz81.73TSD s207.00 |  $341,560.00
4 Furnish and Instal 18-inch Flea-Ring Ductlls Iron Pipe by HDD LF 560 S20245f $111.347.50 $18430| $108,865.00 $211.00|  $116,050.00
8 |Furnizh and instail 16.nch Gate Valve Assembly EA 3 3483500 s1as0so0f  ssemooo|  si7.e40.00 sso0500| s20715.00
$ Furnish and install Concrete Valve Vault EA 1 $10,785.00 Mdﬂ_ﬂmms ﬂnﬂ.ﬂﬂms $17.662.00 Hﬂ.gm.g m@-mbm.s
; Muuﬂn_.".uai Install Ductite iron Mechanical Joint Fittings and TON 3 s126w000| 3783000} s$1821500| seveason| sieasso0|  ss0sEs.00
8 |Fumish and install Manual Alr Releate Valve Assembly EA 1 $4,020.00 $4,020.00 s1,00800]  s1.038.00 s183500f  $1935.00
5 |Furnish s kystall Eire Hydeant Assembly EA 1 $7,462.00 §7,482.00 $5,300.00 soaezo0f siozis00f  sto0zisoo
10 |Connect to Existing Water Main EA 2 £3,545.00 57.07000 s7.25400| swsoe00] $114s000| 52208000
11 [Furniyh and Install Concrate Sidewalk sy | eon $40.00 |  s2040000 s3275| s1oe5000 s48.50|  s27.900.00
92 Milling of Existing Asphalt {1-inch Average Thickness) sY 4,000 52.35 $9,400.00 §345 $13,800.00 §4.50 $18,600.00
Furnish and install Superpave Asphattlc C ts, SP 9.5 TON 275 $192.00 $52,800.00 ¥ 5178.20 $48,005 00 $174.00 $47,850.00
Fuenish and install Settlement Monitoring Paints LS 1 34,800.00 $4,800.00 $15,608.00 $15,888.00 $5,750.00 $5,750.00
Unsultable Material Removal oY 100 s3g.00 £3,800.00 $8.50 $850.00 $30.50 $3,050.00

16 Addidonal Salsect Fill Material cYy 100 sar.oo §3,700.00 . $14.25 $1,42500 §27.00 52,700.00
17 |miscellanesus Cancrets cy 50 s68000|  $34,000007 s20600¢{  $10,250.00 saos00|  s18.750.00
TOTAL BASE BID $649,655.00 $663,376.50 $761,820.00

18 |Soniract Conlingency % 10 $64,985.50 568,337 .65 $78,182.00
Hﬂ_m _noms_..q.?n._. AWARD - WHITFIELD AVENUE 16-INCH WATER — I PR
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IFB #15-0660-OV/BASE BID A"
Whitfield Avenue 16-inch Water Main
Manaties County, Bradenton, FL - Project No.: 6040970

4 = [ 6
Danella Uiility Conastruction,
BID "A" Inc. * Andrew SHework LLG Fosplech Contracting, Inc,
210 CALENDAR DAYS
Unit Extonded | UNR Extanded Unit Extended
ftem No. | Line item Uik Qty Prige Price Prics Price Price Price
1 Mobilization & Damoblilzation LS 1 $80,000.00 $80,000,00 $640,683.00 $88.663.00 $125,000.00 5125.000.00
2 |Maintenance of Tralfic L5 1 $44,090.00 £44,008.00 s2456300| sz45e3co]  s2s00000|  s2s.p00.00
s ”w:“w.ﬂum““__as._ 16-Inch Flex-Ring Ductile Iron Pige and Fittings | o |, oy s205.00]  $338,250.00 s181.5¢| s20m475.00 s261.00|  $430,850.00
4 {Furish and Install 16-inch Flex-Ring Ductils ron Pipe by HOD LF 550 522350 |  $122,925.00 s34900| 10185000 528000 $154,800.00
5 Fumnish and Inatall 18-inch Gata Valve Assembly EA 3 $7,102.00 $21,300.00 $7.218.00 $21,654.00 $7,136.00 521,408.00
] _-n..z._-_. and install Concreta Valve Vault EA 1 $27,711.00 $27,711.00 $7 462,00 §7.462.00 $16,500.00 $16,506.00
7 |Feeteh and bastall Guctlls lran Mechanical Jolnt Fiitings and ToN | 3 szoro0]  s230100]  s12m00|  s3ermoo]  sizso000|  sar.soooe
8 Fumish and inutal Manual Air Release Valve Assembly EA 1 $1,122.00 $1,122.00 $1,130.00 $1,130.08 $5,500.00 $5.500.00
] Furnish and nstall Fire Hydrant Assembly EA 1 $12,085,00 $12,085.00 $8,760.00 56,760.00 §7,200.00 $7.200.00
10 rnﬂ._...nn- 1o EE Water Maln EA 2 $18.116.00 $33,238,00 $5618.00 $13,238.00 $850 00 $1,700.00
Furnish and Install Concrete Sidewalk sy 600 56540 $51.240.00 $55 68 $33,355.00 $48.50 $29,100.00
Milling of Existing Asphalt (1-Inch Average Thickness) sY 4000 $3.70 $14,800.00 5494 £19.760.00 $2.75 $£11.000.00
43 Furnish and Install Superpave Asphalic Concrete, 3P 9.5 TON 275 517100 $47.025 00 $420.80 $118,940.00 $154.00 $42,250,00
14 __u...:.F: and Install Settlement Monltoring Points LS 1 5$17,331.00 $17,231 00 $17.397.00 $17,287.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00
1% _C_.—u.-_—n-_-o Material Remaoval cY 109 $7.28 373000 $25.40 $2,540.00 $12.00 $1,200.00
16 Additional Select Fill Matoria] cY 100 $10.03 $1.003.00 $47.38 %4.736 00 $15.00 $1,500 00
17 |Mizcellanpoiie Concrete cY 20 $131 40 $8,570.00 $148.00 $7.400 00 $450.00 $22.500.00
TOTAL BASE BID 34826 626,00 $842 183 00 3937108 00
18 Contract Contingency % 10 $82.882,80 $84,216.30 $93.710 80
H-W.".-.”_W_wnw.ﬂﬂﬂbn._. AWARD - WHITFIELD AVENUE 184NCH WATER $505.510.60 $920.370.30 $1,030,818.80
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iFB #15-0660-OV/BASE BID "A"
Whitfield Avenue 16-inch Water Main
Manatee County, Bradenton, FL - Project No.: 6040970

i #.J.ﬂﬂumv BT
BID "A" Woodruff & Sons, Inc. Harris-McBumey Co. Westra Construction Corp.
210 CALENDAR DAYS
Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
item No. | Line ltem Unit Qty Prige Price Pricg. ___ Price Price P

1 |Mobilization & Demobilization LS 1 $98,304.10 |  $98,304.10 NO BID no BiD| NO BID NO BID)
2 |Malntenance of Traffic LS 1 $183,840.45 |  $183,840.45 NO BID NO BID] NO BID NO BIDJ
3 |y Oman g 2! 16-nch Flex-Ring Ductile lron Pips and Fitings | ¢ | 1,650 $247.76 | $408,767.50 NO BID NO m_cm NO BID NO m_c_
4 |Fumish and install 16-inch Flex-Ring Ductile Iron Pipe by HDD LF 550 $229.30 |  $131.81500 NO BID NO m_u__ NO BID NO m_c=
5 |Fumish and Install 16-inch Gate Valve Assembly EA 3 $8,830.58 |  $26,518.74 NO BID NO BID| NO BID NO BID|
6  |Fumish and Install Concrate Valve Vauit EA 1 $20219.00 $28,219.00 NO BID No BID| NO BID NO BID|
: e CuemmSechalcalSolnkEKHngaAnd ToN | 3 $13,343.23 |  $40,020.60 NO BID NO m_u__ NO BID NO m_c__
8 [Furnish and Install Manual Alr Release Valve Assembly EA 1 §1,915.15 $1,815.15 NO BID NO BiD| NO BID NO BID|
9 |Fumish and Install Fire Hydrant Assembly EA 1 $8,784.57 $8,784.57 NO BID No BID| NO BID No BiD|
10 |Connect to Existing Water Main EA 2 $6,923.60 |  $13,847.20 NO BID NO BID| NO BID NO BID|
11 |Furnish and Install Concrete Sidewalk sY | 600 $34.36 |  $20,616.00 NO BID NO BID| NO BID No BID|
12 |MiNing of Existing Asphalt (1-inch Average Thickness) sy | 4000 $as0|  $13,200.00 NO BID NO BID| NO BID NO BIDY
13 |Furnish and Install Superpave Asphaltic Concrete, SP 9.5 TON | 215 $126.50 |  $34,787.50 NO BID No Biof NO BID ~o BiD|
14 __"E.__m: and Install Settlement Monitoring Points LS 1 $4,180.00 $4,180.00 NO BID NO m_c_ NO BID NO m_u_
15 |unsuitable Material Removal cv | 100 $53.28 $6,329.00 NO BID no in| NO BID no Bio|
16 Addiflonal Select Fill Matorial cYy 100 $115.94 $11,594.00 NO BID NO m__u_ NO BID NO m_c_
17 |Miscellaneous Concrete cY 50 $78674 |  $39,337.00 NO BID | NO BID NO BID|

TOTAL BASE BID $1,071,912.90 NO BID) NO BID,
18 |Contract Contingency % 10 $107,191.39 no Bio] No BID]

ﬁ_ﬂw W&ﬂm?oq AWARD - WHITFIELD AVENUE 164NCH WATER SR— — p—
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BID TABULATION
FOR
IFB #14-0684-0V
Whitfield Avenue 16-inch Water Main

BID "A"
BASED ON A COMPLETION TIME QF 210 CALENDAR DAYS

PREPARED BY: £
{Project Manager) Kelly PE, nn&:n

REVIEWED BY: Wl
{Profect Manager) Don ullers, Cardno
PROJECT MANAGEMENT: AR
Brian Bates, PE, Project Man
APPROVED BY: \mm. e \\3 _ M\“ \ /s
(Purchasing) "Oiga <u_.%? Contract Specialist '
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IFB #15-0660-OVIBASE BID "B"
Whitfield Avenue 16-inch Water Main
Manatee County, Bradanton, FL. - Project No.; 6040970

s 2
[T -1 " Spectrum
m__u B Kille S Underground, inc.
270 CALENDAR DAYS

Unit Extended Unit Extendad |
Hemt No. | Line ltem Unit | Oty Prigs Price Price Price |
b ] _Eu_-_ga & Demobllization 18 1 $40,240.00 $40,240.00 $40,050.00 $40,050.00
F _!-_—-D__-!._n. of Trafic LS 1 $33,500.00 $33,500.00 $15,260.00 $15,260.00
: Mﬁ.u.“-__". .“:._ Instail 18-Inch Flex-Ring Ductle lron Pipa and Fitlings by | | 1,650 $14975  $247.087.50 517075 |  s201,737.50
4 q....h_..qt-__ and Install 15-lnch Flax-Ring Ductiie Iran Pipe by HDD LF 650 $202.45 $111,247.50 $184.30 $108,855.00
5 Furniah and Install 18-dnch Gale Valve Assembly EA 3 34,835.00 $14,505.00 $5,860.00 $17,640.00
€ |Fumish and Install Concrete Vaive Vauit EA 1 $10,765.00 $10,765.00 $17,662.00 $17,662.00
Furnish and Inatall Ductile lron Mechanical Jolnt Filtings and ToN 3 $12,610.00 $37,830.00 $18,215.00 $48,645.00

7 [Restraints
8 T-.:-_u._ and Inatall Manuai Air Ralsase Vatve Assambly EA 1 54,020.00 $4,020.00 $1,038.00 $1,038.00
5 Fumish and Install Fire Hydront Assembly EA 1 $7.,482.00 $7.462.00 $6,300,00 56,303.00
10 |Connect o Existing Water Maln EA 2 $3,535.00 $7,070.00 $7,254.00 514,508.00
11 Fumish and Install Concrete Sidewalk Y 800 548.00 $29 400,00 $32.75% $19,650.00
Milling of Existing Asphalt (1-4inch Average Thickness) 8Y | 4,000 $2.35 £9 400,00 $3.45 $13,800 00
13 |Fumish and instali Supsypave Asphaitic Concrels, SP 8.8 TON | 375 $192.00 §52,800,00 s178 20 $49,005 00
14__|Fumish and inatalt Settlsment Moriltoring Polits s | 1 s180000]  ssmona0| sisemasn|  sisseac
18 Unsultable Material Removal cY 100 $38.00 $3,800.00 $8.50 $850.00
16 Additions! Seject Flll Material cY 100 337.00 $3,700.00 $14.25 $1,425.00
17 |Miscellansous Concrete cyY 50 $680.00 $34,000.00 $205.00 $10,250.00
TOTAL BASE BID $851,727.00 $863,378.50
18 |Contract Contingency % 10 $85,172.70 $66,337.85

TOTAL - N

_ZP_Z wmo._ﬂmx)nﬂbihzu WHITFIELD AVENUE 16-INCH WATER $716.000.70 $729.714.15
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IFB #15-0660-OVIBASE BID "B"
Whitfield Avenue 16-inch Water Main
Manatee County, Bradenton, Fi. - Project No,: 6040870

—

k! 4 I3
E.T. Macksozie Danelis Utility Construction,
| 1) [ ]
BID "B of Florida, nc. Hanis-McBurney Go. Ine.
270 CALENDAR DAYS
Unit Extended | UAR Extented Unit Extandad
ltem Mo, | Line lem Unit | Qty Price Price Price Price Brice Pricg
1 |Mobilization & Demokilization L8 1 367,380.00 $67,380.00 $46,525.00 $46,525.00 $80,000.00 £80,000.00
2 |maintensnce of Trathc LS 1 $15,785.00 $15,765.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00 $44,008,00 $44,005.00
s M_._h_."._._... :n..a Install 18-inch Flex-Ring Ductila ron Plpe and Fitings by |, | 4 55 $207.00 |  5344,560.00 s21000|  s$381,350.00 s20500 |  $338.250.00
4 _ﬂ_._:.__w_.. and _-ﬂuh__ 16-inch Flex-Ring Duclile iron Pipe by HOD LF -] 21100 $118,050 00 5265.00 $145,750.00 5223 50 $122,02500
§__{Fumish and instah 16-inch Gaste Valva Assembly A | a 660500  smzisoe|  ssomuo|  swapesso]  s7.am300]  s21a08 0
& |Furnish and tnstall Concrata Vatve Vault EA 1 $0,645.00 $0,845.00 522,518 00 $22,615 00 $27,711 00 $27.711.00
. n”u....“.u_.uaaa Install Ductile Iron Mechanical Joint Fittings and Ton | 3 $16,855.00 $50,565.00 $5,400.00 $26,200.00 $797.00 $2,301 00
8 |Furnish and install Manual Aif Release Valve Aszembly EA 1 $1,035.00 $1,935,00 5871.00 $871.00 $1,122.00 51,122.00
9 _.“..-:_a_._ and install Fire Hydrant Azsembly EA 1 $10,215.00 $10.215.00 %6.714.00 $8,714.00 $12,085.00 512,08500
10 _no...:nn» to Existing Water Maln EA 2 511,490.00 $22,980.00 $12,736.00 $25472.00 £19,116.00 536,234 .00
1 __n.___.__._u-_ and nstsl) Goncrete Sidewalk §Y 600 348,50 $27.900.00 852.20 $31,320.00 $65.40 $51,240.00
12 |miing of Exiating Asphult [1-Inch Average Thickness) sY | 4000 84.50 $18,060.00 54.55 $18,200.00 saz70 §14,800.00
13 _m.._._..u_.. and Install Superpave Asphaltic Concrele, SP 9.5 TON e $174.00 $47,850.00 $14500 $308.875 00 $171 00 $47.025 00
Ls 1 $5,750.00 $5,750.00 $13,640.00 $13,640.00 $17.221.00 $17.331.00
15 |Unaultable Material Remova) cr | 108 $30.50 $3,050.00 $25 00 $2.500.00 $7.30 $730.00
16 |Additiona) Setect Fill Material cY 100 327 .00 $2,700.00 $25.00 $2,500.00 $10.03 $1,003.00
17 |Miscellaneous Goncrate ey 50 5395.00 $19,750.00 $150.00 $7.500.00 $131.40 8,570.00
TOTAL BASE BID $781,820.00 $616,208.00 $828,828,00
18 |Gontract Gonlingency % 0 $78,182.00 381,620.80 582,652.60
ﬂhﬂ. nUDJ“MNbﬂ._. AWARD - WHITRIELD AVENUE 16-INCH WATER $560,002 00 $aa7,927 8D $900.610 80
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tFB #15-0680-OV/BASE BID "B"
Whitfield Avenue 16-inch Water Main
Manatae County, Bradenton, FL - Project No.: 6040970

i T
BID "B" Andraw Sitework LLC Wastra Construction Corp. Pasplech Contracting, inc.
270 CALENDAR DAYS
~Unit Extenced §  Unit Extanded Unit Extanded
tiem No. | Line em Unit | aty Pricg Price Peicg Price Price Pdge
1 |Mobliization & Demobllization LS 1 $68.653.00 $68 §63.00 $105,600.00 $105,800 0D $175,000.00 %175.000 00
2 _z_._...a.u..n- of Traffic LS 1 $24,563.00 $24.5083.00 $42,500.00 $42,500.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00
5 Mﬂnﬁ_u_hi Inatall 16-inch Fiax-Ring Ductile Iran Pipe and Fittings by | &z | 4 4sp sB150 | szeva7s00 $25900|  $427,350.00 $26100|  3430,650.00
4 |Fuenish and Inatsii 18-Inch Flex-Ring Ductile lron Pips by HDD LF 880 $349.00 §191,850.00 $2680.00 $154,000.00 $260.00 $154,000.00
5 |Furnish and (nstall 16-nch Gate Valve Assembly EA 3 §7,218 60 $21,854.00 $6,200,00 $18,800.00 $7,138.00 $21,409.00
[] __u:_.._sn___ and Inslall Concrete Valve Vault EA + $7,462.00 57.462.00 $30,000.00 $30,000,00 $16,500.00 516,500.00
7 et snd Inxtall Ductlo lran Machanical Joint Fittings and ToN | 3 $1,203,00 $3,87800 $12,000.00 $36,00.00 $12,500.00 $37,500.00
8 _n..:._a.. and Instsll Manual Alr Release Valve Assambly EA 1 $1,130,00 $1,130.00 $3,000.00 £3,000.00 $5.500.00 $5,500.00
8 |Fumisn and Install Fira Hydrant Assembly EA 1 $6,760.00 £6,760.00 $9,000,00 $8,000.00 $7,200.00 $7,200.00
18 |Connect to Existing Water Maln EA 2 $8,619.00 $13,238.00 $9,000.00 $18,000.00 $850.00 $1,700.00
11 |Furnish and Install Cancrate Sidewalk 8Y 800 $55.66 $33,386.00 $60.00 $36,000.00 $48.50 $29,100.00
[Milling of Existing Asphalt {3.Inth Average Thicknass) sY | 4,000 $404 $18,760.00 $4.00 $16,000 0D $2.75 $11,000.00
Furnish and Install Superpave Asphaitic G te, SP 9.5 TON 5 $429.60 $148,140 00 $200 00 $55,000.00 $154 00 $42.350.00
Fumnish and Install Setlement Monltoring Points s 1 $17,387.00 $17,397.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00
15 {Unmuitable Material Removal cy 10 $25.40 $2,640.00 $12.00 $1,200.00 $12.00 $1,200 00
16 Additional Select Fill Malerial cy 100 $47.0%% $4,736.00 $25.00 $2,500.00 $15.00 1,500 00
17 Mizscellaneous Concrate cY 50 $HB00 $7.400.00 $200.00 $10,000.00 $450.00 $22 500 00
TOTAL BASE BID $842,163.00 $084,750.00 $967,108.00
18 [Contract Contiugency o 10 $84,216.30 $88,475.00 $98.710.80
ﬂ.ﬂ" Mun_..zu.mahﬂ._. AWARD - WHITFIELD AVENUE 16-INCH WATER $026,379.30 $1,083,225.00 $1.085.818.0
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IFB #15-0660-OV/IBASE BID "B"
Whitfield Avenue 18-inch Water Main
Manatee County, Bradenton, FL - Project No.: 6040970

BID "B" Woodruff & Sans, Inc.
270 CALENDAR DAYS
“Unit Extended
fiem Na. | Line itom Unit Qty Price Prics

1 sobilization & Demobillzation Ls 1 $95,391.20 $85,381.20
2 _.a._...-..e_naa Trafiic LS 1 5161,745.58 $181,745.55
s _Mﬁ_...__“.._“_h_a Install 16-inch Flex-Ring Ductife Iron Pipe and Fitinga by | | = | , ggp $220.60 $375,680 80
4 _...._a_u__ and nstall 16-nch Flex-Ring Dutile [ron Plpe by HDD LF 550 $232.00 §127,800.00
[ _n..a_-.. and Install 16-Inch Gate Valve Assembly EA a $8,427.53 $25,282.50
6 |Furniah and Instail Goncrete Valve Vaul BA | 1 $27,056.10 527,056.10
i Mﬂ"“”_.. 3”.4 Install Buctife iron Mechanical Joint Ftings and TON 3 $12,564.71 $37.054.13
8 |Fumnish and stall Manual Alf Relesss Valve Assembly EA 1 $1.681.70 $1,601.70
9  [Fumish and Insta$l Fire Hydrant Assembly EA 1 $0,346.59 $8.348.59
1 |Connect to Existing Water Maln EA 2 $8,231.58 $12,463.16
11 |Furnish and Install Concsete Sidewalk &Y §00 $33.33 $19,600.00
12__ |Milling of Existing Asphait {1-Inch Average Thickness) Sy | 4800 $3.30 $13,200.00

Furnish and Install Su allic Concrets, SP 8.5 TON | 278 $128.50 §34,787 .50
14 [Fumish and Install Seitiement Monitoring Points LS 1 54,180.01 $4,120.01
1§ |Unsuitable Material Removal cy 100 543.60 $4,360 00
16 |Additional Select Fill Material cY 100 $103 56 $10,356 00
17 |Misceilansous Concrate cY 55 §71a 80 535,930.00

TOTAL BASE BID $000.051.06
18 [Contract Contingency % 10 $68.005.11

TOTAL CONTRACT AWARD - WHITFIELD AVENUE 16-INGH WATER

|satn 81D “B” $1,058,956.17
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8ID TABULATION
FOR
{FB #14-0884-0V
Whitfield Avenue 16-inch Water Main

BID "8"
BASED ON A COMPLETION TIME OF 270 CALENDAR DAYS

PREPARED BY: -( ~(S
{Project Manager) . Date
REVIEWED BY: j&) §§\S A
{Project Manager) Don McCullers, Cardno Data
PROJECT MANAGEMENT: R &— (ili—

Brlan Bates, PE, Project Manager Date
APPROVED BY: | Q ) gk L {5
{Purchasing) Olga Valcich, nw&% Specialist
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