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NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD e

Notice of Iintent to Award, Invitation for Bid #16-2289BLS, Water and Sewer Materials and Accessories to the
bidders (primary and secondary) with the lowest, responsive, responsible bids (by group, subtotal) Ferguson
Waterworks , Fortiline Inc. and HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.

ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITY

Federal/State law(s), administrative ruling(s), Manatee County Comp Plan/Land Development Code,
ordinances, resolutions, policy.

Manatee Couniy Code of Laws

BACKGROUND/DISCUSSION

» This procurement is for water and sewer materials and accessories for the Utilities Maintenance Warehouse
Department.

» The intent of this Invitation for Bid (IFB) is to establish a primary and secondary award to the two lowest,
responsive, responsible bidders meeting specifications by group, subtotal.

» The annual estimated expenditure is $500,000.00

» The County solicited Invitation for Bid #16-2289BLS from July 20, 2016 through August 8, 20186, appropriate
bid procedures were followed.

» Notice of IFB #16-2289BLS was solicited on Demand Star (thirteen planholders), MyManatee.org, and the
Manatee County Chamber.

» Three bids were received from Ferguson Waterworks, Fortiline Inc., and HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.

ATTACHMENTS FUNDING SOURCE El Funds Verified
(List in order of attached) o (Acct Number & Name) [1 Insufficient Funds
AMT/FREQ OF RECURRING
Annual Estimate COSTS (Attach Fiscal Impact

COST $500,000.00 Statement) 5010003698-595000
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» August 16, 2016 received a memorandum from C. Mike Gore, Utilities Director to award by group as

follows:

GROUP PRIMARY

A (PVC fittings/pipe) Ferguson ($7,860.92)
B (C900 PVC pipe) Ferguson ($12,056.00
C (SDR26 fittings/pipe) Fortiline ($16,187.46)
D (HDPE fittings/pipe) Ferguson ($26,537.95)
E (Misc valves/stems) Ferguson ($38,476.89)
F (Ductile Iron fittings/pipe) Ferguson ($33,128.87)
G (Misc repair clamps) Ferguson ($41,155.61)
H (Meter/Valve boxes) Ferguson ($54,381.29)

I (Fire hydrants/repair kits) Ferguson ($94,275.53)

SECONDARY

Fortiline ($11,339.26)
Fortiline ($12,474.40)
Ferguson ($16,922.53)
n/a

Fortiline ($39,634.65)
HD Supply ($37,701.88)
n/a

HD Supply (55,521.93)
n/a

*each group has a fixed percentage discount off published manufacturer’s price list for like items not

specifically identified.

GROUP PRIMARY

A (PVC fittings/pipe) Ferguson — 81%
B (C900 PVC pipe) Ferguson — 0%
C (SDR25 fittings/pipe) Fortiline — 50%
D (HDPE fittings/pipe) Ferguson — 0%
E (Misc valves/stems) Ferguson — 64%
F (Ductile Iron fittings/pipe) Ferguson — 64%
G (Misc repair clamps) Ferguson — 52%
H (Meter/Valve boxes) Ferguson— 0%

I (Fire hydrants/repair kits) Ferguson —37%

SECONDARY
Fortiline — 50%
Fortiline — 50%
Ferguson — 80%
n/a

Fortiline — 48%
HD Supply — 0%
n/a

HD Supply — 0%
n/a
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GROUP A i
PVC FITTINGS AND PIPE - SCHEDULE 40 AND SCHEDULE 80 j |
321225 |MALE ADAPTOR - SLIP x MIPT SCH. 40 Ya 125 | EA |CHARLOTTE $0.16) $20.00} $26.2
321230 % 115 | EA |cHaRLOTTE $0.17 $19.55) $26.4
321300 34" X 1/2" 25 | EA |CHARLOTTE $0.29 $10.50
321235 1 60 | EA |CHARLOTTE $0.31 $25.20
3721240 1% 25 | EA |CHARLOTTE $0.35 $12.7
321250 1% 25 | EA |CHARLOTTE $0.46§ $17.00
321255 2 125 | EA |CHARLOTTE $0.58} $1112
3212656 |MALE ADAPTOR SLIP x MIPT SCH. 40 3 100 | EA |CHARLOTTE $2.2 { $385.
321270 4 10 | EA |CHARLOTTE $2.87§ $49.1
321280 |FEMALE ADAPTOR - SLIP x FIPT SCH. 40 ¥ 50 | EA |CHARLOTTE $0.20f $13.00
321295 Y 110 | EA |CHARLOTTE ; $0.28 $36.2
321305 1 60 | EA |cHARLOTTE | $0.29 $22.8
321310 1Y% 25 | EA |cHaRLOTTE | $0.41 $14.750
371315 1% 25 | EA |cHARLOTTE | $0.47 $17.00}
371320 2 25 | EA |cHaARLOTTE ; $0.62 $22.75]
321330 |FEMALE ADAPTOR SLIP x FIPT SCH. 40 3 12 EA |CHARLOTTE ‘ $1.99 $37.2l3!
321335 4 10 | EA JCHARLOTTE | $3.07 $51.4
3Z1345 |REDUCING BUSHING SLIP x SLIP SCH. 40 Bx¥ 200 | EA JCHARLOTTE | $0. 19 $48.0§
321350 1x % 120 | EA |CHARLOTTE | $0.33] $52.8
321355 1x % 50 | EA |cHARLOTTE | 50.33] $22.00|
371365 1% X 1 5 | EA |cHARLOTTE ‘ $0 43 $2.9
321375 1% x 1 10 | EA |CHARLOTTE | $0.46 $6.3
321390 2x1 15_| EA |cHARiOTTE | 8071} $15.6
321395 2x1% 5 | EA |cHARLOTTE | $0.7¢ ‘ $5.2
321400 2x1% 5 EA |CHARLOTTE $0.70 $5.2
3Z1415 4x2 10_| EA [cHARLOTTE | $3.32 $55.00]
321420 4x3 15 | EA |CHARLOTTE | $3.32 $82.5
321425 6 X 4 5 | EA [cHariOTTE | $7.94 $68.0
371440 |REDUCING BUSHING SLIP x FIPT SCH. 40 1x% 25 EA |CHARLOTTE i 3046 $12.5
A30 | 321450 1% x 1 12 | EA |CHARLOTTE ! $0.67 $9.1
A31 | 3Z1455 1% X % 12 | EA |cHARLOTTE ‘} $0.77 $10.4
A32 | 321460 1% x1 12 | EA |CHARLOTTE g $0.77 $10.4
A33 | 321480 2x% 125 | EA [cHARLOTTE ] $1.00 $125.004 $146.2
A34 321520 |CAP-SLIP SCH. 40 Ve 55 EA |CHARLOTTE | $0.16 | $8.80I $9.3
A35 | 371525 % 75 | EA [cHariOTTE | $0.19 $14.25) $15.0
A36 | 371530 1 15 | EA |crarioTTE | 30.29] $4.3 $4.6
A37 | 371540 1% 12 | EA |CHARLOTTE i $0.414 $4. $5.2
A38 | 321545 1% 15 | EA |charioTTE | $0 44 $6.60 $7.05{
A39 | 321550 2 15 | EA |CHARLOTTE ‘ $0.51 $7. $8.55
A40 | 321565 |CAP SLIP SCH. 40 3 15 | EA |CHARLOTTE i $1.64 $24.6 $20.850
Ad1 321570 4 5 EA |CHARLOTTE | $3.41 $17.0 $22.65
Ad2 | 3Z1575 6 20 | EA |CHARLOTTE $7.91 $158.20), $216.80
Ad43 321035 |CAP - FIPT SCH. 40 % 10 | EA |CHARLOQTTE $0.39 $3.9 $4.0
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IEB #16-2289BLS - Water and Sewer Materials and Accessories - Rorson Watarworks Fortilins Inc.
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Ad4 1 10 EA

371535 CHARLOTTE $0.51 $5.10 $o.53|| $5.30]]

Ad5 | 371040 1% 10 | EA |cHARLOTTE $6.40 $0.64 $6.40] $0.73|
A46 | 321045 1% 10 | EA |cHARLOTTE $6.40 $0.64 $6.40]| $0.76|
A47 | 3z1555 2 12 | EA {cHArLOTTE $14.2 $1.13 $13.564 $1.36
A48 | 321050 3 5 | EA |cHarorrE | $12.00) $2.09 $10.45 $2.60
A50 | 371585 |COUPLING SLIP x SLIP SCH. 40 % 100 | EA |cHarRLOTTE $11.0 $0.12) $12.00] $0.11
A51 | 371500 % 150 | EA |cHARLOTTE $22.50 $0.16 $24.00]| $0.17
A52 | 321595 1 65 | EA |cHarLOTTE $16.90 $0.27 $17.55] $0.30)
A53 | 321600 1% 75 | EA |CHARLOTTE $27.00 $0.38 $28.5 $0.40]
A54 | 371605 1% 100 | EA jcHaARLOTTE $39.00| $0.4 $40.0 $0.44|
A55 | 371610 2 450 | EA |cHArLOTTE $265.50]| $0.56 $252.00 $0 66|
A56 | 371620 [COUPLING SLIP x SLIP SCH. 40 3 25 | EA |charioTTE $49.75 $1.84 $46.00 $2.30]
A57 | 371625 4 50 | EA |cHARLOTTE $147.0 $2.56 $128.00 $3.33
A58 | 321055 |COUPLING FIPT x FIPT SCH. 40 % 100 | EA |cHARLOTTE $39.00 $0.39 $39.00 $0.4
A60 | 371635 |BEND 45 DEGREE SLIP x SLIP SCH. 40 Y% 50 | EA JcHarRLoTTE $13.00 $0.28 $14.00]f $0.31
A61 | 321640 % 60 | EA [cHartoTTE || $25.20 $24.00{ $0.4
A62 | 321645 1 60 | EA [cHarLOTTE $29.40 $28.20] $0.57
A63 | 321650 1% 5 EA |CHARLOTTE $3.30 $0.8
A64 | 321655 1% 5 EA |CHARLOTTE $4.1 $1.00
A65 | 371660 2 25 | EA |cHARLOTTE $26 50 $1 30
A66 | 371675 4 5 | EA |cHARLOTTE $33.6 $9.44]
A67 | 321690 |BEND 90 SLIP x SLIP SCH 40 Y 210 | EA |cHarLOTTE $35.7 $0.19]
AB8 | 321695 ' % 210 | EA JCHARLOTTE $42.00 $0.21
A69 | 321702 |BEND 90 DEGREE STREET SCH. 40 3/4" 25 | EA |cHARLOTTE $14.00]| $0.6
A70 | 321705 |BEND 90 SLIP x SLIP SCH 40 1 105 | EA |CHARLOTTE $36 754 $0.3
A71] 321710 1Y% 20 | EA |cHARLOTTE $11.40] $0.66
A72 | 371715 |. 1% 35 | EA |cHarioTE | $22.0 $0.71
A73 | 321720 2 25 | EA |charioE ] $23.50 $1.11
A74 321730 |BEND 90 SLIP x SLIP SCH. 40 3 25 EA |CHARLOTTE $75.5 $4.0
A75 | 3Z1735 4 5 | EA |cHarRLOTTE $26.40 $7.24
A76 | 3z1070 |BEND 90 DEGREE THREAD x THREAD SCH. 80 Y 12 | EA [cHARLOTTE $17. $1 86
A77 | 371065 % 25 | EA |cHARLOTTE $45.7 $2.33ff
A78 | 321090 2 5 EA {CHARLOTTE $19.3 $5.03
A79 | 322640 [90 DEGREE ELBOWS-SXS SCHED 80 AL 40 | EA |charLoTTE $345.20] $11.5
A80 | 321750 | TEE SLIP x SLIP SCH. 40 A 50 | EA |cHarLOTTE $10.50{ $0.23
A81 | 321755 % 100 | EA |cHarRLOTTE $26.00] $0.27
A82 | 321760 1 60 | EA |CHARLOTTE $27.00, $0.50
A83 | 371770 1% 10 | EA [chariore || $8.10 $0.04
A84 | 321775 2 15 | EA |cHarorE | $17.1 $1.37
A85 | 371785 |TEE SLIP x SLIP x SLIP SCH. 40 3 5 | EA |cHartoTTE i $22.1 $5.94
A86 | 321790 4 20 | EA |cHARLOTTE $153.40 $10.76}
A87 | 321170 | TEE FIPT x FIPT x FIPT SCH. 80 2 5 | A |cHARLOTTE $33.8 $3.49
A88 | 321120 | PLUG THREAD SCH. 40 % 65 | EA |CHARLOTTE $33.1 $0.5
A89 | 3zZ1125 1 75 | EA |cHARLOTTE $57.75] $0.8
A90 | 3z1130 1% 5 | EA |cHarLOTTE $4.05| $0.93
A91 | 3z1135 1% 5 | EA |cHARLOTTE $4.20] $1.00
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A92 3Z1 140 2 CHARLOTTE $1.09 $10.90 $1.06 $10.60 $1.29 $12.90f
A93 | 321145 3 5 EA |cHARLOTTE $2.50 $12.5 " $2.08) $10.40 $2.70] $13.50 |
A94 | 371810 |NIPPLES SCH. 80 % x 2 10 | EA |sPears $0.25 $2.50 $0.61 $6.1 $0.34 $3.40f
A95 | 321815 % x4 100 | EA |SPEARS $0.35 $35.00 $0.90 $90.00 $0 47 $47 00
A9B6 | 321860 1% x 4 4 EA |SPEARS $13 $5.48 $1.93 $7.72 $1,09 $4.3
A97 | 321115 1% x 12 4 | EA |sPears $3.30 $13.20 $3.62 $14.48 $2.23| $8.9.
A98 | 321880 2x8 4 EA |SPEARS $3.25 $13.00 $3.45 $13.80 $2.19 $8.7
A99 | 321885 2x12 4 | EA |sPears $5.05]| $20.20 $5.3 $21.3 $2.96 $11.8
A100| 321185 JUNION SCHEDULE 80 FIPT x FIPT 1 4 | EA |cHARLOTTE $5.25| $21.00 $4. 96'[ $19.8 $6.46 szs.a:u
A101| 321200 _ R 4 | EA |cHARLOTTE $9.8 $39.40 $9.08 $36.32 $12.31 $49.2
A102| 371190 2 5 | EA |CHARLOTTE ‘ $18.4 $92.2 $17. 2 $86.1 $23. $117.304
A103| 321975 |FLANGE - VAN STONE - SCHEDULE 80 SLIP 3 5 EA [CHARLOTTE $9.2 $46.1 $9. 31 $46.5 $12.53 $62.65§
A104| 371980 4 10 | EA [charloTTE | $11.52| $11.78 $117.80 $15.86 $158.60f
A105] 321965 |ADAPTOR PVC SCH. 80 F.I.P. x FLANGE 4 10 | EA |cHArLOTTE $42.55] $32.94 $329.40 $44.79 $447.90f
Ig 06| 321970 _ 6 6 | EA [sPEARsS $71.7 $51.80 $310.80 $71 43 $428.58)
BALL VALVE PVG FIP X FIP SCH. 80 TRUE 1 I
A107| 3V1395 {UNION, EPDM GASKET, FULL PORT Ve 2 EA |CHARLOTTE $7.8 $19.13 $38.2 $26.91 $53.824
A108| 3v1255 1% 2 | EA lcHarLOTTE $30.05 $44.43 $88.86 $52.44 $104.88)
PVC COMPACT BALL VALVE TEFLON SEAT, ‘
A109| 3v1410 |JEPDM O-RING, Sx S b 4 EA |CHARLOTTE $0.81|| $9.68 $38.72 $11.88 $47 5
A110] 3v1415 % 5 | EA |cHARLOTTE $1.15 $13.08 $65.40 $16.21 $81.05)
A111] 3Vv1420 1 5 | EA [cHARLOTTE $1.65 $14.28 $71.40 $17.71) $88.55]
A112| 3V1430 1% 4 EA |CHARLOTTE $3.15 $25.57 $102.2 $31.72 $126.88]
A113| 3V1435 2 5 | EA |cHARLOTTE $4 55 $33.79 $168.9 $42.35 $21175]
A114| 3P1055 |PVC PIPE,SCHED 40, 20 FT LENGTHS 12" 25 | EA |cHARLOTTE $3 82“ $8.8 $220. $9.6 $240.
A115] 3P1060 3/4" 50 | EA |cHaARLOTTE $4.6 $11 20 $560.00) $11.52) $576.0
A116] 3P1065 1" 35 | EA |cHARLOTTE $6.00 $16 .80 $588.00 $18.40]f $644.0
A117] 3P1070 1 1/4" 35 | EA |CHARLOTTE $7.80 $22.0 $770.00 $858.5
A118] 3P1075 142" 20 | EA |CHARLOTTE $9.40 $24.60 $492.00 $554.6
A119] 3P1080 g 10 | EA |cHARLOTTE $12.70]| $127.00 $34.00 $340.00 $381.3
A120| 3P1083 2142 5 | EA |cHARLOTTE $19.00]f $95.0 $54.40 $272.00 $321.3
A121] 3P1085 3" 10 | EA |cHarLOTTE $26 00 $260.00 $64.00]f $640.0 $749.3
A122] 3P1090 |. 4" 10 | EA |cHarLOTTE $35 0 $350.00 $86.80 $868.00 $1,050.7
A123] 3L1200 |PINT - PVvC CEMENT SCHEDULE 80 W/DAUBER 700 50 | EA |orTEG $5.15 $257 50 $8.00 $400.00 $470.504
A124| 3L1260 |PINT - PVC PRIMER - PURPLE W/DAUBER 100 | EA |orTEG $4 60 $460.00| $7.00 $700.00 $639.00f
3L1205 |PINT - PVC CEMENT, WET DRY W/DAUBER 100 | EA JorTEG $6.30 $7.00 $700.00 |

SUB TOTAL, GROUP A

FOR ALL OTHER ITEMS NOT LISTED ABOVE IN GROUP A, LIKE ITEMS MAY BE PURCHASED A
A FIXED PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT OFF A PUBLISHED MANUFACTUER'S PRICE LIST. Submit a
detailed attachment is applicable.

GRAND TOTAL, GROUP A

$11,339.2

50% ($2,500.00 0%

$630.0
$7,860.92

$5,000.00 81%

(estimate only)
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Fortiline Inc.

HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.

GROUP B
C900 PVC PIPE (4" and above) ‘
[ B1 | 3P1100 |PVC PIPE, C900, BLUE FOR POTABLE WATER 4" 5 | EA |DIAMOND NAPCO $41.40 $207.00 $40.40 $202.00 $60.53 $302.65
B2 | 3P1115 8" 10 | EA [piaMOND NAPCO $77.60 $79.80]f $798.00 $120.80, $1,208.00}
B3 | 3P1125 8" 3 | EA |DIAMOND NAPCO $134.40 $138.40 $415.20] $208.80 $626 40}
B4 | 3P1140 10" 4 | EA |piamonD NaPco $206 40 $207.80 $831.20 $313.60 $1,254.408
B5 | 3P1150 12" 4 | EA |piamonD NaPcO $279 40| $293.20 $1,172.8 $442.75 $1,771.00}
B6 | 3P1155 L 16" 3 | EA |DIAMOND NAPCO $542.20 $1,626.60 $733.33] $2,199.99)
PVC PIPE, C900, GREEN FOR NON-POTABLE !
B7 3P1105 |WATER 4" 8 EA |DIAMOND NAPCO $40.4 $323.20 $63.73 $509.84 i
B8 | 3P1120 6" 5 | EA |piamonD NaPcO $79.80 $399.00] $126.67 $633.35}
B9 | 3P1130 8" 4 | ea [piamonp Napco | $138.4 $553. $219 2 $876.808
B10 | 3P1145 10" 4 | EA [piamonD NaPCO | $207.8 $831.2 $329 33 $1,317.32
B11 | 3P1146 12" 4 | EA |DIAMOND NAPCO $293.20f $1,172.8 $464.88 $1,850.52§
B12 | 3P1147 16" 4 | EA |DIAMOND NAPCO $542.20 $2,168.80 $733.33 $2,933.324
PVC PIPE, C900, PURPLE FOR NON-POTABLE !
B13 | 3P1217 |RECLAIMED WATER 6" 4 | EA |piaMOND NAPCO $79.80 $319.20 $129 07 $516.28)
B14 | 3P1124 8" 12 | EA [DIAMOND NAPCO ‘ $138.40 $1,660.80] $223.47 $2,681.64f
| SUB TOTAL, GROUP B [ $12,474.40 [ s4s,600.51]
FOR ALL OTHER ITEMS NOT LISTED ABOVE IN GROUP B, LIKE ITEMS MAY BE PURCHASED il ] I Q _‘
AT A FIXED PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT OFF A PUBLISHED MANUFACTUER'S PRICE LIST. Submitff  $5,000.00 0% [ s000 50% | ($z,.5oo.oo] 0%
a detailed attachment is applicable. (estimate only) —
GRAND TOTAL, GROUP B $18,690.51]
—_— ’5
GROUP C | | |
PVC PIPE & FITTINGS (SDR 26)
———— |
3P1160 |PIPE, SEWER, SDR26, GREEN, 14 FT LENGTHS 4" 25 | EA |piaMOND NAPCO $15.68 $15.54 $388.50 $23 33 $583.25§
3P1165 6" 25 | EA {DIAMOND NAPCO $32 48 $33.32 $833.0 $50.67 $1,266.75§
3P1170 8" 5 | EA |DIAMOND NAPCO $58.94 $60.06] $300.30 $91.33 $456 65§
3P1158 |PIPE, SEWER, SDR, GREEN, 14 FT LENGTHS 10" 5 | EA |piamonD NaPCO $92.12f $460.60 $94.22 $471.10 $142.67 $713.35.
3P1173 12" 5 | EA |DIAMOND NAPCO $632.8 $134.26 $671.30 $203 47 $1,017 35)
3P1174 15" 5 | EA |DiaMOND NAPCO $1,034.60 $203.98 $1,019.90] $308.56 $1,542.80f
351020 |SDR 26 CLEANOUT FEMALE ADAPTOR 4 50 | EA |DIAMOND NAPCO $113.00 $2.24 $112.00 $2.26 $113.00f
381025 |. 6 100 | EA |DIAMOND NAPCO $1,055.00 $10.30 $1,030.0 $10.68 $1,068.00§
[ co | 351030 |SDR 26 ELLS GASKETED 4 BxB 45 10 | EA |DIAMOND NAPCO $90.70 $6.85 $68.50 $9.07 $90.70}
[ c10] 351035 4 S/45 60| EA |DIAMOND NAPCO | $501. $6.53 $391.80 $8.38] $502.80}
i c11 | 3s4040 6 BxB 45 10 | EA |piamonD NaPco | $166. $15.2 $152.2 $16.66] $166.604
C12 | 3S1045 6 S/45 100 | EA |[DIAMOND NAPCO $1,213. $11.74 $1,174. $12.31 $1,231.00§
C13 | 351050 4 BxB 22% 10 | EA |DIAMOND NAPCO $117.60 $6.69 $66.90 $12.05 $120.50 |
C14 | 351055 4 8/22% 25 | EA |DIAMOND NAPCO $287.50 $6.35 $158.7 $11.53 $288.25§
c15| 351060 6 BxB22% | 10 | EA |piaMOND NAPCO $226.20) $16.70] $167.0 $22.72 $227 20]
C16 | 351065 6 S/22V 50 | EA |DIAMOND NAPCO $1,071.00] $15.Szl| $793.00 $21.75 $1,087.5
c17 | 351085 |SDR 26 WYE GASKETED 4x4 50 | EA |DIAMOND NAPCO $1,012.00] $19.4 $970.00 $20.54] $1,027.00f

Page 5



IFB #1 6—22898LS Water and Sewer Materials and Accessor Accessones 1-
icsTock| MFG | PAR
weu|boween | erooucroescrenon | M

Fe

rguson Waterworks
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Fortiline Inc.

' HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.

| C18 331 090 6 X 6 100 DIAMOND NAPCO $32.92 $3,292.00] $29.14 $2,914.00 $33.39 $3,339.004
C19 | 351005 |SDR-26 WYE GASKETED 8x6 10 | EA |TRED $43.25 $432.50 $40.45 $404.50) $43.33 $433.308
c20 | 351096 6xBx6x6 | 25 | EA [TRED $61.44 $1,536.00 $54.14 $1,353.50 $59.24 $1,481.0
c21 | 3s1097 [4" PUSHPLUG 4 25 | EA [reD $2.29 $57.25 $6.31 $157.7 $7.34)f $183.5
C22 | 351008 |6" PUSH PLUG 6 50 | EA |TRED $3.52 $176.00} $14.28 $714.00 $14.80]| $740.0
C23 | 351105 |6 x4 INCREASER SDR-26 6 X 4 25 | EA |TRED $16.77| $419.25 $18.49 $462.2 $17.20 $430.0
C24 | 351107 |SANITARY TEE, SDR26 6 X 4 12 | EA |TRED $29.1 $349.68 $27.63 $331.56)

C25| 351109 |SANITARY TEE, SDR26 8X6 5 | EA |TRED $41.21 $206.05 $39.43] $197.1

C26 | 321950 |SDR 26 INVERTED SCREW PLUG 50 | EA |TRED $3.17 $158.50

C27 | 321955 |6° INVERTED SCREW PLUG EA |TRED 381

a detailed attachment is applicable.

SUB TOTAL, GROUP C

FOR ALL OTHER ITEMS NOT LISTED ABOVE IN GROUP C, LIKE ITEMS MAY BE PURCHASED
AT A FIXED PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT OFF A PUBLISHED MANUFACTUER'S PRICE LIST. Submit

GRAND TOTAL, GROUP C

$5,000.00

(estimate only)

80%

50%

0%

GROUPD
HDPE PIPE AND FITTINGS (DR-11)
B [NATI J-m
PIPE, HDPE SDR11, BLUE STRIPE, 40 FOOT SO EIRE |
3P1326 |[|LENGTHS 6" 50 EA |PERFORMANCE $217.20 NO BID NO BID $266 46 $13,323.00
NATI J-M || i
POLYPIPE ;
3P1345 _ 8" 12 | EA |PERFORMANCE $365 60 NO BID NO BID $478 7 $5,745.24
DR-11 DIPS HDPE MJ ADAPTER WIKITS ISCO CTR SPECIFIED :
3A1075 |OR EQUAL 4" 5 EA |IND PIPE $62. NO BID NO BID $89 75 $448.75
CTR SPECIFIED
D4 3A1080 6" 10 | EA [INDPIPE $84.00 NO BID NO BID $67.43 $674.30
CTR SPECIFIED ||
D5 3A1085 8" 5 EA |IND PIPE $103.00 NO BID NO BID $128.23 $641 1
DR-11 DIPS HDPE FLANGE ADAPTER ISCO CTR SPECIFIED
D6 3A1325 |(ISMFFA0411DIPS) OR EQUAL 4" B EA |IND PIPE $17.35 NO BID NO BID $30.65 $153.25
CTR SPECIFIED
D7 3A1330 6" 5 EA |IND PIPE $26.05 NO BID NO BID $42.33 $211.65§
CTR SPECIFIED
D8 3A1335 8" 5 EA JIND PIPE $41.55 $207.7 NO BID NO BID $64.23 $321.1
STAINLESS STEEL BACKUP RINGS ISCO CTR SPECIFIED “
D9 3A1340 |(BUD4DIPSSS) OR EQUAL 4" 5 EA |IND PIPE $74.85 $374.2 NO BID NO BID $175.01 $875.05
CTR SPECIFIED
D10 3A1345 8" 5 EA |IND PIPE $99.95 $499.7 NO BID NO BID $167.68 $838.40
CTR SPECIFIED
D11 3A1350 8" 5 EA |IND PIPE $147 $735.0 NO BID NO BID $175.8 $879.4
DR-11 DIPS HDPE MOLDED FITTINGS ISCO CTR SPECIFIED
D12 | 3A1300 |OR EQUAL-90 DEGREE ELBOWS 4" 5 EA [IND PIPE $19.20 $96.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CTR SPECIFIED H
D13 3A1305 6" 5 EA |IND PIPE $41 20 $206.00 NO BID NO BID $44.93 $224 6 "‘
CTR SPECIFIED || ||
D14 3A1310 8" 5 EA |IND PIPE $96.30 $481.50 NO BID NO BID $116.32 $581.604
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|FB #16-2289BLS - Water and Sewer Materials and Accessories _ e HD Supply wf_tirm"‘s’ Cic:

MC STOCK MFG | PART |
PRODUCT DESCRIPTION Rl UM NUMBERS J
|

|

POLY PIPE BLUE, CTS-SDR-ASTM D2737 - 100 T |
ROLLS - CHARTER, ENDO PURE OR VANGUARD | |

D15 { 3P1285 |PROCORE % 15 | RL |CHARTER $21.75 $326.25 NO BID NO BID $21.11 $316.654
D16 | 3P1290 1 50 | RL |cHARTER $36.00 $1,800.00 NO BID NO BID $35.89 $1,794.50}
D17 | 3P1295 1% 5 | RL [cHARTER $75.15 $375.7 NO BID NO BID $75.16/ $375.80]

POLY PIPE BLUE, CTS-SDR-ASTM D2737 - 100'
ROLLS - CHARTER, ENDO PURE OR VANGUARD

{
[
I
|
I

D18 | 3P1300 |PROCORE 2 25 | RL |cHARTER $129.00 $3,225.00 NO BID NO BID $128.5 $3,214.25]
D19 | 3P1315 |POLY PIPE, PURPLE 1 5 | RL [cHarTER $36.00 $180.00 NOBID I NO BID | $35.89
D20 | 3P1325 2 5 | RL |cHARTER $129.00, $645.00 NOBID I NO BID | $128 57
D21 | 3C1010 |INSERT CTS-SS-PE SDR 9 FLAIRED ENDS 1? 150 | EA |Forp $1.01 $151.5o|| NO BID NO BID $116
D22 | 3C1015 2" 75 | EA |ForD $1 .40 $105.00, NO BID NO BID $1.61

[ SUB TOTAL, GROUP D ] | [ $26,537.95] [ $0.00]
[ ———C]

FOR ALL OTHER ITEMS NOT LISTED ABOVE IN GROUP D, LIKE ITEMS MAY BE PURCHASED

AT A FIXED PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT OFF A PUBLISHED MANUFACTUER'S PRICE LIST. Submitl] ~ $5,000.00 0% % 0%
a detailed attachment is applicable. (estimate only) _ ’t_‘l ||

| GRAND TOTAL, GROUP D | '[ NO BID |

____GROUPE ____ |
MISCELLANEOUS WATER AND SEWER VALVES | (l

3v1080 |FULL BODY 4 8 | Ea $301.00 $2,408.00 $308.08 $2,464.8 $304.88
3V1085 6 25 | EA $384.00 $9,600.00 $390.90 $9,772.50 $388.86
3V1090 8 4 EA $612.00 $2,448.00 $619.34 $2,477.3 $619.14
3vi100 | . 12 2 | Ea $1,206.94 $2,413.88 $1,215.60 $2,431.20]  $1,221.93
FLANGED GATE VALVE/WHEEL HANDLE NRS
3v1065 |(Non Rising Stem) 4 4 | EA $298.39 $1,193.56 $305.26 $1,221.0 $302.08
3V1060 6 6 | EA $308.85 $2,393.10 $405.94 $2,435.64 $403.82
3V1135 |TAP VALVE WITH CENTERING RING 6 4 [ea $537.00 $2,148.00f  $543.04 $2,172.1 $543.04
3v1140 8 2 | EA $791.25 $1,582.50] $806.04 $1,612.08]l $806.04
OS &Y VALVE WITH PET COCK, WHEEL, FLG.
3v1042 |XFLG. 3" 2 | Ea $336.50 $673.00 $468.72 $937.44) $458.96
3V1045 4" 2 | Ea $392.70 $785.40) $529.01 $1,058.02 $523.50
3v1050 6" 3 EA $500.85 $1,502.5 $766.58 $2,299.7 $762.58
3V1052 8" 2 EA $764.95 $1,529.90 $1,249.58 $2,499.1 $1,249.58
3v1160 |CHECK VALVE WITH WEIGHTED ARM 4" 4 | EA $739.75 $2,959.00 $526.32 $2,105.2 $644.78
E14 | 3V1155 6" 2 EA $996.70 $1,993.40 $696.34 $1,392.6 $857.26
E15 | 3V1165 8" 2 | EA $1,509 60 $3,019.20 $960.42 $1,920.8 $1,297.40
_ SuUB GROUPE_-A; ECCENTRIC PLUG VALVES
ECCENTRIC PLUG VALVE - FLANGED ENDS,
EA-1| 3V1110 |MILLIKEN OR EQUIVALENT 3" 1 | EA 213.00 $213 oo|| $ 210.64 $210.64)| $ 206.25
EA-2| 3v1120 4" 1 | Ea 275.25 $275.25) $ 269.47 $260.47] $ 266.67
EA-3| 3V1115 8" 1 | EA 703.20 $703.on $ 561.26 $561'2£JL$ 558.33
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m.____ L
SUB GROUP E-B; EXTENSION VALVE STEMS

EXTENSION VALVE STEMS W/CENTERING
EB-1| 3v1175 |RINGS & STAINLESS STEEL PIN. 3 5 | Ea
[EB-2] 3vi180 4 5 | Ea B $ 119.57
3V1185 5 5 | EA] $ 48.15 75 $ 125.00

| $39.634.65|

48% | ($2,4oo.oo!| 0%
| |

$37,234.65

SUB TOTAL, GROUPS E, E-A, AND E-B

FOR ALL OTHER ITEMS NOT LISTED ABOVE IN GROUPS E, LIKE ITEMS MAY BE PURCHASED
AT A FIXED PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT OFF A PUBLISHED MANUFACTUER'S PRICE LIST. $5,000.00 64%
Submit a detailed attachment is applicable.

GRAND TOTAL, GROUPS E, E-A, AND E-B
GROUP F

DUCTILE IRON PIPE & FITTINGS

{estimate only)

3F1041 |FLANGED FITINGS: BEND 90 3 5 SIGMA STES $ 40.85 || 41.68 || 41.32 $206.6
F2 | 3F1048 4 5 | EA [siGMA STES $ 65.20 65.08 $325.40) $ 64.52 $322.60}
F3 | 3F1013 6 4 | EA |SIGMA STES $ 101.50 100.90 $403.60 $ 100.04 $400 16}
F4 | 3F1016 8 5 | Ea |siGMA sTES $ 166 75 165.61 $828.05] $ 164.20 $821.00{
F5 | 3F1018 10 2 | EA |sioma sTES $ 262.40 250.34 $518.68) $ 259.89 $519.78
F6 | 3F1051 12 2 | EA [sioma sTES $ 340.30 | 336.38 $672 76 $ 337.10 $674.20
F7 | 3F1116 [TEE 3 5 | EA |SIGMA STES $ 59.65 | 59.59 $297.95) $ 59.08 $295.40f
F8 | 3F1121 4 5 | EA |SIGMA STES $ 113.00 112.97 $564.85|| $ 112.00 || $560.00f
Fo | 3F1128 8 5 | EA [SIGMA STES $ 247.70 244.87 $1,224.35(| $ 245.39 $1,226.95§
F10 | 3F1076 |FLANGE TAPPED D.I. 4%2 5 | EA |SIGMA STES $ 38.75 38.75 | $193.75 $ 38.42 $192 104
F11 | 3F1081 6x2 5 | EA [SIGMA STES $ 53.72 53.74 | $268.70)f $ 53.28
F12 | 3F1084 8x2 5 EA [SIGMA STES $ 83.35 83.35 $416.75) $ 82.86 $414
F13 | 3F1021 |6" BLIND FLANGED.I. 6" 5 | EA |siomA STES $ 43.13 4268 $213.40f| $ 42.77 $213.
F14 | 3F1023 |8" BLIND FLANGE 8" 4 |Ealsiomastes  |I$ 72.75 71.98 $287.92] $ 7213 $288 5
F15 | 3F1031 |CROSSES D.l. FLANGED 6" 2 | EA |sicma sTES $ 202.90 200.74 $401 48] $ 20117 $402.3
EPDM SAFETY ORANGE, FULL FACE RUBBER Specification
F16 | 3F1135 |GASKETS %" 3 12 | EA |Rubber Products || $ 6.31 6.91 $82.97| $ 6.91 $82.9
EPDM SAFETY ORANGE, FULL FACE RUBBER Specification
F17 | 3F1140 |GASKETS %" 4 60 | EA |Rubber Products || $ 7.37 $442 20] $ 8.06 $483.60] $ 8.06 $483.6
EPDM SAFETY ORANGE, FULL FACE RUBBER Specification
F18 | 3F1145 |GASKETS %" 6 25 | EA |Rubber Products || $ 8.81 $220.25] $ 9.41 $235.25(| $ 9.64 $241.0
EPDM SAFETY ORANGE, FULL FACE RUBBER Specification
F19 | 3F1150 |GASKETS %" 8 10 | EA |Rubber Products || $ 13.70 $137.00f| $ 14.48 $144.80|| $ 14.99 9
EPDM SAFETY ORANGE, FULL FACE RUBBER Specification
F20 | 3F1155 |GASKETS %" 10 50 | EA |RubberProducts | $ 2348 $1,174.00§ $ 24.82 $1,241.00]| $ 25.69
STZR, SIGMA,
F21 | 3K1005 |MJKIT LESS GLAND 3 5 EA |TYLER, UNION $ 9.55 $47.75]| $ 13.41 $67.05/ $ 11 96
STZR, SIGMA,
F22 | 3K1010 |MJ KIT LESS GLAND & 45 | EA |TYLER, UNION $ 10.25 $461.25l $ 16.10 $724,5o|| $ 14.70
STZR, SIGMA,
F23 | 3K1015 |MJ KIT LESS GLAND 6 210 | EA |TYLER, UNION |l$ 12.70 | $2,667.00{ $ 18 45 $3,874 5o|| $ 17.04 “
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: : Ferguson Waterwo k Fortiline | HD S ly Wat ks, Ltd.
|_IEB #16:2280B1S - Water and Sewer Materials and Accessories —‘ g l T
PRODUCT DESCRIPTION

T — STZR, SIGMA, ]I_—'—Ili _||_
3K1020 |MJ KIT LESS GLAND 8 20 | EA |TYLER, UNION $ $ 23.63 $472.601 $ 22.35 $447.0
STZR, SIGMA,
F25 | 3K1025 |MJKIT LESS GLAND 10 5 | ea [rvier,unoN || $ $ 20.07 $145_35||$ 27.80 $139.0
STZR, SIGMA,
F26 | 3K1030 |MJKIT LESS GLAND 12 8 | EA |TYLER, UNION $ $ 36.55 $292.401 $ 34 96 $279.6
STZR, SIGMA,
F27 | 3K1056 |MJ KIT WITH GLAND 14 5 | EA |rviEr,unON i § $ 46.62 || $233.100 $ 46 87 $234.3
STZR, SIGMA, :
F28 | 3K1057 |MJ KIT WITH GLAND 16 8 | EA {TYLER, UNION ;ﬂs $ 51.31 I’ $410.48||$ 51 .59|| $412.724
STZR, SIGMA, |
F29 | 3M1535 |MJ GASKET 4 5 EA |TYLER, UNION $ $ 7.41 $37.05 & 8.04 $40.208
STZR, SIGMA,
F30 | 3M1540 |MJ GASKET 8 5 | EA JTvLER,UNION || $ 7.85 || $39.25)| $ 8.55 $42.75)| $ 8.91 $44.550
STZR, SIGMA, b
F31 | 3m1545 |MJ GASKET 8 5 | EA |TYLER, UNION 4’3 9.75 ” $48.75)| $ 10.62 H $53.10] $ 13.48 $67 40}
STZR, SIGMA, :
F32 | 3M1550 |MJ GASKET 10 5 | Ea |vier unon I $ 13.05 $65.25) $ 13.92 $69.60||$ 15.98 $79.908
STZR, SIGMA,
F33 | 3M1555 |MJ GASKET 12 5 | EA [rvier,union || $ 16.50 $82.50) $ 17.39 $86.950 $ 22.39 $111.95)
STZR, SIGMA, i
F34 | 3M1560 |TRANSITION GASKET 3 5 | Ea frvier,union || $ 9.95 || $49.75) $ 10.73 || $53.65[ $ 9.57 $47.85
STZR, SIGMA, i
F35 | 3M1565 |TRANSITION GASKET 4 15 | EA |ryEr, unioN || § 10.50 $157.50 $ 15.00 $225.00] 13 70 $205.50]
F36 | 3M1570 |TRANSITION GASKET 6 10 | EA |sTRzISIGMA $ 12.45 $124 50/ $ 18.35 $183.50]| $ 16.96 | $169.604
F37 | 3m1575 |[TRANSITION GASKET 8 5 | EA |sTRziSIGMA $ 16.60 $83.00]l $ 24.02 $120.10] $ 2272 | $113.60}
F38 | 3M1580 |TRANSITION GASKET 10 5 | EA |sTRzisIGMA $ 19.55 | $97.75|| $ 28.07 || $140.35)| $ 26.85 $134.25]
F39 | 3M1585 |TRANSITION GASKET 12 5 | EA [strzisioma |8 34.90 | $174.50 $ 33.44 || $167.20 $ 33.26 $168.30]
F40 | 3K1035 |MJ GRIP RING KITS; STAR PIPE #PVGPK4 4 5 | EA |sTRzIsIGMA $ 17.00 | $85.00]| $ 32.75 $163 75 $ 32.29 $161.45]
F41 | 3K1040 |MJ GRIP RING KITS; STAR PIPE #PVGPK6 6 5 | EA |sTRzisIGMA $ 20.00 $100.00|f $ 39.85 $199.25] $ 39 30 $196.50]
F42 | 3K1045 |MJ GRIP RING KITS; STAR PIPE #PVGPK8 8 5 | EA IsTRz/SIGMA $ 28.00 $140.00f| $ 54.90 $274.50] $ 54.43 $272 15
F43 | 3K1050 |[MJ GRIP RING KITS; STAR PIPE #PVGPK10 10 5 | EA |sTRzISIGMA $ 38.00 $190.00] $ 87.72 $438.60)| $ 87.44 $437 204
F44 | 3K1055 |MJ GRIP RING KITS: STAR PIPE #PVGPK12 12 5 | EA |sTRzis1GMA $ 42.00 $210.00)| $ 96.57 $482.85] $ 97.29 $486.45
F45 | 3M1167 |MECHANICAL JOINT FITTINGS: MJ 90 3 2 | EA |sTRzisiGmMA $ 32.25 $64.50) $ 3217 || $64.34]| $ 31.90 $63.80f
F46 | 3M1172 4 2 | EA |sTRzISIGMA $ 35.15 || $70.30/| $ 35.10 $70.200| $ 34.80 $69.604
F47 | 3M1177 6 2 | EA [sTRz/SIGMA $ 57.45 | $114.90|| $ 57.40 $114.80]| $ 56.91 $113.82
F48 | 3M1182 8 2 | EA [sTRziSIGMA $ 83 80 $167.60|| $ 82.83 $165.66|| $ 83.01 $166.0
F49 | 3M1187 10 5 | EA |sTRzisIGMA $ 132.55 $662.75|| $ 129.56 $647.80]| $ 131.22 $656.1
F50 | aM1127 [MJ 45 4 2 | Ea [sTRzISIGMA $ 28.95 $57.90|| $ 28.88 $57.76|| $ 28.64 | $57.2
F51 | 3M1133 6 5 | EA |sTRzIsIGMA $ 46.85 46.80 |l $234 .00l $ 46.40 || $232.0
F52 | 3M1137 8 5 | EA |sTRzISIGMA $ 58.55 66.91 $334.55|| $ 67.06 $335.3
F53 | am1372 |MJ TEE 4 5 | EA |sTRZISIGMA $ 47.25 || 46.66 $233.30|1 $ 46.76 $233.80
F54 | 3M1387 6 5 | EA |sTRZISIGMA $ 83.05 | 81.24 $405.20] $ 82.28 $411.4
F55 | 3M1422 |MJ REDUCING TEES 8x6 2 | EA [sTRZISIGMA $ 103.60 $207.20] $ 101.28 $202.56{ $ 102.58 $205.1
F56 | 3M1487 |MJ L/P SLEEVE DI 4" LONG 5 | EA |sTrzisiomA $ 30.45 $152.25|| $ 30.34 $151 70]| $ 30.09 | $150.4
Fs57 | 3M1473 6" LONG | 30 | EA [sTRz/siGMA $ 53.90 $1,617.00) $ 53.74 | $1.612.208 $ 53.28 || $1,598.4
F58 | 3M1507 16" LONG 5 | EA |sTRzisiGMA $ 258.20 248.87 $1,244.35) $ 257.36 $1,286.8
F59 | 3M1277 |MJ REDUCER DI 6x3 2 | ea |strRzisigma $ 38.85 38.75 $77.50} $ 3842 $76.841
F60 | 3M1282 6x4 5 | EAlstRzisioma || § 33.35 | 33.27 $166.35|| $ 32.99 $164.95)]
il Fe1 | 3m1297 8x6 2 | EA|sTRzisigMa || 8 48.75 | 48.62 $07.24|| $ 48.21 $96.42|
| Fe2 | 3m1322 12 x 10 2 | Ealstrzisiema {8 92.30 || 91.15 $182.30l] $ 91.34 $182.68)
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IFB #16-2289BLS - Water and Sewer Materials and Accessories 4_ FAIusoRWatsow Orks HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd. i
- TmMme stocktit,,,....... — NI I MEG/PART | i' S 5
rew| | _ |

| ITEM| ": PRODUCT DESCRIPTION

F63 | 3M1072 |MJ CAP 6 5 STRZ/SIGMA $ 23.90 | $119.50( $ 23.76 | $118.80]| $ 23 56 $117.80)
F64 | 3M1097 |MJ TAPx 2" FIPT CAPS 4 4 | eA [strzisioma $ 24.60 $98.40}f $ 24.49 $97.96)| S 24.29 $97.16
F65 | 3M1102 6 2 | EA |STRz/sIGMA $ 34.85 || $69.70]| $ 34.73 $60.46) $ 34.43 $68.86]
F66 | 3M1242 |MJ TAP PLUG x 2" FIPT 3 2 | EAlstRzisicma | 27.55 $55.10) $ 27.42 $54.84f| $ 27.19 $54.38)
F67 | 3M1247 4 2 EA |STRZ/SIGMA $ 26.05 $52 10[| $ 26.96 $51.9§l $ 25.74 $51 48]
F68 | aM1252 6 2 | EA |sTRzZISIGMA 3 39.25 $78.50|| 30.12 $78.24)| $ 38.78 $77.50]
F69 | 3M1262 10 2 | EA lsTRzisiGMA $ 84.30 $168.60] $ 82.32 $164.64)l $ 83.37 || $166.74]
F70 | 3M1263 12 1 | A [sTrzisigMA $ 86.35 $86.35(| $ 84.46 | $84.46] $ 85,54 $85.54]
F71 | 3M1214 [PLUGS DIMJ 3 4 | EA [sTRZISIGMA $ 16.90 | $67.60 $ 16.82 $67.28 $ 16.67 $66.68]
F72 | 3M1222 6 4 | EA |sTRz/SIGMA $ 28.65 $114 60| $ 28.52 $114.08) $ 28.27 $113.084
F73 | 3M1022 |CROSSES MJ 6 3 | EA |sTrRzisioMA $ 121.00 $363 00} $ 118.11 $354.33] $ 119.62 $358.86]
F74 | 3M1008 [M.J. 11-1/4 6 3 | EA [sTRzisIGMA $ 44.35 $133.05|| $ 43.77 $131.31)| $ 43.86 $131.58
F75 | 3M1036 |M.J. 22-1/2 6 4 | EA |sTrRzisIGMA $ 42.90 $171.60f| $ 42.32 $169.28]l $ 42.41 $169.64]
F76 | 3H1110 |MJ x SWIVEL TEE 6x6 10 | EA |sTRz/SIGMA $ 46.00 $460.00f| $ 94.26 $942.60|f $ 94.97 $949.70]
F77 | 3H1115 8x6 4 | EA [sTRzISIGMA $ 120.60 $482.40f| $ 117.75 $471.00|f $ 119.25 $477.00}
F78 | 3H1120 10 x 6 4 | EA |sTRzISIGMA $ 148.70 $594.80]f $ 144 54 $578.16] $ 147.16 $588.64)
MEGALUG RESTRAINERS FOR DUCTILE IRON
F79 | 3K1080 |PIPE; EBBA OR STAR 3 #1103 4 | EA |sTRziSIGMA $ 12.00 $48.00) $ 13.73 $54.92) § 12.88 || $51.5
F80 | 3K1085 4 #1104 5 | EA |sTRz/sIGMA $ 12 95 $64.75] $ 14,55 $72.75) § 13.65 $68.2
F81 | 3K1090 6 #1106 60 | EA |sTRzisiGMA $ 15.20 || $912.00|| $ 17.10 $1,026.00|f $ 16.04 $962.4
F82 | 3K1095 8 #1108 10 | EA [sTRz/sIGMA 3 22.80 $228.00] $ 25.70 $257.00] $ 2412 $241.2
F83 | 3K1100 10 #1110 15 | EA [sTRz/SIGMA $ 33.70 $505.50|| $ 37.67 || $565.05{| $ 35.75 | $536.2
F84 | 3K1105 12 #1112 2 | ea |sTrRzisioMA $ 49.40 $98.80] $ 54.28 52.08 | $104.1
F85 | 3K1107 16 #1116 5 | EA |sTRzisicmA $ 89.90 $449 .50} $ 96.36 95.02 $475.10f
F86 | 3K1109 |FOR C900 3 #003PV | 2 | EA [sTRzisigma $ 14.50 | $29.00]f $ 16.39 15.37 $30 74
F87 | 3K1110 4 #2004PV | 30 | EA |sTRz/SIGMA $ 15.60 $468.00|l $ 17.61 16.52 $495 608
F88 | 3K1115 6 #2006PV | 100 | EA |sTRzisIGMA $ 18.95 $1,895.00) $ 21.41 20.09 $2,009.00
F89 | 3K1120 8 #2008PV | 10 | EA |sTRz/SIGMA $ 28.15 $281.50|| $ 31.65 29.69 $296.90]
Foo | 3K1125 10 #2010PV| 5 | EA |sTRzISIGMA $ 53.20 $266.00] $ 59.13 56.11 $280.55}
Fo1 | 3K1130 12 #012PV| 7 | EA |sTRzISIGMA $ 56.10 $392.70]] $ 61.59 ; 59.09 $413.69)
Fo2 | 3K1135 14 #2014PV ]| 2 | EA |sTRzISIGMA $ 89.00 $178.00] $ 95.19 : 93.87 $187.74
Fo3 | 3K1140 _ |16 _#2016PV| 5 | EA |sTRzsIGMA $ 119.00 $595.00f $ 124.66 || $623.30] § 126.26 $631.30]
ADAPTER, FLANGED COUPLING, MJ x FLANGE,
Fo4 | 3A1030 |FORD.l., JCM OR EQUAL 4" 7 | EA |EBccLOSS $ 22 55 $157.85||$ 35.85 $250.95||$ 127.78 || $894 46}
F95 | 3J1035 [BELL RESTRAINT FOR C900, EBBA OR EQUAL 6" 5 EA |STRZ PRICELESS || $ 28.47 $142.3:| 3 30.53 $152.65)| § 30.27 $151.3
F96 | 3J1040 8" 5 STRZ PRICELESS || $ 49,19 $245.95(| $ 48.99 $244.95( $ 49.09 $245.4
Fo7 | 3A1053 |ADAPTOR UNIFLANGE CI - MODEL 400-C 3" 2 | ea [esccLoss $ 17 65 || $35.30] $ 32.41 | $64.82]| $ 32.13 $64.2
Fo8 | 3A1055 4" 2 | EA [eccLoss $ 23.85 | $47.70]| $ 35.48 | $70.96|| $ 3518 $70.364
F99 | 3A1060 8" 5 | EA |EBccLOSS $ 25.70 $128.50) $ 44.05 $220.25) $ 43.14 $215.7
F100| 3X1105 |POLYWRAP: BLUE 3"-8" FOR D.l. 2 | RL |rrRumBALL $ 120.00 $240.00) $ 126.00 $252.00|| $ 117 36 $234 7
F101| 3X1110 |POLYWRAP: BLUE 10"-12" FOR D.l. 2 | RL [TRUMBALL $ 156.00 $312.00][ $ 162.00 $324.00]( $ 158.90 $317.
F102] 3X1115 |POLYWRAP: BLUE 14"- 16" FORD.L. 2 | RL |TRUMBALL $ 204.00 $408.00f| $ 204.00 |f $408.00| $ 201.10 $402.2
F103| 3X1120 |POLYWRAP: PURPLE 3"-8" FORD.I. 2 | RL |[TRumBALL $ 126.00 | $252.00|| $ 147.00 || $294.00|| $ 129.23 | $258.4
F104| 3X1125 |[POLYWRAP: PURPLE 10"-12" FOR D.I. 2 | rRL |[TRUMBALL $ 171.00 | $342.00|| $ 186.00 || $372.00f| $ 176.04 | $352.0.
F105| 3X1130 |POLYWRAP: PURPLE 14"-16" FORD.I. 2 | RL [tRumBALL $ 219.00 | $438.00] $ 222.00 || $444 00f| $ 220.88 | $441.7
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HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd. |

|FB #16-2289BLS - Water and Sewer Materials and Accessories ’- ;

rew] Noween | PRODUCT DESCRIPTION -M-_ ] |
SUB TOTAL, GROUP F | [ sssa287 §37,701.88 l'

FOR ALL OTHER ITEMS NOT LISTED ABOVE IN GROUP F, LIKE ITEMS MAY BE PURCHASED AT]

A FIXED PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT OFF A PUBLISHED MANUFACTUER'S PRICE LIST. Submitaf $5,000.00 64% 62% [ ($3,100.00) 0%
detailed attachment is applicable. (estimate only) _I —|
GRAND TOTAL, GROUP F $34,706.71 s37,7u1.s
GROUP G |
MISCELLANEIOUS WATER AND SEWER REPAIR CLAMPS I
3R1005 [CLAMP - PATCH %x3 1.05]| 20 | EA |FORDFSC ‘ $4.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
G2 | 3R1010 %x6 1.05| 10 | EA JForoFsc | $8.11 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
G3 | 3R1015 1x3 1.32] 10 | EA |ForDFsc | $4 73 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
G4 3R1020 1x6 1.32 i EA |FORD FSC . $8. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
G5 | 3R1040 1%x6 190 | 4 | EA |FornFsc $9.88] NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
G6 | 3R1045 2x3 238| 4 | EA |ForpFsc $5.74) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
G7 | 3rR1050 |. 2x6 238| 4 | EA|Fororsc $10.38 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
G8 | 3R1055 |REPAIR CLAMPS: 2x7% 235-263 PVC 7 | eA |ForpF1 $26.69 NO BID NO BID NOBID | NO BID
Go | 3R1060 [2x12% 235-263 PVC 10 | EA |ForD F1 $38.02 NO BID NO BID | NO BID NO BID
G10 | 3R1065 [3x7% 395-425AC 4 | EA |Foro F1 $32.65 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID |
G11] 3R1070 [3x15 395-425AC 5 | EA [ForD Fi1 $56.90 NOBID |l NO BID NO BID NO BID i
G12| 3R1075 |CL 200 4 x 74 495-535 AC 4 | Ea [ForpFi [ $34 56] NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
G13| 3R1080 |CL 150 4 x 15 474-514 AC 5 | EA |ForD F1 $60.17, NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
G14 | 3R1090 |CL 150 6x 15 684-724 AC 5 | EA |ForDF1 $73.56 NO BID NO BID NOBID | NO BID
G15| 3R1095 |CL 150 8x 15 899-939 AC 4 EA |FORD F1 $89.37 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
G16 | 3R1100 [CL 200 10X 15 1175-1215 AC 4 | EA |[ForDF1 $1153 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
G17| 3R1140 [CL 150 4 x 7% 474-514 AC 5 | EA |ForD F1 $34.5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
G18 | 3R1145 |CL 200 4 x 15 495-535 AC 5 | EA |Forp F1 $60.1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
G19| 3R1155 [CL 200 6x 15 745-785 AC 4 | EA |ForD F1 $73 55| NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
G20 | 3R1160 [CL 200 8 x 15 927-967 AC 4 | EA |ForDF1 I $91.50, $366.00 NO BID NO BID I ~oBD | NO BID
G21| 3R1165 [C900 10 X 15 1104-1144 4 | EA [FORD F1 $115 35 $461.4 NO BID NO BID | NoBD NO BID
G22| 3R1170 [C 900 12 X 15 1310-1350 4 | EA [ForDF1 $131.20 $524.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
G23| 3R1210 [2%x 12 270-300 PVC 4 | EA |ForpF1 $40. 24 $160.96 NOBD | NO BID NO BID NO BID
G24 | 3R1215 [3x7% 346-370 PVC 4 | EA |[ForpF1 $31.53 $126.12‘ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
G25| 3R1220 [3x15 346-370 PVC 4 EA |FORD F1 $55. 50 $222.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
G26 | 3R1225 [4x7% 445-473PVC 4 | EA [ForRDF1 $32.64| $130.56 NO BID NO BID NOBID |l NO BID
G27| 3R1230 |4x15 445-473 PVC 8 | ea [ForoF | $56.90 $455.2 NO BID NO BID |  ~NoBD NO BID |
G28 | 3R1235 |6x7% 656-696 PVC 4 | EA |ForDF1 $40.69 $162.7 NOBDD | NO BID NO BID NO BID
G29 | 3R1240 |6x15 656-696 PVC 5 | EA [ForDF1 $71.7 $358.7 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
G30| 3R1245 |8x15 854-894 PVC 4 EA |FORDF1 $893 $357. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
HYDRAULIC REPAIR COUPLINGS- 2.10 - 2.60 TOTAL PIPING |
G31| 3R1200 |MINIMUM O.D. RANGE, #2000-0303 - 260 2" 8 | EA [soLuTions $82 80| $662.4 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3.46 - 4.33 MINIMUM O.D. RANGE, #2000-0433 - TOTAL PIPING
G32 | 3R1295 [260 3" 8 | EA |soLuTions $108 45 $867.6 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4.25 - 5,63 MINIMUM O.D. RANGE, #2000-0563 - TOTAL PIPING J || ﬂ <ﬂ
G33| 3R1300 260 4" 10 | EA |SOLUTIONS $139.65 $1,396.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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IFB #16-2289BLS - Water and Sewer Materials and Accessories _ Ferguson Walsranchs

] ‘owse -
E M PRODUCT DESCPTON

Fortlllne Inc.

HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.

MF
numeers P S b 1

6.42 - 7.68 MINIMUM O.D. RANGE, #2000-0768 - TOTAL PIPING | ‘
3R1305 |260 EA |SOLUTIONS $184 30 $2,764.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID |
8.54 - 9.84 MINIMUM O.D. RANGE, #2000-0984 - TOTAL PIPING '
G35 | 3R1310 |260 8" 5 | EA |soLuTions $208.70 $1,043.5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID |
10.7 -12.0 Mm - TOTAL PIPING
G36 | 3R1350 |260 10" 4 | EA |SOLUTIONS $269.95 $1,079.80 NO BID NO BID n NO BID NO BID |
12.4 -13.66 MINIMUM O.D. RANGE, #2000-1366 - TOTAL PIFING
G37| 3R1315 |260 12" 4 EA |SOLUTIONS $317.70 $1,270.8 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOTAL PIPING
G38| 3R1265 |10.96-12.26 3R1265 10" OVERSIZE, #2000-1226-260 3 EA |SOLUTIONS $288.65 $865.9 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
G39| 3C1175 |Compression Cplg GALVANIZED % 00840 | 4 | EA |rELsco $9.62 $38.48 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
G40 | 3C1180 % 1050 | 5 | EA hesco $10.55 $52.7 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
G41| 3c1185 1 1315 | 4 | EA |tELsco $12.44 $49.7 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 G42| 3C1190 1% 1.660 4 | EA [reLsco $15.92 $63. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
G43 | 3C1195 1% 1.900 5 EA |TELSCO $18.3 $91. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
G44 | 3C1200 2 2.375 | 20 | EA |rELsco $23.0 $461.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FLEXIBLE COUPLINGS: CLAY x IPS PVC
G45| 381125 |FERNCO 4x4 50 | EA |FESNCO $3.51 $175.5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
G46 | 351145 6x4 5 | EA |Fesnco $3.82] $44.10 NOBID | NO BID | NO BID NO BID
G47 | 381150 6x6 100 | EA [FESNCO $7.52| $752.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID |
G48 | 351175 8x6 30 | EA [FEsnco $14.06]| NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
G49 | 381170 8x8 10 | EA |FESNCO $11.5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
G50 | 351130 [IPS PVC x IPS PVC FERNCO 4x4 75 | EA [FESnco $3.51 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
G51 | 351133 4x3 8 | EA |resnco $3 81 NOBID | NO BID NO BID NO BID
G52 | 351140 6x4 100 | EA |FESNCO $8.82]l NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 cs53| 3s1155 8x6 40 | EA |reEsnco $7.52 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
|| G54 | 351185 8x6 5 | EA [FEsnco fl $139 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
351180 8x8 10 | EA |FESNCO $115 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
351135 |CLAY x CLAY FERNCO 4x4 4 | EA |FESnco $3.7 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
351165 8x8 4 EA |FESNCO $12.49 NO BID NO BID NO BID NQ BID
SERVICE TAPPING SADDLES—2 x 1 PVC (2.8 -
371025 |2.50) FORD S70 6 | EA |ForD $14 41 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
aT1140 |4x2 PVC (4.25- 4.50) 325SERIES | 4 | EA |sMITHBLAR $90.80{] $363.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3T1150 [6x1 PVC (6.50 - 6.63) 325 SERIES | 20 | EA |smiTH BLAR $90.15 $1,803.0 NO BID | NO BID NO BID NO BID
3T1155 [6x2 PVC (6.50 - 6.63) 325SERIES | 5 | EA |sMiTHBLAR $103.15 $515.7 NO BID | NO BID NO BID NO BID
371160 [8x1 PVC (8.50 - 8.63) 325SERIES | 10 | EA [sMITHBLAIR $111.70 $1,117.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID I NO BID
3T1165 [8x2 PVC (8.50 - 8.63) 325SERIES | 3 | EA |sMITHBLAR $117.55 $352.65| NO BID _|l NO BID “ NO BID NO BID 1
371170 [10x 2 PVC (10.60 - 10.75) 325 SERIES 3 | EA |sMTHBLAR $150. 60|| $451 80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3T1175 [12x2 PVC (12.75 - 13.50) 325SERIES | 3 | EA |smiTHBLAR 1J> $1737 $521.2 NO BID fl NO BID NO BID n NO BID i
371035 [4x1 ACDI (4.80-5.57) FORD 202BS | 10 | EA |Forp $74. 5 $745.4 NOBID | NO BID NO BID NO BID
371045 [4x2ACDI (4.80-5.57) FORD202BS | 5 | EA $89.9 $449.5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
371050 [6x1ACDI (6.90 - 7.56) FORD 202BS | 40 | EA $87.7 $3,511. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3T1055 |6x2AC,Dl (6.90 - 7.56) FORD202BS | 30 | EA $104.75 $3,142.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
371060 [8x1ACDI (9.05-9.74) FORD202BS | 5 | EA $108.65] $543.2 NOBID | NO BID NO BID NO BID
371065 [8x2 AC,DI (9.05-9.74) FORD202BS | 5 | EA |Forp $117.05 $585.2 NOBID | NO BID NO BID NO BID
371070 |10x2 AC,DI (11.10-12.12) FORD202BS | 5 | EA |ForD $149.25 $746.2 NO BID NO BID NOBID | NO BID
371075 [12x2 AC,DI (13.20 - 14.38) FORD202BS | 5 | EA [ForD $171.85 $859.2 NO BID NO BID NOBID | NO BID
371085 [16x 2 AC,DI (17.40 - 19.19) FORD202BS | 5 | EA |rorD $447.70 $2,238.50 NO BID NO BID NOBID | NO BID
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IFB #16-2289BLS - Water and Sewer Materials and Accessories

TOCK
ITEM NUMBER

Ferguson Waterworks

7 PRODUCT DESCRIPTION
G75] 371033 BRONZE E TAPPING SADDLES- 3 X 1 DI,CI,C00 (3.80- 4.29) _ JForo $44 55 $445.50
[ G76 | 311040 |BRONZE TAPPING SADDLES- 3 X 2 DI,C1,C900 (3.80- 4.29) 5 EA FORD $47.89 $239.4
“ G77 | 3T1047 |4 X 2 DI,C1,C900 {4.80 - 5.00) ] 5 | EA [ForD $47 80|l $239.00
G78 | 3T1101 |24 X 2 DI,C1,C905 (25.80 - 26.32) 2 | Ea |Forp $154.05 $308.10
G79 | 371148 |PVC,AC (4.36 - 5.66)+D543 2 EA FORD $78.7 $157.40 NO BID NO BID
G80 | 3T1027 |EQUAL g2 13 Copper Tube Size) ROMAC $35.3 $707.00 NO BID NO BID
SUB TOTAL, GROUPG |
FOR ALL OTHER ITEMS NOT LISTED ABOVE IN GROUP G, LIKE ITEMS MAY BE PURCHASED
AT A FIXED PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT OFF A PUBLISHED MANUFACTUER'S PRICE LIST. $5,000.00 52% %
Submit a detailed attachment is applicable. ( estimate only)
| GRAND TOTAL GROUP G |
GROUPH
_ METER AND VALVE BOXES & RELATED ACCESSORIES BOXES & RELATED ACCESSORIES
3W1005 [1910 OR EQUIVALENT. (LID PAINTED BLUE, MARKED WATER). SIGMA $33.95 NO BID
[ID ONLY, C.I, FORPOTA NWATER METER ||
3W1050 |BOXES, PAINTED BLUE, MARKED WATER 100 | EA |sicma $11.44 NO BID
TID ONLY, C.I. FOR POTABLE CAST IRON WATER METER ||
3W1051 |BOXES, PAINTED BLUE, MARKED WATER (WITH 2" HOLE) 25 | EA |sicma $11.38 $284.50 NO BID
[0 ONLY, C.I., RUS'S'EEL‘L'C‘EIEW?T"X‘T‘%"‘UNP- ; "UNPAINTED,
3W1001 |(WITH PICK HOLE 10 | EA |siema $9.8 $98.40 NO BID
LTD ONLY, C.I., RLRS'S'EEL_L_C_SEWW"_UNP— ; TUNPAINTED,
3W1002 |(WITH 2" HOLE{ 10 | EA |siema $9.00 $90.00 NO BID
: 2 1 , ROME
3W1010 |1910 OR EQUIVALENT (LID PAINTED PURPLE, MARKED 4 | EA |siema $33 80 $135.20 NO BID
[0 ONLY, C.I., FOR RECLAIMED CAST IRON WATER METER
3W1055 |BOXES, PAINTED PURPLE, MARKED RECLAIM 4 | EA |siema $10.80 $43.20 NO BID
[ID ONLY, C.I., FOR RECLAIMED CAST IRON WATER METER ||
3W1056 |BOXES, PAINTED PURPLE, MARKED RECLAIM, (WITH2"HOLE) | 4 | EA |sicma $10.80 $43.20 NO BID
3aw1100 |WASHER, METER RUBBER, 3/4" x 1/8" 7,000 | EA |BAYWHOLESALE $0.08| $560.00) NO BID
3W1101 |WASHER, METER RUBBER, 3/4" x 1/16" 3,500 | EA |BAYWHOLESALE $0.07 $245.0 NO BID
3W1015 |METER BOX , #OKDK-15 ONLY, 17" x 30" BOX FOR 2" METER 3 | EA |cisson prw $79.5 $238.5 NO BID
CISSON EAST
3W1016 |LID FOR ABOVE BOX, OKDK-5 ONLY, 17" x 30" LID 3 | ea |JorpaN || $93.7 $281.10 NO BID ; :
3W1045 |VALVE BOX CL W/SQUARE LID MARKED RECLAIMED 17 | EA [SIGMASTRZ $41.73 $709.41 NO BID NO BID $69.57 $1,182.6
VALVE BOX E BOX 1O
3W1021 |DELIVERED ASSEMBLED AND IN CRATES 100 | EA |PrRORELEICT $20.37 $2,037.00 NO BID NO BID $26.20 $2,620.0
351008 |LID ONLY FOR 2 PIECE VALVE BOX MARKED SEWER 7 | EA |prorELEICT $6.32 $4424]  NOBID NO BID $6.52] $45.6
STRZ, SiGMA
3W1025 |LID ONLY FOR 2 PIECE VALVE BOX MARKED WATER 100 | EA |PRORELEICT 36,32" $632.0 NO BID NO BID $6.52 $652.0
Extra Deep Covers for high traffic areas, series 6800 13 | EA |EJ Water Solutions $32_98|| $428.7 NO BID NO BID $27.17 $353.21E
3W1065 |LID ONLY FOR SQUARE VALVE BOX MARKED RECLAIM 5 | Ea |sicma $31.9 $159.50 NO BID NO BID I $13.04 $65.2
STRZ, SIGMA
3W1030 |VALVE BOX RISER 1", FOR 461-S, 3-PIECE 30 | EA |PRORELEICT || $4.2 $127.80 NO BID NO BID $4.26 $127.8
STRZ, SIGMA
3W1035 |VALVE BOX RISER 1%", FOR 461-S, 3-PIECE 25 | EA |PRORELEICT || $5.96 $149.00 NO BID || NO BID $5.97 $149.2
STRZ, SIGMA
|| H21 | 3w1040 |VALVE BOX RISER 2" FOR 461-S, 3-PIECE 40 | EA |PRORELEICT L $7.50 $300.00 NO BID || NO BID $7 46, $298.4
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IFB #16- 22898LS Water and Sewer Materials and Accessories -

HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.

eroocrpescreron  Jarfuw| woeew | | | | |

STRZ, SIGMA
H22 | 3w1042 |VALVE BOX RISER 3", FOR 461-S, 3-PIECE 50 | EA |PRORELEICT $9.65 $482.50 NO BID
H23 VALVE BOX RISER 2" SQUARE 9X8 RECLAIMED, 15 | EA [ReliCorp $63 85 $957.75 NO BID
H24 VALVE BOX RISER 3" SQUARE 9X8 RECLAIMED, 15 | EA |Rell cop $69.15 NO BID
H25 | 351005 |CLEANQUTS #7621 100 | EA |sioma usF $27.65 NO BID : ]
H26 | 351015 |MANHOLE RING TRAFFIC #170 100 | EA |usrF $77. NO BID $87. $8,744.00]
MANHOLE COVER TRAFFIC #170E, LIDS MUST BE MARKED !
[ H27 | 351010 [MANATEE COUNTY SANITARY SEWER" AND YEAR 100 | EA |usrF $84.44 NO BID $182.80 $18,280.00f
7WB - SS
RAINSTOPPE
MANHOLE INFLOW PROTECTORS STAINLESS|RS or Inflow
H2s | 351018 |STEEL 23-3/4 Systems Equal INFLAW SHIELD $92.0 $18,410.00 NO BID $34
I SUB TOTAL,GROUPH Il
FOR ALL OTHER ITEMS NOT LISTED ABOVE IN GROUP H, LIKE ITEMS MAY BE PURCHASED
AT A FIXED PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT OFF A PUBLISHED MANUFACTUER'S PRICE LIST. $5,000.00 0% % 0%
Submit a detailed attachment is applicable. (estimate only)
[ GRAND TOTAL, GROUP H
GROUP |
FIRE HYDRANTS
[ 11 | 3H1022 [5% VALVE OPENING BURY 24" $1,685.00 $1,661.18 $1,691 39
[ 12 T sH1027 BURY 30" $1,701.50 . $1,705.86 $8.529.30f  $1,72801
13 | 3H1032 BURY 36" $1,822.50 $14,580.00f  $1,751 01 $14,008.08]  $1,764.65
14 | 3H1037 BURY 42" $1,886 50 $18,865.00) $1,80528 | $18,052.80]  $1,809.97
15 | 3H1041 BURY 48" $1,939.00 $19,390.00 $1,846.97 $18,460.70]  $1,85177
6 | 3H1043 BURY 54" $1,956.00 $7,824.00 $1,882.77 $7,531.0 $1,887.66
SUB GROUP I-A ;RELATED HYDRANT PARTS ||
I'A1 | 3H1010 |[FIRE HYDRANT GRADELOCK W/GLANDS 6x12 5 [EA I $274.80 $1,37400]  NOBD NO BID | $282.44
I-A2 | 3H1015 6 x 24 4 | EA $350.00 $1,400.00 NOBID I NO BID | $359 89
I-A3 | 3G1225 |TRACER WIRE BOXES VALCO 10 | EA $18.95 $189.50 NO BID NO BID $19.89
2% TO %"
I-A4 | 3H1130 |HYDRANT ADAPTOR NOZZLE MALE 10 | EA $14.56 $145.60 NO BID NO BID $12.07
I-A5 | 3L1245 |HYDRANT OIL A-51 10 | GA $29.75 $297.50 NO BID NO BID $39.63
I-A6 | 3H1125 |HYDRANT WRENCH - ADJUSTABLE HANDLE 10 | EA $16.95 | $169.50  NOBID NO BID $17 33
I-A7 | 3H1127 |HYDRANT WRENCH- RECLAIM 5 | Ea $89.00 | $445.00 NO BID NO BID | $51.93
|| SUB GROUP |-B ;TRAFFIC REPAIR KITS 340, AMERICAN DARLING ONLY.- OEM
[ 1-B1] 3H1050 |5% VO EXTENSION 6" 4 | EA AFC $283.30 $1,133.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1-B2 | 3H1060 | I 1P 4 | EA AFC $311.50 $1,246.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
AMERICAN DARLING B-84-B 5% HYDRANT ||
I-B3 VALVE 4 | Ea] AFC84-41 $73.80 $295.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
I-B4 | 3H1140 |AMERICAN DARLING B-84-B 5% TRAFFIC REPAIR KIT 5 | Ea AFC $178.95 $894.75]  NOBID NO BID i NOBID NO BID
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IEB #16-2289BLS - Water and Sewer Materials and Accessories HD Supply Watsrworks; 1td:

- Ferguson Waterworks | Fortiline Inc.
L e e
UL : PRODUCT DESCRIPTION

1-B5 | 3H1235 |AMERICAN DARLING B-62-B TRAFFIC REPAIR KIT 4 | EA AFC $187.05 $748.20 NO BID NO BID

NO BID ‘

TRAFFIC REPAIR KITS 340, KENNEDY 5% VO || ,
NO BID $367.22 $1,101 .

SUB GROUP I-C; TRAFFIC REPAIR KITS 340, KENNEDY ONLY. - OEM | ’l

I-C1 | 3H1045 |EXTENSION 8" 3 EA Kennedy $330.55 $991.6 NO BID

I-c2 | 3H1065 12" 4 | Ea Kennedy $386.00 $1,544.0 NO BID NO BID $428.87 $1,715.48f
I-c3| K8151 |KENNEDY K-81 MAIN VALVE KIT 5 1/4 4 | EA | 1585MVRKRNC $301.00 $1,204.00 NOBD | NO BID $238.00 $952.00f
I-C4 | 3H1145 |[KENNEDY K-81-A TRAFFIC REPAIRKIT 5

SUB GROUP I-D; TRAFFIC REPAIR KITS 340, MUELLER A-423 ONLY. - OEM ||
TRAFFIC REPAIR KITS 340, MUELLER A-423; 5%

EA Kennedy $149.55 $747.75 NO BID ﬂ NO BID $166.12 $830.654

I-D1| 3H1070 |VO EXTENSION 6" 3 | EA| Muelier 340 $281.96 $845.8 NO BID
I-D2 | 3H1055 12" 3 | EA| Mueller 340 $332.70 $998.10 NOBID I NO BID $388.89 $1,166.6
I-D3 MUELLER CENTURIAN 5 1/4 Bonnet Repair Kit 3 280355 $32.10 $96.30 NO BID NO BID $5538 $166.14}

NO BID $338.89 l’ $1,016.6

$ 345.70 $1 ,037.1o|| NO BID NO BID 362.41
$ 148.60 | $445.80] NOBDD NO BID 228.38

$ 145.00 | $435.00|

$94,275.53

($1,850.00

I-D4 MUELLER CENTURIAN 5 1/4 Main Valve Repair Kit 3 280359
I-D5 MUELLER CENTURIAN 5 1/4 Shoe Repair Kit 3 280357

I-D6 | 3H1150 |MUELLER CENTURIAN 5% TRAFFIC REPAIR KIT 3 EA | Mueller 340

SUB TOTAL, GROUPS |, I-A, I-B, I-C, AND I-D

FOR ALL OTHER ITEMS NOT LISTED ABOVE IN GROUPS |, LIKE ITEMS MAY BE PURCHASED
AT A FIXED PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT OFF A PUBLISHED MANUFACTUER'S PRICE LIST.
Submit a detailed attachment is applicable.

GRAND TOTAL, GROUPS |, I-A, I-B, I-C, AND I-D

133.33

NO BID

I___ $74,896.86|

$5,000.00
{estimate only) _I

_

37%

I

$92,425.53

No Bid: Bert Lowe Supply
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