MANATEE COUNTY GOVERNMENT

Authorization to award IFB 09- June 8, 2009
0897-0OV — Replacement ,
SUBJECT | Pumps for Lift Stations DATE POSTED Date Posted on (/ /g! z
(Various Locations) mym natg -0rg
By: :
Z
PURCHASING DATE CONTRACT
REPRESENTATIVE | Olga Valcich, Ext. 75627 SHALL BE AWARDED | June 15, 2009/7 .
Financial Management CONSEQUENCES 1r //@ UV
DEPARTMENT Dept /Purchasing Div. DEFERRED | N/A ‘ W
Barney’s Pumps, Inc., | \
SOURCE Lakeland, FL 33812 AUTHORIZED BY R.C. “Rob” Cuthbert, CPM, CPPO
RECOMMENDATION | (Reg. No. R039570) DATE | June 8, 2009

ACTION DESIRED

Authorization to award IFB#09-0897-OV to the lowest responsive, responsible bidder meeting all aspects of the terms and
conditions, and specifications to Barney’s Pumps, Lakeland, FL total bid of $228,249.00.

ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITY

Federal/State law(s), administrative ruling(s), Manatee County Comp Plan/Land Development Code, ordinances, resolutions, policy.)

Ordinance 08-43, Purchasing Code Article 4E(2)

BACKGROUND/DISCUSSION

o The project involves the procurement of Submersible Pumps only. Installation of Submersible Pumps to be
performed by Manatee County Personnel at forty-eight (48) various lift stations throughout Manatee County.

e Background / discussion continued on page 2.

e Funding Source: Utility Rates.

SUMMARY

ATTACHMENTS:

(List in order as

attached)

INSTRUCTIONS TO BOARD RECORDS:

Department Memorandum dated
May 6, 2009

Bid Tabutation

Data sheets submitted by
Custom Pump & Controls
providing service factor of the
pumps (All items highlighted)
Copy of Technical Specifications
detailing the require service ice
factor to be a minimum of 1.5,
continuous duty (see highlighted
area)

Copy of email from Jim Marble

dated 05/28/2009
N/A
COST | $228,249.00 SOURCE (ACCT# & NAME) | 4020019707/534000/5001301/0004
AMT./FREQ. OF RECURRING COSTS
(ATTACH FISCAL IMPACT
COMMENTS | N/A STATEMENT) | N/A




June 8, 2009 — Page 2

Source Selection

IFB 09-0897-OV

Replacement Pumps for Various Lift Stations

This Invitation for Bid was issued for procurement of Submersible Pumps only. Utilities will be
replacing Submersible Pumps at forty-eight (48) various lift stations throughout the County. Pumps
shall be delivered (one time delivery) to the Utilities Department Warehouse, 66™ Street West.

03/16/2009 through 04/07/2009 appropriate bid procedures were followed. Notice of Bid availability
was broadcast to two hundred and sixty-six (266) suppliers via Onvia DemandStar and
www.mymanatee.org. Eleven (11) supplemental suppliers were added to the list. Thirty-eight (38)
bidders obtained copies of the bid and fifteen (15) bids were received

Listed are the bids received in ascending dollar value:

Base Bid

1. Custom Pumps & Controls, Inc., Tampa, FL $225,523.00
2. Barney's Pumps, Inc., (Homa Pumps), Lakeland, FL $228,249.00
3. Barney’s Pumps, Inc., (Hydromatic Pumps), Lakeland, FL ~ $241,365.00
4. Southeastern Pump, Ft. Lauderdale, FL $247,296.08
5. Mader Electric Motors, North Ft. Myers, FL $285,616.36
6. Hudson Pump & Equipment, Lakeland, FL $287,881.00
7. Coast Pump & Supply Co., Venice, FL $296,491.40
8. Power & Pumps, Jacksonville, FL $352,374.00
9. Technical Sales Corporation, Tampa, FL $353,793.00
10. Tampa Armature Works, Inc., Riverview, FL $362,307.00
11. PX Pumps, USA, LLC, Sanford, FL $392,422.57
12. Griffin Pump & Equipment, Co., Houston, TX $451,020.00
13. ABS USA, Sanford, FL $485,5622.00
14 |TT Water & Wastewater Florida,LLC, Apopka, FL $568,192.00
15. Godwin Pumps of America, Inc., Bridgeport, NJ No Bid

Although Custom Pumps & Controls, Inc., Tampa, FL is the apparent low bidder at $225,523.00, the
proposed electric motors show a service factor of 1.0 for 9 of the 48 locations where the
submersible pumps will be installed. Technical Data provided by Custom Pump & Controls, Inc,, is
attached for further reference. The bid specification requirements state the electric motors are to
meet a minimum service factor of 1.15. See attached for reference.

Attached email dated May 28, 2009 from Mr. Jim Marble, Utilities Superintendent states he spoke
with Mr. William Sagatys, Senior Engineering Specialist for Public Works who wrote the pump
specifications for the Manatee County Utility Standards. Mr. Sagatys states that pumps performing
with a higher service factor provide a cushion before the motor overloads. In other words, a motor
with a service factor of 1.15 is less likely to overload or burn out than a motor with a service factor of
1.0. Mr. Sagatys’ recommended we accept the pumps with the higher service factor as specified in
our Invitation for Bid.

The price difference between Barney's Pumps, Inc., (Homa Pumps) and Custom Pumps & Controls
is approximately 1.2%

The funding source for this contract is Utility Rates.



MEMORANDUM

PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT

Project Management Division > Phone: 941-708-7450
1022 26th Avenue E. X Fax: 941-708-7549
Bradenton, FIL 34208 MANATEE COUNTY Www.mymanatee.org
FLLORIDA
To: R.C. "Rob" Cuthbert, C.P.M., Purchasing Manager
From: Timothy A. Hochuli, P.E., Deputy Director .
s/elo7

Date: May 6, 2009

Subject:  Replacement Pumps for Lift Stations - Various Locations
Barney’s Pumps, Inc (Homa Pumps)
Recommendation for Award - IFB 09-0897-OV

The bids for the above referenced project have been reviewed by staff. The bid tabulation form is
attached for your review. It is recommended that the contract be awarded to the lowest responsive,
responsible bidder, Barney’s Pumps, Inc. (providing Homa Pumps) in the amount of $228,249.00
and in accordance with the terms and conditions of the bid package. The apparent low bidder,
Custom Pumps & Controls, Inc., proposed providing pumps that did not meet the IFB requirements
at 9 of the 48 locations. Specifically the proposed pumps in question did not meet the bid
specifications requirement for the electric motors having a minimum service factor of 1.15. The
funding source for this contract is Utility Rates.

Please contact Salvatore Bordonaro Jr. if you have any questions regarding the attached
documents.

Thank you for your continued assistance.

Cc: Dan Gray, Director, Utilities
Ron Schulhofer, Director, Public Works
Bruce Simington, Project Management Division Manager
Salvatore Bordonaro Jr., Project Manager
Stacey Stinton, Administrative Assistant, w/enc.
Marlene Marlatt, Administrative Coordinator |
Project File: 0019707 - 9.1

PARRY BUSTLE * DRCGWENDOLYN Y. BROWN * JOHN CHAPPIE * RON GETMAN * DONNA G. HAYES * CAROL WHITMORE * JOE MCCILASH
District | District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7

SHPGM RN ProjectManagersisbordonaro\Projects\Utiities\Wastewaten\Satellite Lift Stations\Lift Station Upgrades\RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD 99 PUMPS 42
09 doc



MEMORANDUM

Financial Management Dept
Purchasing Division Phone: 941.749.3014

ORDM
iz haee e sests NFANATEE COUNTY e amancao
Bradenton, FL 34205 www.mymanatee.org

FLORIDA

Subject:  Revised Tabulation — IFB 09-0897-OV - Replacement Pumps for Lift Stations

To: All Bidders
From: Olga Valcich, Construction Buyer
Date: May 20, 2009

Bidders:

Attached please find the revised tabulation dated May 20, 2009 for IFB 09-0897-OV which was opened on April
7,2009.

The tabulation is being reissued as we had inadvertently omitted Technical Sales Corporation, Tampa, FL.
Please accept our apologies for the error. Should you have any questions, please contact me at 941-708-7527.

We thank you for your continued interest in the Manatee County bidding process.

Cc: Sal Bordonaro, Project Manager
Jim Marble, Utilities Superintendent

I ARRY BUSTLE * DR. GWENDOLYN Y. BROWN * JOHN R. CHAPPIE * RON GETMAN * DONNA G. HAYES * CAROL WHITMORE * JOE MCCLASH
Svsiricr District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7



REPLACEMENT PUMPS 09-08970V

BID TABULATION

BARNEY'S PUMPS,
INC. HYDROMATIC BARNEY'S PUMPS, COAST PUMP & CUSTOM PUMPS & |GODWIN PUMPS OF| **GRIFFIN PUMP &
ABS USA PUMPS INC. HOMA PUMPS SUPPLY CO. CONTROLS, INC. AMERICA, INC. EQUIPMENT, INC.***
SANFORD, FL LAKELAND, FLL LAKELAND, FL VENICE, FL TAMPA, FL BRIDGEPORT, NJ HOUSTON, TX
(800) 323-1731 (863) 665-8500 (863) 665-8500 (941) 484-3738 (813) 886-6255 (856) 467-3636 (713) 671-7000
EST. EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED | UNIT [EXTENDED] UNIT | EXTENDED
NO DESCRIPTION QTY. | U/MJ UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
1 pumping 600 GPM @ 32' T.D.H. for #12 2 ea $3,995.00 $7,950.00{ $2,194.00 $4.388.00] $2,134.00 $4,268.00| 52,389 56 $4,779.12| $1,841.00 $3,682.00] NO BID NO 8ID| $4,261.00 $8,522.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
2 pumping 320 GPM @ 43' T.0.H_ for #14 2 ea $2,866.00 $5.732.00 $1,736.00 $3,472.00| _$1,766.00 $3,532.00] $2,389.56 $4779.12| $1841.00 $3.662.00] NO BID NO BID| $4,261.00 $8,522.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
3 pumping 275 GPM @ 35' T.0.H. for #6 2 ea $2,394.00 $4.788.00] $1,682.00 $3.364.00] $1.679.00 $3,358.00] $2,240.00 $4,480.00{ $1,752.00 $3,504.00] _NO BID NO BID| $3,985.00 $7.970.00
6" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
4 pumping 800 GPM @ 35' T.0.H. for #7 2 ea $3,990.00 $7.980.00] s3A4R00 $7,206.00! €390¢0200 $7.986.00] $4.781.58 $9,583.15] _$3,577.00 $7.154.00] NO BID NO BID} $5.270.00 $10,540.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
5 ___ipumping 250 GPM @ 48 T.D.H. for 14-D 2 ea $2.866.00 $5.732.00] $1,736.00 $3.472.00] $1,766.00 $3,532.00| _$2,389 56 $4.779.12] $1,839.00 $3,678.00] NO BID NO BID| $4,261.00 $8,522.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
6 pumping 600 GPM @ 60' T.D.H_ for 15-D 2 ea $4,682.00 $9,364 00| $2,465.00 $4.930.00 $2.947.00 $5,894.00| $4,791.57 $9,563.14| $2,580.00 $5,160.00{ NO BID NO BID| $5,270.00 $10.540.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
7 pumping 200 GPM @ 25'T.D. H. for 16-D 2 ea $3,067.00 $6,134.00] $1,553.00 $3,106.00) _$1,203.00 $2,406.00| $2,109.21 $4218.42| $1,578.00 $3,158.00] NOBID NO BID| $2,357.00 $4,714.00,
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
8 pumping 275 GPM @ 25' T.D.H. for 1M-A 2 ea $2.167.00 $4,334.00] s1682.00 $3.364.00]  $1,203.00 $2,406.00| $1,998.20 $3.996.40] $1576.00 $3.156.00] NO BID NO BID| $2,357.00 $4,714.00.
6" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
9 pumping 550 GPM @ 41' T.D.H. for 21-A 2 ea $3,930.00 $7,980.00| $3,648.00 $7,296.00] $3,993 00 $7,986.00| $4,791.57 $9.563 14| $2,343.00 $4,686.00] NO BID NO BID} $8,528.00 $17,056.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
10 __{pumping 125 GPM @ 27' T.D. H. for 28-A 2 ea $2.553.00 $5.106.00| $1,553.00 $3,106.00| $1,203.00 $2,406.00{ $2,109.21 $4218.42] $1,604.00 $3.208.00] NOBID NOBID| $2,357.00 $4,714.00!
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
11 Ipumping 500 GPM @ 45' T.D. H. for 2-D 2 ea $3,995.00 $7.890.00| $2 465.00 $4,930.00 $2,134.00 $4.268.00) $2,624.11 $5.248.22| $2,390.00 $4.780.00] NO BID NO BID]_$5,270.00 $10,540.00
4" Submersible Sewage pumps capable of
12 ipumping 275 GPM @ 25' T.D. H. for 2-M 2 ea $2,167.00 $4.33400| $1,682.00 $3,364.00| $1,203.00 $2,406.00] $1,998.20 $3,996.40 $1,578.00 $3,156.00] _NO BiD NO BID|_$3,985.00 $7,870.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
13 pumping 180 GPM @ 20° T.D. H. for 3-M 2 ea $2,553.00 $5,106.00{ _$1,553.00 $3,106.00] $1,203.00 $2,406.00| $2,109 21 $4.218.42] $1418.00 $2.836.00{ NO BID NO BID| $2,218.00 $4,432.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capabte of
14 pumping 200 GPM @ 26' T.D.H. for 42-A 2 ea $3,067.00 $6.134.00] $1,553.00 $3,106.00} $1,203.00 $2,406.00] $1,898.20 $3,996.40} $1,578.00 $3,156.00] NOBID NO BID| $2,357.00 $4.714.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
15 |pumping 120 GPM @ 20' T.D.H. for 4-D 2 ea $2,553.00] $5,106.00| $1.504.00 $3,008.00) $1,20300 $2,406.00] $2,108.21 $4,218.42] 5141800 $2.836.00] NOBID NO BID| $2,216.00 $4,432.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of -
16 ___|pumping 184 GPM @ 46' T.D.H. for 5-D 2 ea $2,866.00 $5,732.00] $1.736.00 $3,472.00| $1,679.00 $3.358.00] $2,240.00 $4,480.00] $1,726.00 $3,452.00] NO BID NO BID/_ $3,056.00 $6,112.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
17 |pumping 280 GPM @ 31' T.D H. for 7-A 2 ea $2,917.00 $5.834.00| $1,682.00 $3,364.00 $1,203.00 $2,406.00] $2,122 10 $4,244.20| $1,578.00 $3.156.00[ NO BID NO BID| _$3,985.00 $7.970.00
6" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
18 pumping 465 GPM @ 42' T.D.H. for 7-D 2 ea $3.788.00 $7,578.00 $2.194.00 $4,388.00] $3,348.00 $6,696.00] $4,791.57 $9.583.14 $1815.00 $3,630.00{ NOBID NO BID| $4,261.00 $6,522 00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps cabpable of
pumping 150 GPM @ 25’ T.D.H. for Airport
19 {Industrial Park 2 ea $2.553.00 $5.106.00] $1,553.00 $3,106 00| $1,203.00 $2,406.00] $1,998 20 $3,996.40| $1.444 00 $2,868.00[ NO BID NO 81D $2,216.00 $4.432.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 80 GPM @ 15' T.D.H. for Bayou
20 _|Condominiums 2 ea $2.553.00 $5,108.00] $1,504.00 $3,008.00 $1.203.00 $2.406.00] $2.109.21 $4.218.42| $1318.00 $2.636.00] NO BID NO BID| $1,848.00 $3,696.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 250 GPM @ 64; T.D.H. for Bayshore
21 __|on the Lake 2 ea $3.995.00 $7,990.00] _$2.465 00 $4,930.00 $2,512.00 $5,024 00| $2.624 11 $5.248.22| $2363 00 $4726.00]  NOBID NO BID] $5,270.00 $10,540.00
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REPLACEMENT PUMPS 08-08970V BID TABULATION

**ITT WATER &
HUDSON PUMP & WASTEWATER, **MADER ELECTRIC TAMPA ARMATURE **TECHNICAL SALES **SOUTHEASTERN
EQUIPMENT FLORIDA LLC MOTQORS POWER & PUMPS **PX PUMPS USA, LLC WORKS, INC. CORP. PUMP
LAKELAND, FL APOPKA, FL N FT. MYERS, FL JACKSONVILLE, FL SANFORD, FL RIVERVIEW, FL TAMPA, FL FORT LAUDERDALE, FL
(863) 665-7867 (407) 880-2900 (239) 731-5455 {904) 356-5881 (407) 936-2570 (813) 621-5661 (813) 876-9256 (954) 583-3303
EST UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. UM PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
1 pumping 600 GPM @ 32' T.D.H. for #12 2 ea $3,185.00 $6.370.00] $5,480.00 $10,960.00] $2,945.65 $5.891.30| $3,566.00 $7.132.00] $3,667.95 $7.335.90| $2,577.00 $5.154.00]  $3.120.00 $6,240.00 $2,571.84 $5,143 .68
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
2 pumping 320 GPM @ 43' T.D.H. for #14 2 ea | $3,185.00 $6,370.00| $4,845.00 $9,680.00{ $2,709.78 $5,410.56] $3,280.00| $6.560.00] $3,667.95 $7,335.90] $2,466.00 $4,932.00  $2,751.00 $5,502.00 $2,571.84 $5,143.68
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
3 pumping 275 GPM @ 35 T.D H. for #6 2 ea $1,975.00 $3,950.00( $3,807.00 $7,614.00| $1,134.78 $2,269.56| $1,526 .00 $3,052.00] $2,075.29 $4,150.58] $2,133.00 $4.266 00}  $2,443.00 $4.886.00] §2,166.91 $4,333 82
8" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
4 pumping 800 GPM @ 35' T.D.H. for #7 2 ea $3.414 00 $6,828.00! $8,35€ 00 $16.712.00] $3,116.43 $6,236.96] H3,7/5.00 $7.550.00] $4,807 69 $9.615.38] $4,300.00 $8,600.00]  $4,007.00 $8.014.00| $2,845.44 $5 690 88
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
5 pumping 250 GPM @ 48 T.D.H. for 14-D 2 ea | $2,982.00 $5,964 00| $4,845.00 $9,690 00| $2,047.83 $4,095.66| $2,755.00 $5.510.00| $3.224.31 $6,448.62] $2,466.00 $493200] $2,751.00 $5,502.00| $2571.84 $5,143.68
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
6 pumping 600 GPM @ 60' T.D.H. for 15-D 2 ea | $3.211.00 $6,422.00] $8.425.00 $16,850.00] $3,071.74 $6,143.48| $3,718.00 $7,436.00| $6,140.48 $12,280.88] $4,133.00 $6,266 00|  $3,853.00 $7.786.00] $2,571.84 $5,143.68
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
7 pumping 200 GPM @ 25'T.D. H. for 16-D 2 ea | $1.896.00 $3.392.00{ $3,248.00 $6,496.00| $1,080.43 $2,160.86] $1.45300 $2.906.00| $2,075.29 $4,150 58] $1,911.00 $3.822.00]  $1.853 00 $3,906 00| $2,166.91 $4,333.82
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
8 pumping 275 GPM @ 25' T.D.H. for 1M-A 2 ea | $1,696.00 $3,392.00| $3,807.00 $7,614.00] $1,080.43 $2,160.86] _$1,453.00] $2,906.00| $2,075 29 $4.150.58] $2,133.00 $4,266.00| _ $2,083.00 $4.166.00] $1,696.32 $3,392.64
6" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
9 pumping 550 GPM @ 41' T.D.H. for 21-A 2 ea | $3.211.00 $6,422.00| $5,232.00 $10,464.00] $2,992.39 $5.984.78| $3,622.00 $7,244.00] $5,308.88 $10,817.76] $4,300.00 $8,600.00( _ $4,007.00 $8,014.00 $2,845 44 $5,600.88
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
10 pumping 125 GPM @ 27' T.D. H. for 28-A 2 ea $1,249.00 $2,498.00] $3.113.00! $6,226.00 $968.48. $1,936.96] $1,303.00 $2,606.00] $2,07528 $4.150.58] $1,911.00 $3,822.00}  $1,953.00 $3,906.00[ $2,166.91 $4,333.82
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
11 |pumping 500 GPM @ 45' T.D. H. for 2-D 2 ea | $3.211.00 $6,422.00| $5,460.00 $10,960.00] $2,867.39 $5.734.78] $3,471.00 $6,942.00| $3,667.95 $7,335.90| $2,577.00 $5,154.00]  $3,120.00 $6,240.00/ $2,571.84 $5,143.68
4" Submersible Sewage pumps capable of
12 _{pumping 275 GPM @ 25' T.D. H. for 2-M 2 ea | $1.88500 $3.772.00| $3,807.00 $7.614.00| $1,080.43 $2.160.86| $1,453.00 §2,906.00] $2,075.29 $4,150.58| $2,133.00 $4,266.00| _ $2,083.00 $4,166.00] $1,606.32 $3.382.64
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
13 _|pumping 180 GPM @ 20' T.D. H. for 3-M 2 ea | $1,886.00 $3,772.00] $3,673.00 $7,346.00{ $1,080.43 $2,160.86] $1.453.00 $2,906.00| $2,075.29 $4,150.58) $1,911.00 $3,822.00|  $2,011.00 $4,022.00| $1,641.60 $3,283.20
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
14 lpumping 200 GPM @ 26' T.D.H. for 42-A 2 ea | $1.696.00 $3,392.00|  $3,248.00/ $6,496 00] $1,080.43 $2,160.86} $1,453.00 $2,906.00] $2,075.29 $4,150.58} $1,911.00 $3.822.00| _$2,011.00 $4,022.00] $1,696.32 $3.392.64
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
15 pumping 120 GPM @ 20' T.D.H. for 4-D 2 ea $1,248.00 $2.498.00| $3,113.00 $6.226.00| $1,080.43 $2.160.86] $1,453.00 $2,906.00] $2,075.28 $4.150.58) $3.633.00 $7.266.00|  $1.848.00 $3,696.00] $1,641.60) $3,283 20
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
16 __lpumping 184 GPM @ 46' T.D.H. for 5-D 2 ea | $1,682.00 $3,364.00] $4,930.00 $9,860.00{ §1,080.43 $2,160.88] $1,453.00] $2,906.00] $3,224 31 $6,448 62| $2,466.00 $4,932.00|  $2,134.00 $4,268.00) $2,571.84 $5,143.68
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
17__ |pumping 280 GPM @ 31 T.D H. for 7-A 2 ea | $1.88600 $3,772.00| $3.807.00 $7.614.00] $1,080.43 $2.160.86| $1,453.00 $2,906.00( $2.075.29 $4,150.58) $2,133.00 $4.266.00|  $2,083 00 $4.166.00] 2,166 91 $4,333.82
6" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
18 _ |pumping 465 GPM @ 42 T.D.H. for 7-0 2 ea | $2,85400 $5.708.00] $5,232.00 $10,464.00] $2,945 65 $5.891.30| $3,566.00 $7.132.00| $5,115.83 $10,231.66] $4,300.00 $8.600.00| 3$4,007.00 $8.014.00] $2.84544 $5,690.88
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps cabpable of
pumping 150 GPM @ 25' T.D.H. for Airport
19 |industrial Park 2 ea | $1335.00 $2,678.00| $3,113.00 $6,226.00| §1,080.43 $2,160.86] $1,453.00 $2.906.00| $2.075 29 $4.15058) $1,911.00 $3.822 00|  $2,287 00 $4.574.00] $1,641.60 $3,283.20
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 80 GPM @ 15' T.D.H. for Bayou
20 Condominiums 2 ea | $1,262.00 $2.524.00 NiA NIA| $1.080 .43 $2,160.86| $1,453.00 $2,906.00| $2.075.29 $4 150.58| $3,633.00 $7.266.00|  $1,848.00 $3,696.00 $1.641 80; $3.283.20
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 250 GPM @ 64. T.D H. for Bayshore L
21__ jonthe Lake 2 ea | $3.084.00 $6,168.00] $5,480 00 $10,960.00{ 52,703 78 $5419.56| $1.45300 $2,906 00} $3,667.95 $7.335.90] $2,577 00 $5.154 00| _ $3,10500 $6.21000) $1,64160 $3.283.20
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REPLACEMENT PUMPS 09-08970V BID TABULATION

BARNEY'S PUMPS,
INC. HYDROMATIC BARNEY'’S PUMPS, COAST PUMP & CUSTOM PUMPS & |GODWIN PUMPS OF| *“GRIFFIN PUMP &
ABS USA PUMPS INC. HOMA PUMPS SUPPLY CO. CONTROLS, INC. AMERICA, INC. EQUIPMENT, INC.***
SANFORD, FL LAKELAND, FL LAKELAND, FL VENICE, FL TAMPA, FL BRIDGEPORT, NJ HOUSTON, TX
(800) 323-1731 (863) 665-8500 (863) 665-8500 (941) 484-3738 (813) 886-6255 (856) 467-3636 (713) 671-7000
EST EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED | UNIT YEXTENDED UNIT f EXTENDED
NO DESCRIPTION QTY || U/M j UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
6" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 1200 GPM @ 115' T.D.H. for
Bayshore Yacht Basin (Add.#1 /03/30/09)
22 3 ea $19,933.00 $59,799.00] $10,240.00] $30,720.00] $8,350.00 $25.050.00| $7,005.47 $21,016.41| $5,601.00 $16,803.00] NO8ID NO BID| $12,023.00 $36,069.00]
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 150 GPM @ 61' T.D.H. for Doraye
23 |Villag 2 ea $3.722.00 $7,444.00| $1,736.00 $3.472.00] $2,400.00 $4,800.00| $2,389.56 $4.779 12| $2,192.00 $4,384.00] NO BID NQ BID| _$5.270 60 $10,540.00
8" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 800 GPM @110’ T.D.H. for El
24 Conquistador 1(Add.#1 /03/30/09) 3 ea $19.391.00] $56,173.00{ $4,853.00 $14,559.00| $6,527.00 $19,581.00] $6,749.37 $20,248 11 $5217.00 $15,651.00) NOBID NO BID| $12,023.00 $36,069.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 220 GPM @ 102" T.D.H. for
Foster's Grove - Vortex Impeller Pumps
**25 _{(Add. #1/03/30/09) 2 ea $8.188.00 $16.376.00] $3,928.00 $7.856.00| $3,628.00 $7,256.00| $2,624.10 $5,248.20] $3,920.00 $7.840.00| NGO BID NO BID| $7,090.00 $14,180.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 300 GPM @ 81' T.D.K. for Glenn
26 |Lakes 1 2 ea $4.724.00 $9,448.00|  $2.720.00 $5.440.00{ $2,947.00 $5,894.00] $2,624.10 $5.248.20 $3,853.00 §7.726.00] NOBID NO BID| $6,009.00 $12,018.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 105 GPM @ 31' T.D.H. for Glenn
27 |lakes?2 2 ea $2,640.00 $5,280.00) $1,553.00 $3,106.00| _$1.203.00 52,408 00;_$2,109.21 $4,218.42}  $1,604.00 $3,20800 NO BID NO BID| $2.357.00 $4,714.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 100 GPM @ 32' T.D.H. for Harbor
28 __|Woods 2 ea $3.067.00 $6,134.00| $1,553.00 $3,106.00{ $1,203.00 $2,406.00| $1,998.20 $3,996 40} $1,604.00 $3.20800| NOBID NO BID| $2.357.00 $4,714.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 140 GPM @ 28' T.D.H. for Henson
29 _ |Industrial Park 2 ea $3,067.00 $6,134.00| $1,553.00 $3,106.00| $1,203.00 $2,406.00| $2.109.21 $4,218.42] $1,578.00 $3,156.00] NO BID NO 8ID] $2.357.00 $4.714.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
3g_ |Pumping 200 GPM @ 35 T.D.H. for KayRoad|  , | $2,917.00 $5,834.00] $1,682.00 $3.364.00] $1,203.00 $2.406.00| $2.122.10 $4.244.20] $1,604.00 $3,208.00] NOBID NOBID| $398500]  $7.970.00
6" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 1427 GPM @59' T.D.H. for
31 Lakewood Ranch Riverwalk 3 ea $15,980.00 $47,540.00] $4.656.00 $13,968.00{ $5,398.00 $16,194.00] $6,612.42 $19,837.26] $4.639 00 $13,817.00] NOBID NOBID/| $11,130.00 $33,390.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capabie of
pumping 200 GPM @ 23' T.D.H. for Manasola
32 _lindustriat Park 2 ea $2,553.00 $5,106 00| $1.553.00 $3,106.00] $1,203.00 $2,406.00| §1,998 21 $3.996.42| $1.444.00 $2.888.00| NO BID NO 8ID] $2,216.00 $4.432.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 100 GPM @ 38 T.D.H. for Mill Creek
33 |2 2 ea $2,167.00 $4,334 00| $1,682.00 $3.364.00] $1,203.00 $2,406.00] $1,998 20 $3.996 40| $1,604 00 $3.20800] NOBID NO BID| $2,357.00 $4.714 00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 100 GPM @ 46' T.D H. for Mili Creek
34 13 2 ea $2,394.00 $4.788.00] 5168200 $3,364.00] $1.679 00 $3,358.00] $2,122.10 $4.244.20]  $1,604 00 $3.208.00| NO BID NOQ BID} $3,056.00 $6,112.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 830 GPM @ 101" T O H. for
35 _ IMissionary Viliage 2 ea $14,133 00 $28.266.00] $4,382 00 $8.764.00] $4,992 00 $9,984.00] $6.932.51 $13.865.02| $4,872.00 $9,944.00] NOBID NO 8iD| $12,023 00 $24,046 00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
36_ {pumping 315 GPM @ 53' T.O.H for N7-A 2 ea $3,995.00 $7,990.00] $2,194.00 $4.388.00] $2.134 00 $4.268.00{ $2,624 10 $5,248 20| 52,319.00 54,638 00} NO BID NOBID| $5.270 00 $10,540 00
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REPLACEMENT PUMPS 09-08970V BID TABULATION

**ITT WATER &
HUDSON PUMP & WASTEWATER, **MADER ELECTRIC TAMPA ARMATURE **TECHNICAL SALES **SOUTHEASTERN
EQUIPMENT FLORIDA LLC MOTORS POWER & PUMPS **PX PUMPS USA, LLC WORKS, INC. CORP. PUMP
LAKELAND, FL APOPKA, FL N FT. MYERS, FL JACKSONVILLE, FL SANFORD, FL RIVERVIEW, FL, TAMPA, FL FORT LAUDERDALE, FL
(863) 665-7867 (407) 880-2900 (239) 731-5455 (904) 356-5881 (407) 936-2570 (813) 621-5661 (813) 876-9256 (954) 583-3303
EST UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. UM || PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
6" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
PUMBING T200 GPM @ 115 T.OH_ 15T
. Bayshore Yacht Basin (Add.#1 /03/30/09)
22 3 ea | $10.488.00 $31,464.00( $22,292.00 $66.876.00 $11,913.04 $35,739.12| $14,421 00 $43,263.00] §14,521.44 $43,564.32| $15,833.00 $47,499.00| $12,721.00 $36.163.00] $5,860.51 $17,581.53
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 150 GPM @ 6% T.D.H. for Doraye
23 |Villas 2 ea | $3,084.00 $6,168.00| $5,480.00 $10,960.00] $1,080.43 $2,160.86| $1,453.00 $2.906.00| $3,667.95 $7.335.90] $2,577.00 $5.15400] $3,120.00 $6,240.00] $2,571.84 $5,143.68
6" Submersibie Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 800 GPM @110’ T.D.H. for Ei
Conquistador 1{Add.#1 / 03/30/09)
24 3 ea | 3694600 $20.838 00! $17,837.00 $63,511.00{ $12,806.52 $38,419.56| $15,503.00 $48,509.00| $11,937.54 $35,812.62( $15,833.00 $47.499.00| $10,009.00 $30,027.00| $5,855.04 $17,565.12
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 220 GPM @ 102’ T.D.H. for
Foster's Grove - Vortex impeller Pumps
25 [{Add. #1/03/30/09) 2 ea | $4.881.00 $9,762.00 $9,730.00 $19,460.00| $5,896.74 $11.793.48] $7.138.00 $14,276.00| $6,140.48 $12,280.96| $4,450.00 $8.900.00|  $4,000.00 $8.000.00) §3,688.13 $7,376.26
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 300 GPM @ 81' T.D H. for Glenn
28 |Lakes 1 2 ea | $455000 $9,100.00 $9,195.00 $18,390.00| $2,867.00 $5,734.00| $3.471.00 $6.842.00| $6,140.48 $12,280.86| $4,133.00 $8,266.00|  $4,707.00 $9.414.00| $3688.13 $7,376.26
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 105 GPM @ 31' T.D H. for Glenn
27 [Lakes2 2 ea | $1,339.00 $2,678.00{ $3,248.00 $6,496.00(  $968.48 $1,936.95] $1,303.00 $2,606.00) $2,075.29 $4,150.58) $1,911.00 $3.822.00| $2,237.00 $4,474.00| $1,641.60 $3.283.20
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 100 GPM @ 32' T.D H. for Harbor
28 |Woods 2 ea | $1.339.00 $2,678.00] $3.248.00 $6,496.00] $1,080.43 $2,160.86] $1,453.00 $2,806.00f $2,075.29 $4,150.58] $1,911.00 $3,82200| $2.237.00 $447400| $1.541.60 $3,283.20
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capabie of
pumping 140 GPM @ 28' T.D K. for Henson
29 _lindustrial Park 2 ea | $1.24800 $2,496.00| $3,248.00 $6.496.00| $1,080.43 $2,160.86| $1,453.00 $2,906.00] $2,075.29 $4,150.58| $1,911.00 $3,822.00| $2,011.00| $4,022.00) $1,641.60 $3,283.20
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
30 |Pumping 200 GPM @35 T.DH. for Kay Road| ea | $1.784.00) $3,568.00] $3,807.00 $7,614.00 $1,080.43 $2.160.86] $1,453.00 52.906.00] $2,075.29 54.15058| $2,133.00 $4.266.00  $2.443.00 $4,8686.00] $2,166.91 $4.333.82
6" Submersible Sewage Pumps capabie of
pumping 1427 GPM @59 T.D.H. for
31 Lakewood Ranch Riverwalk 3 ea_| $6.83500 $20.685.00| $13,765.00 $41,295.00{ $12,184.78 $36,554.34| $14,750.00 $44,250.00 $8,676.11 $26,028.33| $6,425.00 $19.275.00] $10,009.00 $30.027.00| $3,688.13 $11,064.39
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 200 GPM @ 23' T.D H. for Manasota
32 lindustrial Park 2 ea | $1.875.00 $3.950.00] $3,113.00 $6.226 00| $1.080.43 $2.160.85! $1.453.00 $2,906.00| $2,075.29 $4,15058] $1,911.00 $3,82200|  $2,346.00 $4,69200] $1.641.60 $3,283.20
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 100 GPM @ 38' 7.D.H. for Mill Creek
33 |2 2 ea | $1.772.00 $3.544.00| $3,113.00 $6,226.00|  $968.48 $1,936.95] $1,303.00 $2,606.00] $2,075.29 $4,150.58] $2,133.00 $4.266.00 $2,443.00 $4.885.00) 1,696 32 $3,392.64
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 100 GPM @ 46' T.D H. for Mill Creek
34 13 2 ea | $1.772.00 $3,544 .00 NiA Nia| $1,080.43 $2,160.86| $1,453.00 $2,906.00( $2.075.29 $4,150.58) $2,133.00 $4,266.00] $2,443.00 $4,886.00 $2,166.91 $4,333 82
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 830 GPM @ 101" T.D.H. for
35 |Missionary Village 2 ea | $6,946.00 $13,892.00] $16.774.00 $33,548.00| $12,806.52 $25.613.04} $15,503 00 $31,006.00| $11,766.77 $23,533.54] $8,525 00 $17,050.00|  $9,960.00; $19,920.00| $5,198.40 $10.396.80
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
36 |pumping 315 GPM @ 53' T.D H_for N7-A 2 ea | $2.98200 35,964 00} $5,480 00 $10.960.00] $1,130.43 $2,260.86] $1,521.00 $3.042 00f _$3,667 95 $7,33590| $2,577.00 35,154.00|  §$3,120.00 $5.240.00 52,571.84] $5.143.68]
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REPLACEMENT PUMPS 09-08970V BID TABULATION

BARNEY'S PUMPS,
INC. HYDROMATIC BARNEY'S PUMPS, COAST PUMP & CUSTOM PUMPS & GODWIN PUMPS OF | “*GRIFFIN PUMP &
ABS USA PUMPS INC. HOMA PUMPS SUPPLY CO. CONTROLS, INC. AMERICA, INC. EQUIPMENT, INC.***
SANFORD, FL LAKELAND, FL. LAKELAND, FL VENICE, FL TAMPA, FL BRIDGEPORT, NJ HOUSTON, TX
(800) 323-1731 (863) 665-8500 (863) 665-8500 (541) 484-3738 (813) 886-6255 (856) 467-3636 (713) 671-7000
EST EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED | UNIT |[EXTENDED] UNIT | EXTENDED
NO DESCRIPTION QTY. | UM | UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 100 GPM @ 28' T.D.H. for Palm Aire
37 14 2 ea $2.553.00 $5.106.00| $1,553.00 $3,106.00] _$1,203.00 $2,406.00] $2,109.21 $4,218.42| $1,578.00 $3,156.00| NO 8IO NO BID| $2,216.00 $4,432.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 210 GPM @ 115’ TD.H. for River
Wilderness 3 - Vortex Impeller Pumps
38  [(Add. #1/03/30/09 2 ea $8,949.00 $17.896.00( $3,950.00 $7,900 00| $3,628 00 $7,256.00] $5.400.86 $10,801.72| $3.884.00 $7.768 001 NORID NO 8iD! $7,090.00 $14,180.00
4" Submersible Sewage Fumps capabie of
pumping 30C GPM @ 83' T.D.H. for River
39 |wilderness 5 2 ea $4,119.00 $8.238 00 $2,465.00 $4.930.00[ $2,512.00 $5,024.00] $2.624.10 $6,248 20| $2,390.00 $4.780.00| NOBID NO BID| $5,270.00] $10,540.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 120 GPM @ 37' T.D.H. for Riverview
40 _ [Landings 2 ea $2,167 00 $4,334.00{ $1,682.00 $3,364.00) $1,203.00 $2,406.00| $2,122.10 $4,244.20 $1,578.00 $3,156.00] NOBID NO BID| $2,357.00 $4.714.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
41 _ |pumping 100 GPM @ 35' T.D.H. for S-4 2 ea $3,067 00 $6,134.00| $1,682.00 $3,364.00]  $1,203.00 $2,406.00{ $2,109.21 $4,218.42| $1,578.00; $3,156.00| NOBID NO BID| $2,357.00] $4,714.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capabile of
pumping 240 GPM @ 22" T.D.H. for San
42 |Remo 2 ea $2,553.00 $5.106.00{  $1,553 00 $3.106.00| $1,203.00 $2,406.00| $2.109.21 $4,218.42| $1578.00 $3.156.00| NOBID NO BiD{ $2,357.00 $4,714.00)
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 100 GPM @ 14°' T.D.H. for Saunders
43 __|Rd. Industrial Park 2 ea $2,553.00 $5,106.00] $1,504.00 $3,008.00] $1.203.00 $2.406.00| $2,109.21 $4,218.42| $1,318.00 $2,636.00] NOBID NO 8iD| $1,848.00 $3,696.00)
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capabie of
pumping 180 GPM @ 27° T.D.H. for Spanish
44 lpark 2 ea $3.067.00 $6,134.00| $1,553.00 $3,106.00] $1,203.00 $2,406.00] $1,998.20 $3,996 40| $1,578.00 $3.156.00| NOBID NO BID| $2,357.00 $4,714.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 425 GPM @ 25 T.D.H. for State
45 |Road 70 2 ea $2,917.00 $5,834.00, $1,682.00 $3,364.00| $1,203.00 $2,408.00] $2,240.00 54,480.00| $1,604.00 $3,20800| NOBID NO BID| $3,985.00 $7,970.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
46 [pumping 400 GPM @ 40' T.D.H. for Tara 6 2 ea $3.995.00 $7.990.00| $2,194.00 $4,388.00{ $1,766.00 $3.532.00) _$2,389.56 $4,779.12) $1,841.00 $3.682.00| NOBID NO BID| $4,261.00] $8,522.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 300 GPM @ 23' T.D.H. for
47 |Timberlake 2 ea $2.167.00 $4,334.00| $1,682.00 $3,364.00| $1,203.00 $2,406.00] $1,998.20 $3.996.40| $1.578.00 $3,156.00| NOBID NO BID| $2,357.00] $4,714.00
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 155 GPM @ 26' T.D.H. for Travier's
48 _|Qasis 2 ea $2,553.00 $5,106.00 $1.553.00 $3,106.00| $1,203.00 $2.406 00| _$2,109.21 $4.218.42| $1,604.00 $3.208.00| NOBID NO BID| $2,357.00] 34,714 00
TOTAL PRICE: $485,522.00 $241,365.00 $228,249.00 $296,491.40 11$225,523.00 NO BID $451,020.00
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REPLACEMENT PUMPS 09-08970V BID TABULATION

**ITT WATER &
HUDSON PUMP & WASTEWATER, **MADER ELECTRIC TAMPA ARMATURE | **TECHNICAL SALES **SOUTHEASTERN
EQUIPMENT FLORIDA LLC MOTORS POWER & PUMPS **PX PUMPS USA, LLC WORKS, INC. CORP. PUMP
LAKELAND, FL APOPKA, FL N FT. MYERS, FI., JACKSONVILLE, FL SANFORD, FL RIVERVIEW, FL TAMPA, FL FORT LAUDERDALE, FL
(863) 665-7867 (407) 880-2900 (239) 731-5455 {904) 356-5881 (407) 936-2570 {813) 621-5661 (813) 876-9256 {954) 583-3303
EST. UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
NC DESCRIPTION QTY. UM | PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capabie of
pumping 100 GPM @ 28 1.D.H. for Palm Aire
37 4 2 ea $1.248.00 $2,498.00| $3,113.00 $6,226.00[ $1,080.43 $2,160.86| $1.453.00 $2,906.00| $2,075.29 $4,150 58] $1,811.00 $3,822.00]  $1,953.00, $3.906.00| $1,641.60 $3,283.20
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 210 GPM @ 115' TD.H. for River
Wilderness 3 - Vortex Impelier Pumps
38 |(Add. #1/03/30/09 2 ea $4,881.00 $9,762 00| $6.258 00 $18,516.00] $5282.61 $10.565.22| $6 1385 an $12,700.00! $512225 $15,236.50| $4,678.00 $9,350.00]  $4,415.00 $8,838.00) $3.688.13 $7.376.26
4" Submersivie Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 300 GPM @ 63’ T.0.H. for River
39 Wilderpess 5 2 ea $3,211.00 $6.422.00] $5,480.00 $10,860.00| $1,130.43 $2,260.86] $1,521.00 $3,042.00] $4.807.69 $961538| $2.577.00 $515400| $3,64500 $7,280.00] $2,57184 $5,143.68
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 120 GPM @ 37' T.D.H. for Riverview
40 Landings 2 ea $1,682.00 $3,364.00| $3,807.00 $7.614.00 $968.48 $1,936.96| $1,303 00 $2,606 00 $2,075.29 $4,150.58| $2,133.00 $4,266.00] _ $1,802.00 $3,804.00] $1,696.32 $3,392.64
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
41 pumping 100 GPM @ 35' T.D.H. for S-4 2 ea $1.696.00 $3,392.00 NIA N/A $968.48 $1.836 986 $1,303.00 $2,606.00| $2,075.29 $4,150.58] $2,133.00 $4,266.00| $1,902.00 $3,804.00] $1,696.32 $3,392.64
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 240 GPM @ 22' T.D.H. for San
42 Remo 2 ea $1.886.00 $3,772.00{ $3,113.00 $6,226. 00| $1,080.43 $2,160.86] $1,453.00 $2.906.00) $2,075.29 $4,150.58| $2,467.00 $4,93400] $2,011.00 $4,022.00f $1,641.60 $3,283.20;
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 100 GPM @ 14' T.D.H. for Saunders
43 Rd. Industrial Park 2 ea $1,248.00 $2.498.00 NiA N/A) $1,080.43 $2,160.86| $1,453.00 $2,906.00; $2,075.29 $4150.58] $3,633.00 $7.266.00| $1.848.00 $36968.00 $1,64160 $3,283.20
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 180 GPM @ 27' T.D.H. for Spanish
44 Park 2 ea $1.696.00 $3,392.00| $3,248.00; $6,496.00] $1,080.43 $2,180 86 $1,453.00 $2.906.00] $2,075.29 $4,150.58| $1,911.00 $3.82200f  $2,011.00 $4,022.00 $1.641.60 $3.283.20
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 425 GPM @ 25' T.D.H. for State
45 Road 70 2 ea $1.875.00 $3.950.00| $3,638.00 $7,276.00f $1,134.78 $2,269.56| $1,525.00] $3.052.00| $2,015.2¢ $4,150.58] $2,133.00 $4,266.00) $3.113.00 $6,226.00{ $2,166.91 $4,333.82
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
46 pumping 400 GPM @ 40' T.D.H. for Tara 6 2 ea $3.186.00 $6,372.00| $4,845.00 $9.690.00] $2047.83 $4,08566] $2,888.00 $5.776.00| $3,667.95 $7,33590] $2,577.00 $5154.00| $3,907.00 $7.814.00] $2571.84 $5,143.68
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 300 GPM @ 23' T.D.H. for
47 Timberlake 2 ea $1,886.00 $3,772.00] $3,638.00 $7,276.00{ $1,080.43 $2,160.86f $1,453.00 $2,906.00| $2.075.29 $4,150.58| $2,133.00 $4,266.00{  $3,166.00| $6,332.00{ $1,696.32 $3.392.64
4" Submersible Sewage Pumps capable of
pumping 155 GPM @ 26' T.D.H. for Travier's
48 Qasis 2 ea $1,335.00 $2.678.00) $3,638.00 $7.276 00f $1,080.43 $2,160.86| $1,453.00 $2,906.00( $2,075.2¢ $4150.58] $1,911.00 $3,822.00)  $2,346.00 $469200) $1,64160 $3.283.20,
TOTAL PRICE: $287,881.00 $568,192.00 ::1$285,616.36 $352,374.00 $392,422.57 $362,307.00 $355,793.00 $247,296.08
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