

# MANATEE COUNTY GOVERNMENT

## INTENT TO AWARD

<b>IFB NO. / TITLE</b>	21-TA003584DJ, Installation of Force Main at 41 <sup>st</sup> Avenue E. and I-75	<b>DATE POSTED</b>	MC _____ DS _____	CC _____ BIDSYNC _____
<b>PROCUREMENT REPRESENTATIVE</b>	Dave Janney Senior Procurement Agent	<b>PROJECTED AWARD DATE</b>	March 23, 2021	
<b>DEPARTMENT/DIVISION</b>	Public Works	<b>AUTHORIZED BY DATE</b>	Jacob Erickson, Procurement Official	

### NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD

The Manatee County Procurement Division provides notice of its intent to award a contract with Woodruff & Sons, Inc. for the provision of Installation of Force Main at 41<sup>st</sup> Avenue E. and I-75.

### ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITY

Manatee County Procurement Ordinance, Sec 2-26.

### BACKGROUND/EVALUATION

Services include furnishing all labor, materials, and equipment to provide the Installation of Force Main at 41st Avenue E. and I-75.

The solicitation was advertised on January 4, 2021 on the Manatee County website and Periscope S2G. It was also provided to the Manatee County Chamber of Commerce, the Manasota Black Chamber of Commerce, Gulf Coast Builders Exchange, and Gulf Coast Latin Chamber of Commerce for release to their members. Responses were received from the following firms:

- |  |   |
|--|---|
| 1. PWC Joint Venure LLC, Fort Myers, FL    | 3. Woodruff & Sons, Inc., Bradenton, FL |
| 2. Westra Construction Corp., Palmetto, FL |   |

#### **EVALUATION SUMMARY:**

Woodruff & Sons, Inc. is the lowest responsible, responsive bidder(s). A bid tabulation of the results is attached to this Notice of Intent to Award.

#### **RECOMMENDATION**

The Procurement Division and the Public Works Department recommend award to Woodruff & Sons, Inc..

<b>ATTACHMENTS (List in order of attached)</b>	Bid Tabulation	<b>NAME AND NUMBER OF FUNDING SOURCE</b>	Utility Rates 4046097980 534000
<b>COST</b>	\$985,010.76	<b>FUNDS VERIFIED</b>	Yes

**BID SUMMARY TABULATION**  
**IFBC NO. 21-TA003584DJ**  
**INSTALLATION OF FORCE MAIN AT 41st AVENUE E. AND I-75**  
**COUNTY PROJECT NO. 6097980**

				PWC Joint Venture LLC	Westra Construction	Woodruff & Sons
	Total Construction Cost Bid "A" Based on 120 Calendar Days			\$1,022,137.40	No Bid	\$985,010.76
	Total Construction Cost Bid "B" Based on 180 Calendar Days			\$1,022,137.40	\$1,461,758.77	\$985,010.76

**BID TABULATION**  
**IFBC NO. 21-TA003584DJ**  
**INSTALLATION OF FORCE MAIN AT 41st AVENUE E. AND I-75**  
**COUNTY PROJECT NO. 6097980**

PWC Joint Venture LLC

Westra Construction

Woodruff & Sons

**BID "A" BASED ON 120 CALENDAR DAYS COMPLETION**

BID ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	UNITS	QTY.	UNIT PRICE (\$)	EXTENDED PRICE (\$)	UNIT PRICE (\$)	EXTENDED PRICE (\$)	UNIT PRICE (\$)	EXTENDED PRICE (\$)
1	F&I 20" Polyvinyl Chloride (PVC) Pipe	LF	590	\$150.00	\$88,500.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$310.02	\$182,911.80
2	F&I 36" Steel Casing	LF	530	\$1,208.00	\$640,240.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$1,015.05	\$537,976.50
3	F&I 20" Plug Valve	EA	4	\$14,500.00	\$58,000.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$14,866.35	\$59,465.40
4	F&I 20" Solid Sleeves	EA	4	\$1,800.00	\$7,200.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$2,664.43	\$10,657.72
5	F&I 20" Tee	EA	2	\$2,600.00	\$5,200.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$3,192.54	\$6,385.08
6	F&I 20" 45° Bend	EA	4	\$1,900.00	\$7,600.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$2,716.30	\$10,865.20
7	Maintenance of Traffic (MOT)	LS	1	\$2,400.00	\$2,400.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$5,407.64	\$5,407.64
8	Erosion And Sedimentation Control	LS	1	\$1,700.00	\$1,700.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$2,485.33	\$2,485.33
9	Asphaltic Concrete (Level C) (1.25" minimum)	TN	27	\$400.00	\$10,800.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$410.98	\$11,096.46
10	Asphaltic Concrete w/ Prime Coat (1.25" minimum)	TN	27	\$440.00	\$11,880.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$451.84	\$12,199.68
11	Full Base Replacement (8" minimum)	SY	126	\$48.00	\$6,048.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$104.45	\$13,160.70
12	Milling 1.5" Avg. Depth	SY	126	\$91.00	\$11,466.00	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$93.13	\$11,734.38
	<b>Subtotal Construction Cost</b>				<b>\$851,034.00</b>		#VALUE!		<b>\$864,345.89</b>
13	Mobilization	LS		\$45,000.00	\$45,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$20,142.95	\$20,142.95
14	Miscellaneous Work & Clean Up	LS		\$35,000.00	\$35,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$11,233.30	\$11,233.30
15	Record Drawings	LS		\$6,000.00	\$6,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,854.03	\$2,854.03
16	Contract Contingency (10% of Subtotal Construction Cost)	%	10%		\$85,103.40	No Bid	#VALUE!		\$86,434.59
	<b>Total Construction Cost Bid "A" Based on 120 Calendar Days</b>				<b>\$1,022,137.40</b>	No Bid	#VALUE!		<b>\$985,010.76</b>

**BID "B" BASED ON 180 CALENDAR DAYS COMPLETION**

BID ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	UNITS	QTY.	UNIT PRICE (\$)	EXTENDED PRICE (\$)	UNIT PRICE (\$)	EXTENDED PRICE (\$)	UNIT PRICE (\$)	EXTENDED PRICE (\$)
1	F&I 20" Polyvinyl Chloride (PVC) Pipe	LF	590	\$150.00	\$88,500.00	\$232.00	\$136,880.00	\$310.02	\$182,911.80
2	F&I 36" Steel Casing	LF	530	\$1,208.00	\$640,240.00	\$1,245.00	\$659,850.00	\$1,015.05	\$537,976.50
3	F&I 20" Plug Valve	EA	4	\$14,500.00	\$58,000.00	\$22,000.00	\$88,000.00	\$14,866.35	\$59,465.40
4	F&I 20" Solid Sleeves	EA	4	\$1,800.00	\$7,200.00	\$9,965.00	\$39,860.00	\$2,664.43	\$10,657.72
5	F&I 20" Tee	EA	2	\$2,600.00	\$5,200.00	\$16,700.00	\$33,400.00	\$3,192.54	\$6,385.08
6	F&I 20" 45° Bend	EA	4	\$1,900.00	\$7,600.00	\$6,500.00	\$26,000.00	\$2,716.30	\$10,865.20
7	Maintenance of Traffic (MOT)	LS	1	\$2,400.00	\$2,400.00	\$2,500.00	\$2,500.00	\$5,407.64	\$5,407.64
8	Erosion And Sedimentation Control	LS	1	\$1,700.00	\$1,700.00	\$2,900.00	\$2,900.00	\$2,485.33	\$2,485.33
9	Asphaltic Concrete (Level C) (1.25" minimum)	TN	27	\$400.00	\$10,800.00	\$410.00	\$11,070.00	\$410.98	\$11,096.46
10	Asphaltic Concrete w/ Prime Coat (1.25" minimum)	TN	27	\$440.00	\$11,880.00	\$510.00	\$13,770.00	\$451.84	\$12,199.68
11	Full Base Replacement (8" minimum)	SY	126	\$48.00	\$6,048.00	\$27.00	\$3,402.00	\$104.45	\$13,160.70
12	Milling 1.5" Avg. Depth	SY	126	\$91.00	\$11,466.00	\$92.45	\$11,648.70	\$93.13	\$11,734.38
	<b>Subtotal Construction Cost</b>				<b>\$851,034.00</b>		<b>\$1,029,280.70</b>		<b>\$864,345.89</b>
13	Mobilization	LS		\$45,000.00	\$45,000.00	\$32,550.00	\$32,550.00	\$20,142.95	\$20,142.95
14	Miscellaneous Work & Clean Up	LS		\$35,000.00	\$35,000.00	\$294,000.00	\$294,000.00	\$11,233.30	\$11,233.30
15	Record Drawings	LS		\$6,000.00	\$6,000.00	\$3,000.00	\$3,000.00	\$2,854.03	\$2,854.03
16	Contract Contingency (10% of Subtotal Construction Cost)	%	10%		\$85,103.40		\$102,928.07		\$86,434.59
	<b>Total Construction Cost Bid "B" Based on 180 Calendar Days</b>				<b>\$1,022,137.40</b>		<b>\$1,461,758.77</b>		<b>\$985,010.76</b>