MANATEE COUNTY GOVERNMENT
INTENT TO AWARD

IFB NO. / TITLE 23-TA004807DJ Force Main DATE POSTED MC DS
32A Replacement
PROCUREMENT Dave Janney, Procurement PROJECTED Aoril 9. 2024
REPRESENTATIVE Agentll AWARD DATE prit=,
Jacob EI’iCkSOh, MBA, Digitallysigned by Jacob y
DEPARTMENT/DIVISION  Public Works AUTHOR'ZEDDA?: CPPO, NIGP-CPP Datei 054015 0700837 0500

Jacob Erickson, Purchasing Official

NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD

The Manatee County Procurement Division provides notice of its intent to award a contract with Accurate Drilling
Systemes, Inc. for the provision of Force Main 32A Replacement.

ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITY

Manatee County Procurement Ordinance, Sec 2-26.

BACKGROUND/EVALUATION

The Scope of Work consist of replacing approximately 1,400 linear feet of force main, grouting the existing force
main, tying into an existing manhole and valve vault, and rehab three (3) manholes.

The solicitation was advertised on July 20, 2023, on the Manatee County website and DemandStar. It was also
provided to the Manatee County Chamber of Commerce, the Manasota Black Chamber of Commerce, Gulf Coast
Builders Exchange and Gulf Coast Latin Chamber of Commerce for release to their members and in the Bradenton
Herald and Tempo News newspapers. Responses were received from the following firms:

1. Accurate Drilling Systems, Inc., Labelle, FL
2. Woodruff & Sons, Inc., Bradenton, FL

The following firms were deemed non-responsive/non-responsible: None

EVALUATION SUMMARY:

Accurate Drilling Systems, Inc. was the lowest responsible, responsive bidder(s). A bid tabulation of the results is
attached to this Notice of Intent to Award.

RECOMMENDATION
The Procurement Division and the Public Works Department recommend award to Accurate Drilling Systems, Inc..
ATTACHMENTS Tabulation Sheet COST $948,524,50

(List in order of attached)

Intent to Award (Rev. 10-25-22)




TAB SHEET

23-TA004807DJ FORCE MAIN 32A FORCE MAIN REPLACEMENT

PROJECT #6110580
Bidders must provide prices for each available line'item on each tab for their bid to be considered Accurate Drilling Systems Woodruff and Sons
responsive.
*To be considered responsive, it is the sole responsibility of the bidder to correctly calculate and
manually enter all sub-total, contingency, and total bid price fields.
UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
ESTIMATED BID A BID A BID B BID B BID A BID A BID B BID B
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT 150 150 240 240 150 150 240 240
CALENDAR | CALENDAR | CALENDAR | CALENDAR | CALENDAR | CALENDAR | CALENDAR | CALENDAR
1. MISCELLANEOUS
1 Mobilization (10%) 1 LS $95,700.00 $95,700.00 $95,700.00 $95,700.00 NO BID NO BID $270,816.40 $270,816.40
2 Maintenance of Traffic 1 LS $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 NO BID NO BID $23,352.00 $23,352.00
3 Preconstruction Video 1 LS $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 NO BID NO BID $1,980.00 $1,980.00
4 Erosion and Sediment Control 1 LS $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 NO BID NO BID $3,049.96 $3,049.96
5 Clearing and Grubbing 1 LS $14,250.00 $14,250.00 $14,250.00 $14,250.00 NO BID NO BID $729,901.64 $729,901.64
6 Project Signs 1 LS $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 NO BID NO BID $3,385.90 $3,385.90
7 Bypass Pumping 1 LS $48,000.00 $48,000.00 $48,000.00 $48,000.00 NO BID NO BID $462,990.94 $462,990.94
8 Record Drawings 1 LS $6,900.00 $6,900.00 $6,900.00 $6,900.00 NO BID NO BID $4,788.00 $4,788.00
9 Pipeline Testing 1 LS $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 NO BID NO BID $34,557.86 $34,557.86
SUBTOTAL $222,850.00 $222,850.00 $1,534,822.70
II. PROPOSED UTILITY RELOCATIONS
10 12" HDPE DR11 Pipe (HDD) 1,110 LF $158.00 $175,380.00 $158.00 $175,380.00 NO BID NO BID $288.91 $320,690.10
11 10" PVC C900 Pipe (Open-Cut) 280 LF $106.00 $29,680.00 $106.00 $29,680.00 NO BID NO BID $374.08 $104,742.40
12 20" Steel Casing with 10” Carrier Pipe (Jack and Bore) 90 LF $1,350.00 $121,500.00 $1,350.00 $121,500.00 NO BID NO BID $2,212.44 $199,119.60
13 12" DI Fitting- 11.25 deg 2 EA $2,415.00 $4,830.00 $2,415.00 $4,830.00 NO BID NO BID $1,914.77 $3,829.54
14 12"x10" DI Fitting- Reducer 2 EA $1,900.00 $3,800.00 $1,900.00 $3,800.00 NO BID NO BID $2,007.42 $4,014.84
15 10" DI Fitting - 45 deg 5 EA $1,800.00 $9,000.00 $1,800.00 $9,000.00 NO BID NO BID $1,928.73 $9,643.65
16 10"x4" DI Fitting - Reducer 1 EA $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 NO BID NO BID $1,718.51 $1,718.51
17 4" DI Fitting - Tee 2 EA $1,550.00 $3,100.00 $1,550.00 $3,100.00 NO BID NO BID $1,450.09 $2,900.18
18 10" DI Plug Valve 1 EA $7,600.00 $7,600.00 $7,600.00 $7,600.00 NO BID NO BID $4,832.15 $4,832.15
19 AC Water Main Relocations 1 LS $31,000.00 $31,000.00 $31,000.00 $31,000.00 NO BID NO BID $67,405.01 $67,405.01
20 2" Above Ground Air Release Valve 1 EA $7,700.00 $7,700.00 $7,700.00 $7,700.00 NO BID NO BID $40,730.63 $40,730.63
21 Manhole Rehabilitation 3 EA $11,160.00 $33,480.00 $11,160.00 $33,480.00 NO BID NO BID $35,529.53 $106,588.59
22 Lift Station 32A Force Main Connection 1 LS $9,600.00 $9,600.00 $9,600.00 $9,600.00 NO BID NO BID $62,634.14 $62,634.14
23 MH-S1 Force Main Connection 1 LS $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 NO BID NO BID $40,772.88 $40,772.88
24 Lift Station Water Service Modifications 1 LS $13,500.00 $13,500.00 $13,500.00 $13,500.00 NO BID NO BID $41,992.66 $41,992.66
25 Sidewalk Restoration Repair 45 SY $215.00 $9,675.00 $215.00 $9,675.00 NO BID NO BID $175.33 $7,889.85
26 Asphalt Driveway Repair 180 SY $135.00 $24,300.00 $135.00 $24,300.00 NO BID NO BID $179.80 $32,364.00
27 Sodding 750 SY $19.00 $14,250.00 $19.00 $14,250.00 NO BID NO BID $7.88 $5,910.00
28 Landscaping/Irrigation Restoration 1 LS $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 NO BID NO BID $107,760.00 $107,760.00
29 Remove and Replace Curb 60 LF $85.00 $5,100.00 $85.00 $5,100.00 NO BID NO BID $145.31 $8,718.60
30 Grout Fill and Abandon Existing Pipelines 30 CY $900.00 $27,000.00 $900.00 $27,000.00 NO BID NO BID $2,490.60 $74,718.00
31 Jack and Bore Utility Depth and Location Verification 1 LS $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $5,500.00 NO BID NO BID $107,909.76 $107,909.76
32 SUE Locates for the Existing Force Main 1 LS $12,250.00 $12,250.00 $12,250.00 $12,250.00 NO BID NO BID $95,700.23 $95,700.23
33 Site Fence Restoration 1 LS $11,200.00 $11,200.00 $11,200.00 $11,200.00 NO BID NO BID $19,500.00 $19,500.00
34 Buried Utility Relocation Allowance 1 LS $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00
SUBTOTAL $639,445.00 $639,445.00 $1,522,085.32
TOTAL SECTIONS I AND II $862,295.00 $862,295.00 $3,056,908.02
35 IContingency (10%) 10% | LS $86,229.50 $86,229.50 $305,690.80
GRAND TOTAL $948,524.50 $948,524.50 $3,362,598.82
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